Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 2:53 PM
To: Sbk E

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: PAYMENT FOR FBN5048H
Dear Mr Kwan,

Please send to insurance.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 2:45 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PAYMENT FOR FBN5048H

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E [mailto:sbk5643e@yahoo.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 2:32 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; assignments@I|kkauto.com
Cc: ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg

Subject: RE: PAYMENT FOR FBN5048H

Dear Sir,

Please refer to the email below and kindly assist as Ruth asked us to forward to you. Please confirm if you
need the originals? Thanks.



Regards,

Kwan S. H.
Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

————— Forwarded Message -----

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

To: Gek Tiang Ruth Chua <ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2019, 8:20:36 AM GMT+8
Subject: RE: PAYMENT FOR FBN5048H

Dear Ruth,

Please confirm if you need original and the ETA for payment. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.
Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd
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