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£ UBLAVE 1, #0122 PAYA UNINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORF 4080030 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX ; N5 2564015

Your Ref: D19004204MFSH

Our Ref: CS/FCI190] 1446/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date: 29 July 2019

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __ GBF 2062C .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 28/06/2019 at the premises of M/s SM AUTOMOTIVE. and have the following to
report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount :S§  30.894.00

Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the ofs portion & undercarriage.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

'S§__10.197.85
158 - i
1 S% -
:S§% -
- 58 -
MR
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Tl j6%) S222 2351 Fax: (B5] 6222 3547

Chali & Pawtiar Uniimrmiting Dapr: 38 Fobinzon Road #16-00 Oty House Segaoote DERE77
Tei [E5) BS07 3848 Fax (55 6507 3045

vy e Airstragital tom i
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Daip 26-06-2019 Our Ref No, D19004204MFSH
| Accident Date 26-06-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
lnsured Vehicle SHA4B08X Third Party Vehicle. GBF2082C
Survey Location BLK C, 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43
_untact Person, SUKYI CHONG
Caniact No. 67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Jipointed
R LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

vy

ntanct Person NA Fax No. 68416315

ntact Number, NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

-we submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based an
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

HIHD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Workshop SM AUTOMOTIVE Attention. NIL
Ut TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
lieer Incharge EILEEN LEE
IMPORTANT NOTE

iindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer genarated latter. no signature required.




Shiau Chan SLI{KAutnj

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 12:06 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments; SLIR

Cc: ‘Eileen Lee'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCI19011446A0 d3.pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of GBF 2062C.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@ |[kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089353)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 1:57 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ‘Elleen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204M FSH/1

Dear Eileen,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 2062C on 28/06/2019.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Hest Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 5:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=; SUR
<sur{@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <Elleenlee@msfirstcapital com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,



Shiau Chan {I.I{KAutn!

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 1:57 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments; SUR

Ce: ‘Eileen Lee'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204MF5H/1
Dear Eileen,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 2062C on 28/06/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 5:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com,sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; SUR
<suri@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Elleen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email; gssignments@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto; motorclai sfirstcapital
Sent: Thursday, 27 June, 2019 5:40 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTSE LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <gwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital. com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004204MF5H /1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1
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PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

| of |

"> Back to OneMotoring

s

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Veliicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type

Cheener (D

Vehicle Detalls

Wehicle Mo,

Wehicle to be Exported
Imended Deregistration Date
Vehicle Mike

Vehigle Model

Primary Colour:
Manutacturing Year:
Engine Mao.;

Chassis No

bl rmum Poreer Output
Open Market Value
Origlnal Reghltration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count!

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eliglbility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rubate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date-

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
POP Paid

COE Rabate Amount
Total Rebate Amount:

Company
2591K

GBF2042C
Mo

26 jun Z019
TOYOTA

HIACE VAN TURBO 4 DR
AUTO

White

2015

1KD2633327
JTFHTO2P100201420
£2%.070.00

2B Jul 2015

28 Jul 2014

0

£1.45400

N

£0.00

27 Jul 2028

C - Goods Virhicle & Bus
10

$37,218.00

£24.37200
£26,372.00

The infarmatian contained herein is correct as at 26 Jun 2019

OK

vel hegovsg inovrl acnon enguireRebateBy PublicBefore

2662010, 2:43 pn



SM AUTOMOTIVE .

mal: SM_AUTOMOTIWEEHOTMAILCOM

LANTERNFEST CREATIVE (S) PTELTD
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-43
Singapore 417883

Accident date: 26/06/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: GBF2062C TOYOTA HIACE VAN 3.0 A '16

CHASSIS: JTFHTO02P100201420

TP Lo
L.er Chitn

JTFeTeL ‘)»"JG-‘JJHLO

27/06/2019

S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 2 Front Lower Arm 24 Béd $382.25 S764:50J8 248
2 2  Front Upper Arm et ~~ $972.10 $1,944.20 X .
3 2  Front Knuckle Arm Rw Bt $561.60 §1,1232¢ st/ 6o
4 2 Front Knuckle Arm Bearing tH 7ed . $374.40 $748.80 27¥-v.
5 2  Front Stabilliser Bar  w+¢ ane $378.85 $757.70 *
6 2 Front Shock Absorber (1 Bet $174.70 $349-40 | ¥
7 1 Front Steering Rack st A~ $2,821.10+
8 1 Front Anti Roll Bar At A $381.90 &
9 1 Rear R/H Fender 7 steried $2,119.00 «
10 1 Rear R/H Fender Wheel House Panel Z g $595.00 -+
11 1 RearR/HTyre lupilured $350.00 £vasv)
12 1 RearR/HRim [t SRBO.00-<ww (in)
13 1 RearR/HHubCap (acdded $186-10 (ot )
14 2 Rear Spring Assembly A~~~ $1,081.00 $2,162.00 + -
15 2 Rear Shock Absorber & i $182.50 536500 /44
16 2 Rear Axle Bearing Nt Bv $241.00 $482-00 24/
17 1 Rear Axle Shaft “eyd. $806.00 +<~
18 1 Rear Axle Bed - ' $2,028.60 <
19 1 Front Crossmember Zedt $1,218.85 <
20 1  Front Bumper  For. $581.90 -
21 1 Front R/HAir Filter Box  cweld (51,1960 — 6 ¥
22 1  Front R/H Air Filter Hose ¢ ae- $105.00 ¢
23 1 Rear R/H Mud Shield %H‘I‘ $128.60v
24 6 Rear R/H Mud Shield Clip 4% $6.50 $39.00% |
25 1 Rear Exhaust pt A $1,712.85+
26 2 Rear Exhaust Mounting #+ - S$61.10 $122.20 &~
27 1 Rear Center Exhaust %,.r $1,829.104
28 2 Exhaust Heat Shield D4 - $228.00 ('Sfﬁw 224
ise3d0 7
7(5? 3‘5’ \ A ":’ L



Subtotal :- $26,054.00

Labour charges

To remove & refit front undercarriage, steering rack & crossmember Sﬁw 350
To remove & refit rear spring assy, shock absorber, axle & bearing $380.00 £ 55
To remove & refit rear & center exhaust S480-00 (60
To suspend engine to facilitate removal of front crossmember $550.00
To check wheel alignment $150,00 Fu
Tuff kote $1D9.ﬂﬁ 8o

Towing fee v 58() SID/OeﬁﬁéU

Panel beating SI;ZWIJ 8.0
Spray painting 51,2[]0{60 TJoo
Subtotal :- $4,840.00
Total:- $30,894.00
19/59
LKK Aufo Consultanis hence nolify +0+'41 /? ¢ -i’ {
the Repairer of tha following:
» To resurvey belorsalter 578y [AN1Ng k’ S E 8 f ff-
To diplay demagad part §) Surng me ey
>y proes are subpEect fo conlerEios
rrd gty Survey IS on & “Withoyt Prel dics” bans
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y L5 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e ;e . 57 Ubi Ave 1 #07-25 Paya Ubi Industreal Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6258 4115

Reg. No: 19860T198R GST Reg. No. 19-B607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ral CSIFCI18011446/Aqd3n2
H16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 083877 el | ullIIlI“mII“ ||
Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 4608 Veh. Inspected GBF 2062C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19004204MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 270672018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE c.C 2082
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JTFHTO2P 100207420 Colour WHITE
Odometer B6534 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN DRDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
4 Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
. Ganaral Information
Accident Date  26/06/2019 |inspection Date 28/06/2019
Survey held at  SM AUTOMOTIVE
BLK C., 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)JDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJ}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. | Estimate Days of Repair

lESTI-Iq"LHTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 8256 3581 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg, Mo 199607198R GST Aeg Mo, 19-9807198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 2062C

ay|  Descriptionof Parts | condion
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|FRONT LOWER ARM @$382.25 OFS5 BENT 764.50 38225
2|FRONT UPPER ARM @$972.10 NOT NECESSARY 1.844.20 -
2|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM @$561.60 O/S BENT 1,123.20 561.60
2|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM BEARING @$374.40 0/S DAMAGED 748 B0 37440
2|FRONT STABILISER BAR @8378.85 NOT NECESSARY 757.70 =
2|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER @$174.70 NIS BENT 340.40 174.70
1|FRONT STEERING RACK NOT NECESSARY 2821.10 =
1|FRONT ANTI ROLL BAR NOT NECESSARY 381.90 -
1|REAR R/H FENDER DISTORTED 2,118.00 2,118.00
1|REAR R/H FENDER WHEEL HOUSE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 595.00 -
LABOUR
2|REAR SPRING ASSEMBELY @$1081.00 NOT NECESSARY 2,162.00 -
2|REAR SHOCK ABSORBER @$182.50 Q/S BENT 365.00 182.50
2|REAR AXLE BEARING @5241.00 QS NECESSARY 482.00 241.00
1|REAR AXLE SHAFT DAMAGED 806.00 806.00
1|REAR AXLE BENT 2,028.80 2,028.60
1|FRONT CROSSMEMBER BENT 1.218.85 1.218.85
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 581.80 581,90
1|FRONT R/H AIR FILTER BOX CRACKED 1.186.00 549.00
1|FRONT R/H AIR FILTER HOSE NOT NECESSARY 105.00 .
1|REAR R/H MUD SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 128.60 .
B|REAR R/'H MUD SHIELD CLIP @$6.50 NOT NECESSARY 39.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 1,712.85 -
Z|REAR EXHALIST MOUNTING @$61.10 NOT NECESSARY 12220 .
1|REAR CENTER EXHALIST TO REPAIR SEE 1,829.10 s
LABOUR
2|EXHALUST HEAT SHIELD @3228.00 DENTED 456.00 224.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -2,385.95
24 B37 90 7.157.85
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR R/H TYRE (SN) PUNCTURE 350.00 200.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011446/Aqd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Uibi Inausinial Park, Singapone 408933
TEL: B25E 3581 FA: 8255 4315
Reg. Mo 189607 188R GST Reg. Mo, 18-96071688-R

1|REAR R/H RIM (SN) cuT .
1|REAR R/H HUB CAP (SN) CRACKED 186.10 60,00
1,216.10 450,00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE, 680,00 350,00
STEERING RACK & CROSSMEMBER
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR SPRING ASSY, SHOCK 380,00 350.00
ABSORBER, AXLE & BEARING.
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTER EXHAUST. 480,00 160.00
TO SUSPEND ENGINE TO FACILITATE REMOVAL OF NOT NECESSARY 550.00 -
FRONT CROSSMEMBER.
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT, 150,00 80.00
TUFF KOTE. 100.00 80.00
TOWING FEE. 100.00 60.00
PANEL BEATING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,200.00 800.00
R/H FENDER WHEEL HOUSE PANEL AND REAR CENTER
EXHAUST.
SPRAY PAINTING, 1,200.00 700.00
4,840.00 2,580.00
GRAND TOTAL 30,894,00 10,197.85
'8,100.00
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