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WTS Enginearing Pte Ltd aus
8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel 65598084 Fax 68622163
Company Registration Number 200505706E Adem
Quotation fe
DATE: 24/06119 LOCATION Guil Works
VEHICLE NO WC1285X Q REF No Q19/06/1
ORIVER: DEVANATHAN VINOTHKUMAR DEPARTMENT:  WTS Mix:
ATTENTION TO: ACCIDENT DATE: 22106M19
PREPARED BY: Chan Soo Lye REF No: JW-0618
SIN [Duu.rtpllnn | Qty I
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i _|FRONTRHSLIPBUMPER - [/ [ 1 | "
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.| REPLACE BUMPER LIP iy O™
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TOTAL: 995 80
Total Amount SGD 995.80
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Piease note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory

lifespan (If applicable) of the vehicle.

The informatian contained hereln is correct as at 27 Jun 2019

OK

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmner 1D Type: Company
Owner 1D: 2721IM
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No.: WC1295X
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date; 27 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: ISUZU
Vehicle Model: CYH525
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Yean 2007
Engine No.: AWG1405375
Chassis No.: JALCYHS52577000005
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $86,440,00
Original Registration Date: 12 Jun 2007
First Registration Date: 12 Jun 2007
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Pald: $0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 11 Jun 2022
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 5
PQP Paid: $18,757.00
COE Rebate Amount: §$11.096.00
Total Rebate Amount: $11,096.00
Message
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Ce:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir{ Mdm,

Maotor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Wednesday, 26 June 20719 11:31 AM

kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sq; ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; admin-d@lkkauto.com
Sherini Pillai

RE: PRI WC1295x% VS SHD3312P DOA 22/06/2019

GIA.PDF: QUOTATION.PDF; PRIPDF 12 DW 3‘; 14

ﬁl’\@

vlfnt'i{ Pﬂﬁ’\\

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle \WC 1295 and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Sherini.

*Kindly upfoad this survey request emall t merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
b I N O & FO KO

® ]
@
( Sermay B repais i | wET

G4 Cacll Street, #05 - 1DB Bullding
Singapore D49711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

] NDIA
1 NTERMNATIONAL
IHSU RANCE

From: kenjilee @woodlandstransport.com.sg [mailto:kenjilee @woodlandstransport.com.sg)

Sent: 26 June, 2018 10:22 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com,sg; sichan@woodlandstransport.com.sg
Subject: RE: PRI WC1295X VS SHD3312P DOA 22/06/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We choose

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
As the single joint expert for this PRI.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

Reayc Lee FHN2

Claims Department



3 .@.Wmdlands Transpart'

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

B, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Main Line :+65 6559 B988 Fax :+65 6898 2394
Direct Line ; +65 6559 B954
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg €2

w"l"]fﬂx’--‘} -‘lﬁh

Group of Companies

From: Motor Claim - Il €motorglaim @iil.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 9:44 AM
To: kenjilee@woodlandstranspart.com.sg

Ce: gonEwoodlandstransport.com.sg; sichan@w landstransport.com.
Subject: RE: PRI WC1295% VS SHD3312P DOA 22/06/2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

o LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
PG RFO R

&4 Cecll Streat; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

IHDIA
|NTERNMATIONAL
InsuRANCE

From: kenjilee @woodlandstransport.com.sg [mailtokenjllee@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: 25 lune, 2019 5:06 PM

To: Motar Claim - Il smotorclaim@ii.com.sg>

Cec: poo@woodlandstransport com sg; sichan@woodlandstransport. com.sg

Subject: PRI WC1295X VS SHD3312P DDA 22/06/2019

Dear Sir



We are instructed by Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd to notify you of a road traffic accident on 22/06/2019 around 11:30
h_r';-_ at Mountbatten Road involving our client’s/customer’s vehicle registration number WC1295X and vehicle registration

number SHD3312P driven by you at the material time. A copy of the Singapore accident statement [traffic police report filed
Is enclosed,

As a result of the accident, our client’s /customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would
like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply fram you within the stipulated timeline, our

client/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please send your surveyor to our premises at No. 8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564,
Please contact Mr Chan Tel 6559 8984/92994122 for an appaointment to view the vehicle.

For your immediate attention and action, please.

Thanks and Regards,

Rentt Lec FHI2

Claims Department

@Wondlands Transport'

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Main Line :+B65 6559 B9ES Fax :+65 6898 2394
Direct Line : +65 6559 8954

WWW. com.sg €2

Tt

Growp of Companips:  WTStrovel B

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

3



notified that any use. distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

" of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Intemet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pre Lid.

Registration No, 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim. which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



7132018 Menmen a-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :

“WC1295X
[SHD3312P]
TP

WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTE LTD
Jun 22 2019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Woodiands Transport Service Pte Ltd

_Reply | _Reply All || Mark as Unread | _print Message | Delete Message | | Forward | N
:-:m mgm-uﬁmiwm Pte Ltd (HQ) (II1_SG), sent on 03/07/2019 14:47 PM,
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - WC1295X - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

Approved:0.00.

| DOCUMENTS SUMMARY 1
There are no documents. - —

hitps /isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index cfm?usebox=SVCmail&iuseaction=dsp_viewhmode=1&iinbodd=15092514I0omainid=11&i0bld=3... 112




Tizaz2019 Marimean a-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :

“WC1295%
[SHD3312P)
TP

WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE FTE LTD
Jun 22 3019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD)
Woodlanas Transport Service Pte Lid

| Reply | Reply Al | Mark as Unread || Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

Ta _
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (§$1452.95) - WC1295X - Clalm Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved:1452.95.

From m International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 23/07/2019 10:07 AM.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

hitps./isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfmfusebox=SYCmallsfuseaction=dsp_viewSmode=1&linboxid=1520285&IDomainid=118I0bjid=3... 172




6\ !) WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

YOUR REF - CC4/1119011429/Ewb3
OUR REF - Jw/0619/389
0s5/07/2019

India International Insurance Pte Ltd /O
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,

Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Attention : Mator Claims Department WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD3312P WITH OUR VEHICLE WC1295X ON 22/06/2019

We refer to the above acoident and understand that you are the insurer of SHD3312P

From our investigation, we are of opinion that the accident arose as a result of your
insured's negligent driving.

Our lass in this connection comprises the following:

Cost Of Repair S 69550

3DayslossOfUse S 750.00

Search Fees 5 7.45

Total § 1,85295

Please let us know whether you are prepared to admit liability and reimburse our loss in full
within the next two weeks on receipt of this letter atherwise we will proceed the matters
legally which we will recourse the costs incurred to you.

Please acknowledge receipt of the above letter.

Thank -,rqu

|
Yours faithfully,

Kenji Lee

Claims Department
Direct Line . 6559 8954
Facsimile 6838 2394
Email ken|i landstransport.com.s
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd ENTERPRISE
8. Gul Circle. Singapore 620564 Tel: 6 550 8088 Fax & 808 2394 ,i‘} 6"% ((tda
3 = el

Company Registration Number : 2005605706



- .
O\J_p Woodlands Transport

Your ref CCCHNNI90] 1429/Ewh],
Our ref - JW/0619/389
30/07/2019

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

HO2-25

S(308933)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear 5irs,
Accident involving WC 1295X AND SHD 3312P ON 22/06/2019

We, Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd, owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No.
WC1295X do hereby authorize WTS Engineering Pte Ltd as my agent and representative
to correspond in, negotiate and settle on my behalf, my claim against the parties
invalved in the above-mentioned accident.

Yours faithfully,

T
s i, s
Lim Eng Kwong
Group Managing Director

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Lid
8. Gul Cirche. Singupore 619544

iy TERP
ThSSYEmE Foeii 1M NGA ‘;“
Y v
badadeiien= - T e X T :.I;E mlrl\'l:‘iﬁ.{ , ' J ﬁfm _E_I;_IE
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Inoia
@ |nTERsATIONAL (o, Hez N0, WRTNNTHk | GET fleg N M2 THADG-X
4 1 Gt Strvet | S04 | 207 | S6-02 | 10 Bulkling | Ragapore 049711
lllil.lm Office (45) G4TRL00  Emadl  insarediicomag
Al Fux | (66) AZ24A104  Wobile www il ot g

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
|ll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: "‘“J(‘h bes T
Claimant Raf : Wi A

Wel. _WTS Engineering Ple Ltd ("the workshop®) herstiy confirm that wel| have reached an sgreemen
wilh the sppointed Surveyor of india Intemationsl Insurance Ple Lid LKK Aulo Consultants P1a Lid i
of Surveyor with respect to the amount claimed for §%_1.300.00 IS L = T,
vt~ —————tpearcirfeed, vohicks o W 125X (i was dasmaged pursuant 1o the gccdent which ocoumed
on _ zmenote  (gate) sl MCUNTBATTENTD flocalion) Involving vehicle no. $40 B12P_ {insured
vehucle] This & pursuant lo the inspection conducted on27ARE010 {gm12) a1 “he workshop®

\Wesl confirm that well srelam suthorized by tha owngr _ Wessnds Transpor Serves Pie 30 ("the third party

claimant’] of vehicke no We 2B hmum“mummmmmmmmmmm
thie matier on hisfher behall in 8 manner inat wall deam fil Wedl snciose herein the letier of authorty given by "tha third
party claimant®

Well turther confirm that we/l will indemnify Indin Imematonal mmﬁltdhﬂmu,mmlmﬂ
they will oF fave sresdy incurredt in ihe evert that “the third parfy clamant” after the above said agreomert lodges a
furhar clam lnﬁnuhhmmim‘nwbnlrﬂmmpﬂﬂﬂmmldmnmmwmm
of use pursuant 1o he damage 1o e 12882 {vehicia no ) as a resull of (he accident

Wnﬂcnnﬁnnmlllmngmnﬂmdudmuhuﬂwmnrdldu'rrrlul"ﬁwwmmmim-rf
pursisnt to the accident and thal further fhis ssifiement is reached on @ withoul prejudics and wilhout admission of Rebility

basis

This agreement is sublect to the application of Singapcre law and e Singapore Courts have axclusive jursdicion over any
disputa arsing out of the sama

Wail authorize youlo pay thetotal amount of 5§ 13x.00 to WTS Enginesting Pte Lid

Dated this 33T day of . JLY =

WITNESS: LKK

INDHA INTERNATIONAL INSUBANCE PTE LTD

CLAIMANT: MY

Signatura - A Signalura -
Signed by "the workshop” (with chop Signed by appoinind Sarveyor

Nama WISEHGNERRRIEUR Name LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
200505TO6E

MRIC: =i S — NRIC: 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25

ASesE: 8 GUL CIRGLE Acich Singapore 408933
ENCAPORE BPESS

Matioralty: = — Mathenality:




@ WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

From :‘Workshop Department

M/S: Woodlands Transport sarvice Ple Lid Date : 5-Jul-19
Mo B Gul Circle No: 0619/1037
singapore 629564

Sin Description Unit Amount
Repair cost of WC1295X%

accident Date: 22/06/2019
Repair works took 3 days

Lumpsum repair inclusive of labour charges 5 650.00
and spray painting

Add 7% GST 5 45.50

56G0: Six Hundred Ninety Five
& Cents Fifty Only

Total ~ | % 695.50
-
If\
Authorised Signature
WTS Engineering Pie Ltd ENTERPRISE
8. Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel: 6 550 8088 Fax: 6 808 2394 l;‘ 6
o I birshE, NE=2

LIRL www woodlang siranspon. com.Sg
Company Registraton Number ; 200505706E



Receipt Page | of |
> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Dirve
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. - M4-0008529-2
Print Data/Time 25 Jun 2019 / 16:56:59

Recsipt DateMime 25 Jun 2019 / 18:56:59

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No ; ITNET-D0000-180625-002974

Previous Recsipt No
SIN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
. Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST {55) (5%) (S8)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - SHD3312P
As at 22 Jun 2018/11:30:00

Insurance Co. INDIA INTL INS PTE LTD
1 Insursnce Enquiry - SHD3312P

Envuiry Fee 7.00 0.48 748
20190625165454477718
Sub-Total T7.00 049 745
Total Before Rounding 700 048 748
Rounding Difference [l
Total Amount Payabio T45
Paid By
20190625165506618 mm:tﬂe:gsnm 745
Total T 45
Cash Change 0.00
. Tendered Amount TAS
Excass Refundable Amotint 0.00

THANK YO AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Ploase ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider | Minancial institution. Otherwise. the transaction and receip! is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt oK Save as PDF

https://vrl ta.gov se/lta/vel/action/completePayvment?FUNCTION [D=F1301001TT 25/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |
...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
Direct S=itlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Casa  |Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assignes Ad] Rpt Act) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status

| 126 Jun 2019 Pending for Survey
| 190l 2019 fo0:00 $$650.00 o mw.wl &zt
Edil Reg I EtIMIMJ Edit Estimates Wiew Rl o i Casa |

Main Referance

|CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| [Created by adjuster]

\!I;turld:

| COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. feg. ho. -

Mainy |
Claimant:

| WOODLANDS TRANSPORY SERVICE PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198102711M

wehicle Res- | wie1298X

Date of Loss:

42/0&/2019 00:00 - :59
[144 Manths and 10 Days From LTA Reg Oate (Man ¥rj]

| Claim Type: |1P § MCT19060570

Policy/Cover
Note No.:

1MmﬂunL5

Poliey Mo,
{Claimant):

I.EDIB'II'I.MB!

Excess:

_ Wis Engineering Pte Ltd (HQ} § Gul Circle, 679564 Tums - Tel:

|1ndla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel! 63476100 ... [Handied by Sherinl Pillal]

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) 6221 B&1]

|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3581 . [Handled iy CHEN TSUE YEE] ... [Final Rpt due 08/07/2019]
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o M_SG0NOT/I00F): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - WC1295X - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillal

+ 101_5G [23/07/2019) Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (551452.95) - WC1295X - Claim Handler: Sharini Pill... ‘
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Claim Documents
*WC1295X (MCT19060570)
[SHD3312P]
T
WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTE LTD
Jun 22 2019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wts Engineering Pte Ltd
Upload Docements | Upload Mhotos | Compase tew umr_] View [View in Browser | =]
|. m—— I! per 3 | =N
b — B 3o -  ——
[No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
|1 |03/07/19 17:57 | General View D | caawc | A
2 loy0718 1757 | General View 0 | wedivc |
3 037191757 | General View 0 | weows | B4
4 030791757 | Genaral View @ | oadic | M
5 03/07/19 1757 | General View 0 | eaws | 4
|6 03078 1757 Odometer Reading n waa s | BA
7030719 17:57 | General View O  waws | &4
8 |03/07/19 17:57 | General View 0| sdiec | &
O pOINS 1257 | General View 0| lsows &
10 0307/19 1757 | General View O | weaws |
11 03/07/19 17:57 | General View Q| oadies | & |
112 |02/0771% 17:57 | General View 0| wers | 4
13 1030719 17:57 | General View © | wawws | &
14 [0307/1917:57 General View O | waws &
15 |03/07/19 17:57 | Chassis Number 0 | osaws | B |
16 0V07/1817:57 | General View 0 | weiws | &
117 |03/07/19 47:5% | Photo After Spray 0 | weows | B |
(18 |03/07/19 1756 | Photo After Spray D | wdws |
18 |03/07/12 17:58 | Photo After Spray 0 | weewc |
]nuumma 1 —1~] &
(Mo |Helabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
{1 |27/D6/19 16:50 | TP GIA REPORT © | Load POF
12 | 27/96/19 16:50 | TP ESTIMATE @ | Losd POF
{3 |27/06/19 16:50 EMAIL FROM 111 DD 26062019 S____LHH PL3F
4 0107/1208:15 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Losd FOF
IS |32/07/19 DA:54 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
|6 |22/07/19 08:54 | LOD Load FOF
7 |22/07/19 DB:S54 LTA SEARCH Load POF
8 |07/0B/19 08:41 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Laad FOF
9 |07/08/19 08:41 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 0 | Load FoF
Mo iFmalzed On India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnaill | Print
! I8/06/1908:51 | Singapore Accident Statement © | Loaaror
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | print |
There are no document checklists configured. |
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Show Remarks Te: [ Handling Insurer
Feale. Bermarks Bre Orivete whines vou vhos it to otk Derbes
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd cc regne 109s071s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Induslrial Park

Singapons 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@kkauto.com;assignmentsi@kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/11118011429/EWB302
Date: 07/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD15
Claimant Vehicle 1
No : WC1295X Insured Vehicle No : SHD3312P
Date of Loss: 22/068/2018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18080570
RIPTION & | IF1 10N I
Reg No: WC1295X
Make & Model ISUZU CYH528, 15.7 D (M) Engine No: BWE1405375
Rep. Date 12/08/2007 (Man. Year; 2007) Chassis No JALCYHB2S77000005
Colour: White Odometer 345764 km
Engine Capacity: 15681 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S8) Market Value/New Car Price
DONDITI I TH RVEY
General Condifion: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification. No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 285/80 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 205/80 R225
Front Left Side Austone 5 mm Rear Left Side: Austone 5mm
Front Right Side Austone 5 mm Rear Right Side: Austong 5 mm
The above values represant (he remaming tyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - _ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  DIiff %)
Parts 145.80 145.80 0.00 0.00
Miscallaneous Items 0.00 0,00 0.00
Labour B50.00 650.00 200,00 23.53
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 995.80 78580 200.00 20.08
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 650.00
(s8) §95.80 650.00 345.80 3473
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS) B9.71 45.50 24.21 3473
Nett Amount (S§5) 1.065.51 695.50 iTo.on 3473
+ Loss of Usa (3.0 x 55200.00/day) (S$§) B00.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) T.45
Nett Liability (S5) 1,302.95
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 1,300.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 26/06/2018
Date Inspected 27108/2019 Inspaciad Al:
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Wis Engineering Pte Ltd
8 Gul Circle
Singapore 629564
Estimated Penod of Repair; 3.0 days
Adjuster: CHEMN TSUE YEE Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG

NOTE: This repart represents our fingings af the time and place af ingpechion stated harein. Such ingpechion has been camied ouf fo e best of owr
knowiecoe and abiily but any ather Sabililty under any othér circumatances is hemby exprassly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 22 Jul 2019)

Parts; MN/A ISUZU CYH52S 15.7 D (M) (Model not availabie in dalabase)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for WC1285X)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on 4ll eslimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

‘Further Info: Ite_m_a'_m _ljgut ln_r_efqu_unw calalogue are prefived with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Oty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT RHS LIP BUMPER Denled 14580FS *14580FS
FeFranchas part S=S5pcNett

Total Parts (S$) 145.80 145.80

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no now miscellansous ilems selecied.

Recommended Labour

No Pariiculars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Hems
1 TO REMOVE FRONT BUMPER PANEL BEAT RHS PORTION New 450.00 350.00
AND REPLACE BUMPER LIP TO RE-ALIGNMENT FRONT
BUMPER
2  TO SPRAY PAINTING FRONT BUMPER MNew 400.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) B50.00 650.00

Report was unsubmitted during this prini-out. ]

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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