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WTS Engineering Pte Ltd i i s © 1|
8 Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel; 65598984 Fax: 686221
Company Registration Number: 200505706E Acknuredged by Repsiry |
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Quotation Oats:
DATE: 24/06/19 LOCATION: Gul Workshop
VEHICLE NO: WC1295X Q REF No: Q19/06/1035
DRIVER: DEVANATHAN VINOTHKUMAR DEPARTMENT: WTS Mixer Truck Department
ATTENTION TO: ACCIDENT DATE: 22/06/19
PREPARED BY: Chan Soo Lye REF No: JW-0619-389
SIN lDoscripllon l Qty l Cost per Unltl Amount S§ M%S é.f
Spare Parts 104
T TrrRonTRHS LPBUMPER .~ [V [ "y 1 145.8] 145.80|[ 7177
Labour Costs
1 |TO REMOVE FRONT BUMPER PANEL BEAT RHS PORTION AND 1 450 450.00 TSU
d REPLACE BUMPER LIP. =
TO RE-ALIGNMENT FRONT BUMPER.
Spray Paint
1 |Spray Painting 1 400 400.00! j’,]g
TO SPRAY PAINTING FRONT BUMPER.
TOTAL: 995.80
Total Amount SGD 995.80
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Chan Soo Lye <slchan@woodlandstransport.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 04, 2019 9:29 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: WC1295X AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Hi Mr Steve Chen,

Confirmed.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Woodlands Transport'

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax : +65 6862 2163
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg €

s CASHBOX

Group of Companies: ~ WTStrave! L

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July, 2019 6:07 PM

To: Chan Soo Lye

Subject: WC1295X AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Hi Mr Chan,
The above lorry finalize $650 (L/S, before GST). 3 days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1




