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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 1888E
Vehicle No.: GZ9001T
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registration Date: 17 Aug 2018
Vehicle Make: OPEL
Vehicle Model: COMBO VAN AZ
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2006
Engine No.: Z17DTH01514043
Chassis No.: WOLOXCF2563069302
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $19,572.00
Original Registration Date: 01 Nov 2006
First Registration Date: 01 Nov 2006
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $0.00
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
[CItERde T COE Rehate D fa L s e s e
COE Expiry Date: 310ct 2021
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 5
PQP Paid: $24,482.00
COE Rebate Amount: $15,689.00
Total Rebate Amount: $15,689.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to
the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Aug 2018

OK

nttps:/ivrl.ita.gov.sg/ita/vri/action/enquireKebateByHublictetoreUereginput {FUNC | IUN_IU=FU3040091 | mnm



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

e —
From: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg
Sent: Saturday, 12 October 2019 10:41 AM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Xin Y’ assignments; SUR
Cc: 'samson’; amanda@seahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: V URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T :

CS3/ASM18014627/Etd3e2-1

Dear Denise

Thanks for your email below. As it appears that it was not economical to repair the vehicle, please revise your report
accordingly.

May we have the revised report urgently.
Thanks !

Yours
Chee Kiong

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 5:55 PM

To: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: V URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T : CS3/ASM18014627/Etd3e2-1

Dear Chee Kiong,

Market Value: $18,000.00 - $20,000.00(Est)
LTA : $15,689.00
Nett Value :$2,311.00-54,311.00(Est)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 8:07 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: V URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T : CS3/ASM 18014627/Etd3e2-1

Dear Nivithia / Denise



_ Cc: 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T

Dear Nivithia
May we hear from you on our email below urgently ?

Yours
Chee Kiong

From: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, September 13, 2019 3:56 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; 'assignments’
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Accounts (LKKAuto)' <account@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'samson’ <samson@seahong.com.sg>; 'amanda@seahong.com.sg' <amanda@seahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T

Dear Nivithia

Your survey report is enclosed. We note that it is a 2006 vehicle. Can you confirm whether the vehicle was
economical to repair ?

May we hear from you urgently ? Thanks !

Yours
Chee Kiong

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2019 12:50 PM

To: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg; 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ S5001T

Dear Chee Kiong,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: cheekiong@seahong.com.sg [mailto:cheekiong@seahong.com.sg]

Sent: Sunday, 4 August 2019 9:17 AM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; 'assignments’
<assignments@lkkauto.com>




_ Cc: 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: URGENT - SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T

Dear Nivithia
Thanks for your email below. The Plaintiff is not responding to our request for RI.

In order not to delay the court proceedings further, please let us have your survey report in lieu of the RI. May we
hear from you urgently ? Thanks !

Yours
Chee Kiong

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 June, 2019 2:20 PM

To: 'Xin Yi' <xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Chee Kiong' <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>; 'samson’ <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T

Dear Xin Yi,
Thank you for the assignment.

Kindly assist to arrange for the Re-Inspection appointment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yi [mailto:xinyi@seahong.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 12:16 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Chee Kiong' <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>; 'samson' <samson@seahong.com.sg>; amanda@seahong.com.sg
Subject: SOP file ref: 18.25882 PD-O | GZ 9001T

Dear Nivitha

CLAIMANT : DOUBLETRANS PTE. LTD
VEHICLE NUMBER : GZ 9001T

ALLEGED ACCIDENT DATE : 02.08.2018

AXA VEHICLE NUMBER : WC 7342D

1. We act for AXA Insurance Pte Ltd for the above matter.

2.  We understand that you were engaged to survey the claimant’s vehicle.



. 3. ' The Plaintiff’s claim is as follows:-

a.  Costof repairs $10.100.00
b. Loss of use 1,350.00
5 days pre-repair survey loss of use 750.00
TOTAL $12,.200 00

4.  The Plaintiff's surveyor’s report with the coloured photographs as well as the GIA reports by the
parties, are attached.

5.  We have requested for RI of the Plaintiff's vehicle and will liaise with you thereafter. Thanks!

Thanks & Best Regards

Heng Xinyi

(Secretary to Mr Tan Chee Kiong)
Seah Ong & Partners LLP

36 Robinson Road

#12-03 City House

Singapore 068877

Tel: 6536 5369
Fax: 6536 5811

This message is intended for the recipient named above. It may contain confidential or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to this
message and then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. Thank
you.

Disclaimer: Internet communications are not secure. While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure
that this communication has not been tampered with, Seah Ong & Partners LLP cannot be responsible for
alterations made to the contents of this message without its express consent. If you wish to receive a hard
copy of this message for comparison or should you require any other form of confirmation of the contents
of this message, please contact the sender. Opinions, conclusions and other information in this message that
do not relate to the official business of the company shall be understood as neither given nor endorsed by
Seah Ong & Partners LLP.

. AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; www.avg.com



8/17/2018 Singapore Used Car Listings - sgCarMart

[

scCAarMART.CON
THE ONLY PLACE FOR SMART CAR BUYE

» Opel Combo Used Vehicle List (5 vehicles)

Car Model Price Depreciation  Reg Date Eng Cap  Mileage Company Availabl
Opel Combo 1.7 (COE till $17,800 $4,520 Jyr 24-)ul-2007 1,686 cc = Breaking Point Availat
07/2022) (Diesel)

Please Call And Make An Appointment Before You Drop By As To Avoid Disappeintment. One Of The Most Popular Van In The Market. Low Fuel
Consumption. Easy To Drive. Price Can Be Negotiable. Hurry Come G...

Office No. - 65614858
Alex Gan - 87972000

Opel Combo 1.7 (New 5-yr $22,800 $4,560 /yr 08-Jul-2008  1,686cc - ABWIN Bus Pte Ltd Availat
COE) (Diesel)

Opel Combo 1.7M, Previous Owner Use To Ferry Light Goods Only. Clean Interior, Vehicle In Tip Top Condition. View To Belleve. We Provide Flexibie In
House And Bank Loan Up To 100%. Hurry Up And Call F...

Office No. - 69339404

Wilson - 81685758 | Zhiwel - 91055246

Opel Combo 1.7 (New 5-yr $22,800 $4,560 /yr 17-Jun-2008 1,686cc 184,000 km Think One Automobile &  Availat

COE) (Diesel) Trading
Lowest Price In The Market. No Further Discount. Serious Buyer Are Welcome!

Office No. - 65553300
Henry - 96741842 | Liza - 977639403 | Victor - 98198540

Opel Combo 1.7 (COE till $22,800 $4,770 /yr 27-May-2008 1,686¢cc - ABWIN Bus Pte Ltd Availat
05/2023) (Diesel)

Super Low Depreciation Compact Van! Good Condition And No Repair Needed. Popular Small Van For All Kind Business. Test Drive To Believe. Call Now C
You Miss It Later,

Office No, - 69339404
Ah Chong - 91297320 | Zhiwei - 91055246

Opel Combo 1.7 (New 5-yr $23,888 $4,770 [yr 13-Jun-2008 1,686 cc - AMT Automobile Availat
COE) (Diesel)
New 5 Year COE. All Wear And Tear Has Been Change.

Office No. - 62620653
Alan - 96261140 | Desmond - 91070316

sgCarMart Is the number one car classifieds for parallel import cars, Toyota, Honda, Nissan, Mitsubishi & BMW. There are plenty of cars for sale, even for C
cars, OPC cars, vans, trucks, hybrid cars, sports cars or stationwagons, You can also buy from a car auction, look up car loans, low mileage cars, car brand:
carpark rates & car insurance. We have new car dealers comprising parallel importers, authorised car dealers, and used car dealers on our site. Find new c
price lists, new car launches and new car promotions, and also motoring advice, car reviews & car news on the latest models. Visit our partner sites for job
openings for Singapare jobs, real estate properties for sale, mover, car performance parts, car discussion, forum discussion, commercial vehicle leasing & C
results,

© 2004-2018 sgCarMart. All rights reserved.

http://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/search_resull_pricelist_prinl.php?SA=&MOD=0pel%20Combo&RPG=20&VEH=08ENG=3&RGD=108AVL=... 11



MARKET VALUE OF MOTOR CARS

PUBLISHED DURING THE MONTH OF AUGUST 2018

Presented By: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MODEL | MODEL | ADVT. MAKE/MODEL MODEL S$

YEAR | MONTH DATE DESCRIPTIONS '000

2016 JAN 28.08.18 [NISSAN NV350 VAN 55.0
2009 NOV 28.08.18 |NISSAN URVAN VAN 15.5
2011 MAR 28.08.18 |NISSAN URVAN VAN 21.8
2008 JUN 28.08.18 [OPEL COMBO VAN 22.8
2010 01.08.18 |PEUGEOT PARTNER VAN 8.8
2010 02.08.18 |PEUGEOT PARTNER VAN 8.8
2010 02,08.18 |PEUGEOT PARTNER VAN 8.8
2010 06.08.18 |PEUGEOT PARTNER VAN 8.8
2010 07.08.18 |PEUGEOT PARTNER VAN 8.8
2009 31.08.18 |RENAULT KANGOO VAN 8.8
2018 APR 28.08.18 [SUZUKI EVERY VAN COE 4/2028 51.8
2001 JAN 01.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 3/2022 215
2001 JAN 02.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 3/2022 21.5
2001 JAN 03.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 3/2022 21.5
2008 27.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 27.8
2008 APR 28.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 27.8
2008 AUG 13.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 AUG 14.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 SEP 14.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 AUG 15.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 SEP 15.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 SEP 16.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 AUG 16.08.18 |[TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 8/2023 29.8
2008 SEP 17.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 AUG 17.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 8/2023 29.8
2008 SEP 20.08.18 |[TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 29.8
2008 JUN 07.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 31.8
2008 JUN 08.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 31.8
2008 JUN 09.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 31.8
2008 JUN 10.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 31.8
2008 JUN 13.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 31.8
2011 JAN 01.08.18 |[TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 1/2021 13.5
2011 JAN 02.08.18 |[TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 1/2021 13.5
2011 JAN 02.08.18 [TOYOTA DYNA LORRY COE 1/2021 13.5
2014 MAY 01.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 48.8
2014 MAY 02.08.18 |TOYOTA DYNA LORRY 48.8

Note: Price quoted are as published in the classified section of locar newspaper. Listed price are asking price of vehicles and discount have to be considered for the

Market Value.

Page25




sacCarRMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

= = LI ( —w opend $30toqualify "7

- REE Ngaeeullh NOWTILL 15 NOV 2019 CLICK O FND OUT MORE
L— WEEKDRY PARKING Lo | MOM - FRI, 6PM - 10 ==

[OpelCombo Price Range * | [Depreciation ¥ | [YearReg ¥ | [Venide Type R

Home » Used Cars » Bee Huat Holdings Pte Ltd » Opel Combo 1.7M (COE till 02/2022)

Opel Combo 1.7M (COE till 02/2022)

Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Price $14,500 Lifespan 04-Feb-2027
Depreciation $6,240 fyr Reg Date 05-Feb-2007

(2yrs 3mths 25days COE left)

Mileage N.A, Manufactured 2006
Road Tax N.A. Transmission Manual
Dereg Value $11,269 as of today (change) oMV $20,023
COE $24,252 No. of Owners 4
Engine Cap 1,686 cc

Curb Weight 1,240 kg

Type of Vehicle Van

Accessories
CD Players.
Description Shortlist Compare Add note
High COE, Good From Business Just Start, Repaort Error More Actions
Catego
rfeg Y Seller Information
COE Car
Company Bee Huat Holdings Pte Ltd
Status = gealar's pricelist
. = 1 vehs sold | 2 vehs available
Available
Address 71 Woodlands Avenue 10 £09-11
Resources Search cars nearby this location
Location Woodlands Industrial Xchange
m\ Car Valuation - Free
Find out the market value of your existing car for free. Get startad Office No 64811728
m Vehicle Evaluation Contact Person(s) Lek 90016524

Lt Afraid of lemons? Request to have this car evaluated professionally. Find out more

Posted on: 19-5ep-2019 | Last Updated on: 09-Oct-2019

Upfront Payment

Transfer Fee $25

Down Payment $1,450 (cnange) Maximum 0% Loan

1st Instalment $532 Based on 3.5% interest rate
Insurance You'll also need a valid car insurance to drive

this vehicle. 18% off with code CAR18
Get a quote now!

=ck with act fiy
Total Upfront Payment ?3,00? . Check with seller for exact figure



10/10/20189 Used Opel Combo Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
scCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resour

Spend $30 to qualify % =

A\ NOW TILL 15 NOV 2019 CLICK TO FIND OUT MORE
[MON - FRL 6PM = 10PM] ]

e |

ARKING

* Free VICOM evaluation

® Frea grooming and & months maintenance

= In-house workshop ensures quality service

= Member of SVTA and hire purchase assoclation

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

= 100% deposit refund for unapproved loan m

JJIE> YONG LEE SENG MOTOR PTE LTD

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling
Browse by Category ¥ [Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 resuls/page
1 vehicles Opel Combo - N
Model Price Deprediation aq) Dats . EngCap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection  Opel Combo Any Any > 100'1;;3'(’) Any Any Any Availabl
Opel Combo 1.7M (COE till $14,500 $6,240 [yr 05-Feb-2007 1,686 cc - Van Availabl
02/2022)
Fuel Type: Diesel

High COE, Good From Business Just Start.

Posted: 19-5ep-2019 Tags: 2007 Opel Combo, 2007 opel combo, Opel Combo, opel combo, Opel, Combe, combo, Used Opel

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.

Model Price Depreciation Req Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type

For old advertisements, view Expired ads 20 ¥ results/pag

Home | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum |Resources

sgCarMart is the number one car classifieds for parallel import cars, Toyota, Honda, Nissan, Mitsubishi & BMW. There are plenty of cars for sale, from vans, trucks, sedan cars, luxury cars,

or stationwagons, SUV, MPV, hatchback, to COE cars & OPC cars. You can also buy from a car auction, look up car loans, financial services, low mileage cars, car brands, carpark rate:

Insura Find buy used Opel Comba, Opel Combo Singapore, used Opel Combo Singapore, used Opel Combo, used vehicles Singapore or even buy used Opel Combao Singapore. We hay

car dealers comprising parallel importers, authorised car dealers, and used car dealers on our site, Find new car price lists, new car launches and new car promotions. Visit our partner sit
job openings for Singapore jobs, real estate properties for sale, mover, car performance parts, car discussion, forum discussion, commercial vehicle leasing & COE results.

ca

All prices and other information displayed on sgCarMart.com are gathered from sources and based on algorithms that are believed by sgCarMart.com to be reliable, but no assurance can b
that this information is accurate, complete or current. sgCarMart.com does not assume any responsibility for errars or omissions or warrant the accuracy of this information.

Follow sgCarMart.com

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Sitemap  Terms of Service | Privacy Policy | Personal Data Protection Statement
©2004-2019 sgCarMart. All rights reserved.

mpare

https://iwww.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=10&0RD=RGD_ASC&MOD=0pel Combo&RPG=208VEH=08AVL=2 il
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GZ 9001T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 of 2

ut £ i ' - Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty j ‘Description of Parts Condition Workshop g)) (s-j)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER REPLACED 950.00 850.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 365.00 <
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER REPLACED 96.00 60.00
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 230.00
2|FRONT BUMPER PROTECTOR REPLACED 176.00 176.00
1|FRONT GRILLE REPLACED 448.00 350.00
1|FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM REPLACED 80.00 60.00
1|FRONT TOP PANEL REPAIRED SEE 350.00 2
LABOUR
1|R/H HEADLAMP REPLACED 685.00 450.00
1|L/H HEADLAMP REPLACED £85.00 450.00
2|HEADLAMP PANEL REPAIRED SEE 420.00 a
LABOUR
1|AIRCON CONDENSER REPLACED 1,180.00 1,000.00
1|RADIATOR ASSY REPLACED 1,020.00 800.00
1|RADIATOR FAN ASSY REPLACED 685.00 550.00
1|INTER COOLER NOT NECESSARY 650.00 o
1|AIRCON COMPRESSOR NOT NECESSARY 1,185.00 2
1|AIRCON BELT NOT NECESSARY 145.00 4
1|AIR DUCT NOT NECESSARY 68.00
1|AIR INTAKE PIPE NOT NECESSARY 105.00
1|ALTERNATOR NOT NECESSARY 1,250.00
1|RADIATOR TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 98.00
1|BONNET REPLACED 920.00 800.00
1|BONNET HINGE NOT NECESSARY 226.00
1|BONNET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 168.00
1|R/H FRONT FENDER ARCH GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 196.00
1|L/H FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 643.00
1|L/H FRONT FENDER ARCH GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 196.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT s -554.60
13,220.00 4,991.40
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; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) )
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) REPLACED 60.00 35.00
60.00 35.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL 1,400.00 700.00
BEAT WHERE NECESSARY. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF FRONT TOP PANEL AND HEADLAMP PANEL.
TO PUTTY, APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY-PAINT ON THE 1,400.00 800.00
AFFECTED PORTION.
TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON REPAIRED, REPLACED 150.00 30.00
PANEL
TO REMOVE / RENEW AIRCON CONDENSER & REFILL 150.00 100.00
GAS.
TOWING CHARGES. 80.00 60.00
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS. 60.00 30.00
3,240.00 1,720.00
GRAND TOTAL 16,520.00 6,746.40
~ RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) '
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NOTE: MARKET VALUE: $18,000.00-$20,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $15,689.00=NETT VALUE:
$2,311.00-84,311.00 (EST)

—a

CHEN TSUE YEE

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




