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51 UBL AVE 1, 21-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL (63) 62563561 FAX ; (05 62564315

Your Ref: D19004126MFSH Date: 28 June 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI119011371/T1qd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SLZ 5644E .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 27/06/2019 at the premises of M/s ETHOZ. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8$  3.859.65
Revised Estimate Amount :S$  2.190.58
“Check” ltems Amount :§% - ;
Market Value : 5% - .
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8% - ;
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s portion.

Yours faithfully

Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



M5 First Capital Insurance Limited foieg v 1950001060 CUF Reg Mo M2 DU0LETS-9
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel: (B5)6222 2311 Fax (656222 3547

MS @ FirstCapital

Claoni & Mober Vesserwriting Cept: 36 Robinson Road #1E-01 Gty House Singapore 062877
Tal: (65) 6507 3848 Faw (65) 6507 3§49
www.mitirsteapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 25-06-2018 Our Ref No. D15004126MFSH
Accident Date 30-05-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC7836Z Third Party Vehicle. SLZ5E44E

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT

LEE CHEN SIN

66547520/ BE228339 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

66547542

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop ETHOZ GROUP LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge HEMRY KAQ

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 June 2019 2:39 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: ‘Henry Kao Cai Jie’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004126MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI19011371T1qd3.pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLZ 5644E.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 10:04 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004126MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 5:52 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004126MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Date

To

Attn

Certificate No
Vehicle No

ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS

. :
| QTY  DESCRIPTION

List Ttem
1 FRONT FENDER RH

1 FRONT FENDER EMBLEM RH

I FRONT DOOR RH

1 FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER)

I FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER)

1 FRONT DOOR STICKER RH (SET)}BLACK)
|

1

REAR DOOR RH

REAR DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER)
1 REAR DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER)

PLEASE ARRANGE TO SURVEY
VEHICLE AT 30 BUKIT BATOK
CRESCENT (S 658075)

Lee Chen Sin
CLAIM DEPARTMENT
DID : 66547520

24/06/2019 FAX :
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Motor Claim Department FAX
ETHOZ Group Lid
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
DI9MTRENTOO0052 Accident Date 30/05/2019
SLZ-5644-F Make & Model TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A
Excess 0.00 Add Excess 0.00
REPAIRER AMT (§)  SURVEYOR APP. |
RESTORE K%
a000. . Wl
1,078.60 a&r— bt
1550 b — W
75.50 £
7820, An
1,069.20 Ky
75.50 Ry
75.50 £y
foliowing nowy
“Jﬁ"ﬁq
PaR(8) during resurvey
Subject 1o confirmation
WPy iz on a mpw
:..-'17" 8 Sowed besy
- i MUs ba
19 Subioct 15 Mal agproval from s b e
ligeatirg.
G
T Tt -
PAGE 1

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 Bukt Batok Crescent, Singapore 558075 | Tel 6319 8000 | Fax £654 7547 | weww athozgroup com

Comparsy Pegaran be TBI0H20TH



Date : 24/06/2019

To ; MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED _
ESTIMATION

Attn : Motor Claim Department FAX .

Owmer ; ETHOZ Group Lid -

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.

Certificate Mo . DISMTRENTODO052 Accident Date o 30/052019
Vehicle No : SLZ-5644-E Make & Model . TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A’
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS  Excess . 0.00 Add Excess : 0.0
QTY  DESCRIPTION == =  REPAIRER AMT(S) SURVEYOR APP,
1 REAR DOOR STICKER RH (SET}BLACK) 7820 X N4
| ROCKER PANEL RH RESTORE A
| REAR FENDER RH RESTORE RY \1Z 0
Sub Total 2646.20 'L[d,f.} 5 3
Discount 25%  On Parts (661.55)
Labour & Misc
LABOUR TO FACILIATE REPAIR 600.00 47 =
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECCESSARY WIRINCS 35,0007
TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS 1,000.00 X e
SPRAY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED AREA 40.00 7o

PAGE 2

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 sukt Batok Crescent Singapare 658075 | Tel 6319 8000 | Fax 6654 7543 | www ethozgroup com

Compary Negastaon Mo, il



Dane : 24/06/2019

To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED ) 1
ESTIMATION

Attn - Motor Claim Department FAX .

Owmer ETHOZ Group Ltd

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
Certificate No DIOMTREENTO000S2 Accidem Date 052019
Vehicle No SLZ-5644-E Make & Model TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A

ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS

oTy DESCRIPTION

TO TRANSFER FRT DOOR RH FITTING
TO TRANSFER REAR DOOR RH FITTING
Sub Total

Remarks:

Surveyor's name:

\

Principal's name:

Survey Date & Time;

23[L[14_Q

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 Bukit Batok Grascent

T u&mﬁ 34 45 14

ETHOZ Group Ltd NI

W

4 ( LA
1

Excess r o 0.00 Add Excess :  0.00
== REPAIRER AMT (5) SURYEYOR APF.
100.00 £
100.00 X a0
1875.00 \1,26
f2190-5%
3.850.65
OTAL
T 7.0 % 27018
1 TOTAL 4,129 .83

4 iﬁ
Sy L" I| }vllk ILLC ™ WA~

PAGE 3

Singapare 558075 | Tel 6319 8000 | Fax: 6654 7543 | www ethozgroug. com

Cempary Regaraten He 1041043394
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FRONT FENDER RH

FunAcizalion) W?

ETHCZ

RESTORE

FRONT FENDER EMBLEM RH

FRONT DOOR RH

FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER)
FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER)
FRONT DOOR STICKER RH (SET)(BLACK)

REAR DOOR RH

REAR DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER)
REAR DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER})
REAR DOOR STICKER RH (SET)BLACK)

ROCKER PANEL RH
REAR FENDER RH

RESTORE
RESTORE

0.00
40.00
1078.60
75.50
75.50
78.20
1069.20
75.50
75.50

78.20
0.00

0.00

PAGE : 1

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent. Singapare 658075 | Tek: 6319 8000 | Fax 6654 7543 | waw athozgroup.com

Company Begarion Mo, 198108211

Date 03/07/2019
To MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
Atin Motor Claim Depariment FAX :
Owner ETHOZ Group Ltd
Insured By SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
Certificate No D19MTRENTO000052 AccidentDate :  30/05/2019
Vehicle No SLZ-5644-E Make & Model : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A)
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess . 0.00 Add Excess : 0.00
oy DI-.‘SCRT["'I'ION .= - REPAIREI;‘. AMT_{SEURVE‘;'ﬁIl AMT (5)
List I1r:m S - - I

0.00
0.00
1078.60
75.50
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.0
0.00
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Dute 0 03/07/2018

To ; MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Attn 2 Motor Claim Department FAX :

Gwner : ETHOZ Group Ltd

Insured By : SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.

Certificate No . D19MTRENT000052 Accident Date :  30/05/2019

Vehicle No : SLZ-5644-E Make & Model : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A)
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess ; 0.00 Add Excess : 0.00

REPAIRER AMT (SEURVEYOR AMT (%) |

!.QTY ﬁz.qcmmnw

Sub Taolal 2646.20 1154.10
Dismnm{- 15% } Omn Parts (0.00) (661.55) (288.52)

Labour & Mise

LABOUR TO FACILIATE REPAIR 600.00 400.00
TO CHECK AND RECONMNECT ALL 35.00 35.00
NECCESSARY WIRINGS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS 1000.00 800.00
SPRAY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED AREA 40.00 30.00
TO TRANSFER FRT DOOR RH FITTING 100.00 60,00
TO TRANSFER REAR DOOR RH FITTING 100.00 0.00
Sub Total 1875.00 1325.00

PAGE : 2

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 10 Bukt Batok Crescent, Singapore 58075 | Tel: 6319 8000 | Fax 6654 7543 | wrw. olhozgroup.cum
Comgary Ragaraben Ma 1REEE11H



ETHCZ

Date : 03/07/2019

To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Attn - Motor Claim Department FAX :

Owner : ETHOZ Group Lid

Insured By = SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE, LTD.

Certificate No . D19MTRENT000052 Accident Date :  30/05/2019

Vehicle No : SLZ-5644-E Make & Model : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 STANDARD (A)
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess 0,00 Add Excess : 0.00

REPAIRER AMT ($FURYV E.."('_()_R. A]'irIT-{S_}J

Sub Total 3850.65 2,190.57
GST 7.0% 270.18 153,34
Total 4,129.83 2,343.92

Cor: B2 190.57 (AR &Y ART )

4 e cemR
Surveyor Name : TAUFIK - LKK ARS - B LISy o - 35D
Date & Time  : 27/06/2019 4:00:00 PM B 86553
Lee Chen Sin 8 - B 4}, 335.00 PAGE - 3
CLAIM DEPARTMENT T e

B2, 190 53

DID : 66547520 4
FAX : -

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 Bukt Batok Crescont. Singapore 658075 | Tel. 6319 B000 | Fax: 6654 7547 | wenw. ethozgraup com

Towag-atry Rlegriralon Mg 1GETEITAH



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-89607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18011371/T1gd3n2
3? aFﬁBtI:T'EE HSS;EDSINGAPDRE 068877 DNk Aeuraen ” “I"Im"lllml” "I
Coda: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 78362 Veh. Inspected SLZ SB44E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004126MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAQ Assign Date 26/06/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MROS3IREHE04581684 Colour GREY
Odometer 1278 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/65R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/65R15 YOROHAMA 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/65 R15 ¥ OKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/65R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE OJ/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  30/05/2013 Inspection Date 27/06/2019
Survey held at ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 658075
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No; 199607196R GST Reg. No. 19-9607182-R Page MNo.1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SLZ 5644E
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
o pti Workshop ($)| _ ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|ERONT FENDER RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER EMBLEM RH NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR RH BENT 1,078.60 1,078.80
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER}) BENT 75.50 75.50
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER) TO REPAIR SEE 75.50 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER RH (SET)(BLACK) NOT NEGESSARY 78.20 d
1|REAR DOOR RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,069.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR HINGE RH (UPPER) TO REPAIR SEE 75.50 :
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER) TO REPAIR SEE 75.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR STICKER RH (SET){BLACK) NOT NECESSARY 78.20 =
1|ROCKER PANEL RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE " -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE . -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -661.55 -2B8.53
1,084 65 BB5.5T
LABOUR
LABGUR TO FACILITATE REPAIR. INCLUSIVE OF THE §00.00 400.00
REPAIR OF FRONT FENDER RH, FRONT DOOR HINGE
RH (LOWER), REAR DOOR RH, REAR DOOR HINGE RH
(UPPER), REAR DOOR HINGE RH (LOWER), ROCKER
PANEL RH AND REAR FENDER RH.
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
WIRINGS.
TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1,000.00 B00.00
SPRAY RUST PROCF ON AFFEGTED AREA. 40.00 30.00
TO TRANSFER FRT DOOR RH FITTING. 100.00 £0.00
TO TRANSFER REAR DOOR RH FITTING. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1,875.00 1,325.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011371/T1gd3n2
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Page No.2 of 2
GRAND TOTAL | 1 3,850.65 2,1 nn.srl
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 2,190.57|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011371/T1gd3n2

al KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
B.Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A
Licensed Appraiser

Automotive Assessor
MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sclely lor the use and banafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




