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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 6224D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: FBK41227
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 28 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: MT-09 ABS TRACER
Primary Colour: Red
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine No.: N701E043449
Chassis No.: JYARN29K000000441
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $9.538.00
Original Registration Date: 14 Aug 2015
First Registration Date: 14 Aug 2015
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $1,431.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 13 Aug 2025
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $6,312.00
COE Rebate Amount: $3.866.00
Total Rebate Amount: $3,866.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Jun 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta. gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereg Input 7FUNCTION_1D=F030,,.  28-Jun-19
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EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTELTD
No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 202-62 AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit Singapore 417882
Tel 67527740 Fax 67528660 Hid
Co Reg No. 201202259
COhwner WELLMY RACHMATULLAH Aciident Date b-Jun-19
FARYONO
Vehicle o - FBK 41227 Vehicle Model - YAMAHA MTO9
. Estimated Repair Costs
Qty  Description Amount 5(5)
List llems
2 Fork inner tubes s 77 woooy
2 Fork outer tubes $ 47 40my
I Headlamp 8 A4 38000
| Handle-bar 5 135.00 o
1 Brake lever 5 1 200y
| Top fawring % 1 21000 ¥
| Main stand § U 10500 N
1 Front footrest 5 oy Mo
1 Front footrest bracket 5 Fud 9000 X
1 Arabe pedal 5 Py 4300
| Rear footrest 8 Ty 4200 —
1 Exhaust protector R/ H § 5S¢ 100 —
| Crash bar ( 1 < | $ Cgm 3WW_—
5 135Tm
Less 101% 5 pLE i
s 219N —
/ “
Y U’# ' A0/

PACEVOF 2




c/k 5 219330

Special Nett ltems
I Number plate (1 s ) § #a B0 Y
o Fork oils 5 s MO0 I 'd
2 Fork oil seals $ e 000
| Stewring cone { | set ) § <7 asp0d
| Lever guard { 1 set ) s N 28000 —
$ ARG 00
S/MNo. Labour
f To provide tow ing service s -1 spo0 X
2 To provide labour § L0 W
L To chech wiring and reset headlamp focusing 5§ 41 ﬁl.ll]JX
s S1000
Crand Total s 319230
r I_-- N -
A
{1
| ‘o
. H_ ( e
EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTELTD - —

PACE 2OF 2



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE I'TD

No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883

Tel : 67527740 Fax : 67528669

Co. Reg No. 201202259N

Yl o

Owner: WELLMY RACHMATULLAH Accident Date : 6-Jun-19
FARYONO
Vehicle No: FBK 4122 7 Vehicle Model : YAMAHA MT09
Estimaled Repair Costs
Oty  Description Amount S(5)
List Items
2 Fork inner tubes s A7 000X
2 Fork outer tubes s 41 46(]&%
1 Headlamp S A4 38000
| Handle-bar 5 L. 13500 q‘
1 Brake lever S a9 2200
1 Top fairing S »~1 21000X
1 Main stand g #U 105.00 %
I Front footrest S Fua 3B00o¢
1 Front footrest bracket S  Tut 9000 X
1 Brake pedal 5 Sy 4500 —
| Rear footrest 5 T 20—
1 Exhaust protector R/H $ St 12000 —
1 Crash bar ( 1 set ) $ < 35000 —
-] 2.437.00
Less 10% 5 24370
5 2,193.30

/M-f/

V

PAGE10F2
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c/f: S 2,193.30

Special Nett lltems

1 Number plate (1 set ) 5 A= 28.00 _}(

2 Fork oils 5 74 30002

2 Fork oil seals 5 A 36000

1 Steering cone ( 1 set ) g « 95.00 ¢

1 Lever guard (1 set ) s (Y 28000 —"
S 489.00

S/No. Labour

1 To provide towing service. s 171 5000 A

2 To provide labour. $ Xg 380.00

3 To check wiring and reset headlamp focusing $ A1 80.00 X
5§ 510.00

Grand Total % 3192.30

/ |
748
(f

f
- ’ II

— ( ey e S
EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD fo s re

PAGE20F 2



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mator Claim - Il <motarclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 11:38 AM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg; ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc Pool Chin Han Daniel

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBK4122Z (Accident invalving
FBK4122Z and SHD4494R on 06.06.2019)

Attachments: shd4494r_20190626104249 pdf

Dear Sir{ Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FBIX41227 and let us have your report urgently,

This claim will be handled by Daniel, p. Lo \w
“Hindly upload this survey request emall to menmen, 1. \3oe l’
oQ iy
Thank You
I L
Best Regards, e Vv
Gabriel Wee

o Inp1a
Y © InTERNATIONAL
(l [nsurancE
IiI NG AFOLI
fwerprng e rmyse e § RS

&4 Cecll Street; #05 - 10B Bullding
Singapore 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From;: Erofia Motor - Leelee Tan [mailto:erofia@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: 26 June, 2019 11:06 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBK4122Z (Accident involving FBK4122Z and SHD4494R on
06.06.2019)

Dear Gahriel

Kindly arrange LKK consultants Pte Ltd
Thank you

Regards

LeeLee Tan

Frofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Tel: 67527740
Fan: 67528669

From: Motor Claim - Ill [mailto:motorclaim@iil.com.sg)
Sent: 26 June, 2019 10:50 AM




To: erofia@singnet.com.sg; "erofia2@gmail.com’ <erofial @gmail.com>

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBK4122Z (Accident involving FBK4122Z and SHD4494R on
06.06.2019)

Dear 5ir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your letter.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
®  \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyar agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
I N O B FOE B

&4 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Building
singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

IHHM
IHT'ERH.&TIOH&L
IN!U RANCE

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 10 us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same. kindly let us know immediately,

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

[f you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use. distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted. corrupted. lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may anse as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including



the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

It you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore. we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



82002018 Menmen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*FBK4122Z (MCT19060120)
[SHD4494R]

WELLMY RACHMATULLAH FARYONO
Jun 6 2018 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 17/09/2019 11:18 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$1081.30) - FEK4122Z - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han Daniel

Approved:1081.30:Please request TP WS to raise Tax Invoice for Cost of repairs in III's name

htps:Nsingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cimMusebox=5VCmall&Afuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=554128304CFTOKEN=3aZ2c5bal3ead 3e0f-FB... 11




Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669
E-Mail: erofia@singnet.com.sg
Co Registration No: 201202259N

Our Ref; EMT1523/19/It/FBK41222 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your reference: TO BE ADVISED BY HAND TO LKK

22 August 2019

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street #04-00 & #06-00

108 Building

Singapore 049711

Attn: Officer-In-Charge (Motor Claims Department)

Dear Sir

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD4494R AND FBK41227 ON 06 JUNE 2019

We are instructed by our client Wellmy Rachmatullah Faryono to claim damages against your
insured SHD4494R in connection with a road traffic accident on 06 June 2019 at about 12.20hrs

along Syed Alwi Road with our client’s motorcycle registration number FBK4122Z

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and
expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1. Cost of repair as per Surveyor's Recommendation 55981.30
2. Loss of Use (Sdays x $520.00/day) repair day +PRI 55 100.00
Total to Claim 5%1,081.30

Attached final repair bill for your early process of our claim
Thank you

Yours faithfully
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

|

Teo Hwa Heng



Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669
Co Reglstration No: 201202259N

AUTHORISATION TO ACT

1"We, '!"'J«‘:\ﬁhﬁ Q':\"-""“ﬂ”"-l"ah"? 1"1!“"-'.‘!’ (“the third party clermant’) of
Ak 430 Cemands BVE D Rokabc  S1.0430 _(address), owner of

K g1z (vehicle no.) hereby suthorize Ermofia Motor Trading Pre Lid (“the
workshop™) to sct for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of

use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. TEK 412 = That was damaged pursuant 10 the

accident which occurred on g blofl=u (date)

ﬁl‘;ﬂ'} Cy }L'& | 0 F]l'.m\ location) mvolving wvehicle nois
TRD dnad R (“the accideat™),

| further authorize the workshop to setlle my sbove mentioned clsim in & manner that they
deemed fit and the workshop is further suthorized to receive payment further o senlement of my

claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop - EROFIA MOTOR
TRADING PTE LTD

I further acknowledge that any serlerent the workshop may resch on my behsifis on s withow
prejudice and without sdmission of lishility basie insofir as the driverfownerfinsurers of the

other vehicle/s is concemed,

Diated this e7 dsy)of O tmenth) 20 19 (year)
Signad by ic\ﬁi/d party Lln ant” Signed by “the workshop™
(With company stamp if applicable) (With company stamp)

Frovide always thel this discharge ol my

laem for damages relating o the damage o

mry vehiicle aball mo) prejudice or alfect or

preciude me (fom making & further claim for

procral and spozial damages for my perscaal

imugies suslawsed iu (he mme BOClent
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

lIl-Direct Settiement (PODS)

India Ref; WCTYROSCDED
Claimant Ref ; =1z

Ve, EROF MOTOR TRADIG FTE LTO ("l weorkshop") hateby corfiem thul well have reachoed an sgreemont
with (he nppoinied Surveyor of indin [niemational Insurance Ple Lid | =K &UT0 COWSLATANTS FTE LTD [reurriam
of Surveyed) with mespoct 1o the amouni clamed for 5§ 8013 (rapul coaf), 5% 19000 {lose of
uselimeind), 53 - (search foe), vehicle no. _FBEATIZ  fhel wes dumeged pursuani to the socident which occutted
on MEEAOTIE (ctadn] at TEWMESEND RO TWIE E¥E0 ALM =D (lacgtion) invohang wehicls fo SHO SR |inguned
voucie) Thw s pursuant 1o the respechon conducied on SO0 § date) at “the wordkshop”,

Wi corfirm that wa/l arefam authorized by the ownar WELLMY RACHMATURLAHTARTONO {"tha third party

claimund™) of vehicks po FBCAIZT (o moks (he claim as sel oul in the sbove pemgmph end well have full sulbority 1o setis
the matter on hisher bahall in & mannoe thal well deem B Wel encloss harein the lotter o sulhority given by “the thim
party clarman™

Vel furihier confinm [hat wel will indemndy India Intecnational insurance Ple Lid for afl domages, loss and/or expense that
Ihey will or have aleady incurmed in the evenl thal The thed party claimanl™ aller Ihe above said agresment odges @
further claim againat tho formar Tor any e snd cxponses sufferod portaining lo cosl of repaits and/or renisl andior loss
al use pursuant to the domage ta TE=4IIEE  (yahicle no.) e a resdlt of the accident.

Wl confirm that the agreemant mached above & in full and final saftiament of Al claims of “the third pay clamant™
pursuant fo the sccident @nd thal furiher this soilement s meched on a withoul prejudios and withou? sdmssion af abilry
bass

This agresmant i eubject to the application of Singapets law and ihe Singapore Courts have exclusie jurisdiction over any
dispiie atising oul of the sarme.

Wil aulhorize youto pay thetotal amount of 5§ _ 180138 jg EROFIA MOTCR TRADING FTELTD

Dubed this ...

CLAIMANT: WITNESS:

Signatire: Signature

Mame: Hama: LEK AUTD CONSULTANTS PTELTD
NRIC NRIC 180007 198R

Adress M- w '-"‘F[ % b Addiess: 51 UBI AVE 1 #02-25

KO- (0 WLbRY () 48T AR

HNalonalily

Decupation: Ocoupalson:

Provide slways thst this discharge of my
cliim for damages relating to the damage 1o
my vemcle shall not prejudice or affect or
prechnde me lrom making @ Meriber claim for
goncral and special domages [or iny personal
Ill'ljn.llﬁ tustaoncd m the same acculent



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel : 67527740 Fax : 67528669
Co. Reg No. 201202258N

Email: erofia@singnet.com s

INVOICE
Number Date Page
FBK4122Z 22-Aug-18 1

VEHICLE NO: FBK4122Z
MAKE/MODEL: YAMAHA MTOS
NAME: INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTELTD
ADDRESS: 64 CECIL STREET #04/805

I0B BUILDING

SINGAPORE 049711

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD4494R AND FBK4122Z ON 06 JUNE 2019

Repair Costs
Oty Description Amount 5(%)
List [tems
1 Brake pedal S 45.00
1 Rear footrest $ 42.00
1 Exhaust protector - R/H ] 120.00
1 Crash bar (1 set) % 350.00
5 557.00
Less 10% $ 55.70
$ 501.30
Special Nett Items
1 Lever guard ( 1 set) 5 280.00
$ 280.00
sgygu. Labour o w - L
1 To provide labour b 200.00
$ 200.00
Loss of Use (5 days x $20.00/ day)repair days $ 100.00
Grand Total $ 1,081.30

Dollars: One Thousand Eighty-One and Cents: Thirty only

I\

EROFIA MOTOR T?DIHﬁTE LTD

Page 1 of 1



Mermen e-Claims Page 1 of |

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiement

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =
Cass Natified Est Submirteg Adj Assigned Ad| Rpt Adt Submitted  {Ins Aurh'ed | Statusn
19 Aug 2019 26 Jun 2019 | geggy 39 $$981.30 R for e,
Wi Eqit Aag on0 et Estimams | | view B |
Edit Adj Rpt ] Cancei Cass I

Claim Details

Main

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

[ a COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co fisg. No 1993038218

ml mlm’. WELLMY RACHMATULLAH FARYONO, Co Reg No: SETD6224D
Vehicie Reg. _ | 06/DB/2019 12:00 - 159
Mo |FBK4122Z Date of Loss: || 4g Manths and 23 Days From LTA feg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: !TP / MCT19060120 gf"ﬁ""” MCOMOOLS (TP, Fire & Theft)
Vahicls Reg.
Palicy Na
Mo, | sMDaasar (Claimanty: | MC/00581668
{Tnsured):
Encess

Repairr: Ercfis Maotor Trading Pta Ltd (KAKI BUKIT) 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE £ #02-62, 417883 Kaki Bukir - Tel

m}* India International Insurance Pte Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Mandied by Pool Chin Han Daniel]

Claimn®'s | oy oce Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 65322868

Insurer:
Adjustar: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ] - Tel: 6256-3561 __ [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due 05/07/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All |  Compase Case Mail |

» 115G {17/09/2019]: Aert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$1081.30) - FBK41227 - Claim Handler: Pool Chin H...
« 111_SG [19/08/Z019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($50.00) - FBK4122Z - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han ..

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Sesrch Tasks | Create New Task | Comgsete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group  Subject Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dane?
No results.

https://singapore,merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 8/10/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBK4122Z (MCT19060120)
[SHD44594R]
TP

WELLMY RACHMATULLAH FARYONO
Jun 6 2019 12:00PM
{COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

uplosd Documents | _ upiosd Protos | compose New ener | View
Video [Lperpage [v] W
Ne |Finslzed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reg no 1ssso7108r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 5844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto com;assignments@|kkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur Flle No: CC4/MM8011318/UGA302

Date: 0BM0/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlemational Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMOD15
Claimant g
Vehicle No - FBK41227 Insured Vehicle No : SHD4484R
Date of Loss: D6/06/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT 180680120
E | | A I
Reg No FBK41222
Make & Model: YAMAHA MT-09, B4Tecc Engine No: NTO1EQ43445
Req. Date: 14/0872015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: JYARN28K000000441
Colour Red Odometer: 32608 km
Engine Capacity 847 cc
Market ValueNew Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price
F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 120/702 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 180U55Z R17
Frant Left Side Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
Thae above valles reprosan! e remaning fyre reads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Parts 268230 781.30 1,601.00 T70.87
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 510.00 200.00 310.00 60.78
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Mett Amount (5§) 3,192.30 981.30 2,211.00 69.26
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x $520.00/day) (S$) 100.00
Nett Liability (S5) 1,081.30

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 26/06/2018
Date Inspected; 28/06/2018 Inspected AL Ercfia Molor Trading Pte Lid (KAK|

BUKIT)

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-62

Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA

Manager: Chong Pul Lin

NOTE: This report represenis our findings af Me time and place of ingoection sfated hersin. Suoh inspaction has been camed oul fo the best of aur
inowledge and abiity but any athar labilty under any other circumatances is horeby expressly excluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 04 Sep 2018)

Parts: NIA YAMAHA MT-08 B47cc (Model nol available in database)

Labour: Raepairar's (Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBK41222)

(Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
| numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Furthnr Info: Item;{ualges not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 2 *FORK INNER TUBES Not Necessary 44000 FL “FL
2 2 *FORK OUTER TUBES Not Necessary 460.00 FL “FL
3 i *HEADLAMP Not Necessary 380.00FL “FL
4 1 *HANDLE -BAR Serviceable 135.00 FL “FL
5 1 *BRAKE LEVER Nal Necassary 22 00FL *FL
;] 1 “TOP FAIRING Repair 210.00FL *.FL
7 1 *MAIN STAND Repair 105.00 FL “.FL
8 1 *FRONT FOOTREST Serviceable 38.00FL “.FL
a 1 *FRONT FOOTREST BRACKET Serviceable g0.00FL *-FL
10 1 ‘BRAKE PEDAL Cul 4500FL “4500FL
1 1 *REAR FOOTREST Cut 42 00FL *42 DOFL
12 1 *EXHAUST PROTECTOR R/H Scratchad 120.00 FL *120.00FL
13 1 *SET CRASH BAR Scralched 350,00 FL *350.00 FL
14 1 *SET NUMBER PLATE Nol Necessary 28.00FS *-F8
15 2 *FORK QILS Not Necessary A0.00FS *FS
16 2 *FORK DIL SEALS Mot Necessary 56.00FS *-F§
17 1 *SET STEERING CONE Not Necessary 95.00FS “-FS
B8 1 *SET LEVER GUARD Cut 280.00FS *280.00FS
F=Franchise part S=SpcNet. L=ListtemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 2,926.00 837.00
- List ltem Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 24370 55.70
Total Parts (5§) 2,682.30 781.30
l_ Report was unsubmitted duning this print-cut |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous Homs selecied.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO PROVIDE TOWING SERVICE New 50.00 0.00

2 TO PROVIDE LABOUR Mew 3680.00 200.00

3 TO CHECK WIRING AND RESET HEADLAMP FOCUSING  New 80,00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 510.00 200.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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