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Xg 23357Y
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Make: D -A l/ 0.0
Colour o AC: Insured | Std / NI/ NA

T/Radia: Insured | St | N1/ NA

19%0%

5p.Reading
Eng/No:
e ALRTEESACOG 1 337
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PRE-RZPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - XE2357Y vs SMG6395E (Ol) on D.0.A.: 22/05/2019

From:  Har, Yinrul
Ta: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com'. Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com)

Cc Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Kaur, Baljit, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi,

Sent:  6/24/2019 512:16 PM
Attachments 5

Lim. $heng Yang. Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur, Subramaniam, Divyashni, Tor

Hi,
Please refer to the enclosed request from Vision Law LLC.

Claim no : 28995641805G003
Case Owner : Lee Ming Yao

If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know.
Kindly assist to assign MOHAMMED RASUL as Single Joint Expert as requested.

Thanks & Regards,
Her Yin Rul (Viviane)

AlG

Claim Adjuster Il. Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto

4ig.Com | www,aig.59

Yinrul.k

From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com]
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 4:46 PM
To: Hor, Yinrul
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Cc: Fong, Andy-SY; Fan, Winnie-LW; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Subrayaiiam, V{‘&{.

Divyashni; Tong, Wahxin

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMG6395E AND XE2357Y ON 22/05/2019

Importance: High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Qur Ref: XE 2357 Y{YL)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wir/Madam

U Lrwye

We refer to your email of even date informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of Surveyors,

Our chient confirmed appointment of MOHAMMED RASUL-LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Piease be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTE LTD
1 TUAS AVENUE 20
SINGAPORE 638832

Contact: Ms. Jolene @ 6302 1999 (Please call before going)
s
pre—

If you fall to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter

without further reference to you.
Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Toh -
Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 {Ext. 122}

Fax: 65356802

cg: XE 2357 ¥ - By Email only

From: Hor, Yinrul [mailto:Yinrul.Hor@aig.com)
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 4:16 PM
To: Elaine Toh

Cc: Fong, Andy-5Y; Fan, Winnie-LW; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Subramaniam,

Divyashni; Tong, Wahxin

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMG6395E AND XE2357Y ON 22/05/2019

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

BRERIEEE. MERELEE, SIFRM .
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Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya, membuka
attachment.

Click here by 2019-07-01 16:15 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

«d its content are confidential and intended solely for the use of the

stity the sander if you have received this emalt in error or simply ¢

Jaint Encryption, Copyright © 2009-2017 Proafpoint, Inc. All rights

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unigue Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email {including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email
by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any
person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email
transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American
International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Yinrul.Hor@aig.com

To: Elainetoh@visionlawlic.com

Cc: Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com Winnie-LW.Fan@aig.com ,Baljit.Kaur@aig.com ,Nocharlesa.AbuKassim@aig.com \Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com \yokeshi.chan@aig.com ShengYang.Lim@aig.com
.Aashweenjeetkaur.wthons'\ngh@aig.com ‘DLvyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com Wahxin, Tong@aig.com

Subject: aigencrypt PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMG6395E AND XE2357Y ON 22/05/2019

Date: Thu, 20 Jun 2018 08:10:28 +0000

Without Prejudice

- XE2357Y (YL)
1 28995641805G003

Your Reference
Qur Reference

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to your Notice of Accident of even date.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert:

Name of Surveyor
AIG In House Surveyor

Company Name
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lud
Priority Services

Lawrence Ng Chun Kee

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kiat Priority Services

Jimmy Lee Priority Services
EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Ng You Han

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Soon HanXin (Gary)

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Chow Bo Xiong

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin)
Kalvin Ang
Xing Guo Qiang

Marcus Chua LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
}mlamnd Taufikh LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd J
‘—Adrian Ling LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mohammed Rasul KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd J
E&mmh Kong LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd J

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the
listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Thanks & Regards,

Haor Yin Rul (Viviane)
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Clair pdjuster I\, Singapore FNOL. Claims Operations = Auto

\ﬂgs_d-_flni@gi.g gom | www.2ig.59

from: Elain Toh [rna'ﬂto:E'.ainetoh@v'\s‘lonlawllc.com]

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2019 3:43 PM

To: Hof, yYinrul

ce: 'Uly.T an@aig.com", *Andy-SY .Fong@a'\g.com'; ‘Balj‘lt.Kaur@aig com’; Lee-Ying Chin@aig com'; ‘NourMar'nesa_AbuKass‘nm@a‘ug.com", 'imran.lshak@aig.com‘;
'ShengYang.um@aig.com‘; 'Darsheneﬁupraman‘nam@a'\g.com‘; 'Syazaird’ma.Az'.an@a‘lg.com", 'yokeshl.chan@aig.com", M‘\thoosir\gh, Aashweenjeetkaur

subject: [EKTERNAL} RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY —~ ACCIDENT IN\'OLVING ¥E 2357 ¥ & SMG 6395 E ON ?.1.05.2019 ALONG ADMlRALT‘f ROAD WEST AT ABOUT 1230 HOURS
Importance'. High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachmems.

our Ref: XE 2357 ¥ (YL
WITHOUT PREJUD!CE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed bY CHOON HE OGISTICS pTELID O notify you of aroad traffic accident on 22.05.2019 ALONG ADM\RALT"( ROAD WEST AT ABOUT 1230 HOURS involving

NG LU

our client’s yehicle registranon number YE 2357 Y and yehicle reg1straﬁnn number SMG 6395 E driven by you,’yourmsured atthe material nme.

ps a result of the accigent, ouf client's yehicle has been damaged pefore our client proceed 1o repair the damaged yehicle, please let us know within 2 working davs of your
receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like 1o conduct @ prcvrcpa‘nr survey of the yehicle. \f we do not receive any reply from you within the st'\pulated ameling,

our client shall proceed to repair the yehicle without further reference o you-

Thank you:

Regards,

Elaine Toh

Vision Law LLe

Tel: £5342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax 5356802

< KE ?3’)7Y'B\' EMAIL

VISION AW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(lmorporated with limited tiability)

Unique Entity No. 200721 148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #1 8-01/02 Chinatown point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Pay oh #03-11 BDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1) Singapore 310490

DISCLMMER:

The contents of this email (including any auachmems) are conﬁdemia'l and priv ileged and only intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. 1 you received th
email

by erroT. please notify the gender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or disscminating any of its contents (in a0y forr
any

person. Email communication is not secure- Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or omissions in the contents resulting from e!
{ransmission or any illcgal or unauthoriscd usage or tampering of its cmail system-
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Pte Ltg
Business Reg No: 201500892N Quotation
To : Choon Heng Logistics Pte Ltd Our Ref : W/Q/19/0063
Attention  : Mr. Dickson Poh Quoted By : Htoo
Tel 1 +65 34898856 Date : 14-Jun-19
Fax t+65 6863 3101 Page tlofl
Subject :XE2357Y Accident Repair RO
We are pleased to quote the followings of the above mentioned repair.
A. PARTS
No Description Qty Unit Price Amount
1 Grille Coe .~ 1 s 827.00 ¢ 82700 2720Y
2 Bumper bracket ?(ﬁu/ S 1,949.10 3 1,949.10 o
3 Lamp bracket 7 (A& . $ 42830 § 428.30 (o)
4 Front Bumper assy will knock and use back 1 - $ -
P y s 5 9 &,%,E’ 0 [j
-
B. 10B SCOPE 1 (Repair) $ I,/Oacr.ﬁ
Removal and replacement of new griile %
Panel beating and spray painting of bumper and rhd headlamp cover panel %
Dismantle and fix back for 3l accident parts
290, 285250

Waiting for approvallll

NOTE: Waiting for Approval
it has been a great pleasure to be
rep

ly by return fax duly signed. Please contact me should yo

Labour and parts total S 4,244.40 //:'L’
GST @ 7% $ 297.11 é{?? +) b
Balance Due $ 4,541.51 ? 7
—
Terms: 30 Days S

of service ta you. | hope the quotation is favourable and
u have any query.

LV \ /.

A ’,L;\"'/
N\

i

Customer Stamp / Signature / Date

Remark

This quotation is only an enstimated

during the course of repair, extra

which vou shall he intarmead oriar to

LKK Autg Q@??ﬁ#?éﬁ it
the Repairer of the ol!;mﬁ pRfi nal quotat

wmgg?
» To resurvey befora/after spray painting
« To display damaged part{s) during resurvey
© Parts prices are Subject to confirmation
» Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
* No illegal modification(s) is allowed
* Supplementary item(s) must be resury eyed and
i subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date;

Ephraim Engineering Pte Ltd

Quotation and should additional work be found necessary

terial and labour cusls would be charged accordingly for
action taken.
ill be charged should you decide not to proceed with the repair

on.

me

1 Tuas Avenue 20 Singapore 638832
El: (65) 6302 1998 Fax: (65) 6863 3101




