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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 11:55 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/0210953 Our ref: GS/18/4943/TMF/ms [External 

General]-SDT 8209K 

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf (amend).pdf; LKKInspection.pdf

Dear Gerald, 

 

According to surveyor, he have checked through and determined the damages. Basing on the photos submitted by the 

TP lawyer,  noted that there was misalignment on the LH side rear portion such as Rear n/s control arm and Rear n/s 

knuckle arm parts need to be replace. 

 

Enclosed please refer review report. 

 

 

    

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 11:24 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/0210953 Our ref: GS/18/4943/TMF/ms [External General] 

 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 August, 2019 8:48 AM 

To: Accident@kscgp.com 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/0210953 Our ref: GS/18/4943/TMF/ms [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
 
Dear Myra, 
 
We shall seek clarifications with our insured and revert. 
 
In the meantime, please hold hands pending their reply.  
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Aside to LKK – Attn : Veron   
                                 Kindly look into the comments and let us hear from you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

From: Accident@kscgp.com [mailto:Accident@kscgp.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 24 August, 2019 12:22 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; MT_Claim_SG 

Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/0210953 Our ref: GS/18/4943/TMF/ms[External General] 

 

 

Dear Gerald,  

 

We refer to the above matter.  

 

 

(a) Damaged items 

 

We are instructed that all of our client's vehicle's damaged parts were replaced, as per the recommendation 

by our client's appointed surveyor. We enclose herein photographs evidencing the same, for your kind 

attention and reference.  

 

 

(b) 10 days' notice 

 

We regret that parties are still far apart in their respective positions on quantum. 
 
In order to expedite matters, please let us have your agreement by way of open letter to concede liability at 100% in 
our client's favour, leaving damages to be agreed and/or assessed.  
 
We further hereby give you 10 clear days’ notice that our client intends to proceed with the issue of a writ of summons 
against your insured and/or their driver. In this regard, please let us know if you have instructed solicitors to accept 
service of process on your insured and/or their driver’s behalf. 
 
Regards,   
Myra  
for and on behalf of Mr Gurdeep Singh Sekhon 
KSCGP Juris LLP  
10 Hoe Chiang Road  
#13-03A Keppel Towers  
Singapore  089315  
Tel: 6538 3611 / DID: 3152 0989 / Fax: 6538 3708  
Email: accident@kscgp.com  
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KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited Liability 
Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be protected by legal privilege. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return email, delete this message and 
you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. Please note that e-mails are 
susceptible to change and we shall not be liable for the improper or incomplete transmission of the information 
contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that 
the integrity of this communication has been maintained nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or 
interference.  

 

 

----- Original Message ----- 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com] 

To: Accident@kscgp.com 

Cc: mt_claim@lonpac.com 

Sent: Thu, 18 Jul 2019 00:54:26 +0000 

Subject:  

Lonpac External - General 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Save as to Cost 
  
Our Ref        : 18/18/18/VP05/020953 
  
Dear Myra, 
  
We attached a copy of the survey report for your attention. 
  
We are prepare to revise our offer to $11,250.00(all-in) in full and final settlement 
of your claim. 
  
Please confirm settlement.          
  
  
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

  
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

From: Accident@kscgp.com [mailto:Accident@kscgp.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 5:42 PM 

To: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/0210953 Our ref: GS/18/4943/TMF/ms 
  

  

Dear Sirs,  

  

Please find enclosed herewith our letter of even date for your kind attention.  

  
Thank you. 
  
Regards,   
Myra  
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for and on behalf of Mr Gurdeep Singh Sekhon 
KSCGP Juris LLP  
10 Hoe Chiang Road  
#13-03A Keppel Towers  
Singapore  089315  
Tel: 6538 3611 / DID: 3152 0989 / Fax: 6538 3708  
Email: accident@kscgp.com  
  
  
KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited Liability 
Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be protected by legal privilege. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return email, delete this message and 
you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. Please note that e-mails are 
susceptible to change and we shall not be liable for the improper or incomplete transmission of the information 
contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that 
the integrity of this communication has been maintained nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or 
interference.  
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