Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Dear Asher

Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Friday, 22 November 2019 9:28 AM

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Jaime Tay

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 3365S AND SLR 4268G ON 22/06/2019
(DM19HO01802-JT)

Follow up
Completed

Please proceed with direct settlement and seek mandate if necessary.
Claim handler for this matter is Ms Jaime Tay.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2019 5:08 PM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 3365S AND SLR 4268G ON 22/06/2019

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 33655 AND SLR 4268G ON 22/06/2019

Enclosed a copy of the third party video for your easy reference.
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Video show that our insured exit from the slip road and hit on to third party vehicle that is traveling along the main

road.

In view on above we are in view that insured is not in our favour.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




