Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 5:56 PM

To: ‘Jenny Toh'

Cc: SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-

JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY (NEAR VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-
REPAIR SURVEY
Attachments: PC 4773X - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Jenny,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PC 4773X.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 3:41 PM

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh@gbe.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY
(NEAR VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

Dear Jenny,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@gbe.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 2:23 PM
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>



Subject: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY (NEAR
VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

Our ref: VC012438
Hi all
Kindly survey the third party claim, on “WP” basis

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Website LinkedIn Twitter

& QBE

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 5:13 PM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: Re: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY
(NEAR VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

Dear Sirs

We refer to your email of 13.05.19.

Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor as the SJE: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client's vehicle at the following address:

TECK TIONG MOTOR WORKSHOP
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-07 Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Contact: Joyce/ 6286 9882

Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair
survey within 2 working days of his appointment.

Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey.

As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should
you reach a direct settlement with our client's repairer.

Regards
Irene



Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

On Monday, 13 May 2019, 4:38:54 pm SGT, Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com> wrote:

Our Ref: V0014865
Dear Irene
We refer to the above captioned matter.

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the
motor surveyors named in the attached list:

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte

Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors.

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Website LinkedIn Twitter

> QBE



From: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 4:20 PM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: FW: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-JUNCTION KEPPEL
WAY (NEAR VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

FYA —VC012438

Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo

Senior Assistant

Claims Dept/Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 64771184 | +65 62246633

Website | Linkedin | Twitter

/> QBE

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 2:22 PM

To: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@gbe.com>; Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>

Subject: L19.0599.CJ // ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19 T-JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY
(NEAR VIVO CITY) NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

Dear sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4773X & SKS9130T ON 24.03.19

T-JUNCTION KEPPEL WAY (NEAR VIVO CITY)

NOTIFCATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

We act for Advan Engineering Pte Ltd, whose vehicle registration number PC4773X was damaged in the above accident.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please
let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the
vehicle.



A copy of our client's SAS report is enclosed.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without
further reference to you.

Regards
Irene

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.
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