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Bsm mm = Pie Lod Campany Reglstration Na. Y89&0T198R

S1UNEAVE 1, 002:25 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564313

Your Ref: D19004098MESH Date; 27 June 2019
Our Ref: CS/FCL19011220/Ksd3

The Motor Claims Department

Fi ital Insurance

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHD 9905P .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 26/06/2019 at the premises of M/s Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 3803484
Revised Estimate Amount :S$ 1320544
“Check” Items Amount : 5%

Total : S8

Market Value : 58

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value S8

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s front portion. = o
Comments/ Present Status:

Damages ConsistenlL.

Repair days: 2 days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

& Rafties Quay 121-00 Sngapore D4BSE0

MS Firs? Capital Insurance Limited (s ey bin 395002106

1\*‘ Tel (65 6222 2311 Fax (6516222 3547
\ Clatn & Mt Unssrwsiting Cage 35 Rotenman moad # 16-01 Oty Howe Smgagore DBETTT
Tel |65) 6507 3848 Fax (551 6307 3849
wvrws P NrYIT astALCEm g
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 24-06-2018 Our Ref No. D15004088MFSH
Accident Date 21-06-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SH748BM Third Party Vehicle. SHD8S05P
Survey Location NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET B3
Contact Person. AMANDA TAY
Contact No. 62876666/ 0 Fax No. 62571333
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Appointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Banchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

/ TRANS-CAB AUTO :
Cc : Workshop SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Saolicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This Is a computer genarated latter, no signature required

AT Npg B MU OOT1EPED




" Shirley Hiew !LKI{ Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 luly 2019 9:00 AM

To: ‘Ng Wai Yin'

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1906-199--Accident involving SHD 9305P & SH 7488M on
21/06/2019

Attachments: image001. wmz

Hi Wai Yin,

L/S $ 1,200.00 confirmed.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phane: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@®|kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, B02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mallto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 6:28 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com=>

Cc: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1906-199--Accident involving SHD 9905P & SH 7488M on 21/06/2019

Dear Shirley
lasmine's not agree S 1,150/-. We purpose the finalise amount § 1,200/-.
Kindly help check with Kenneth's.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Departmant
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*#2 plagse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com sg

‘f‘!‘ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
RAﬁg Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 562111
— 1 Main Line: (65) 4287 &&66& Fax Line: [65) 6287 7744
c 1! Website: www. ranscab.com.sg
Hes meEssage s confulEntial. 1 Ay

e nblvilegea therwiss protected by o b progluct immagnity o otfies legal roles 1f
vl have recalvad it by mistake, plsass let us know by 8-mall reply Bod deiete it from your sy stEm; you may not copy 1
fisciose its contents to anyane Piegse seri] us iy far any messace cantammg deadlines &8 s Wi & imamibls are ni e
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed an the Internet



From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 4:19 PM
To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Ce: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1906-199--Accident involving SHD 9905P & SH 74BEM on 21/06/2019

Hi Wai Yin,
As spoken, maintain L/S $ 1,150.00.

Please confirm,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Higw | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lidkauto com | fan: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mallto:waivin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 3:28 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew @ lkkauto com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1906-199--Accident involving SHD 9905P & SH 7488M on 21/06/2019

Hi Shirley
Can we finalize @ $1,200/- (calculation amount 51,176.36/- round up should be $1,200/-)

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wal Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** piagse be reminded that oll claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
# TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
N No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Streel 43, Singapore 567111

— Main Line: [45) 4287 6646 Fax Line; [65) 6287 7764
ca Website: www . ranscab.com.sg

This meessge (g conflidential, 1t may also be privileged or otherwise profected by e rie progluct immunily or othes Egal r
vou have recanved it I_ Y Mistake, pleass et us know Dy &-mal| reply and delete 1T rrom \,r|||r '\'-'&- SEETT; YOu mMay NoL Cofry thirs me
r disclose s contents to anyone, Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines &5 incoming e-malls are not s

for response deadlines. The pitegrity and secunty of this me<sage cannot be guarantead on th [||| Juyli

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 3:08 PM

To: 'Ng Wal Yin' <walyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Ce: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1906-199--Accident involving SHD 9905P & 5H 7488M on 21/06/2019

It



Dear Wai Yin,

Please confirm final fig $ 1,150.00 (lump sum) @ 2 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirlay Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall; Surfikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BIK 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




= Shirlﬂ Hiew !LI(K Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew®lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 5:45 PM

To: ‘Elleen Lee’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Ce assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004098MFSH/1
Attachments: SHD 9905P - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 9905P.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #O2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 5:28 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004098MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 26/6/2019.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consulinnts Pte Lid

Phone 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 4:19 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM



Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <ElleenLee®@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004098MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Wehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Orwoner 1D

Wehicle Details

Vahicle Na

Wehicie to be Exported:
intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model

Primary Calour:
Marutacturing Year:

Engine No.-

Chassis No:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Valse

Oiriginal Registration Dats
First Regivtration Drate
Transfer County

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
FARF Ellgit lity:

PARF Eligitsility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category

COE Penod(Years):

POP Paid

COE Rebare Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of |

Company
I8TEK

SHD99OSP

Yes

21 Jun 2019

REMNALILT

LATITUDE 20L DCI AUTO DVAB 4DR
Red

2014
MPREEIFCO0117E
WFIABLISAUCITT404
127 0kW (170 bhp)
£19 99400

05 Jun 2014

035 Jun 2014

1]

$12498.00

Yes
04 Jun 2022
LA T4R00

04 Jun 2022

A« Car upto 14600cc & 976W {1306hp)
]

$57.33800

£21.17400

£29.924.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or whern the vehicle

reaches its statutory [ifespan (it applicable), whichever js earfier,
The information contained herein id correct as at 21 Jun 2019

OK

hups:/vrl lagov sg/ha/velaction/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ’FUNCTION _1D=F03040... 211062019



I Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd "% 4£D1906-199

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111 /007 /{#“Wy
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax Mo. : 6257 1330
CO/GST Reg. No. 201019626G 5 /f.’,, £1052/
SHD 9905P
Vehicle No.: SHD 9905P
Chassis No.: VF1ABL15AUCZT 7404
Vehicle Make: RENAULT
Vehicle Model: LATITUDE
Date of Accident : 21.6.19
Third Party Insurer : FIRST CAPITAL
Date of Registration: 5/6/2014
PART LIST
1 BUMPER COVER FRT $ I 125042
1 BUMPER SPOILER FRT $ /S 18175
1 BUMPER ABSORBER FRT $ fn, 39468
1 BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH 5 . 1514
1 BUMPER SUPPORT FRT $ /. 12388
1 BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT 9 Je, 47283
1 BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT $ fe 26680
1 BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH $ fy 20721
1 BUMPER BEAM FRT $ #T 91408
1 HEADLAMP RH $ i 118443
1 HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH $ M 1521
1 FENDER PANEL FRT RH $ & 78383 —
1 WHEELARCH FRT RH 3 o 27884
1 FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH $ 1579
1 FENDER INSULATOR RH $ S 13084
1 TOW COVER FRT $ fu. 2861
1 FRONT BRACE PANEL $ T 17722
1 RADIATOR GRILLE $ P, 170778
1 RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE 'RENAULT' § I 22536
1 RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME 8 f',_. 1,353.75 ;(
1 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL $ N 61590
1 FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET $ T 8979
1 BONNET $ 1 194163
1 BONNET INSULATOR $ Fo, 40573
1 BONNET STRUT LH $ Iy, 86T
1 BONNET STRUT RH $ o, 8861
1 BONNET HINGE LH $ T 34831
1 BONNET HINGE RH $ T 34831
1 BONNET LOCK $ A 30548



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No, : 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G
SHD 9905P

BONNET CABLE

BONMET CABLE COVER
BONNET SEAL OUTER
BONMET SEAL INNER
DOOR PANEL FRT RH
DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH
DOOR MIRROR GLASS RH
DOOR MIRROR BACK COVER RH
WIPER RESERVOIR MOTOR
WIPER RESERVOIR

WIPER RESERVOIR NECK
DOOR HARNESS WIRE RH

e e R e . |

Special Nett
FRONT DOOR STICKER 'Trans-cab’
FRONT DOOR STICKER 'Classic’
BUMPER CLIP FRT
BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH
BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH
BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP
1SET  FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL NUT
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD
WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH
FRONT RIGHT TYRE
FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM
1SET  Front licence plate with holder
1SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW
1SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP
WINDSCREEN SEALANT
FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING
FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL
BONNET INSULATOR CLIP L70Y
BONMET STRUT L70Y
BONMNET CABLE CLIP L70Y

— el ek el el el

e e T Y

P B O el el =

TOTAL
10%

AAD1906-199

IS 11919
[e 161.03
fe, 9236
o 15728
7T 284466
i, 1.48340
o 14820 p X
Jo 21846
o 27006
I 34825
TS 43611
fn 267000 )

22,892.02
2,289.20

WA A Y s o B WA A A WS W W A

20,602.82

W S LA R W W W R R A N W W W S S WY Y Y AR A

. 8000 6osa
/h:" Bﬂ.ﬂﬂ /Ff‘h-
A 66.00
vAa. 1200
A 1050
AA 6900
A 70.00
A 2000
Y1 3000
A 3050

FS 30000 >)(
J& 38000
fn Booo
o 1600
YA 5200
e 25380
AA 12000
A 100,00
~A T30
e 8861
v E.?.J




Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1906-199
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No. : 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 9905P
2 BOMNMET CABLE COVER SCREW L70Y $ Vv 1085 X
TOTAL § 1,872.02
TOTAL PARTS § 22,474.84
LABOUR
Putty and spray painting of the affected portion. 4 6,000.00 éﬁdp’

Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts, adjust
and realign the same 3 6,000.00 Z-.rl,f

To rust-proofing of the affected areas. § 17000 For

To transfer of front windscreen fittings and conduct
water seepage test S v~ 17000 X

To transfer of front fender fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. $ Ve 38000 X

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment $ S 22000 X

To transfer of front bumper fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. g 4 38000 X

To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings, garnish,
fittings and other, to enable repair. $ 9 38000 X

To transfer of front door fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. 3 & 38000 X

To transfer of tire, im and on wheel balancing. s L 17000 X

To transfer of bonnet fittings, attachment and perform
water seepage test. - 4 38000 X

To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned. 4 17000 Zz/



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1906-199
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No. : 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 9905P

Labour charge to mount and dismount vehicle on jig
bench, to facilitate repair. 5 A 380.00

To apply paint protection system (PPS) maintain and
A

enhancement 3 380.00 A
TOTAL $ 15,560.00
Over All Total § 3803484
20045 -F0
LUMP SUM (REPAIR DAY) _28-DAYS

27"/‘7&



’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Adm BE B §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag. No: 1996071868R GST Reg. No. 19-8607 188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Rel CS/FCI118011220/Ksd3n2
serommeonson wossorcosssr o oo | [TINIINNIN
Code: FCI2
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SH 7T4B8M Veh. Inspected SHD 8805P
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No., D19004098MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 25/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Mode! REMAULT LATITUDE (A) c.C 1885
Engine Ne. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. VF1ABL1SAUC277404 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 643323 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification NIL
General GoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R18 GIm 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/60R16 GITI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI B mm
4. i Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QIS FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. | General Information
Accident Date 21/06/2018 Inspection Date 26/06/2019
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
ND.2 ANG MO KID ST B3
SINGAPORE 568111
Sa. ! Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ASWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. . Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




Rleg, No: 189607198R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusirisl Park, Singapaore 408833

TEL: 6258 3551 FAX 5255 4315

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 8305P

ay|

— P T L e e

-

e A e

- P A T |

e I T

BUMPER COVER FRT

BUMPER SPOILER FRT
BUMPER ABSORBER FRT
BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH
BUMPER SUPPORT FRT
BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT
BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT
BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH
BUMPER BEAM FRT

HEADLAMP RH
HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH

FENDER PANEL FRT RH
WHEELARCH FRT RH
FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH
FENDER INSULATOR RH

TOW COVER FRT

FRONT BRACE PANEL

RADIATOR GRILLE

RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL
FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET

BONNET

BONNET INSULATOR
BONNET STRUT LH
BONNET STRUT RH
BONMNET HINGE LH

RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE "RENALLT"

SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

SERVICEABLE

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

BENT

SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE

TO REPAIR SEE
LABQOUR

SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

Report Rel No. CS/FCI19011220/Ksd3n2

1rraz2

1.707.78
225.36
1.353.75
615.90
Ba.TD

1.841.63

40573
a8.81
B88.61

34BN




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg No 199607188R GST Reg Mo 19-9807188-R

ay| ption of Parts. [ption) |
1|BONNET HINGE RH TO REPAIR SEE

LABOUR
1|BONNET LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 30548 -

LABOUR
1|BONNET CABLE SERVICEABLE 118.19 .
1|BONNET CABLE COVER SERVICEABLE 1681.03 .
1|BONNET SEAL OUTER SERVICEABLE 92.36 -
1|BONNET SEAL INNER SERVICEABLE 157.28 -
1|DOOR PANEL FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 2,844 86 -

LABOUR
1|DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH SERVICEABLE 1,483.40 -
1|DOOR MIRROR GLASS RH SERVICEABLE 148.20 -
1|DOCR MIRROR BACK COVER RH SERVICEABLE 21846 .
1|WIPER RESERVOQIR MOTOR SERVICEABLE 270,06 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR SERVICEABLE 348.25 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR NECK SERVICEABLE 136.11 -
1|DOOR HARNESS WIRE RH SERVICEABLE 2. 670,00 ~
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,288.20 -78.38
20,602.83 T05.45

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|FRONT DOOR STICKER “TRANS-CAB" (SN} NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "CLASSIC" (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 15.00
1|BUMPER CLIP FRT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 66.00 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.50 -
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 69.00 -
1|SET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.00 -
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMEL NUT [SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 30.50 .
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 300,00 =
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM (SN} SERVICEABLE 3a0.00 -
1|SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN) SERVICEABLE a0.00 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW (SN) SERVICEABLE 16.00 =
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1]|SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 25380 3
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
B|BONNET INSULATOR CLIP L70Y (SN} NOT NECESSARY 7.30 -
2|BONNET STRUT L70Y (SN) SERVICEABLE 8861 2
2|BONNET CABLE CLIP LTOY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 6.31 -
2|BONNET CABLE COVER SCREW LT0Y (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.85 -
1,882 87 75.00
LABOUR
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 8,000.00 440.00
PORTION.
PAMEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 8,000.00 200.00
WECESSARY PORTION REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF BUMPER BEAM FRT HEADLAMP PANEL
FRT ARH,FRONT BRACE PANEL FRAME FULL SUPPORT
PAMEL FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET BONNET
HINGE LH,BONNET HINGE RH BONNET LOCK AND DOOR
PANEL FRT RH.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS 170.00 3000
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT WINDSCREEN FITTINGS AND |NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
CONDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220,00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 B
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS TRIMINGS GARNISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER.TO ENABLE REPAIR.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT DOOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST,
TO TRANSFER OF TIRERIM AND ON WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 .
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I Condition | Estimate By [ Our Adjusted
TO TRANSFER OF BONNET FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 B
PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. 170.00 20.00
LABOUR CHARGE TO MOUNT AND DISMOUNT VEHICLE |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 E
ON JIG BENCH.TO FACILITATE REPAIR
TO APPLY PAINT PROTECTION SYSTEM (PPS) MAINTAIN |[NOT NECESSARY 380.00 B
AND ENHANCEMENT
15,560.00 B90.00
GRAND TOTAL 38.045.70 1,470.45
1,200.00

IENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
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