Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: April 13,2020 4:26 PM

To: ‘TeamAuto Pro'

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SLR 423B / LKK ref: CC4/ASM19011217/Bwb3 / Accident involving SLH
4247U & SLR 423B on 22/06/2019

Attachments: Doc_SLR 423B.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary action: -
e Original Repair Tax Invoice.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Note: We are are on Work From Home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. All submission of claim related documents and information
shall be in softcopy."

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TeamAuto Pro [mailto:teamautoffice@gmail.com]

Sent: April 13,2020 11:01 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your ref: SLR 423B / LKK ref: CC4/ASM19011217/Bwb3 / Accident involving SLH 4247U & SLR 423B on
22/06/2019

Dear Jasper,

Without Prejudice




For the sake of our amicable relationship, we are ready to accept PD offer of $10,600.00 (all-in)

Kindly forward us your DV for our further necessary.

Meanwhile, do take care, stay well and stay safe. Cheers.

Note: Our client's acceptance of your offer is strictly on a without admission to liability basis and solely for our client's claim for
Property Damage and not prejudicial to any other claims arising from the same accident.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Wed, Apr 8, 2020 at 2:00 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Refer to the above matter

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $10,600.0(all-in).

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Note: We are are on Work From Home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. All submission of claim related documents and
information shall be in softcopy."

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



