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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 10:59 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG
Attachments: GBF4609M DV.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Enclosed signed discharge voucher with company stamp for your reference. 
 
*** Please kindly highlight to AIG, payment under "Chew Motor Pte Ltd" *** 
 
 
*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  
 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
 
Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  
Blk A #01-11 Autobay  
Singapore 417883 
T : 6747 9241 
F : 6741 7276 
 
 
 
On Fri, Sep 13, 2019 at 10:34 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

 We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>  
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 10:20 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Khanchna 

  

Thanks for your revise offer with attachment of Discharge voucher. 

  

We found out there was typo error of the company name, this claim is under Chew Motor Pte Ltd instead of New Hock 
Teck Motor Pte Ltd. 

  

Please kindly amend and re-email,thanks. 

  

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  

 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
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Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 

  

  

  

On Fri, Sep 13, 2019 at 9:30 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We confirm settlement as follows: 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,675.00 
2. Loss of Use (6 days x $ 80) $  480.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $      7.45 
Total $ 3,162.45 

 We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>  
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 8:49 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Khanchna 

  

Surveyor Adrian will inform you regarding the repair day,thanks. 

  

  

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  

 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  

  

Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 
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On Thu, Sep 12, 2019 at 5:49 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sukyi, 

  

According to the marked estimate (as attached), COR repair days recommended by our surveyor was 4 days.  

  

Please let us have the revised estimate (if any) to enable us to review. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 5:42 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Khanchna 
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Thanks for your offer. 

  

Cor + Lta ok. 

  

For loss of use we would like to counter propose as 6 days instead of 4 days as your surveyor recommended as 5 
working days and there was 1 weekends. 

  

We are asking:- 

  

Cost of Repair : $ 2,675.00 (w/gst) 

  

Loss of Use    : $ 480.00 ($80 x 6 days) 

  

Lta Search     : $    7.45 

  

Total              : $ 3,162.45 

  

Please kindly consider our appeal and revert. 

  

Hope to heard from you soon,thanks. 

  

  

  

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  

 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
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Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 

  

  

  

On Thu, Sep 12, 2019 at 3:53 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,675.00 
2. Loss of Use (4 days x $ 80) $  320.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $      7.45 
Total $ 3,002.45 

 Please confirm acceptance. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 11:29 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG 

  

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  

  

Hi Khanchna 

  

Refer our email dd05.09.19 there was no reply from you. 

  

Please advice your offer and revert,thanks. 

  

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  

 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  

  

Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 



9

  

  

  

On Thu, Sep 5, 2019 at 9:20 AM Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Khanchna 

  

Please advice your offer and revert,thanks. 

  

  

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  

 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  

  

Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 

  

  

  

On Fri, Aug 23, 2019 at 9:43 AM Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Dear Sir / Madam, 

 
Thank you for your email. 
  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  
Please note that: - 

 
LKK ref Officer in charge   
CC6/AIG19011198/Akb3 Khanchna  

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 4:38 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG 

  

*Without Prejudice* 
 
Dear Motor Claims Department, 
 
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference. 
Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon.  
Thank you. 

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*  
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Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  

  

Chew Motor Pte Ltd  
(GST Registration No.: 201718369R) 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6  

Blk A #01-11 Autobay  

Singapore 417883 

T : 6747 9241 

F : 6741 7276 

  


