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CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & Bk A #01-11 Autobay@Kaki Bukil Singapore 4| TEE3

Tel 6509 5545 Fan 6508 5567
== Wetnite www Chewmoldr com
~ grnunucﬂnmlwmr No. 201718369R GST Reg Mo 201 Tl!:l!g?uﬁ!mu
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#0143
Singapore 417883 10 A
e '!-LL" Al
Accident date: 25/06/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: GBF4609M TOYOTA HIACE DX 3.0 "16
CHASSIS NO: KDH2010203667
S/N QTY ITEMS U/PRICE AMOUNT
1 1 Front R/H Door ﬁtb—_-!‘ $1,217.45
2 1 Front R/H Door Sticker /. $35.00 -
3 1 Front R/H Door Pillar Outer Rakd $631.4
4 1 FrontR/HHubCap M v $180.00°
5 1 R/H Center Sliding Door Le.jed $1,712.10
(] 1 Rear R/H Fender © . r 51,712.45 -~
7 1 Rear R/H Hub Cap L7 $180.60 (ol
217450 S-A (O
178267 Subtotal :- $5,668.40
Labour charges
To check wheel alignment computer 51_;&4:‘-6 Ju
LK Autg Cansyltants hence nolify
| th foliowing: 3
To check wiring !:mhi‘":'m““j_ 51M 3o
o To Sasay Saraged LAY 2NN ey
w F b ol
Tuff kate  Thot ity Sty 6 Wb Pt b $150.00~
& by e mois atand 1) 4 slowed
Panel beating v e Uiy i ot 8 310 1,000 §50
Spray painting Sqranse: & 51,8 fvo
_ g W
Subtotal:- 53,200.00
Total:- 58,868.40
“\ doCd 333%7
= r../ [ 25K .
o4v
2 ‘; Vere
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Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43
Singapore 417883
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CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Bl & #01-11 AutobavEPKak Busit Singapore 417853
Fax G500 5567
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Accident date: 25/06/2019

Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: GBF4609M TOYOTA HIACE DX 3.0 '16

CHASSIS NO: KDH2010203667

S/N QTY ITEMS U/PRICE AMOUNT
1 1  Front R/H Door ¢+ -« $1,217.45~
2 1 Front R/H Door Sticker $35.00 -
3 1  Front R/H Door Pillar Outer Jedked $631.40
q 1 Front R/H Hub Cap  »+¥ e $180.00*
5 1 R/H Center Sliding Doar e it $1,712.10 ~~
6 1 Rear R/H Fender 51,712.45 ~
7 1 Rear R/H Hub Cap 2 $180.80 [
2318 50 Lo TR {5
179387 Subtotal :- $5,668.40
Labour charges
To check wheel alignment computer $1;D:0fl 40
LIK Autg Cangliants hence nofify
To check wiring e e o g 51000 2o
o To Sipady Samajit BN} D0NG MY
&k & w1 i coed et s
Tuff kote Pty S ¢ oo i P 2 $150.00~
* M el rocsfe Ah0mY | 8 SCwed
Panel beating o o et Camyory I3)0 51,990.’65 o0
e Ak rupwipages by Aepoie "
Spray painting Sgraun; Sl.Eﬂ}:ﬂﬂ bt
Dot
Subtotal:- $3,200.00
Tﬂ'tii.- 53.35&.40
Aol 313387
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PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

lof

" Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type
Owner 10,
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No
Wehicke 1o be Exported:
Intended Dereglstration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Wirhicle Maode|
Primary Colour
Manutacturmg Year:
Engine Mo
Chassls Ma:
Manimum Power Output;
Open Markat Vilue
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
POP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount
Total Rebate Amount:

Limited Liability Partnership
17724

GBF440FM

o

24 Jun 2019

TOYOTA

HIACE DX 3.0 MANLIAL
Silver

2016

1KD2642122
KDH20102036467

$32528.00
03 Nov 2016
03 Nav 2016
o

£142700

Ne

$000

02 Nov 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

£43517.00
$£32018.00
$32,018.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jlun 2019

OK

htips: vel aagovsg Mavrl sction enguireRebateByPublicHelore.

2406720109, 2:03 pn



Khanchna !LKI{ Al.rtn! T R—

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 9:31 AM
To: Chew Motor Pte. Lid
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMFB8248 DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG
Attachments: AIG DV.pdf
Chew Motor Fie. Lid
Adrmin A
Meikbwan@lkkauto com Delivered 13/9/2019 931 AM
shupei@|kkauto com Delivered 13/9/2019 931 AM
olivialau@@kkauto com Delivered. 13/3/2019 331 AM

Withaut Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matier.

We confirm settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair [w/GS5T) $2.675.00
2. Loss of Use |6 days x § 80) 3 480.00
3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.45
Total 5$3,162.45

wWe attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. Na admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materlally affect/influence on the lssues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna®@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmaotaor.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 B:49 AM



Khanchna SLKK Autn! S —

From: Chew Motor Pte, Ltd. <claims@chewmaotor.com:

Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 8:49 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc Admin A; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23,06.19 CPL AlG

Without Prejudice
Hi Khanchna

Surveyor Adrian will inform you regarding the repair day,thanks.

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*
Regards,
Sukyi Chong

Chew Motor Pte Litd
|GST Registration Mo.: 20171836%R)

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
Blk A #01-11 Aulobay
Singapore 417883

T: 6747 9241
F:6741 7276

On Thu, Sep 12, 2019 at 5:49 PM Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sukyi,

According to the marked estimate |as attached), COR repair days recommended by our surveyor was 4 days.

Please let us have the revised estimate (if any) to enable us to review.

Thank you.



M

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 3:54 PM
To: Chew Motor Pte. Lid.
Cc Admin A
Subject: RE: FW: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMFB824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AlG
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Chew Motor Pte. Lid
Admin A
Meibwan@kkauto com Delivered: 12/9/2019 3:54 PM
shupe @lkkauto.com Delivered: 12/9/2019 3:54 PM
alivislau@Ikkauto.com Delivered: 12/9/2019 3:54 PM

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose setllement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $2.675.00
2. Loss of Use (4 days x $ B0) $ 32000
3. LTA Search Fee $ 745
Total 53,002.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 11:29 AM
To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com:



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: GBF4A609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DDA 23.06.19 CPL AIG

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Khanchna

Refer our email dd05.09.19 there was no reply from you.

Please advice your offer and revert,thanks.

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*
Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Chew Motor Pte Litd
(GST Registration Mo,: 2017183698

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
Blk A #01-11 Autobay
Singapore 417883

T: 6747 9241
F:67417276

On Thu, Sep 5, 2019 at 9:20 AM Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Khanchna

Please advice your offer and revert, thanks.

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.®
Regards,
Sukyi Chong

Chew Motor Pte Lid

(GST Registration Mo.: 201718369R)
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk A #01-11 Autobay
Singapore 417883

T: 6747 9241
F:67417276

On Fri, Aug 23, 2019 at 9:43 AM Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupel@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CCA/AIG19011198/Akb3 Khanchna

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupeif@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(403933)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <clai motor.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 4:38 PM
To: Admin A <admin- kkauto. >

Subject: GBF4609M CLAIMING SMF8824B DOA 23.06.19 CPL AIG

*Without Prejudice*

Dear Motor Claims Department,

Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference.

Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon.

Thank you.

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.*

Regards,

Sukyi Chong



Chew Motor Pte Lid
{GST Registration No.: 201T18369R)

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
Blk A #01-11 Autobay
Singapore 417883

T: 6747 8241

F: 67417276



Our Reference :  CM1908-0116 / GBF4609M
Your Reference ¢ SMFBB24B

20 AUGUST 2015

1]

Motor

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Bullding CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD
78 Shenton Way #07-16
Singapore 079120

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam

T 1 ING GB M MFBE24B ON 23.06. NG UPPER SERAN ROAD
TOW. Pl EA

We are Instructed by LIVESTAGE SHOWBIZ PRODUCTIONS LLP to claim damages and losses against you
in connection with the above-captioned road traffic accident which our client’s vehicle GBF4609M
damaged by vehicle SMF8824E driven by your insured at the material time.,

We are informed that the said accident was caused by your insured’s negligence. As a result of the
accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expenses, particulars
of which are as follows: -

# Repair Costs (7% G5T) 5 2,675.00
# Loss of Use for 06 days (5 + 1 weekend) 5 600.00
» LTAFees s 245
» Total 5 3,282.45

A copy of each supporting documents are enclosed for your perusal,

7 GIARepornt
¥ Invoice
¥ LTA Search Recelpt

Please let us have your cheque for the sum of $3,282.45 made payable to us, CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.
within the next 14 days.

Yours Sincere hr/

il

CHEW'! MDT#TE. LTD.




T L o

B dm BA B Pre i

S1 UBLAVE 1, #01:25 PAYA UHI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (045) 62363560 FAX : D65 62504315

Our Rel: CCO/AIG19011198/Akb3

02 SEPTEMBER 2019

YOKE MENG KIM

290B BUKIT BATOK ST 24
#05-73

SINGAPORE 653290

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 4609M & SMF 8824B |AIG| ON 23/06/2019 ALONG/AT
UPPER SERANGOON ROAD TWDS CTE

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your pohcy.

We have received a claim from GBF 4609M against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, 1if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further quenies.

Yours fathfully,
Rbhanchna

Case Handler
DID: 6841-2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com

ce  AlG Asia Pacific fnsurance Pre Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

Chew Motor Pte Lid
Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Blk | #01-11
Singapore 417883

Dear Sir,

Accident on 2;/0 Uzﬂfq 0?35
Eavelvieg Vidiides GBFUi0%  CUF PPYA.

Aloug _Upp Seravpoon pol fwap PIE(Tud)

I'We, the registered owner/dnver of velucle registration no: ﬁgpF cf‘ 0 ?M

have involved in the above accident.

I'We hereby authorize Chew Motor Pte Ltd to commence repairs of the said vehicle forthwith.

I'We agree to assign the whnl: proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third pary claim to vou and our
solicitor, , to act on my/our behalf in respect of the
above matter. And if applicable. my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to
pay the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and
¢lient basis.

I'We undenake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors 1o ensure that claim is successful.

I'We also authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.

Yours truly,

M

Owner's Si;nnml':
(Company's stamp if applicable)

Name:
NRIC No.:
Date:




Assignment

To: Chew Motor Pte Ltd (Workshap)

[n consideration for your agreement 10 repair my motor vehicle registration no. GEF (/‘a ?"
and 10 defer demanding for payment of the cost of repair, I'we the undersigned do hereby
irrevocably assign absolutely 1o you all the proceeds of my/our claim(s) including damages, interest.
costs and expenses (including legal costs / disbursements payable on a party and party basis which

are 1o be paid to the parties so entitled including solicitors, vehicle appraisers and other experts /
consultants),

UWe further confirm that payment to you only or to any person authorised by you to receive
payment shall constitute a good and effectual discharge of the obligations by any party of the
aforesaid proceeds of my/our claim(s).

I/'We authorise you expressly to give notice of this assignment to the party concermned.

I/'We confirm that by this assignment, [/we shall not be entitled in law to receive any payment. If &
cheque is sent to mefus, I'we shall return same to the sender as 'we am/are precluded from
accepting any payment.

Dated this 2“ day of 0‘ 0 19

Signature : i
Name : & = rx
1D No. - IBURRANE S
Address :

Witness Signature

Witncss Name D R o
Wi D : Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapore 5;15;333
Witness Address . Email: claims@chewmotor.com

L s sueeenn



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l. CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect 1o the amount claimed for

§§2,675.00(Repair Cost), SS480.00(Loss of UsefRemtal), SS7.45(Disbursement) for vehicle no.
GBF4609M that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 23/06/2019 (date) along

UPPER SERANGOON ROAD TWDS CTE(location) involving vehicle no/s SMF8824B. This is
pursuant to the inspection conducted on 24/06/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LIVESTAGE OWBIZ
PRODUCTIONS LLP(the third party claimant”) of vehicle no. GBF4609M make the claim as set
out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a
manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party
claimamt”™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third parny
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant 1o the
damage to GBF4609M(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this H’ (day) of t'.lq {month) Iﬂﬁ_ {year)

o,

('f LKK ) )
AN/ LWP -
Signed by a ointed surveyor Signed by "ib]: wurk.-.hr}p“ twim:hnp}




CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk A #01-11 Autobay@Kakl Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 6509 5545 Fax: 6509 5567

% M ato r Website: www.chewmator.com
Registration No.: 201718369R GST Reg No.: 20171B369R

TAX INVOICE

AIG ASIA Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Invoice No : CPI1908-0116
78 Shenton Way, Date : 20-Aug-19
AIG Bulliding, #09-16
Singapore 079120 Date of Accident : 23-Jun-19
Vehicle No. : GBF4609M
Client: LIVESTAGE SHOWBIZ Model Type : Toyota Hiace
PRODUCTIONS LLP
Descriptions Amount
Lump Sum Repalr Cost 2,500.00
GST 7% : 175.00
Total [ : 2,675.00

(SGD) Dollars: TWO THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED AND SEVENTY-FIVE ONLY




Recepl https://villtn. gov.sg/Ita/vrlachon/completePayment’FUNCTIO. .

> Back to OneMotoring

JTil |r;|I1\EI1Ir| Mty

Land Transpor Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701
GST Registralion No. : M4-0006528-2
Print Date/Time : 24 Jun 2019 / 14:00:48

Receipt Date/Time : 24 Jun 2019/ 14:00:48

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Recaipt Mo, ; ITNET-00000-180624-001851
Previous Receipt No.
SIN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount

Business Transaction Refarence Before Amount After GST
No. GST (5§) (55) (S%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMFBB248

As al 23 Jun 2019/09:35:00

Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE FTE. LTD.
i Insurance Enguiry - SMFBE248

( Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.48
20190624135852328070
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 T7.48
Total Bafors Rounding 7.00 0.49 T.49
Rounding Differance 0.0
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
Direct Debit aNETS Debil
201890824 140006806 i Ba ) T.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0,00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amoum 0,00
( THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all paymenis to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider | financlal institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt Is considered vold and late fee
may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

lofl 24/672019, 2:01 pm
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING !
" Cass stifle Est Subimittad | Adj Assignad Adj Apt Ad} Submitied | Ins Auth'ed Status
26 Jun 2019 g{.‘ﬂ" ane 5%$2,500.00 $$2,500.00 m i
Masn Eit Rmg Eafit Actj W l Exht Egtirnates | '.I'hlul.:tl wml

Clalm Detalls

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]

Insured: YOKE MENG KIM, [D: 514915764
cm.u- LIVESTAGE SHOWRIZ PRODUCTIONS LLP, Co. Reg. Moo TISLLITSIA
Vehicle Reg. | 23yo6/2019 0600 - 159
Mo.: GBF4G609M Date of Loss: | 134 Manths and 20 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: |TP / 073573375756 PONCY/COVE | 1800142700 (Comprenensive)
Vehicle Reg.
Mo, SMFES248 mﬁ}: 5095523493-01
(Insured):
Extegs:
Arpairer: Chew Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) No 1 Kaki Bulkit Ave &, #01-11/41, AutobeyKaki Bukit, 41 TEED Kakl Bukit - Tel: 67479241 [ 65095545
Handur |A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel. 65-6415-3000 .. [Handied by MdMoor, Nerslah] Norsiah MdNoor §aig.com
f:w“:'" NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel:
Adjuster LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) - Tell 6256-3561  [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 04/07/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wimw Al | Compose Case Mall j
There are no mall for this case,

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= wiew Al | Sewrch Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Ansigned By Complated On Creatod On Done?
Mo results,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 25/9/2019
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Claim Documents

*GBF4609M (07357337575G)
[SMFB8B248]
TP

LIVESTAGE SHOWBIZ PRODUCTIONS LLP
Jun 23 2019 9:00AM
[YOKE MENG KIM]
Chew Motor Pte Ltd

wml wml Wﬂmlﬂmi wll'ﬂll" wml “"
Video [iperpage  [~] M4 |
(Na |Finalized On ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail | Print
t  |1a/o7/19 13:48 :’:':n'wm i SO o I 0 | Lsadavi
2 |wpznoinas  |VMdeo-Acadent e PR p— L
Letters/ Correspondences [1 e [~]
|Ho | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ} Thumbsnall | Print
1 |{Draf) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breskdown [ NIET
| Photos/Images [1perpege TV]| 64
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (W) Thumbnail Print
1 |28/08/19 10:28 | Ganeral View 0 | tosaes |
2 | 28/0B/19 10:28 | Geners] View O | s | &
3 |28/08/19 10:28 Ganeral View 0| toodirc | B4
s |2mom1010:38 | General View 0| teadies | B4
5 |78/08/1910:38 | General View O | cadwc | A
6 |ZA/06/19 10:28 | General View 0| odes | B
7 |28/08/19 10:28 | General View 0 s | M
B | 28/06/19 10:28 | General View 0| oodws | A
o |28/08/10 10:38 | General View Load ps | B
10 |28/08/19 10:38 | General View 0| s
Il |28/06/19 10:268 | Ganeral View 0 | lesdirc | A
12 |28/06/19 10:28 | General View O | wears |
13 |28/08/19 10:28 | General View O cavc | A
14 |28/08019 10:28 | General View 0 | loodies | B
15 |28/08/19 10:28 | General View 0| tesdirc | B4
16 |28/08/19 10:28 | Genersl View @ | wadies | B4
17 |28/08719 10:28 General View ﬁ Load 106 m
18 |28/08/19 10:28 | Genersl View 0| woedws | A
19 | 28/00/10 10:28 General Yiew i Lond 176 | B
20 |28/08/19 10:38 | Genersl View 0| waws | 4
21 |28/08/19 10:28 Genaral View 0 | lcediec | M
22 |28/08/19 10:28 General View @ | aarwc | M
231 |28/08/19 10:28 General View 0| toedrs | B4
24 [20/06/19 10:28 | Genersl View O | wavs | A
25 |28/08/19 10:28 Ganeral View 0| edips | M
16 | I8/08/19 10:78 General View ﬁ Load PG | B |
27 |26/06/19 10:28 General View g_ | Load PG (%)
28 |28/D8/19 10:28 | Genersl View @ | woaws | &
25 |28/00/18 10:28 | General View @ | ledirc | A
0 |2WON/19 10:38 | Genaral View 0| ledtrs | B
31 |28/08/19 10:38 | General View 0| cadws | B
37 |28/08/19 10:28 | General View @ | adrws | 4
33 [28/08/19 10:28 | General View @ | weaws |
34 [28/08/19 10:28 | Genaral View 0| e | A

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 25/9/2019
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Video {1 por %]
Na | Firalized On | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd. (5G] | Thumbnall | Print
Documentation 1 per page <] &
Mo |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lta (HG) Thumbmall | Print
1 |2%/06/1917:05 | TP GIA REPORY @) | Load POF
2 |o/me/1915:115 | LETTER TD O Load POF
3 [42/09/19 09:34 | MARKED TP ESTIMATE Load PDF
4 |26/09/19 11:00 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
|5 |259/09/1911:00 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
6 | I5709/19 11:00 Raleass Voucher Load POF
7 |25/09/19 11:00 | LYA SEARCH Load FOF
B | 25/09/19 11:00 Lon Load POF
Ne |Finalisad On ALG Asin Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd, [SG) Thumbinall | Print
1 |76/06/1% 09:57 |01 GIA REPORT Load PO

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST weset | Save | oot |
There are no document checkiists configured.

= Pie Lid )

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
Motk B@marky @ privat smiies you Bhoe & fo alhies paimisi.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fusecaction=dsp_... 25/9/2019
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
['u"nhlcln No: SMFBB24B (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA HIACE 2.0 (M)
GBF4603M (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 23/06/2019

Global Sum Settiement | - | | ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 'S 9,489.19
Final Repair Cost $ 2,675.00
Loss of Use s 480.00 8.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) $ 0.00 days
LTA /| GIA Search Fea .5 7.45
Others: - 0.00
£
Final Settlemant Sum 5 318245

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
balow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agresd Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable; Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability; (%) Assessed Liability (*); (%e)
* Assessed Liability to be fitlad only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

11 | Chew Motor Pte Ltd s 3,162.45
2) $
3 ;5
25 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invelce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Raport!/ Bill {if any)

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1sssoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 5256-2561 Fax; 6844-8B05 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCE/AIG18011188/AKB30Q2

Date: 25082018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Palicy No: 1800142700
Clalmant §
Vehicle No : GBEF4608M Insured Vehicle No : SMFBEZ24B
Date of Loss: 23/06/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 0735733757506
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBF4609M
Make & Model: TOYOTA HIACE, 2.0 (M) Engine No: 1KD2642122
Reg. Date: 03/11/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: KDH2010203667
Colour: Silver Odometer, 124347 km
Engine Capacity 2082 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S3$): Market Value/New Car Price
10N OF I AT TH M E
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable), Yes Footbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accidenl Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 5 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 5 mm
Froni Right Side: Yokohama 5 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 5 mm
The above wplues represani the remsrnng Dre reads depmn
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer’s  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 5,668.40 1,843.87 3,824.53 67 47
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.200.00 1.310.00 1,880.00 59.08
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) B,866.40 3,153.87 5,714.53 64.44
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 2,500.00
(S9) 8,868.40 2,500.00 6,368 .40 71.81
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 620.78 175.00 44579 T1.81
MNett Amount (S§) 9,489.19 2,675.00 6,814.19 T1.81
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x 5580.00/day) (S%) 480.00
+ Doc/Search Fea (S5) 745
Nett Liability (SS) 3,162.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 24/06/2018
Date Inspected: 24/06/2019 Inspected At Chew Motor Pte Ltd (HQ)
Mo 1 Kaki Bukil Ave 5, #01-11/41,
Autobay(@HKaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This reporf represents our findings af the lime and place of ingpection staled hemin, Such inspection hag been camed ouf ko the best of our
knowiedpe and abilly bul any other labily wader any cther circumatances (s baraby sxpressly seciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fuscbox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT R/H DOOR Repair 1,217 45F “~FL
2 1 *FRONT R/H DOOR STICKER Necessary 3500F *35.00FL
3 1 *FRONT R/H DOOR PILLAR OUTER Dented B631.40F *63140FL
4 1 *FRONT R/H HUB CAP Not Necessary 180.00F "-FL
5 1 *R/H CENTER SLIDING DOOR Dented 1,712.10F *1,712.10FL
6 1 *REAR R/H FENDER Repair 1.71245F *-FL
7 1 *REAR R/H HUB CAP Cut 180.00FS *60.00FS
F=Franchise part S=Spcett. L=LinthemDise
Sub Total (S§) 5,668.40 2,438.50
- List em Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (S5) 0.00 504 B3
Total Parts (S%) 5,668.40 1,843.87

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscallaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT COMPUTER New 150.00 80.00
2 TOCHECK WIRING New 100.00 30.00
3  TUFF KOTE Mew 150.00 0.00
4  PANEL BEATING MNew 1,000.00 500.00
5  SPRAY PAINTING New 1.800.00 700.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,200.00 1.310.00
f Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019



