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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

e~ v L

REPAIR ESTIMATE ! 24/6/2019 9:31
VEHICLE NO : SH 9675B
MAKE :
MODEL : TOYOTA PRIUS
PARTS DESCRIPTION QATY | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
FRONT DOOR GLASS (RH) e $ 313.60
FRONT DOOR OUTER MOULDING A~ $ 188.60
MIRROR ASSY, OUTER REAR VIEW, RH «— 5 1,390.10
COVER, OUTER MIRROR,RH ¢ $ 141.90
OUTER MIRROR, RH = s 212.80
SUB TOTAL 5 2,247.00
LESS 25% -] 561.75
DISCOUNTED TOTAL -] 1.685.25
LABOUR CHARGE ot
Panel Beating $ Mﬁ
Spray Painting Charge $ J"M [
Wiring Charge $ ,.QWU'E.
TOTAL LABOUR $ 250.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 1,935.25
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/ 47

pr

ph ot p”

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.
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S| LI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN : {65) 62504315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3
27 June, 2019

Khoo Seng Khong

867 Woodlands Street 83 #09-325
Singapore 730867

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME 1905C AND SH 96758 ON 22/06/2019 ALONG/
AT T3 TAXI1

We, LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid has been appointed to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location,

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your
Centificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & elc
would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

Ty

Khanchna
Claims

Tel : 6841 2360
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : Khanchna @ lkkauto.com

e, Claims Manager
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Maotor Claims Dept)



Khanchna !LI(I{ Autn!

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 5:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: MVA BETWEEN SME 1905C [OI] & SH 96758 (TP) ON 22/6/2019
Dear Khanchna,

Our principal's hirer had verbally confirmed that he was not injured and will not be making any Bl claims. We
can't give assurance as settlement will be strictly for property damage claims only when matter has been
resolved with us. Hope this clarifies.

Kindly let us have your proposal urgently. Thank you.

Best Regards

Kazali Hj Selahudin

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:13 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin

Cc: Admin A

Subject: MVA BETWEEN SME 1905C [O1) & SH 96758 (TP) ON 22/6/2019

YOUR REF: SH 96758
OUR REF: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Mr. Kazali,
The above matter refers.

We would like to check on whether there is any bodily injury claim or not as our Insured would
like to consider private settlement.

Appreciate your reply,
Thank you,

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

1



Khanchna !Llf.l{ nutaz

To: elijahcheang@gmail.com

Cc: Carissa Lee-Khoo

Subject: RE: Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3 [PRIVATE SETTLEMENT] ACCIDENT BETWEEN
SME1905C & SH 96758 ON 22/6/2019

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED BY LKK SURVEYOR pdf

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3
Your Ref: SME1905C

Dear Mr, Elijah,

The above matter and our telephone conversation yesterday refers.

As requested, we attach herewith a copy of Third party's repair estimate which has been marked by our surveyor.
Please be informed that our surveyor has already surveyed the vehicle and the total repair estimate amount has been

reduced to $1,249.00 before GST.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 11:09 AM

To: Carissa Lee-Khoo <carissakhoo@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3 [PRIVATE SETTLEMENT] ACCIDENT BETWEEN SME1905C & SH 96758 ON
22/6/2019

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3
Your Ref: SME1905C

Dear Mr. Khoo Seng Khong /Ms, Carissa Khoo,
The above matter and e-mail as trailed refers.

Enclosed below is the breakdown of Third-Party's claim if you would like to settle the matter privately to protect the
NCD:

L Cost Repair (w/GST) 51,336.43
2, Loss of Rental (3 days x $125.40) $ 376.20
3 Loss of Income(3 days x $50) S 150.00
4, LTA Search Fee S 749

Total $1,870.12

5. LKK Professional Fee (w/GST) S 34240



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

e ———— e —————————————————ee e e ————————

From: Carissa Lee-Khoo <carissakhoo@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:27 FM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3

Hello Khanchal
Sure, my contact no. is 98200 639,

And the contact no. of the driver that day is Eulin Cheong 9760 9320. He will be the one laising directly with the taxi
driver/company.

Regards
Carissa

> 0n 10 Jul 2019, at 12:09 PM, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:
>

> Dear Carissa,

>

= The above matter and your e-mail as trailed refers.

>

> We are in the midst of checking with the Third party workshop agent as to whether there is any bodily injury claim or
not and we will revert promptly.

-

> In the interim, kindly let us have your contact number.

>

> Thank you.

>

> Best Regards,

> Khanchna| Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51,

> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

>

» —-Original Message—

> From: Carissa Lee-Khoo <carissakhoo@gmail.com>

> Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:01 PM

= To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: Re: Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3

>

> Hello Khanchna

>

> Following our conversation on the phone earlier, | would like to confirm that we would like to handle this incident as a
private settlement

>



> However, since the survey has been done and hence the survey fee incurred, may we obtain the results of the survey
as well so that we can proceed privately with the other party?

>

> Thank you

> Carissa

>

>

>

>> 0n 9 Jul 2019, at 6:45 PM, Carissa Lee-Khoo <carissakhoo@gmail.com> wrote:

>

>> Hello Khanchna

22

>= | received an accident claim with the above ref no. (in the subject). Our vehicle no. is SME 1905C. The letter was
dated 27 June and | know that the note stated that we had to get back to you 5 days after the letter. However, | just
opened our mail last night and so, I'm writing to ask for an extension to the deadline. | hope to get a favourable reply
and obtain a few more days to attend to this matter. Thank you.

>

»>> Regards

>> Carissa Khoo

>

>



HEUOB xsen e

kic ?.:_#M

GRaTEl2 (B[O FL |9
powzear Lk Auvto CemaurasTe P+ LTo BB Of BEA
? anusoouans 1 hves Howveol ovel q'ww’tl'rm SS 342 KO /=

»
Doz avel :‘-'-'-'":3 Coats m-:!.
CHRISTINE TED Y1 TING

LL000002e?7375»00 AKLSE3ERS 233

it UOB ~==~ oo

sl 2 g el | 9]

r:::HF{.-ﬂ‘.TPfLéslp {_M&ln{l:lhg& ?1_.'_! Lte WILL OF BEARLE
SS VA0 a2 fr

I WP
i

! e Dirs Thoutosd Eiﬂ—\ ﬂwﬂvgtl anal

1 EERE LL A

" S:»m\::" Tellave ovwal Toelve Cﬂ-\ﬁ ﬁ*’-j_
CHRISTINE TED ¥1 TING

&N

e el e s

12 00000 A 737500 KL5E 385233



PRIVATE SETTLEMENT

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R), workshop of motar vehicle SH
96758 hereby agree to accepl the sum of (S§1,870.12) as payment from the driver of the
motor vehicle SME 1905C, Cheong Eu Jin (911 595% T ) for the repair to the
damages and loss of use 1o the owner of the motor vehicle SH 96758 as a result of the
accident involving motor vehicle SME 1905C and SH 96758 on Wﬂﬂu‘ﬂﬁ along

Singapore Airport T3.

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R). workshop of motor vehicle SH
9675B heraby agree that there will be no further claim(s), including any personal injury
claims to the driver of motor vehicle SH 9675B at the time of the incident against the owner
and insurer of the molor vehicle SME 1805C for the above mentioned accident upan
accepling the amount of $51,870.12.

This agreement Is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispule arising oul of the same.

Dated this 6" (day) of August (month) 2018 (year),

Signad & chop by workshop of SH #6758 Signed by registered ownerdrver of vehesle SME 1805C

-




PRIVATE SETTLEMENT

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R), workshop of motor vehicle SH
96758 hereby agree to accept the sum of (5$1,870.12) as payment from the driver of the
motor vehicle SME 1905C, Cheong Eu Jin ( S 91/ 5965 T ) for the repair to the
damages and loss of use lo the owner of the motor vehicle SH 96758 asa result of the
accident involving motor vehicle SME 1905C and SH 96758 on 22/06/2019 along
Singapore Airport T3.

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R), workshop of motor vehicle SH
9675B hereby agree that there will be no further claim(s), Including any personal injury

claims to the driver of motor vehicle SH 96758 at the time of the incident against the owner
and insurer of the motor vehicle SME 1805C for the above mentioned accident upon
accepling the amount of $$1,870.12.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Couris have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 8" (day) of August (month) 2019 (year),

.
\&

Signad & chop by workihop of SH WEB\ Signed by registered owner/driver of vehicle SME 1905C

i







Khanchna,!l.lﬂ( Autn!

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 10:00 AM

To: ‘Carissa Lee-Khoo'

Ce: ‘Elijah Cheong'; Admin A; "Christine Teo'

Subject: RE: Ref CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3 [PRIVATE SETTLEMENT] ACCIDENT BETWEEN
SME1905C & SH 96758 ON 22/6/2019

Attachments: PRIVATE SETTLEMENT FORM . pdf; TP CHEQUE ACKNOWLEDGEMENT pdf

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3
Your Ref: SME1905C

Dear Ms. Carissa/ Mr. Elljah,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly be informed that we have already passed a copy of the cheque amounting to $1,870.12 to the Third party
repairer
and we attach herewith a copy of the acknowledgement and the private settlement form for your record purposes.

Kindly also take note that we have Informed your motor insurance company (AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.) to
reinstate your No Claim Discount (NCD) accordingly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna®@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 5:17 PM

To: Carissa Lee-Khoo <carissakhoo@gmail.com>

Cc: Elijah Cheong <elijahcheong@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Christine Teo
<curiouserfaith@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Ref: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3 [PRIVATE SETTLEMENT] ACCIDENT BETWEEN SME1905C & SH 96758 ON
22/6/2019

Qur Ref; CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3
Your Ref: SME1905C
Dear Mr, Elijah/ Ms. Carissa,

The above matter and our e-mail as trailed refers.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 3:54 AM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Cc Admin A

Subject: Ref TP / 977263991556 |[PRIVATE SETTLEMENT] ACCIDENT BETWEEN SME1905C (o0 &
SH 96758 ON 22/6/2019

Tracking: Recpient Delivery
Chan, Kian-Meng
Admin A
Meikwaniilkkauto com Deliversd: 22/8/2019 5:54 AM
alivialau@ kkauto com Delivered: 22/8/2019 5:54 AM
shupeiEkkauto com Delivered: 22/8/2019 9,54 AM

AIG REF: Ref: TP / 977263991556
LKK REF: CC4/AIG19011193/K1kb3

Dear Mr. Chan Kian Meng,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly be informed that the third party repairer has settled the matter
with our Insured driver via private settlement,

We have uploaded a copy of the private settlement form via Merimen for your record purposes and will close the file
accordingly,

In the interim, please assist to re-instate our Insured’s NCD accordingly.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




PRIVATE SETTLEMENT

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R), workshop of motor vehicle SH

96758 hereby agree o accept the sum of (S§1,870.12) as payment from the driver of the
motor vehicle SME 1905C, Cheong Eu Jin ( £911595% 1 ) for the repair 1o the
damages and loss of use to the owner of the motor vehicle SH 96758 asa result of the
acciden! involving molor vehicle SME 1905C and SH 96758 on 22/06/2019 along

Singapore Airport T3.

We/l, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (199303821R). workshop of motor vehicle SH
96758 heraby agree that there will be no further claim(s), including any personal injury
claims o the driver of motor vehicle SH 9675B at the time of the incident against the owner
and insurer of the motor vehicle SME 1905C for the above mentioned accident upon

accepling the amount of $§1,870.12.

This agreement Is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 6" (day) of Augusl (month) 2019 (year).

bLAMS DEPARIVENT

B LOTAEG DRIVE
Ah‘.’-i PORE \raned
b‘
1‘-\9”\
!

Signed & chop by workshop of su&m

The contams of 45 Gooument aply 10 venice damages only
A) persooal injuries and danages ansing Devetrom @ exciudes
from e ambit and aphcation of e documen’

FL G20 EAGWEESNG FIZ LT

-
Signed by rogislered awnerdriver of venicie SME 1905C

Please forward your cheque made payable 10.
COMPORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 11T



COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T 06128/ SH 56758 /KS(st)
Your Ref
Date 27-Jun-18

COGE Tax Claims Dept  “omfonfeiGn

AlIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD 58 Loyang Drive 4th Floor

AlIG Building Singapore 508965
78 Shenton Way
#07-16 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Singapore 079120
Attn : Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH 96758 YOUR INSURED SME1905C
AND OTHER ON 22.06.19

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of

motor Vehicle Mo SH 9675B which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the laxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us

to assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SME1905C
we are submitting these claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 133543

2 4 days Lossof Rental @ $ 12540 perday $ 50160

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 5 -

4 GIA/LTA Search Fees s 7.48

5§ GIA/ Police Report Fees $ .

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation N
SubTotal: § 184552

HIRER'S CLAIM
7 4 daysLossoflncome@ $ 8000 perdays 3 320.00

TotalClaims : § 218552

We enclose herewith the following docurments to support the claims: -
a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 8 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : SME1905C
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of SH 95758
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Pholograph's of Accident Scene { ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Wilness statement/s { x ) Downtima/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is 2 condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Kazali Hj Selahudin

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel - 6214 8736 Fax : 6214 Email : kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required
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COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

8 member o COMFORDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

2010004

ATG ASTA PACTFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

T8 SHENTON WAY AIG BUTTLDING #07-16

STRGAPORE SG& 0791720

CONTACT ND): 54193000

. Description : 3P 722.06.149

3225094

TAX INVOICE

ComiortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid

(TMPANY KHEG. N, @ 1949506045W

Paga: 1
VKRULE W) ANV, BO/IATR
8H S9b 15K Q1451705 26.08, 21149
MAKE JIIR W),
TOYO'A IN5305536
WKL, (HNMETER REALI NG

PRITE HYBRID{G4 )

NATE (0F HEG
07.09.2M7

(HASSIS COUR
TTDKRIM IXO3H63845

DATK/TIME N
A2.06.2019 16:35

8/No  Part No. gry Imir Price Wisc Nat
PART REQRITST'IION
0001  04-01-0302-0RSA PHIGA (XWRR OUTHR MIKROR | 141 _afi 5. 00 106.47
ki
0002 0401 =0302-0594 FHIGS MTHEROR ASEY (TR 1 1,.380.10 Z26.00 1.042. 578
AEAR VIEW HH
FLUHE=1TTAL 1.149. 00
JUOR NATIEE
o001 L PANKL. BEATING 800, 0 500 00
onoz2 I, SPRAY PAINTING CHARGHE B0, 0 50.00
. SHBR-TOAL 1000, (D
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A/membar of COMPORIDILCAD ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No
Head Office :
205 Braddell Road BOTOOD4 1451705
Singapare $T9701

Kindly hata that no recelpt shall ba ssued unless requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

4 mamber of CoMFoMDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

8010004

Al ASTA PACTFI(C INSURANCE PTE I'Th

T8 SHENTON WAY.ATG BUILDING #07-16
STHGAFORE 55 079120

CONTACT NO: s4193000 A225094

LF»F»!]FH'i by
=pair 1 CLSO/DT /5]
F:m:nf fTarm: /Cradit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre L
A mambar of COMMODINLCAD

Head Office
205 Bradde!l Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unkess mequested
CUSTOMER'S COPY

ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid

(YMPANY HEG, WO - 199506048W
TAX INVOICE Page: 2
VEHCLE N INV. RO/DATHE
OH 9R7HH 81451705 26.06.20149
MAK K JOH RO
TOYOITA 105305536
MK (HNMETER HEAL NG
PRIUS HYRRTN(G4 ) ) Cl
DATE (W Rk DATESTIME IN
07.09.2017 A2.06.2019 16:35
(HASS1R (1K
JTNKRIFUXD3ISRIR45
Itams total 1,749.00
Afd GSI' @ 7.000) % 87.43
iTvn1os amount 1.336.43

KATHERTNETAN 26,06.72019 12:02:17

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQO No

S1451705




Our Ref. CT18060567

Fomrort
Date: 26 June 2019 T ——

(

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 22/06/2019 @ 15:30hrs
ALONG AIRPORT T3 TAX| QUEUE
INVOLVING SME1906C

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHI6T5B (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to WEE KWEE CHIK IC NO
S01998792Z a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the matenal time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

setllement of claims with third party’s Insurance company In respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore STST1T Mainline +65 8555 1168 Facsimile <65 6453 3183
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CDG VARS V LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAE)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SH9675B , SME1905C ON 22-Jun-19 15:30
ALONG ATIRPORT T3 TAXI QUEUE

1/ We WEE KWEE CHIK [Hirar] MRIC No.: SXXXMB79Z

andfar (Raliaf) NRIC No,; SXXXX879Z

Taxi Number SH96758
heraby authorise ComfortDelGro Enginesring Fre Lid|CODGE):

1. Ta submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, |oss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. Ta have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim

against third party (except personal injunes and medical claims).

3. Ta sign Discharge Vouchar on my/aur behalf,

shall be farward directly to COGE in accordance with COGE's Instruction and made In favaur of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd",

4, To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the caim against third party and payment by cheque |

Date 23-Jun-2019
Name of Hirer WEE KWEE CHIK
Hirer NRIT SXXXX879Z Signature ; \V\
Addrass 9818 BUANGKOK CRESCENT #11-29
532981
Contact No. 97587963
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nsumnce Particulars Enguiry By Agents Detail hitpsevil b govasg v tonfinaPact Detil By AATFUNCTID...

Enquire Vehicle Insurance Details
Vehicle No.  Incident Date/Time Search Status  Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Name

SMELFOSC 22 Jun 20197 15:30:00 Successiul AD4 AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSLURANCE PTE LTD

Previous OK

d 2406 219, 5:01 am



