Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2019 11:21 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: skc812c

Hi Khanchna,

It's a 100% claim.
Thank you.

Best regards,
Amanda Ang
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From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: skc812c

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
OUR REF: CC3/A1G15015276/Kka3-1

Dear Amanda,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 812C & SHD 9035A ALONG PASIR RIS CAR PARK ON 30/08/2015

Thank you for the e-mail below.

We seek your kind assistance to also confirm the percentage of Liability for the claim.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 2:44 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: skc812c

Dear Khanchna,

Please find below for your kind attention.
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Best regards,
Amanda Ang
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.



