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ASSIGNMENT

-.-".'.\{'(.::u-«' 7&‘“‘* l - 1 (X4

From Date: Veh No: SLC IB‘DA ~ YrRegn: ?‘4(} | Ford
Estimated Cosl. ' Type?(df:—a?! M.Cycle [ Bus | Van [:\Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover /
0D (TR WS /TP RES | OD RES | EVA 1INV [ MV Truck | Trailer or -
To Iks-a/ecl Vehicle No L To A - Make: meﬂ(jﬂ% ?g@‘zr A% ce ! (KC)'{
at Workshop m/s Q\o‘u_Q 8 M | Colour B(,qu( AIC:  Insured/Std/NI/NA
of [8& WM‘W _  |SpReadng  2H q%% T/Radio: Insured  Std / NI/ NA
Insured Pict'\ - Eng/No: I
palcy N oo 00| et 2294 SSEY
Claims No N ) Gen. Cond: Good @ | Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured: Excess: Steering: | Jammed / Leaked | Burnt or
(Client's Record) ' . Brake: .r! Jammed / Leaked | Burnt or

Make of Veh: Modi:  Nil 4SIRIr | STD ARIm or

Tyre Size: B _})g u&’]_ -

(Palicy Condition) RB L 1 i
Remark: The veh had commenced its NiS | O/S | | BS/DUN/EXNOVA/GY/FS/LIZAIMIC/OHTSU/PIR/SUMI/
repair at the time of inspection, TOYO | YOKO or
Bal. or Market Value; Front
IDAC Accident Rport: - Consistpl_'ll?-:Ye-s or No - R!Bar ,é mm
GIA | PR Seem: . Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. - . mm
Est. Repairs: - days Res: Yes or No D.OA. 05 Gzi f‘f
Lum Sum: % 3Val: Yes or No Suwey held at - C -
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt / Rear / O/S / N/S | UIC | Rooftop or
vence WiouT | Peek mfS

Date: Person Contacted: . The UIC / Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due lo colision.

Date/ Time |  Action / Instruction

- — - —_ - —— e e

Date/Time, Fie Pass to? : Preli. Report Days Of Repair: 3
n\”{’ [ f U* Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: _ .. __-____ ‘Survey Fee: | 290
Date/Time. File Return (o7 | Transportation
2) Add Fee: ‘Site Insp  ($ )I_s +RS_ Sl

EI Interview ($__ )' Pholos B
Report Format : [ ] rech invs & )! Others
Lump Sum [1.B.1: (3 \QP(O\'- ) D:Weekend ($ )

TOTAL | @ i



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 10:01 AM

To: Vincent Seah

Cc: SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: SLC130A//GBH3280Y= DIRECT SETTLEMENT || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003674
Attachments: FW: SLC130A//GBH3280Y= DIRECT SETTLEMENT (1.35 MB)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Vincent
Liability is clear for direct settlement. We have copied LKK to arrange with you for the necessary survey.

Thanks and Regards

Sharon Ng, Assistant Manager | Claims, P&C | P. +65 6804 7845 | F. +65 6235 3354 | sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com

GREATAMERICAN
INSURANCE COMPANY Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190
M . Moody's Standard & Poor’s
3 g &t A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
3 ——— Published December 2018 Affirmed February 23, 2018
Uy ,;g A+ (Superior)

Affirmed August 17, 2018

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

From: Vincent Seah <vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, June 14, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: SLC130A//GBH3280Y= DIRECT SETTLEMENT || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003674
Importance: High

Morning Ms Ng

Above video attached for your action . your client change lane and hit into SLC130A REAR

Kindly revert liability

TKS

Vincent Seah
Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited



BodyCare & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel : 83320062 ( H/P ) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

From: Ng, Sharon [mailto:Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 1:51 PM

To: Vincent Seah <vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SLC130A//GBH3280Y= DIRECT SETTLEMENT | | Our ref: CLMOMVC000003674

Hi Vincent

As requested. We are still waiting for your client’s video.

SKETCH PLAN

| A\ | /

o b GRS
/}*}‘»ﬁ\q a0
A —

L R

DESCRIBE CIRCUMST ANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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M lpaceys A & o\l rEie . A 36sS
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AR G Swe EenmS _5‘!53’5 L LT Steianl
ek ST DGwi CANT To  mawe s efous
L MADY ey [>3% % 4 oA nRT __"D-(b-.ic..w'.‘ ol by ol

Regards
Sharon Ng
Great American

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

2



The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. I you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

——
From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 10:23 AM
To: 'vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg’
Subject: SLC 130A /TP / DOA: 3/6/2019

Dear Vincent,
Confirm final figure at $1,940/-, 3 Days.

Please submit your document to China Taiping directly.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



38 / Amx Mars Pte Lid - Bukit Meran
& TIME: Da/08/2018 0118

8Y: Sabitra Shangri Kanthirajan

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please rapont carrectly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process
2. This Farm must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possibie. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.
4. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of palicy liability on the part of the insurance companies

£. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

5. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this repart will, for a fee, be made avallable upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers. you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the repart being made available

aloresain

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

04/06/2019 01:19

03/06/2019 14:30

PIE TOWARDS CHANGI NEAR ADAM RD

SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fieet Policy

Policy Number

Caover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address

SLC130A

PATRICIA LEE GUAT KHENG
S1784552G
PATLEEGK@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-97863829
OFFICE-27863829

MERCEDES-BENZ
A1B0 FL STYLE (R17 HLG)

PRIVATE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

PNPV2019-00008330

PATRICIA LEE GUAT KHENG
S1784552G

30/11/1966

INDOCR

06/07/1987

31 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-97863829

OFFICE-97863829
PATLEEGK@GMAIL.COM

Page 10of 18



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

NIL

NO
OWNER

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
RAINING
WET

NO
2

NO
NO

YES

NO

NO

| was driving slowly as the traffic was heavy. | was on the 2nd lane from the right . Suddenly | felt an impact from my rear vehicle .
I later realised that @ white van had hit the rear of my vehicle. We stop and took some picture of the accident. We exchange

particulars. No injury involved.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Remarks/ Reasons:

Was there any audio recorded?

YES

YES
PENDING
NO

-

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

GBH3280Y

TOYOTA HIACE VAN TURBO 5DR MT WHITE
NA

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

SHAFARIZAL BIN ABDUL WAHAB
§8200520Z

90583025

Page 2 of 18
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Common Statement Pg. 1

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

| was driving slowly as the traffic was heavy. | was on the 2nd lane from the right .
Suddenly | felt an impact from my rear vehicle .

| later realised that a white van had hit the rear of my vehicle.
We stop and took some picture of the accident.
We exchange particulars.

No injury involved.

Taxi Voucher No.:

DECLARATION

IiWe declare that the above particulars & information provided above are true in every aspect

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS REPORTING OFFICER -
MOHAMMAD AZALY BIN ABDULLAH

(N

MARS Officer
Registered Owner or Driver's Signature
Job Complete Date/Time Date/Time:
3 June 2018 at 6:23 PM 3 June 2019 21 6:23 PM

Page 4 of 18



Driving License

MALAYSIA
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mm LEE GUAT «*

£ 4?
-
-

B e 30 Nov 1966
im e 01 Jul 2004

G

lll"iﬁn:snnilllll
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Driving License

41 BRIGHT WLl DRIVE #1301
SINGAPORE 578853
L - : ag: 17-12-200% neo
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Mercedes-Benz

ESTIMATE FOR SLC130A

"~

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited
Authorised Dealer

Company No. 196400367W
GST Reg No. MR-8500111-X

Vehi Document Information
N N wen 33952
Patricia Lee Guat Kheng Mrs.pa 0
Reg No/Reg Date SLC130A /02/06/2016
#13-01 ) L .= o St & -
Singapore 579653 Shaseisio wWOD17604229453584
Engine No 27091030940771
Mobile: 97863829 Make/Maodel MB/MB A 180 (W176) "STYLE"
% P% Colour/Trim 021 191 Cosmos Blac/ 044 461 ARTICO/Fabr
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator
CTP00001 Cash 06/06/2019/ 09:16 Vs 356 / Vincent Seah
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
M _BPNSUN
RDI:I_C_T Nﬁ[,_ACC__ DATE :EH_E;\_'ZOLQ’-DQOUB{_B"Q‘QI J{ 03.06.19 1§ § 2%
DRIVE TN/EXCESS=" :' 03.06.19" // TP CAR NO.: 68H3280¥=GREAT~AMERICAN -
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:
BY/AUTHRIZED ON M
A BPILAB — 0.10 380.0’0/
"USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO /:j_ \ 2
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT" [ . / , _
A BPILAB ™\ /\ﬁ"/ . ‘?éo 1M
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER BN h .
A BPIRES \ 1| Eoy ymﬁo
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPE :
M REAR TRIM BUMPER . ‘q e 1337.36 00.00 1337.36
7 ¢ \
M REAR LOWER BUMPER ° 7 - 230.80 00.00 (230.80
M RIVET e /17 - 4.43 00.00 8.86
M REAR CROSS MEMBER 1’)( ~ € B 473.66 00.00 473.66
7 \: \
- =
-\. R.,,-/_‘:» =
s‘\w.v’/;‘.l' ;
"
{
|
i
ConﬁrrnE_d &accepted by
- Nett 4,830.68
7% GST on 4830.68 338.15
Total Payable 5,168.83

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of quote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Estimated costs quoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include any additional parts or labour which may be
required after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this occur,
we would advise you. Please be informed that a deposit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must alse agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing the rubber seal or other repair requiring

the removal of the windscreen.

m Mercedes-Benz - are registered trademarks of Daimier, Stuttgart, Germany

Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Tel: 6777 8388

Fax: 6779 5383

www.mercedes-benz.com.sg Page 1 of 1



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited

Authorised Dealer
Company No. 196400367W

ESTIMATE FOR SLC130A GST Reg No. MR-85001 11X
Vehi o nt Informati

‘WIPNo 33952 S
Reg No/Reg Date SLC130A /02/06/2016

Patricia Lee Guat Kheng Mrs.pa

61 Brighthill Drive

Ehoie G S‘%Eﬁli% ——
) Chassis No 2 Qﬁ
Singapore 579653 i et dll SN, A o e e
e EngnoNo 2709103084071
Make/Model MB/MB A 180 (W176) "STYLE®

_/ GolourTim 021 191 Cosmos Blac/ 044 461 ARTICO/Fabr

Cash 27/0
= 1‘ = ~ =

iﬁi

1:27 VS
ofiGe &0

et S22 TTEST BT

OF-AN-QEEIC

DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:24.06.19//24.06.19 RASUL-LKK 17:50PM
DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SHARON NG- GAIG
A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
"USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT"
A BPILAB 960.00°
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER
A BPIRES 600.00
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPER
Confirmed & accepted by
Nett 1,940.00
7% GST on 1940.00_ 135.80
Total Payable 2,075.80.

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of quote. This is a comp generated d no signature 15 required.

Estimated costs guoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial fnspaction and doas mot include any additional parts or labour which may be
required after repair work has comsenced. Occasicnally worn or damaged parts are discovered after work has started and needed for repairs or raplacement. However, should this cccur,
we would advise you. Please ba informod that a deposit of 50% of the above estimate s payable befors commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
chaque. You must also agree to pay full amount for remewal of the windscreen in the event of {nadvertent breakage in the course of renewing the rubber seal or cther repair requiring
the removal of the windscrees. %

Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop
Singapors 128378

Tel: 6777 B388

Fax: 6779 5383

m Mercedes-Benz - are registered trademarks of Daimler, Stuttgart, Germany www. mercedes-benz.com.sg Page 1ol 1
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federlﬁon Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAI19011153/R1td3e2

[MRIMTAR

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 05-07-2019

SINGAPORE 039190

Code: GAI

1. ; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 3280Y Veh. Inspected SLC 130A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVCO000003674 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SHARON NG Assign Date 14/06/2019

2. i _ ~ Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ A180 c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. WDD17604221455584 Colour BLACK
Odometer 34983 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR

3. L ~ Conditions of Tyres e

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 225/45 R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm

4, ] _ Description of Damages B
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. U o SRR SR RN Generaliinformation < i S R
Accident Date  03/06/2019 llnspection Date 24/06/2019
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL

188 PANDAN LOOP
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES—BENZ}

5a. ' T Remarks 7o At
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. & e e Estimate Days of Repain¥fich = o il 158

ESTIMATED NDRMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Worklng Days




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLC 130A

1|REAR TRIM BUMPER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,337.36 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LOWER BUMPER (SN) SERVICEABLE 230.80 -
2|RIVET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 8.86 -
1|REAR CROSS MEMBER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 473.66
2,050.68 -
LABOUR
USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET 380.00 380.00
MEMORY TO STANDARD SETTINGS.
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER. INCLUSIVE OF 1,200.00 960.00
THE REPAIR OF REAR TRIM BUMPER.
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPER. 1,200.00 600.00
2,780.00 1,940.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,830.68 1,940.00

g AT = v L | BTSSRI

Report Ref No. CS/GAI19011153/R

1td3e2

U K2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

15} Il L] } pled lo any third party who may reply on the Keport Wholy




