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From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 5:23 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Ce assignments

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMGT76835 AND

5JP&574T ON 14/06/2019

Dear LKK,

Please proceed to liaise with SPECIALISTS MOTOR to survey.
Thank you.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Mator Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
Direct (65) 6388 6192

Fax (65)62247478/62247175

Email: claimsdept@sg. cntaiping com

www sq cntaiping.com

viH

e Mesaparr cme | 918

Lisciminner

FThi messuge is confidenriof: s contents do net constitite o commitment by China Taiping Inxsurance (Singapare) Ple. Lid excepl
wihere providied for i a weitren agreement between yon and Ching Tuiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd Any wunanthiorized
disclosure. wse ar divsemination, either in whole or partial. is prohibited If you are sot the iniended recipient of the message
pleaxe novifv the sender immedicred

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 5:19 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SJPES74T ON 14/06/2019
Without Prejudice

Dear lrene

Please assign LKK- Marcus to survey the vehicle SMGTERAS.

Kindly let us know the above claim liability as soon as passible
1



* Thianks & Regards

Irene Ting -
6747 2112

From: [rene Tay [mallto:irene.tay@sq.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 5:11 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

w Ut p D
Dear Sir,

We intend o conduct a pre-repair survey of the darmaoge to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert,

ADRIAN LING

Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG

LOW SAR HUE
HONG FOOK CHOY
XING QUO QIANG

KENNETH KONG

SIMON HO

CHUA WELJIE
MARCUS CHUA

Flease let us know within two(2) working days whather you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select ane of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey canied
aul by the single joint expert.

Thicrnk you

Redgards

Irene Tay

Exaculive



Clomms Department [Motor Division)

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Arson Road #1500 Springleal Tower Singapore 079709

Direct (&45) 4389 6192
Fax (&5) 62247478/62247175

Email. claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
T

AN THSARY
Tu Kimpatpues simew [ R0

Disclafmer

This message is confidential: its conlents do not constitute a commitment by China Toiping Insurance
(Singapore] Pte. Lid. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping
Insurance (Singapore| Pte, Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is
prohibited. I you are naot the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately,

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mallto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg|
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

URGENT

REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear rene Tay
Please refer to the above matter & our emall dated 19/06/2019, 20/06/2019, 21/06/2019, 24/06/2019
Up to date, we still had hot receive any reply from you.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG76835 as soon as possible.
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.
3



' Thinks & Regards’
Irene Ting -
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [malilto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 1:18 PM

To: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com)
Cc:

claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM1SD202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIPS574T ON 14/06/2019

URGENT

REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear lrene Tay
Please refer to the above matter & our email dated 19/06/2019, 20/06,/2019, 21/06/2019, 24/06/2019.
lUp to date, we still had not receive any reply from you.

Kindly arrange surveyor 1o survey the vehicle SMG7883S as soon as possible.
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liabllity as soon as possible.
Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd "
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 10:14 AM

To: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com)
Cc:

claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM1SD202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

URGENT

REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear lrena Tay
Please refer to the above matter & our email dated 19/06/2019, 20/06/2019, 21/06/2019, 24/06/2019.
Up to date, we still had not recelve any reply from you.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7E835 as soon as possible.
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Ireng Ting



6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc®&singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2019 9:07 AM

Tu-ummmcm&mwmmm
Cc:

5ubje:t RE: OUR REF EHMIQDZM?,’T AYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SJP6574T ON 14/06/2019

URGENT
REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear lrene Tay
Please refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7683S as soon as possible,
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 2:51 PM

To: irene.tay(@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.cheefisg.cntaiping.com)
Cc: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG7683S AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

URGENT
REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear Irene Tay
Please refer to the above matter

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7683S as soon as possible
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as passible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 1:18 PM
To: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com)

5



Subja:t RE: DUR REF SHHHDZGZBB?,’T AYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG7683S AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

LURGENT
REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear Irene Tay
Please refer to the above matter,

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7683S as soon as possible.
The car already in the workshop on 17/06,/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
b747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 11:31 AM

To: [rene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com)
Cc: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear Irane Tay
Please refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMGT76835 as soon as possible.
The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@sinanet.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 8:42 AM

To: |rene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (st 26 )

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT invnwms SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

REMINDER
Without Prejudice

Dear irene Tay
Please refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7683S as soon as possible.

6



The car already in the workshop on 17/06/2019
And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible,

Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112
From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mallto:cardoci@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 4:00 PM

To: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow (sochow.chee@sg. cntaiping.com)

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM15D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG7683S AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019
Without Prejudice

Dear Irene Tay

Please refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG7683S as soon as possible.

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 11:57 AM

To: 'Irene Tay'; 'Chee So Chow'

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear irene Tay

Please refer to the above matter,

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG76835 as soon as possible.
And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Lim Shu Min :

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 10:10 AM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd; Irene Tay; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG7683S AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019

7



Dear Ms Ting,
Please note that the claim handler is lrene
Dear Irene,

Please assist.

Thank you

Lim Shu Min

Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896156 | F (65) 62247175

W: www sg cntaiping com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & 7"¥iis Taiping SG

Digctmmar This e-mad and any ftes transmtted with i i irended only for (he named recipienis and may contain configential infarmation. Any
unrauthorred diaciosure, use or disseinalion of this message ailher in whole or partial (s probibiled i you are not the mtended recipent, plesse
nalify the zendar mmedialely Pease delale the e-mail and any copies of i thersafter

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 9:36 AM

To: Lim Shu Min <shumin lim@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.lay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIP6574T ON 14/06/2019
Without Prejudice

Dear Lim Shu Min

Please refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle SMG76835S as soon as possible.

And also check the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Lim Shu Min H i

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 4:52 PM

To: Irene Tay; Chee So Chow;

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D202837/TAYHP - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIPE574T ON 14/06/2019

Dear Irene,
Please conduct PRS — SMG76835 soonest possible.

File with Officer-in-Charge — Irene Tay — 63896192.



. Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive
Claims Depariment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapora 079309
DID; (65) 63896156 | F (65) 62247175

W: www sg cntaiping com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & + ¥ Taiping SG

Drsctmpwr. This e-manl and any files trangmitted with it 8 intended only for the named moipents and may confain canfidanial informaton. Any
unauthonsed disclasure, use or dissaminalion of this message. adher /v while or partlal. s prahibiled. If yau are nol the intended recipient, please
nafify the sender inmedhately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of f hereaftar.

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 3:39 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI imsdept@sg cntaiping.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG76835 AND SIPE574T ON 14/06/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please refer to the above matter.

Our client SMG7683S Is claiming against your insured SJPE574T.
Please check for us the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Kindly arrange the surveyor to survey the vehicle No. SMG76835 at
Specialists Motor Pte Lid

Blk 3018A, Ubi Road 1

#01-24/25/26

Singapore 408711

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: cardoc@singnet.com.sa :
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 2:28
To: CARDOC

Subject: Attached Image

This emall has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWw.ave.com




This email-has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hip://www svmanteccloud. com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit htip://www. svmanteceloud. com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud, com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud. com
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to-OneMotoring

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
1065W

SMG7683S
No

25 Jun 2019
TOYOTA

VELLFIRE ELEGANCE MOONROOF
(AUTO)

White

2018

2ARJ098672
JTNGF3DH408016505
134.0 kW (179 bhp)
$48,192.00

31 Dec 2018

31Dec 2018

0

$59,469.00

Yes
30 Dec 2028
$44 601.00

30 Dec 2028

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$33,900.00

£32.250.00

$76,851.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jun 2019

OK

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput 7FUNCTION _[D=F030.,,  25-Jun-19



SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 3018A, Ubi Road 1, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoc/@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SMGT683S/1906084 o Sz W

19™ June 2019

o A gt PO

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid -
3 Ansan Road 2< / 6 A‘ 5
#16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore (079909 g J'
Date of Accident : 14" June 2019 ? /f ¢ Yo .

Location - Johor Bahru Checkpoimt
Third Party Claim Vehicle No SIP6STAT
Repair Cost For Vehicle No SMG 7683 S Toyota Vellfire

Estimate Supply of Parts & Labours

No. Particulars Oty Price Amounis
| Rear fender RH SC 1 12070 s 12870 X
2 Rear comer panel RH vl 412.30 $ 41230 —
3 Rear fender glass with moulding RH ¢ A9 1 61920 § 61920 X
4 Rear fender glass sealant (s/net) Z 41 6000 $ 6000 >
$ 2,336.20
Labour Charges :- Amounts
Cut out, renew, knocking & welding sliding door RH, rear fender RH, rear corner S 820.00 ECPD
panel RH, remove & install all damage parts & re-align body
Remove & install rear seats, carpets & upholstery & etc § 32000 / Do
Remove & install rear fender glass A § 140,00 x
Tuff- kote on damage parts 4% 8000 s
Spray painting on damage parts § 680.00 %2?
Check all lighting after repairs $ 3000 2
gl il & nolil
Programme & Dingnostic heRparrdmwbiowng A /Iy S 380.00 ¢
& To peavwy e s tp sainling
Labour Charge mey sy |5 oamn0
Total Amoumnt ® Thard party scrvsy 8 o & Wilhout Prapudics” bass $ 4,786.20
= No illegal modiicabon(s) = aiowss
GST will be reflected in the final bills. g s ep ity o OB




Adjuster Report

Page | of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne1essoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Indusiria
Singapora 408833

| Park

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: surilikkaulo.com;assignments(@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTIO

N REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI19011140/USD3N2

Date: 04/07/2019
REFERENCE
Handling 7
Anakbiae China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No * SEMGTERAS Insured Vehicle No : SJPESTAT
Date of Loss:  14/06/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: N/A
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMGT6835
Make & Model: TOYOTA VELLFIRE, 2.4 DBA-ANHZ20W (A) Engine No: 2ARJ08BET2
Reg. Date: 3272018 (Man, Year: 2018) Chassis No: JTNGF3DH408016505
Colour: White Odometer: 12884 km
Engine Capacity: 2484 cc
Market Valus/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition; Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/50R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/50R18
Front Left Side: Toyo 7 mm Rear Left Side: Toyo 7 mm
Front Right Side: Toyo 7 mm Rear Right Side: Toyo ¥ mm
The shove valuss represan he remaining fyee reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’'s Difference Diff %
Pars 2,336.20 309.22 2.026.98 B6.76
Miscellanaous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaour 2.450.00 1,100.00 1,350.00 55.10
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing D.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S$) 4,786.20 1,409.22 3,376.98 70.56
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 335.03 98.65 236.38 70.55
Nett Amount (5$) 5121.23 1,507.87 3,613.36 70.56
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmant: 26/06/2019
Date Inspected: 25/06/2019 Inspected At: Specialist Motor Pte Ltd (HQ)
BLK 3018A UBI RDAD 1 #01-24-26
Singapore 408711
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager; Hiew May Fung

WOTE: This report repragents our findings af the fime and piace of inspection sfafied herein, Such inspecfion has been camed out 1o e besf af our
knewledge and ahilty buf any cther Tabilty indar any ofther circumstances {s hereby sxpressly seciuded

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 4/7/2019



Adjuster Repont Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 04 Jul 2018)

Parts: M1-MPY TOYOTA VELLFIRE 2.4 DBA-ANH20W (A} (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairar's (Price-denominated Standard Lisl)

iPrint Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SMGTEB3S)

|Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimale pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Further Info: items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *REAR FENDER RH Repair 1.244.70F *-FL
2 1 “REAR CORNER PANEL RH Cut 412.30F *412.30FL
3 1 *REAR FENDER GLASS WITH MOULDING RH Not Necessary 619.20F *-FL
4 1 “REAR FENDER GLASS SEALANT Nol Necessary B60,00F5 *-FS

F=Franchise part. S=SpcNefi. L=ListemDwc.

Sub Total (S$) 2,336.20 412.30
= List ltem Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (S§) 0.00 103.08

Total Parts (S5) 2,336.20 309.22

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 4/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 CUT OUT,RENEW KNOCKING & WELDING SLIDING Meaw 820.00 580.00
DOOR RH,REAR FENDER RH,REAR CORNER PANEL
RH,REMOVE & INSTALL ALL DAMAGE PARTS & RE-
ALIGN BODY
2 REMOVE & INSTALL REAR SEATS,CARPETS & New 320.00 100.00
UPHOLSTERY & ETC
3 REMOVE & INSTALL REAR FENDER GLASS MNew 140.00 0.00
4 TUFF-KOTE ON DAMAGE PARTS Mew B0.00 0.00
5 SPRAY PAINTING ON DAMAGE PARTS Mew 680.00 400.00
B CHECK ALL LIGHTING AFTER REPAIRS MNew 30.00 20.00
T PROGRAMME & DIAGNOSTIC MNew 380.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2.450.00 1.100.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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