Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 4:40 PM
To: Hui Ling

Cc: ‘Yong Teck Far'; SUR

Subject: RE: stream SJJ1974L estimate
Dear Hui Ling,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hui Ling <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 4:38 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Yong Teck Far' <tfyong1966 @gmail.com>
Subject: RE: stream SJJ1974L estimate

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,

We have our client’s appointed repairer instruction to confirm your below recommedation for repair costs.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Hidlrg
RIAZ LLC

Advocates and Solicitors

133 NEW BRIDGE ROAD

# 09-09 CHINATOWN POINT
SINGAPORE 059413

TEL :6534-0110 FAX:6534-0220

Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in error,
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by sending an e-mail to riaz@justice.com.sg. though internet communications
cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have
scanned this message to minimise the possibility of corruption.




From: Yong Teck Far <tfyong1966 @gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 4:27 PM

To: riaz@justice.com.sg

Subject: Fwd: stream SJJ1974L estimate

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
1A Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Date: 201988 H15HEM £411:20

Subject: RE: stream SJJ1974L estimate
To: Yong Teck Far <tfyong1966 @gmail.com>, SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $3800 @ 5 working days

PARTS-$3403.10 (less 20%)=$2722.48
SN-$340
LABOUR-$1730

TOTAL-$4792.48 (less 20%)=3833.98

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Yong Teck Far <tfyong1966@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 2 August 2019 11:07 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: stream SJJ1974L estimate

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
KA : apexi HKS <apexih@yahoo.com.sg>

Date: 20198 A2 B A& L410:37
Subject: stream SJJ1974L estimate
To: tfyong1966@gmail.com <tfyong1966@gmail.com>

bro..for your reference



