VAC

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 12:10 PM

To: VAC

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJT 8650Y (OUR REF: CC4/11119011128/Uga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHB 6234Y & SJT 8650Y ON 06/06/2019 ***

Attachments: image001,jpg; image002.jpg

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms Lee,

Please mail out ALL ORIGINAL DOCUMENTS to us (LKK) in order for us to submit and close case.
Please note original documents needed for iil case.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the

matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liahility, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com!| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

LY 55 spe the Earth Print only wihen necessary:

From: VAC [mailto:vacauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 4:22 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJT 8650Y (OUR REF: CC4/11119011128/Uga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6234Y & SIT 8650Y

ON 06/06/2019 ***

Cecilia

Attached please find the necessary documents for your necessary actions.
Do let us know if you still need any other documents.

Have a great weekend ahead.



VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD uen: 2002108452

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-11 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 8618 8008 | Fax: 6636 5355 | Email: vacauto@singnet.com.sg

Your Ref : SHB6234Y
Our Ref : SJT8650Y

20 March 2020

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04/#05/#06-02 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/Madam

SUBMISSION OF DOCUMENTS FOR THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST YOUR INSURED (SHB6234Y)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJT8650Y & SHB6234Y ON 06/06/2019

We are authorized by Ms Koh Beng Choo, the owner of vehicle Regn No: SJT8650Y
to claim damages and losses against your insured in connection with the above road traffic accident.

The said accident was caused solely by your insured's negligent driving and/or management of
the vehicle. As a result, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client had been put to loss and
expense, particulars of which are as follows:

1. Repair Costs (as agreed/recommeded) $ 600.00
2. Car Rental/Loss of Use $ 300.00 (As agreed)
$ 900.00

We enclose herewith the supporting documents for your necessary actions.

Please let us have your settlement cheque made in favour of
"VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD" within the next 14 days.

Thank you for your kind attention in this matter.

Yours faithfully

(e

Ms Lee SB




Innia INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

EﬁTfRNATR‘)NAL L0, Reg, No. 198703792k | GST. Reg, No. M2-0078806-X

64 | Cecll Street | #04 | #05 | #06-02 | 10D Building | Singapore 049714
ff*lsyi*’j‘;*a . Office (65163476100 Email  insure@iiicom.sg
Mm&mm;w Fax  [65)64244174  Website wwwiilcomsg

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: McT19050201
Claimant Ref : sJT 8850

We/i, VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement

with the appointed Surveyor of India international Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name

of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ _ 600.00 (repair cost), S$__300.00 (loss of
wee/rental), S§ - . (search fee), vehicle no. SJT86s0Y  that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

on ____06/06/2018 (date) at 48 LEITH ROAD (location) involving vehicle no. _SHB 6234Y _ (insured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on _ 25/06/2019 {date) at "the workshop”.

Wel/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner KOH BENG CHOO ("the third party

claimant’) of vehicle no. SJT8850Y _to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to setile
the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third
party claimant".

Well further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
they will or have already incured in the event that “the third party claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental andfor loss
of use pursuant to the damage to _SJT8650Y _ (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant"
pursuant to the accident and that further this settiement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability
basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arising out of the same.

We/l authorize you to paythe total amount of S$ _900.00 to VAC AUTO CENTRE PTELTD

CENTR
CLAIMANT: ‘o WITNESS:
IS \-c
i <
Signature: ‘é\( it *f' Signature: CKS
Signed by "thé\Wgrkshop{with cho Signed by appointed Surveyor
gned by \M p)
. Sl o Name: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC NRIC: 199607 1908
Address: Address: 51 UBI AVE 1 #02-25
) ) — PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 5(408333)
Nationality: Nationality:

Occupation: Occupation;




VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD uen 2002100452

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-11 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel: 8618 8008 | Fax: 6636 5355 | Email: vacauto@singnet.com.sg

17 July 2019

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04/#05/#06-02 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Department

OUR INVOICE NO: VAC2019/111

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/NATURE OF REPAIRS AMOUNT (S$)

Third Party Claim (Direct Settlement)

Name of Owner . Koh Beng Choo

Registrationn Number . SJT8650Y

Make/Model : Honda Jazz

Accident date : 06 June 2019

Being Repair Costs for the above vehicle as recommended by the surveyor $ 600.00

Loss of Use - 2 days

Total Amount Due to Us s=======>>> | § 600.00

Note: Any claim for faulty workmanship is limited to the rectification free of cost of such work
No claim for consequential loss or otherwise being admissible.

1 Cheque to be made payable to: "VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD".
2 Thank you for your gracious support.
3 Meanwhile, if you have any queries or need any assistance, please feel free to contact us.

For and on behalf of
VAC AUTO CENTRE PTE LTD

VACAuUts

Authorised Signature



