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. ’ ASSIGNMEINT
Frp i 1\':-\;'0{4 b LL/{{J’Z{ i1 Rea rZ/ f f7
Eslimated Cost Typfh M.€ar | M.Cycle/ Bus [ Van | Larry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
L‘SJ_T._F_R_I':_& 10D RES | EVA | INV{ MV Truck I Teaileror 4 /
To Inspect Vehicl: No QU 16ER U Metke: Sea f ,qj,hqﬁéfq £ fgf{(%
A Werkshop mfs (Fd.'l"i L]m Ciolour S {v L RC: Insured | Sid /N NA
o Bl Uit{'ru Iﬂfu 10 Sp Reading é ‘q/ _(If" / TRadio: nsured | Std /NI NA
Insured: EngiNo:
Policy No CilNo: V5§W7M%-H V7133 23
Clalma Mo Gen. Cong Bdod | Fair | Poor [ Burnt
Sum Insured: Excess Steering: { Jammed | Leaked | Burnt o
(Clent's Record) Brake: | mmed | Leaked | Burnt or
Make of Veh: Modi - Nil{l SIRim J STD ARim or
| \q’ léﬂlq (O Tyre: Size F: Z Z\f’ / fo—,?/(ﬁ
{Palicy Condition) R: §
Remark; The veh had commenced |ts NS | O BS/DUN/ EXNOVA | GY | FS/ LIZA | MIC | OHTSU [ PIR | SUMI
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO | YOKO or N, .r‘\'i[ st nf 9 /
Bal. or Markel Valug /! &{ff : Front Rear
IDAC Agejdent Rpor Cansistent? : Yes or No R/Bal. 7 - RiBal, 7 mm
Gl | PR Seen: Q_.. Consistent? * Yes or No LiEal, 7 M LBl 7 i
Est. Regalrs: ). days Res: Yes or No DOA ;/ ¥ Af } polL / 7 /’ )’)
Ll S 20 3Val: Yes or No ‘Survey held at ——

27469540

Vehicle: 1IN/ OUT

CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS

Date: Person Gontaciecd;
¥

Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | O/S | NIS | UIC | Rooltop or

_ofs ba

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision
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51 UL AVE I, #02.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARE,

Your Ref: D19004090MFSH

Our Ref: CS/ECI19011110/Usd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

Company Registration No. 199607 108R

SINGAPORE 308933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (D65) 62564315

Date; 02 July 2019

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLL 1665U .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 01/07/2019 at the premises of M/s

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” Items Amount
Total

Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 2 days

Yours faithfully,
Marcus Chua
Automotive Assessor

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd and have the following to

: 5% 3.281.20
.S 247330
: 5%
: 5%
1 S8
: 88
: S8




MS‘ F'i rstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CcReg No 1550000060 GS7 ®eg o M2 COO1676-D

# Raffles Quay ¥21-00 Singapare 048580
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax: [B5) 6222 3547

(laims. B Moter Underwriting Depr: 36 Robinsen Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel (B5) 6507 384R Fax (BS) 6307 3849
wiwnwmgfirstcapital. comosg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 24-06-2018 Our Ref No. D19004050MFSH
Accident Date 12-06-20189 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHAG243G Third Party Vehicle. SLL1665U
Survey Location 1 DEFU LANE &
Contact Person. WILL 1AM
Contact No. 68585151/ 0 Fax No. 68580877
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
A inted

ppow LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No, 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

TAM LIM MOTOR PTE

Cc : Worksho Atte . NIL
[+ P LTD ntion
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA,

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 July 2019 4:58 PM

To: 'Sithara'; "CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 9004090MFSHN
Attachments: SLL 16650 - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLL 1665 U.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4083933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 4:56 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004090MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkaulo.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 4:21 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM



Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004090MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CW5 for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




Used SEAT Alhambra Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SGI:A_RMART.I:I:IM

Mew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance

& CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

5 Classic Promo'Best DeallFast Selling!Hurry Down Now!
Post an Advertisement ginurTy

Sell it yoursalfl Advertise it ak just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Browse by Category ‘il

1 vehicles SEAT Alhambra
[GELT Maodsl Price Depreciation Reg Date
Search Selection SEAT Alhambra ¥ 2017
SEAT Alhambra Diesal 2.0A £128,000 £14,020 fyr 31-Jan-2017

TDI DSG Style
Fuel Type: Diesal [Eure 5 Engine and Above]

SEAT Alhambra Diesel 2,04 TDL DSG Style High Spec.Dealer Don't Call.Wery Desperate Ta Selll Add-In Can Arrange Loan For Buyer Up To 7

Years,Cwner Service Every 8k Km Although Valkswagen Engine [s 15 K...

Poeteds 13-Jun- 2019 Tags: 2017 SEAT Alkamibea, 2017 seat-albamibra, SEAT Alhambra, seat alharmon
el slhamitia, Lissd SEAT
Save this search criteria, 1o get emad aleris whenever a match & found
Make Madel Price Depraciation Beg Date
Far old advertisements, view Expired ads
Home | Mew Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance

s, Thero

tner sites for jo openin

All prices and other information displayed on SgL “arMart.com are gal A
that this infarmation = accurale, compéete or curent, sqLa Tl
Follow sgCarMart.com

are plenty of cars for sak

fimancial services

Page 1 of |

Login  Sign up

Articles Forum Resources

=il surekd sy

\CONNECT,)

= Fren VICOUW evalustion

® Fiea grooming and & months main

® [r-house workshap ensures guait L

= Member of SYTA and hire purchase sssociation

= 100% deposit refumd for unapproved boan m

JIE, YONG LEE SENG MOTOR PTE LTD

Sort by Date Posted | 20 resultsipage [+ |

fwan W Submiti

Mileage eh Type Stalus
Availabie
1,568 oo 41,000 km MPY Available

T
CEAT. Afambra,

Eng Cap Mileage Ve Type Sratus

[20 ] resuies/page
Article | Forum | Resources

Fromm vans, trucks, sedan cars, lukury cars, Sport

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Sktemap  Terms of Service | Privacy Policy | Personal Data Protection Statement

E12004-2019 sgCarMart, All rights reserved.

Compare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2017& MOD=SEAT Alhambra&RPG=20&VE...

01-Jul-19



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OnaMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

Business
0313C

SLL1665U

Mo

13 Jun 2019

SEAT

ALHAMBRA 20TDI 184 STYLE AT
Silver

2016

DEMO17805
WESZZZTINZHVT 13329
135.0 kW (181 bhpl
$34,545.00

16 Feb 2017

14 Feb 2017

o

£43.163.00

Yes
15 Feb 2027
$32,372.00

15 Feb 2027
B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

Page 1 of |

0P Paid: $48,209.00
COE Rebate Amount: $34,988.00
Total Rebate Amount: £49,360.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Jun 2017
OK

https:/ivrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput” FUNCTION ID=F03... 13/06/2019



MS FCIL Insured's Veh No : &[4 gyfflq
Date of Accident : 12 June 2019

TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539365
Tel : 68585151 ( 24 Hours )

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Messrs Elite Motoring

Date : 20 June 2018

Fax : 68580877

L Wil s
Estimate To Repair SLL1665U - Seat Alhambra 2.0 TDI 184 STYLE 6A . 'L/ : L [t
Chassis No : VSSZZZ7NZHV713329 Cle G
SMo | Quantity Description Amount
LIST ITEMS
01 [1pec |right front door Rod4 0 /00 s 2107.00—
02 |1pc right front door window glass channel weatherstrip 7 -7 $ 473.00 | X
03 |1pc right front door weatherstrip 144 2% g 33000 —
04 |1pc right front door outer moulding ,; — 3 258.00 | X
5 3,168.00
Less 10 % ¥ 316.80
5 2,851.20
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES
01 To transfer of door fittings and perform water seepage test. % 100.00 j CPD
02 Panel beating, knocking and straighten the necessary portion, $ 30,004
remove and renewal of parts, adjust and realign the same.
03 Putty and spray painting of the affected portion. $ 300.00 o 95
5 430.00
Total N7~ W §  5.281.20
20 (0
W
| 2

7{?
oy

ﬂ,.,/ﬁ%"/ '
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

Reqg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-95071%8-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref : CS/FCI19011110/Usd3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 M R ” “m“m”le""I
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9243G Veh. Inspected SLL 1665U
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19004090MFSH Excess (3$) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 24/06/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model SEAT ALHAMBRA (A) C.C 1968
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. VESZZZTNZHVT 13329 Colour SILVER
Odometer 64551 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R18 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R18 COMTINENTAL 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 COMNTINENTAL 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/06/2019 [Inspection Date 01/07/2019
Survey held at TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 5359216
5a, Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607128R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLL 1665U
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
2 P Workshop (§)]  ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RIGHT FRONT DOOR BADLY DENTED 2,107.00 1,600.00
1|RIGHT FRONT DOOR WINDOW GLASS CHANNEL NOT NECESSARY 473,00 -
WEATHERSTRIP
1|RIGHT FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP HECESSARY 330.00 250.00
1|RIGHT FRONT DOOR OUTER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 258.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -316.80 -205.00
2,851.20 1,845.00
LABOUR
TO TRANSFER OF DOOR FITTINGS AND PERFORM 100.00 B0.00
WATER SEEPAGE TEST. }
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE 30.00 -
NECESSARY PORTION REMOVE AND REMEWAL OF
PARTS.ADJUST AND REALIGH THE SAME. }
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 300.00 200.00
PORTION.
430.00 280.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,281.20 2,125.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,700.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI119011110/Usd3n2
CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor i made sodaly Tor the uss and banaflt of tha Client namad on tha front page of this Report.
[ e what: 0 cantac] it |5 acoepied 1o any third party who may reply an the Repon whally of in part, Ay thind party acting of repiying on this




