Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 1:01 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto), Admin A

Cc Tan Kah Leong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D202948/tank| - [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement -
Accident Involving SBX338B and SHA3398H (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CT11901 1099/K1ea3) on
21/06/2019

Attachments: LETTER TO Ol.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3
CTI REF -~ SNM19D202948C02/8(tankl)

Dear Asher
We refer to the above matter.
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 53,347.09.

Aside to Kah Leong, please assist to update the claim reserves etc.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comichinataipingsgl/ | WeChat: A F¥i# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named reciplents and may contaln confidential information.
Any unauthorizred disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibifed. If you are not the infended recipient,
pleasa notify the sender immaediately. Please delete the e-mail and any coples of it thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 12:14 PM
To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D2025948/tankl - FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SBX3388 and SHA3398H (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

Hi Kah Leong,

Enclosed for your approval please.



Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Cose Handied

LEE Auto Consultonts Ple Lid
phone: 6841-6051 | email: gsherngSkkoyto.com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 31, Paya Ubl Industdal Pork, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $/408933)

From: Tan Kah Leang <KahLeong.Tan cntaipi >

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 12:06 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.che .Lntaiping. >

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202948/tankl - FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SBX338B (01 CTI - TBA) and SHA3398H (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

Dear Asher,

We refer to your emall dated 24.07.2019.

Please let us have a copy of your letter to insured for our next course of action.
Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Sprningleaf Tower Singapore 079908
DID: (65) 63896193 | F: (B5) 6222 1033

W: www.sg cntaipingcom | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsal

Disclaimer: This e-mail snd any files transmitfed with it is infended only for the named recipients and may cantain confidential information Any
unauthonzed disclosure, use or disseminaltion of this message. either in whole or partial. is prohibited. If you are not the intended recinient, please notify
e sendar immediately. Please delele the g-mail and any copies of if thereaffer

From: Claims Dept of CTI
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July, 2019 1:10 PM
To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 50 Chow

<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>
Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D202948/tank| - FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident involving
SBX338B (O1: CTI- TBA) and SHA3398H (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

Dear Kah Leong,



« Fya.

Thanks,
shumin
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:10 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Alfred Toh

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBX338B (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHA3398H (TP :
LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer ¥ COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at 53,347.09 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) $6,517.69 $2,908.19
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $125.40) 5 501.60 $ 438.90 (3.5days x $125.40)
Total 57,019.29 $3,347.09

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You,

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Coe Handker

LEK Aule Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 48414051 | emall: gshensno@kkouto.com | fox 4741-4108

Bik 31, Poya Ubl industial Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ lkkauto. >

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 10:48 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBX3388 (01 : CTi- TBA) and SHA3308H (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

3



‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHA 3398H at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and
TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

* TP GIA report
* TP estimated cost of repair
« Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

HBest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.svmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 17:10 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Alfred Toh

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBX3388 (Ol : CT1 -
TBA) and SHA3398H (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CT119011099/K1ea3) on 21/06/2019

Attachments: LOD SHA3398H.pdf: LKK Inspection.pdf; LKK Adjustment.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photo.pdf;
LKK Survey Photo.pdf

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at 53,347.09 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 56,517.69 $2,908.19
2. Loss of Rental (4days x 5125.40) S 50160 5 438.90(3.5days x 5125.40)
Total $7,019.29 $3,347.09

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards.
Asher Sng | Case Hondler
LEK Avlo Consullants Ple Lid

phone: £841-6051 | emaik gshenng@kkguto.com | foxc 6741-4108
Ble 51, Poya Ubl Industrial Park, Ul Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 10:48 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>



Fshoy

COMFORIDELCRO
Our Ref . T 0619/ SHA3398H /WT(st) ENG|NEER|NG
Your Ref : - -
Date | _27-Jun-19 COGE TaxiClaims Dept o oo o B d oy

59 Layang Drive 4th Fir

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapors 508269
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079908 Workshaps
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE ity s
Dear Sir Loyang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA3398H YOUR INSURED SBX 338B .
AND DTHER GH 21‘{.5.15 .:1-| 'n1|,_}

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor

Vehicle No - SHA3398H which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authonzed us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

Pandan
Romo

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SBX 3388 5 Lok
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. 5 .

21I"[il'| Fadu
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM !
1 Cost of Repair 5 200819 il
6 4 days Lossof Rental @ § 125.40 perday ] 50160 il Pk A
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 .
4 LTA Search Fees $ -
5 GlA | Police Report Fees $ -
6 Towing | Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -

SubTotal: § 340879
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 ] days Lossof Income @ §  B0.00 per days s
TotalClaims: § 340979
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of pholographs 4 pcs
b)  LTA search slip/s of SBX 338B
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of - SHA33%8H
d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound { ) TowingMledical bill/receipts ( ) Ceriificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter
Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver,
Yours faithfully
Hillam Tan
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email . willlamtan@cdge.com sg
This Is a computer generated letter. No signature 15 required,
o ®

COMFORIDELGRO :



Asher Sna {LKKAutn!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 1 July 2019 1:57 PM

To: STARANCE94@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 58X 3388 AND 5HA 3398H ON 21/06/2019

Our Ref: CCYCTI19011099/K1ea3

01 JUL 2019

GOH SWEE TONG / GOH YANG KENG

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBX 338B AND SHA 3398H ON 21/06/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 67414108

Email: ashersng @ lkkauto.com

€. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V LettolAuthorisation

ACCIDENT INVOLVING
ALONG

1/ We

ang/or

Taxi Number

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(NAF / PAF)

TOYOTA PRIUS SHA3398H , sbx338b

punggal field twds edgefield plain

TAN TOK Juay
TAN TOK KAN

SHA3398BH

hareby suthories ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd{ COGE):

(Hirer) NRIC No.

{Relief) NRIC No..

Page | of |

ON 21-Jun-19 03:30

SEXNASI6H

SHXXXA545H

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including lass of income, lass of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. Ta have absolute discretion to agree to any settlemant or compensation amount in respect of my/Sour claim
agalnat third party (except parsonal injuries and medical claims)

3. Ta sign Distharge Voucher on my/our behall,

4. To accept any paymant (claim procsads) in respect of the claim against third garty and payment by chegue
shall be forward directly to COGE in accordance with COGE's instruction and mads in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date

Mamie of Hirer
Hirar NRIC

Address

Contact No.

MName of Ritief
R=het NRIT

Addresy

Contact No

21-Jun-2019

TAN TOK Juay
SXXXX526H

338 HOUGANG AVENUE 7 #01-405
530338

81688101

TAN TOK KAN
SXXXXS45H

699C HOUGANG STREET 52 05-33
530699

91885625

Signature ©

Signature

e

= e

hitp://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime’ Runtime/View/CDG. VARS. V. LettofAut...  21/06/2019



MOTOR CLATMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy Ne : DMPCSN3008311902 Claim No : SHM1SD202948/TANFL
Claimant : COMFORT TRANSPOHTATION PTE LTD

Amount 1 553,347.09
DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED FORTY SEVEN AND CENTS
NINE ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs § disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehlcle No, : SHA 3398H
Inaured Vehicle No. : SBX 338B

Date of Loss
Place of Accldesnt

: 21/06/20159

: PUNGGOL FIELD TWDS EDGEFIELD PLAIN

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE |(SINGAPORE) PTIE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : GOH SWEE TONG
Driver Name 1 GOH YANG KENG

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of Iiability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTID.

(1) General Damages 5%
(2] Cost of Repalir/Bweess 55 2,908B.19
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/GBassing 55 438.90
(4) GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 55
{5) Medical Reparts/Expenses 55
(&) Survey Fees/P.T. Fess 55
{7) Cost including Disbursement 55
TOTEL < § wadVd & Sl W W e reoTresiasy 3,347.09
Claimant Name : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD KRIC No :
|
Signature : : Dace :
P
|"'
iy~ = L
N s
& . .}
\ . = L #u &
=i o f'-. i = i -|-I -I
A .-ﬂ' 4. =i Jr‘"h ,! 'I"'.:.h‘ - Tt LY,

B.Fhf ¥



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

A& memper ol COMFORDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

BO1OM 2

CHINA TAIPING TNSIURARCE (0 (S)FTE 1.7
SPRINGLEAF TIWKR

d  ANSON ROAD #1600
SINGRPORE &G 079909

CONTACT NO: BRZZZZ3h6

@ Description : 3P 21.06.19

S3/Ro  Fart Ko.

TAX INVOICE

ComioriDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

(AMIPANY WK, NO.: 19950/045W

Page:
VEHCLK MO INV. NOJDATR
SHAI398H 91451539 25,06, 2019
MAKR JOR ).
TOYOT'A 305305137

(IXMETERE HEAD ] NG

DATE/TIME IN
21.06.2019 D4:20

MO,
PRTIIS HYRRTD{G4 )

DATE (F KEG
10.08.2M7

CHASSITS (XK
JTIKRIFISNARAIT T

PART RREQUISTTION

pO01  D4-01-0D3AN2-2282 PRIGE (OVER HRAR HIMPER
0002 04-01-0302-22R7 PFRIGA GUARD-HEAR AlMPER

(CKN'TER

onn3 4= -03N2-296R5 PRI1GG4 FIlLIER-KEAK HIIMFER

KX'T'ENSTON RA

D004 09-01-0302-2005 FRIGG4 HEVERSE SENROR AHSY
0005  04-01-0302-0795 FRIGA KNS AND WY REAR

[.AME 1MWK HH

0006 04-01-0302-278F FRTGA (OVEH HEAR
RIMPER-TOW HOOK COVER

. 0007 04-D1-D302-22R7 PRIV HIMFER Pl1ECCE

ComfortDeltiro Engineering Ple Lid
A membar of CoOMrORNLCRD

Head Office
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issusd unless requestad

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No

gry imit Price WiHBo Nat

1 45R.R1 25.00 143, 9R

1 R52.60 25.00 414 .45

1 J42 . (0 Z25.00 174 .00

1 135.70 0. 00N 135.70

i 548.40  25.00 411.30

1 g2.710 25.00 £72.07

10 2.0 2500 1650
SIB="TOTAl, 1.557.93

AMOUNT BANK/CHQ MNo

91451539

CUSTOMER'S COPY



COM’FOR.-]DELCIRO ComforiDelGro Engineerning Pte Ltd

ENGINEERING v
y mempear of COMFORTDELGRO
(YMUANY WHRG. N0, = 19950R048W
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Pagh: o
/010012
VEHCLK RO INV. NO/DATE
CHINA TAIPING THSURARCE 0 (S)PR LD SHAIF9RH 91451539 25.06.2M9
SPHTNGIEAF TOWER
MAKK JOH W)
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 TOYOTA 05305137
BTNGAPORE 246G 0799049
MOITE, (HEMETER WEAL MG
CONTACT BO: 62222366 PRILS HYRRTD(G4) -,
AT (O HEG IATE/TIME 1N
10.08.2017 Z1.06.2019 04:70
CHASS1TS CODK
. JITRRIFUSDISRITT
5/No Part No. gty IUnit Price WDisc Nat
JOB NATIRE
gopmr 7230 TN NG FRE &0, 00 w0, 00
0002 FPB PANEI, BEATING 400 . 00 400 .00
nona sp SFRAYFATNT (HARGK RO 00 RO0. 0
poo4 17-01 CHECK ALI, T,TGRTTNG 20, 00 20,00
DS 20-2048 HEMOVE /REFIX 1PHOLETERY K01, (10 5000
ASET REPARIR
oooe I HEMOVE /HEFT . HEVERSK 30. (i 30, 0
SENSOR
SUR-TOTAL : 1,160, 00

ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
A mamtsr of COMPORIDTLCAD ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHO No
Head Office

205 Braddell Road
Singapore ST9701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issusd uniess requashed
CUSTOMER'S COPY



COMFORIDELGRO
~ ENGINEERING

A member of COMPORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

RO1001 7

CHINA TATPING [RBIURANRCE 00D (S)PTE I'Th

SFRINGLEAF TOMER

3 ANSON ROAD #1600
STRGAPORE BG 0799049

CONTACT W): RZZ2223606

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

COMPANY WHEG. RO, : 199506048W

TAX lNVOICE i—‘agp; 1
VEHILE RO INV, It'!,ﬂ ATE
SHAFISRH 91451539 25.06.2019
HAK K JIH ).
TOYOTA 305305137
MO, (HXIMETER HEAIN NG

PRITS HYBRID((34) i |

NATE (¥ WG DATK/TIME IN
10.08. 2017 21.06.2019 04:20

{(CHASSTS (XDR
JTDKRIFUROASG6IT T

Items total 2. 717.93
Add GST & T.000 % 190. 26
Z,908.19

IMyDies Amcmt

iqmﬁd : KATHERTNETAN 25.06.2019 16:09:39

pair r (M.30/57/57
Paymenr ﬁ;ﬁ}mm fCredit 30 days

ComforiDeltro Engineering Pre Lud
A mamber of COMPORIERLCRD

Head Office:
205 Bradde!l Rond
Singapore 379701

Kindly note thal no recaipl shall De issued Uniess MeouEsiad
CUSTOMER'S COPY

ACCOUNT Na.

INVOICE No

91451539

AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No




Our Ref; CT19060530 ,\

Date: 25 June 2019

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 21/06/2019 @ 03:30 hrs

ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD TWDS EDGEFIELD PLAIN
INVOLVING SBX338B

We refer 1o the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHA3398H (the "Taxi"), The Taxi was hired to TAN TOK JUAY IC NO
S0118526H a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxl arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seftlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. Mo signalure is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +85 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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