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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 5:03 PM

To: venessa.chan@fwd.com; Admin A

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; lionel.tan@fwd.com; assignments

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON : 20/06/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SBW 7280 S) & YOUR 

INSURED (SKX 8106 U) ALONG JUNCTION OF ADMIRALTY RD WEST & SENOKO RD

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Vanessa, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

 
G.Nivitha| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

From: venessa.chan@fwd.com [mailto:venessa.chan@fwd.com]  

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 4:19 PM 

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; lionel.tan@fwd.com 

Subject: ACCIDENT ON : 20/06/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SBW 7280 S) & YOUR INSURED (SKX 8106 U) ALONG 

JUNCTION OF ADMIRALTY RD WEST & SENOKO RD 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for PRS. 

 

Please create the case in Merimen. 

 
Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Venessa Chan 

Administrative Assistant, Claims 
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FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. 

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986  

E     venessa.chan@fwd.com 

W    www.fwd.com.sg 

 

 
 

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 3:09 PM 

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common 

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 20/06/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SBW 7280 S) & YOUR INSURED (SKX 8106 U) ALONG 

JUNCTION OF ADMIRALTY RD WEST & SENOKO RD 

 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, Client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log card for your 
reference & attention,  
 
Kindly assign your panel surveyor (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd) to survey client's damaged vehicle On : 25/06/19 
(at 10am to 12pm) as owner waiting,  
 
Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct settlement,  
 
Please let us hear from yours soon, 
 
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 

Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  
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The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the 

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please 

notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not 

use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.  
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