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Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2013 11:09 am

To: Boo seng yak

Cc: SUR; Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Adrian Ling
(LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKMB2255 - OD AIG - SURVEYED 21 JUN 19

Dear Mr. Boo,
Confirmed final fig $10,237.76 @ 6 days of repairs before excess $ 500/- & GST.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Lbi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 6:15 pm

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ilkkauto.com:; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com=>; SUR
<sur@l|kkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SKMB82255 - 0D AIG - SURVEYED 21 JUN 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate and photo file is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $10,237.76 @ 8 days of repairs exclude 1 Sunday.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 3:41 PM

To: ‘Claims’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKM 8225 SVEH IN
Attachments: ESTIMATE.pdf

Dear Kelvin,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKM 8225S (Excess $500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair,

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avernue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933})

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 1:11 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR 5KM 8225 SVEH IN

Dear All,
Any update on repair approval?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisaor

Premium Automobiles Ple Lid ireg o ssonzziw)
35 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 4086599

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. 465 6841 1183
e. claimsid i uto.com.se  w.owww.audicom.sg



12/4/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with

*SKMB2255 (17368383535G)
oD
Jun 20 2019 12:00PM
[TAN BEE BOON]
Premium Autcmobiles Pte Lid

From ATIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 02/12/2019 10:39 AM,
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$10237.76) - SKM8225S - Claim Handler: Yap, Weijoe

Approved:10237.76:

[DOCUMENTS SUMMARY o . §
| There are no documents.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claimsiindex.cim?fusebox=SVCmaildfuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1 591805&iDomainld=11&I0k0jld=7415&i... 1/2



Ti42019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKMB2255 (17368383 535G)
oD
Jun 20 2019 12:00PM
[TAN BEE BOON]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

| Reply I ﬁ:Elv All I._Hﬂi:k .as Unread I Prll.'lrlr\ltssa:ge [ Deiete.-r-"lessage | | Furward] .-_f - -

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_S5G), sent on 01/07/2019 10:24 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$9296,00) - SKMB2255 - Claim Handler: Yap, Weijos

!A_ppraued:gzgﬁ.uu: Re-Inspecticn to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY o B = = - B B o
There are no documents,

hitps://singapore.mermen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iin boxld=1507T448&iDomainld=11&100j1d=7... 1/2




Gr24/2018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKMA2255 (17368383535G)
oD
Jun 20 2019 12:00PM
[TAN BEE BOON]
Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd

_Reply | Reply all | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 24/06/2019 15:00 PM,
To LKK_HQ)
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$8393.00) - SKMB225S - Claim Handler: Yap, Weijoe

Approved;8393.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour,

|DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

| There are no documents,
1

hittps:{singapore. merimen.com/iclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1503828&iDamainld=11 &iObjld=7... 12



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqno1sse07158r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel B256-35681 Fax: 6844-BB0S Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Yap, Weijoe Date: 28 Jun 2019

Preliminary Advice

Wehicle Na 1 SKMB2255 Accident Date : 20/06/2019
Make : AUDI Q7 Palicy No. 2100483999
Assignment Date  : 21/06/2019 Excess : S5500.00
Date of Inspection  : 21/06/2019 Est. Duration of Repair : 3 days
Inspection At : Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 33,793.00 (inclusive supp)
Revised Amount 5% 9,296.00 (inclusive supp)
Check Items (Estimated) 5% 10,635.00

Total 5% 19,931.00

Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value S5
Pre-Accident Value 5% 195,000.00
COE [ PARF Rebate 5% 98,998.00
Salvage Value 55
Margin for Repair 55 96,002.00

Remarks

{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ X ) Other comments : Supplementary amount is $ 903.00



LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (coregne1sssorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Censultants Pte Lid

AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Aftn:  MdNoor, Norsiah Date: 24 Jun 2019

Preliminary Advice
Vehicle No : SKMB2258 Accident Date : 20/06/2019
Make tAUDI QF Policy No. 12100483999
Assignment Date + 21/06/2019 Excess : 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 21/06/2019 Est. Duration of Repair ;3 days
Inspection At : Prermium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 8% 32,890.00
Revised Amount 55 8,393.00
Check ltems (Estimated) 3% 10,635.00
Total 5% 18,028,00
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 55
Pra-Accident Value 58 195,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate S8 98,998.00
Salvage Value 8%
Margin for Repair 5% 96,002.00

Remarks

{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage,
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

{ 1 The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

{ ) Other comments :



MPA1T18080463 § Fremium Aulomobites Ple Lid - e
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 2000672019 1534
SUBMITTED EY: Nurdiyara Binle Ahmad

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please report comrectly the detads of the accident to speed up the claims process
2. This Form must be completed by ihe Policyholder andfor the Authorised Criver

3. inforrmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful mesrepresentation or witholdsng of malerial facts may allow nsurence companies to

repudiate policy lkabiliy

4. The issue and accepiance of this Form by insurance companies s nol an admissaen of policy lability on the part of the insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&. Thig report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Assoclation of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this regon will, Tor a fee, be made available upon application by Interested partes
7. By the lodgemen af this report bo the ingurers, you hereby consent o the archiving of this report &t the centre and 1o copies of the repod beng made available

aforesaid,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OF Repor
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

20006/2019 15:34

20/08/2019 12:10

TOH TUCK AVENUE MERGING TO PIE
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Allermnative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Occupaltion

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

hMobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

SKMB2255

TAN BEE BOOM
SB119276F
TANEBOON@GMAIL. COM
(LOCAL) +65-82288068
OTHERS-67 196735

AUDI
Q7 2.0 TFSI QU

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

2100483999-01

TAN BEE BOON
S8119276F

11/06/1981

INDOOR

12M11/2010

8 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-82288068

OTHERS-57196735
TANBEOON@GMAIL.COM

Page 1of 14



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN
MPORT. T

1 Please report Lol the details of the accident 1o speed up the elaim (LI

2 This Foren st 2= completed by the Policgholder ang/or the Authorised Drives
3. Information provided mast be as Ay wnillal mevre presentation o withholding of material

Vacis mary aliow insurande tompanies to tepudiate policy Labikty,

4. The sue and scoeptance of this Form by insurance companies ks ol an adminsion of pohcy babilitg on the part of the maurance
[ BT TR

5 Any false reporting may be teferred 1o the Pohce for investigation

6 The report witl be forwarded by the murers of ihe G Kecords Management Centre establivhed by the General inurance
Aviotiation of Singepore (G1A] for archiving and thit copees of thas teport wil for 2 fee be made availabile upon apphcation by
intereited parties.

Ty the lodgment of this report to the inLuTess, you hereby comtent 10 the archiving of this report #1 the centie and to copies of
e feport b made available atoresaic

i mmmmmmmml
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that
la} bww-,mmm-ﬂhﬁnwdmm of Singapore ["GIA") may/ane pormitted to coliect, use,

mmqwhﬂmmﬂhMMmum “Insirers”), the imurers’ wynlew firms, the
M,-Mnlhw:ndwubwﬂw apency/authory (such a1 the polce ), for the purpose(s)
of :

[l PrOCEGNE, handlng and/or dealing with my claimy mmmammmnum
investigations relating 1o the claims

() investigating the accident and/or my daims:

M}mmmmmmmhmmmulmmﬁmwmwm;

(L1} a8 insurenis) who have imsured vehidiels) involves In this aceident and the Insurers’ lswyers/law firms, may are permsted
o collect, use, draciose and for mmmﬂmhmwmn!mmm.m

£} ey Personsl intormation muyfcan be disciosed by any of the Inmurers andjor GIA 1o their thisd party service providers o
agentsiincluding their laayers/law firmi), which may be sited cutside of SEngapore, for onie o more ol the above Purposes

{d] - my Personal information will aho be collected and uied 1o comgibe clasma history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Invevigation and management in present 304 all hutuee clabms

(e] the tormation so coliected under (d) above may be shaved J diaclosed

[i} 10 8l insurers and/or any ofser thard Partas that assist in evaluating, investigating, cantroling or managing frawud
refulatodt, law enforcement and government sgencies ss Feasonably required for the purposes stated, or

[0} For complying with regurements ender any regulations, lawy or court gedery

]

A Al

b el e —. I —

s Slgrature e Peisonmel o !qn'l.!.rr;

Date & Time 303'41 :lrivn 7 Ot the policyholder) Name bm‘n VLT
' l1 bate & Time Db'?-wtﬂ e L T P TR

Page 3 of 14



Gf21/2019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported;
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year;

Engine No.;

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amaount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 21 Jun 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapare NRIC
Q276F

SKMB2255

Mo

21 Jun 2019

AUD|

Q7 20TFSIQU (252 BHP)
White

2014

CYRO12363
WAUZZZ4AMEGD055356
185.0 kW (248 bhp)
$59,025.00

27 Sep 20146

27 Sep 2014

]

$78,245.00

Yes
26 5ep 2026
$5B,683.00

26 5ep 2026

B - Car above 1600cc ar 97kW (130bhp)
10

$55,501.00

$40,315.00

$98,998.00

OK

|'|T[D5:H"-'rl.IIB.QU'U'.SQ.'|la|"||"rI.I'EGIIDI'h"EI'IquIFEKEﬂa!Eﬂ)’l"u[IIICbETGI'E'L"EFEQIHFIUI!I‘UN!.- TIN_IUSFUduguud ||

I



Accident Photo
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| Comeght = 2014 A Aals Paclic instranc P, Lid

Co ey Mo 01006804

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : Tan Bee Boon (Chen Meiwen) Vehicle No. : BKMB2255

Period of Insurance : 27 Sep 2017 To 26 Sep 2018 Policy No. : 2100483999-01

Engine No, : CYRD12383 Endorsement No.

Chassis No. : WALZZZ4MBGD055356 Issued Date 1 21 Aug 2017
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/Model AUDI Q7 2.0 TFSI _
Engine Capacity/Tonnage - 1,984.00 CC Sum Insured : Market Value First Year of Registration : 2018 |
Driver Restriction A, Off Peak Car : Mo Insuring with COE/PARF  : Yes

FPerson or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive*

&) The Polcyholdar
b} iy ather parson wha is diving on the Policyhoider's Of08r o with hisfier parmisshon
This Policy wil indemnify the Paicyholder or any sutharised driver anly if helshe maets e soecked age condiiion

You have to pay an additianal sum of 3 000 as "Young andlse Inexperienced Dnver Excess” MYIDRT} if You are ar Youwr Aunonsed Dviver (named or unnamed) is under iha age of 23 andior has ks
than 2 years' driving experence

Age Condition : All Age Condition

Limitation as 1o use”
Use only for secial, gomeslic and pleasurs purposes snd for the Pobcyhcicders business. This Palicy does not caver usa for hirg or reward, daving luman, driving las!, racing, pace-making. reliabity wal of
spead-lesling, the carnage of poods olhar than samples in connachion with ry Irade ar business o use 1o7 ANy puOSe 1 connection with Mator Trade

Loss of Use
T Limeatons rendered inaperativa by Sectan 8 of the Motar Vahicles {Third-Party Fisks and Compensalion] Act (Cap 189] ang Secton 95 of ihe Road Transporl Acl, 1837 (Malaysa), are niot bo ba |
Inciuded under thase headings

Section 1

Fire - 50 Own Dermags - S1000 Theti - $0. Floog Cowver - S0

Section 2
Property Damage - 50

Windscreen ; 3100

Mamed Driver and Excess jwhers spolicabie)

Tan Bee Boon (Chen Meiwen) - 51000 {Own Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

VA Customer Service Cenler Add: 55 Ui Riad 1 Singapore 408609 3662723

For ceher Appraved Reporting CentrasiAlG Authorised Repsrers. please contact gur 24-hour sccidard emergency hotkng at +55 5338 E200. ARernalively, you may reter 10 AID wabsite www, ahg, Com. 5
ar AlE 5G Mobile App. Simply smarch and downioad “AG 56 from Tunes or Google Play

IMPORTANT NOTES

_! Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: United Overseas Bank Limited

1¥e hesaby carlify thal tha policy ko which this Cerificate of Insurance ralates is issued i aciordanca with e pravisions af the bator Vehicles{Third Party Fisks and Compensation | Ac? (Cap, 189), Bart IV of =
the Road Transpon Acl, 1937 (Malaysia) and Motor Vehicles (Third Pardy Risis) Bules, 1650 (Maiaysia) §

]
0504125207

-r'\':\“

PREMILIM LEASING - SLEE
281 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
SINGAPORE 158938 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritten by AIG Asia PacHic Insurance Pte. Lid. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE N

entan Way #07-16 AlG Bu o SOTE120 | T+65 6419 3000 | F+656415 3723 | www aig com 49 MG Az Paciic fnsuranes Pha Lid




L4-HOUUR AIG AUTO HOTLINE: +65 6338 6200
IMPORTANT: KEEP THIS DOCUMENT IN YOUR CAR AT ALL TIMES.
P N T o TN - Qi VS e LTSN

LOSS OF USE CAR REPLACEMENT BENEFIT

Applicable only if this benefit is included in your motor insurance. Please refer to your Policy Schedule for details. Policy terms
and conditions apply. Please call our customer service hotline number (65) 6419-3000 for assistance.

The Ceriificate of Insurance (Cl) should be produced without demand when collecting the Rental Car and the Rental Car Company
reserves the right to verify the identity of the holder. The Cl is the property of AIG and its use is subject to the terms and conditions
eontained in the Loss of Use Endorsement under the policy issued to the policyhaolder.

Steps to activate Loss of Use Car Replacement Benefit and Impertant Information
1. To activate your loss of usa car replacement, please contact the Rental Car Company (listed below) after filing/reporting your
accident claim.
2. our rental car will be made available within 3 working hours of activation with the Rental Car Company.,
3. Al the time of collection of the Rental Car, the original insurance policy and schedule issued by AIG, a copy of the Accident
Report from Audi Customer Service Centre must be produced.
4. The number of days is based on the period your vehicle is in the repair workshop unless the number of days of loss of use
entitlement is stated in the Policy.
5. Rental cars are strictly for use in Singapore only.
6. Extension of rental beyond repair period approved by AlG surveyor will be chargeable by the Rental Car Company on per day
basis.
Upgrade of Rental Car is available upon reguest subject to additional charges by the Rental Car Company.

8. The rental car will be delivered (within Singapore), and MUST BE RETURNED BACK TO Audi Customer Service Centre
upon collection of your accident car.

Rental Car Company: Premium Automobiles Pie. Ltd.
Activation Hotline: 64741223
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
Monday to Friday: 9am to 6pm Saturday (Half Day): 9am to 1pm

“The Renls Car Company's Terms & Conditions apply |La, rafundabis secunty deposit, eagass abiity for the Rental Car, Coliison Damage Wanear, alo)

N A
IMPORTANT NOTICE

If you sell your motor vehicle, this Notice is IMPORTANT and MUST be complied with. Policyholders are hereby warned that under the
Motor Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap.99), it shall be unlawful for any person to use or cause or permit any
other person to use a motor vehicle without a valid policy of insurance under the Act.

ThalPoIicyhndder is further warned that on the sale of a motor vehicle, they must surrender the Certificate of Insurance and the Policy to
the insurance company. If the Cerificate of Insurance has been lost or destroyed, a Statutory Declaration to that effect must be made.
Failure to comply with this obligation is an offence under the Motor Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap.88),

This Policy will cease to be valid once the maotor vehicle has been sold to another person unless the transfer of interest has been duly
notified 1o and agreed to by the insurance company concerned. If the insurance company agrees to cover the new owner, they will issue
a new Certificate of Insurance in the new owner's name. The premium chargeable may vary according o the new owner's profile.

2
:
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Premium Automobiles

25 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email; Nora. khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No 6841 1183

Reference PA/OD/OTTH/2019/DY/IGW
Date 20-Jun-19

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name

Ms. Tan Bee Boon

Address 167 Westwood Avenue
Singapore 648256

Telephone (HP)+65 B2288068

Type of Claim Own Damage Claims

Policy No. 2100483999-01

Vehicle No SKM 8225 S

Model Code Audi QF 20 TFSI QU

Mcdel / Year 27/9/2016

Engine No CYR 012363

Chassis No WALZZZ4MBEGDOS5356

Mileage 53979 KM

Date In 20-Jun-19

Liability

Excess Cost -

Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

Accident Date 20-Jun-19

Place of Accident

Toh Tuck Avenue merging to PIE



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 4086959
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SKM 8225 S

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and transfer front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SN & 480.00 _
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.
To remove and reinstall air-con condenser, charged air
5 cm_::lar and rqduator. l{;heck electrical fans and control SN § 140000 <
unit, Pressurise cooling system. To carry out vacuum
and regas.
To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs
3 hea_d.llght. Renew front lock carrier and align to g 4,95ﬂ:ﬂh { o
position. Re-organize front crash management P
companents. Reinstall all parts removed
X | i L —
W o e ﬁ,a—-"_a_u
To respray front bumper, both front bumper spoilers ey i
4 .and both front wheel-arch covers: 3 3'39{}'% fieEhyry 2oopd
5 To carry out diagnostic check. SN % 192.00 e

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : % 10,322.00




~remium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax :6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No.

SKM 8225 S

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N___ Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER ¢ {4 $ 224200 < |7
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS A s $ 403.00 *

3 FRONT TOW EYE COVER  }t 4 $ 36.00 «

4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - LHIRH %1 $ 120.00

5 FRONT BUMPER INNER END CAP -RH  »+to $ 32.00 4

6 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-UPPER CENTRE ~~ $ 252.00 “

7 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE-LOWER CENTRE 1 & $ 187.00 &

8 FRONT BUMPER UNDERRUN BAR  jut = $ 735.00 ¥

9 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT ;&1 &~ $ 191.00

10  FRONT BUMPER SPOILER-LH/RH gt o~ s 384.00

11 FRONT BUMPER SPOILER-LH/RH OUTER AT $ 80.00

12 RADIATORGRILLE ~ ¢meld $ 226000 — |/

13 RADIATOR GRILLE COVER (el ¢ $ 62.00 ~—

14  RADIATOR GRILLE INNER COVER Cacefed A ML g 56.00 =~ X

15 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUDIE GRILLE-LH/IRH [ et 542,00 27/ 21k-4°

16 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE CAP-RH 7~ $ 31.00

17 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE  ( aalerd $ 156,00

18 FRONT BUMPER CARRIER Alet A $ 791.00 *

19 FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER 3, L $ 119.00 &

20  FRONT BUMPER CARRIER SUPPORT-LH/IRH /7 $ 66.00 +
SUB-TOTAL SPARE PARTS - $ B,754.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST,

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




2remium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SKM 8225 S
Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
21 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTON-LH/IRH A 7 - - 80.00
22 SIGN"CAUTION "STICKER /< $ 13.00 %
23 LED HEADLIGHT MOUNTING-LHRH "¢ M 2§ 214.00 7
24  LED HEADLIGHT -LH Rl AL $ 9,074.00 .
25 LED HEADLIGHT LIFT CLYLINDER-LH/RH Mo AT i 2 3 362.00 4
26  FRONT BUMPER SENSOR .Mﬁmﬁ“ *}'fj; $ 924,00
(i =
27  FRONT BUMPER SENSOP SEAL RING M ~ 4§ 12.00
28  FAN FARE-LOW TONE-LH ?;’H Al $ 206.00 /<
20 FAN FARE-HIGH TONE-RH ¢ At A $ 206.00 A
30  LOCK CARRIER WITH MOUNTING FOR COOLANT RADIATOF § 1,100.00 -V,
31 READY-MIXCOOLANT15LTR M7 4 5 84.00 )~
32 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE-LHIRH A 77 2 8 50.00 ¢
33 FRONT WHEEL COVER -LH/RH % 2 g 1,044.00 = t
34  FRONT WHEEL COVER CLIP el 6 $ 500~ 3 L/
35  FRONT CARPLATENO, 24~ SIN § 4000 <«
36  SUNDRIES e $ 400.00 1 .
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 22,568.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 10,322.00 —_—
GRAND TOTAL $

32,800.00 /07"
Fal

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

— —— e

Telefax -|
i
Name . AdNeaa. — ‘}
Surveyed Date - ;In'{j b f 19 !
Authorised Date : b _ -
Excess Cost
Liability =
Remarks : A Aaansed 6 3 ;}} )
Please Note ! This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at

Tel: 6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Mora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Supplementary Estimate

GST Reg No. 18-9902271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/OD/OTT/2019/DY/CW

78 Shenton Way Date 26-Jun-19

#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Kee Siang

Singapore 079120 Pages Lofl

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept ~ Regn No SKM 82255

Tel: 6841 0055 / Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi Q7 2.0 TFSI QU

Quantity: Description Unit Price Amount
Parts

A/C Condenser L‘l'/r / S 878.00
Lock Carrier Air Guide (/T S 25.00

il
2
3
4
>
5}

GRAND TOTAL $ 903.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

\

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408889
Tel: (65) 6366 2323 Fax: (65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No, 19-9802271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PAICDIOTTSI2019/DYIGW
78 Shenton Way Date 2-Jul-18
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan
Singapore 078120 Pages 10f1
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept  Regn No SKM 8225 S
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi Q7 2.0 TFSI QU
_ Quantity | Descripton | UnitPrice  Amount |
Parts 1
1 Wiring set for front bumper Gy 'J.ll_?E‘. c g 582.00 3 465.60
“|
$ 582.00 § 465.60
TOTAL _§ 58200 § 465.60

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate : Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad1

Contact No :  B3B6 2323

Fax No :  B8411183

Reference M PAMQDOTTA2018/DYIGW
Date : 20-Jun-19

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 0792120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 D055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Ms. Tan Bee Boon

Address 187 Westwood Avenue
Singapore 648256

Telephone 1 (HP)+&5 82288068

Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims

Policy No. : 2100483999-01

Vehicle No : SKM 8225 S

Model Code : AudiQ7 20TFSIQU

Model | Year T 2792016

Engine No :  CYROD12363

Chassis No 2 WAUZZZ4MEGD055356

Mileage : 53979 KM

Date In : o 20-Jun-19

Liability :o=

Excess Cost noom

Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

Accident Date : 20-Jun-19

Place of Accident :  Toh Tuck Avenue merging to PIE




