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JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

DEAR SIR
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR SLA4300K
1 IPC REAR BUMPER noMe
2 IPC REARBUMPERCLIPS A
3 | PC REAR BUMPER SPONGE 7o, {
4 1PC REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH 3/«
5 1PC REAR END PANEL sC
6 1PC TAILGATE REPAIR  + -1
7 I PC TAILGATE BADGE A1
8 |PC TAILGATE HARRIER EMBLEM ~ 7
9 2PCS REVERSE SENSOR 5
10 2PCS TAILGATE REFLECTOR # -1
LESS 2
11 SKID PLATE
12 TUFF COATING
13 WIRING
14 REVERSE SENSOR LABOUR CHARGES
15 SPRAY PAINTING
16 LABOUR CHARGES

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590

Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No ::200704370C

27/6/2019
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back'to OneMotoring

Page 1 of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
0944G

SLA4300K

No

25 Jun 2019
TOYOTA

HARRIER ELEGANCE 2.0 CVT 2WD
Black

2015

3ZRB716476
Z5U600070674
111.0 kW (148 bhp)
$27,884.00

01 Mar 2016

01 Mar 2016

0

$26,038.00

Yes
28 Feb 2026
$19.528.00

28 Feb 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$55,001.00

$36,716.00

$56,244,00

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jun 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov sg/la/vil/action/enguireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _[D=F030...  25-Jun-19



Asher Sni SLH]{Autuz

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 11:49 AM
To: Jouis
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLCING SLA4300K AND SMEK 269E ON 20/6/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCR/AIG19010995/ead
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an autherisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Ragoreiy
Asher Sng | Cose Handier
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-4051 | emaik gshenngikkouto.com | fox: &741-4108
Bl 51, Poya Ubd Industnal Park, Ut Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5[408%33)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 11:13 AM

To: jouls <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauta.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.coms; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLCING SLA4300K AND SMK 269E ON 20/6/2019 *** LKK REF: CCB/AIG19010995 /ead

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed Ol has reported. Please refer to the below 01's sketch plan and statement.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact KSher

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mel KEwan | Admin



LKK Auto Consullants Ple Ltd
Phone: 6366 ooss | email: MeiEwan@|kkaute.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408913)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 11:46 AM
To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) <Melkwan@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@®Ilkkauto com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLCING SLA4300K AND SMK 263E ON 20/6/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Mej Kwan ,

ACCIDENT INVOLCING SLA4300K AND SMK 269E ON 20/6/2019

We are assisting owner of SLA4300K handling their third party claim
recovery against SMK269E [ YOUR INSURED ).

Have your insured reported, kindly establish liability .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : |65) 62898126
Fax  :(B65) 62870590
Emall :joui Om.5,



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

BIK 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195

Tel:62898126 Fax :6287059)
Pusimess Megistration o 20743 00

1907/2019 L& W

LKK REF: CC6/AIGI9010995/ea3

without Prejudice

CHO LEK Auto Consultunts Ple Lud
51 Lkl Ave |

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(51408933

Dear Sits,

ACCIDENT INVOLCING SLA4300K AND SMK 269E ON 20/62019
. we are now seeking the total amount of clmm as follow:
Repair cost S$ 3134260 with gst)

\o o LS 200,00
TOTALSS 353426

We shall appreciate if you could kindly comsider our elaim at your earhiest convenlence and kindly let us
have your acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 1 4days of your receipt of this letter

Yours fhithfiilly
4

Jouis Seow ( Emall: jouisidinnuito, com.sg)
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S1UBRTAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (063) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19010995/Uea3

01 JUL 2019

BIS MOTORING PTE. LTD.

20 BENDEMEER ROAD

#03-13/14 BS BENDEMEER CENTRE
SINGAPORE 339914

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 269E AND SLA 4300K ON 20/06/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lud to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ Ikkauto.com

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Moror Claims Dept)



JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Acknowledgement

Accident Involving, SLA “mk‘ _mimm'ﬁ&n_l )b\hll?

L.

:I‘\.i

un

rweTole Socke Kinoug ol v _the owner of vehicle Registratiby
Number mve been advised by them and understand the content of my/our motor
claim as specify herein: |

Type of Claim ; [] Claim Own-pelicy only ‘
‘E/Dim Settlement with 3™ Party Insurer

A Compulsory policy axcess, . i Stated in Motor Policy taken up by you, is applicable fir
own damage claim.

recommended by the surveyor and the Benchmark Rates published in State Court Practice Direction f‘a'-.
Nen-injury Motor Accident (NIMA, \Claims . '

I'We, amfare fully aware tha Jin Auto Services Pre Lid is assisting me/us in my/our third party
insurer, I/we shall release Jin Auto Service Pte Ltd against any linbility, loss claim or proceedings which
mnyuiunu:#minthummufurbymumut‘mu&muﬂhumw-im. =

claimed by you, I/we agres and undertake to pay the ful] amount of your repair bill and survey fies and|

any other expensag reasonably incurred on my/our behalf or to pay vou the difference in amount, as the |
case may be, {

In the event that my/our insurer or third party insurer is not prepered to settle claim due 1o breach of
pnﬂcrnrmharm:mn,mmnllpyﬂnmwmPmudthefullmpurblu. |

Signed by -

£

Name :

I S TV NN TR

NRIC No: 1 q"lﬁq‘l'll' 6

Date :

welu( Vg



VOu R
AIG Asia Pacific-E Third ¥

wwelL JIN AUTO SERVICES FTE LTD (“the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached

an agreement with the appointed suryeyor of Al Asia Pucific Insurance Pro Lid LEK AUTO
) wtm&mym}mmuwmmmlcmfmw
(Repair Cost), $3360.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S8 - (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SLA 4300K
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 20/06/2019 (date) along PAYA

| FRAR ROAD (TOWARDS HOUGANG DIRECTION) (location) involving vehicle no/s SME
269E.

This is pursusnt to the inspection conducted on 25/06/2019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/1 confirm that we/l are/am autho by (e owner MM&I&Y_{% third
party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLA 4300K_make the claim as set oul in the above paragraph and
we/l1 have full authority to settle th!‘.‘imattﬂl' on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will mdemnify AIG Aaia Pacifio Insurunce Pre T 1d for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will urfum- already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”™
after the above said agreement | a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repal m:u:l!urrf.mmlz?md!crrlq:p.ssuufumpm::iwmumrttuedau'rmlgmtr.uﬂ._,!'gl
4300K (vehicle no.) as a result of accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant (o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this EL (day) of '1'*\"!7 {month) Iﬁﬁ.{wﬂﬂ

'E'.i_gned by appointed surveyor
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlang
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cise  |Nolified Est Submitted  |Ad] Assigned | Adj Rot [Ag] Submitten | Ins Auth'ed Status 1
" |21 Jun 2019 ::&"mﬁ 5$1,929.23 54292023 Pending for Survey
amn . Report
! Edit fag | canaaapt | | 2ot Estimates | | view not | Canced Case |

Reference Claim Details

|[Eraated by adjuster]

BI5 MOTORING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 2017350550
TOK SOCK KHENG SALLY, [D: S1410944G

_ |20/06/201% 09:00 - :5%
SLA4300K Date of Lass: | {39 \onins and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man 7))

TP / 511077457256 RoaHeeeT | 0999994322 (Comprehensive)

{Claimant);

Excess:
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd (Defu) Bik 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412, 539195 Defu Lane - Tel: 6289 B126

i
SMK269E Palicy Na. | e oMVPO00DD1915-02-000 |
i
|
1

| { . AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd. (Express] - Tel: 85-8419-3000 ... [Handled by Loh, Chee-Heng| Clies-Heng. LohZalg com

| [lamants | Great American Insurance Company (HQ) - Tel: 6804 6047

Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] | Final Rpt due 02/07/2019]

'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view A1 | _Compose Case wait | |
| Trere arg no rmail for this case

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler
| Mo results.

hutps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 13/82019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLA4300K (51107745725G)
[SMK269E]
TP

TOK SOCK KHENG SALLY
Jun 20 2019 9:00AM
[BIS MOTORING PTE LTD]
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Letters/Correspondences Lperpage  [v]
Mo | Finaljzed Dn LEK Auto Consultanis Pta Lid (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 [{Drafy) Third Party Express Settiemant = Payment Breakdown B | Edi
Photos/Images o o e |
(No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbrnall | Print
1 12506/19 18:34 | Chassis Number D | aairc | A
! |25/06/19 18:34 | Odometer Reading D | adps | 4
|3 |25/06/19 18:34 | Geners! View 0 odws | A
4 |29/06/19 1834 | Genersl View Q| Ladws | A
[l 25/06/16 18:34 | General View 0| oaws | 4
|s' | 25/06/19 1834 | General View 0 | oadws | A
7 |25/06/19 18:34 | Genersl View O | sdvs | A
8 |25/00/19 18:34 | General View 0 | Losd 1;”'3.?-1
5 Z5/08/19 18:34 | General View 0 |cadips A |
_":u__.?_,i_fww 18:34 | General View O | tosa s | (4 |
11 |28/08/19 18:34 | General View 0 | losaws | B!
12 |25/06/19 18:34 | General View 0| wars | F
: 3 'Ilmww 1834 General View ) | Load PG [i‘_’f_I
i4 |15/06/19 18:34 | General View 0 | lcsdwe | A
(15 [35/06/19 18:34 | General View O | oavc | B
ﬁ:_hs.wu 18:34 _|M—ﬂm 0| tvars | A
7 imawu 18:34 lam View 0 | Loadiec
18 |29/06/19 18:3¢ | General View 0 | Lo wc
19 [25/06/19 18:34 | General View © | wars | B
20 |25/06/19 18:34 General View 0 | toad s | B |
(21 |2%/06/19 18:34 | Genersl View 0| leadwc | &
!E: |25/08/19 18:34 | General View O =ars | B
in 25/06/19 18:34 General View 0 | oaowrs | A
|24 |25/06/19 18:34 General View D | oadipa | 4
25 1207190517 | Reinspection Photo O | aaws | A
26 | 12/07/19 09117 | Reinspection Photo O | tars &
27 17/07/1909:17  Reinspection Photo O | aws | |
28| 17/07/19 09:17 Relnspection Phato Load jPG I = |
20 |18/07/1908:33 | Reinspection Phots O dws &
30 18/07/1908:34 | Reinspection Photo 0  icows M
31 |18/07/1908:34 | Reinspection Photo ©  sivc | &
12 momisceas | Reinspection Photo D | ladirs | B
33 1807/19 08:35 | Relnspection Photo 0 wmivs | B
34 | 18/07/10 08:25 Reinspection Phato B | imad o
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 13/8/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Lettars/ Corraspondances 1perpage  [v] A

|No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG}) Thumbinall Print
M|

35 18/07/1908:35 | Reinspection Photo O | s | A

|36 |18/07/19 08:35 Reinspoction Photo 0D | toadrs | A

37 | 16/07/19 08:35 | Reinspection Photo 0 | Losa s

Documentation Twm w]l A

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auts Consultants Pie Ltd (HG) Thumbmnail | Print

1 21/06/19 15:28 | TP GIA REPORT g Load FOF

2 |0107/1911:44 | LETTER TO O1 Lowd FUF

£ 13/08/719 08:40 WORKSHOP TNVOICE B Load POF

4 13/08/ 19 08:40 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Laad POF

5 13/08/19 08:40 Release Voucher o Load POF

|No | Finalized On AlG Asis Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. [SG) Thurnbrall | Print

1 24/00/19 09:38 OI GIA REPORT o Lobd POF

Documents Checklist

I There are no document checkliss confligured,

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Featn Harickl dew Drivess wnlies wou Bhow I b ot Darles

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 13/8/2019



Preview Page 1 of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I'U'lhldn No: SMK269E (Insd veh) Modal: TOYOTA HARRIER 2.0
SLA4300K (TP veh) [ELEGANCE CVT (A)
| Date of Accident: |20/06/2019
Global Sum Settlement |: | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate § 6,130.46
Final Repair Cost 5 3,134 27
Loss of Use 5 360.00 4.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) s 0.00 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee 15 0.00
Others. § D.00
4 ]
Final Settlement Sum -] 3,404 27

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X | NO  [Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Lisbility 100 (%)

) BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liabllity: (%) Assessed Liability () (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filted only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1) [Jin Auto Services Ple Lid - ] 3,454 27
2] ]
13 Aug
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Raport! Bill {if any)

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8VCdoc& fuseaction=dsp _doclt... 13/8/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ics reg e 1sssorissm

51 Ubil Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com assignments@Ikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG12010895/UEA3Q2
Data: 13/082018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No: 0099894322
EIL“':"""' Vehicle o 4300k Insured Vehicle No: SMK269E
Date of Loss: 20/0672010 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 511077457256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLA4300K
Make & Model: TOYOTA HARRIER. 2.0 ELEGANCE CVT (A) Engine No: 3ZRB716476
Reg. Data! 01/03/2016 (Man_ Year 2015) Chassis No: ZSU60007T0674
Caolour Black Odomater: 75378 km
Engine Capacity: 1886 cc
Markel Valua/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured [SS): Market Value/New Car Price

NDITION HI AT THE TIME QF
General Condition; Stearing (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls): Yes Engine Modification: Ne  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 225/85 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/85 R17
Frant Left Side: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Lefl Side: Dunlop 7 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm
The sbove values represent the remaining tyre lreads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 3,259.40 205922 1,200.18 3682
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2470.00 870.00 1.,600.00 6478
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 5.729.40 2,929.22 2,800.18 48.87
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS$) 401.08 205.05 196.01 48 87
Nett Amount (58) 6,130.46 3,134.27 2,996.19 48.87
+ Loss of Use (4,0 x $$90.00/day) (S$) 380.00
Nett Liability (S5) 3,494.27
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmenl: 25/062019
Date Inspected: 25/06/2019 Inspected Al Jin Auto Services Ple Lid (Defu)
Blk 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412
Singapore 5391685
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This report represends our findinga af the tme and place of inspection slated hamih. Such mspection has been carred oul to the best of our
knowiadge and abvlity but any offuer iabiity under sy other circumdsfances is heraby arpressly sxcluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PariNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Dented / Deformed 142570FL  *1,425.70FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 60.00FL “60.00FL
31 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Tarmn 199.70FL  *198.70FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Grazed 526 00FL  “526.90FL
5 1 *REAR END PANEL Repair 882 BDFL ~FL
5 1 *“TAILGATE REPAIR (NPA) Not Necessary 0.00FL “FL
7 1 *TAILGATE BOARD Mot Necessary B3BOFL “~FL
8 1 “TAILGATE HARRIER EMBLEM Not Necessary 72.70FL “FL
8 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 366.30FS  *200.00FS
10 2 *TAILGATE REFLECTOR Not Necessary 320 20FL *.FL
11 1 *SKID PLATE Damaged 20000FS  *200.00FS
FeFranchise pan. G=Spoehen. L=lismamsc
Sub Total (S§)  4,157.10 2,612.30
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25,00% (5%) 897.70 553.08
Total Parts (S§)  3,2590.40 2,059.22

| Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus items selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 TUFF COATING New 120.00 0.00
2 WIRING New 30.00 20.00
3  REVERSE SENSOR LABOUR CHARGES New 120.00 50.00
4  SPRAY PAINTING New 1,100.00 400,00
5  LABOUR CHARGES New 1,100.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,470.00 870.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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