
To : M/s ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Date: 05/04/2021

Your Ref. No. : CDMPG19000921

Our Ref. No. : CC6/EGI19010984/Aga3q2

: $ 750.00            

: $ days

Rental (If any)      : $ 200.00            4 days 

: $ 7.49                

: $

957.49            

: $ 950.00            

:

 

1)                   : $ 950.00                                   

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

GLOBAL SUM

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

14/5/2019

SCL 6628B

SGP 9706X

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

50%

HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability





190620









TAN MENG YOUNG, CHARLES





Our Ref: CC6/EGI19010984/Aka3 
 
03 JULY 2019 
 
WONG SIEW LENG 
BLK 442 SIN MING AVE 
 #15 – 425 
 SINGAPORE 570442 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL6628B & SGP9706X ON 14/05/2019 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for ERGO INSURANCE 
COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver 
under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
  
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or 
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, 
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 16/07/2019, after we 
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis 
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the 
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 
530% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
KHANCHNA  
Case Handler 
DID:  6841 2360 
FAX: 6741 4108 
EMAIL: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c. ERGO INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED  
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 January 2021 4:58 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Ivy Yong
Subject: RE: Accident involving SGP 9706X (TP) & SCL 6628B (ERGO - please advice)  on 

14/05/2019 ERGO: Claim CDMPG19000921

Data Classification: Confidential, C3 

 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please offer 50% liability. We have settled the third party’s BI claim at 50% 
Thank you 
 
Warmest Regards, 
Phoebe Jay Xie 
Manager 
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
8 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Three 
Singapore 038988 
DID.:  +65 6829 9191 
phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg 
 

 
 
Your acceptance of our offer constitutes a binding agreement in the full and final settlement of your claim. By 
clearing our cheque, you are discharging ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd and our insured/s from all further liabilities arising 
directly or indirectly from the said accident. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 14 January 2021 12:20 pm 
To: Ivy Yong <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg> 
Cc: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: Accident involving SGP 9706X (TP) & SCL 6628B (ERGO - please advice) on 14/05/2019 
 
Hi Ivy / Pheobe, 
 
We refer to the email below.  
 
Kindly let us have your mandate approval soon.  
 
As TP is chasing for settlement.  
 
Thanks  
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
ERGO REF: Please advice 
LKK REF : CC6/EGI19010984/Aka3q2 
 
============================  
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGP 9706X  (TP) & SCL 6628B  (OI) ON 14/05/2019 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
TP’s video (as attached) shows TP waiting in his lane for an opportunity to change to the right lane but Insured 
overtook on the left causing the accident. 
 
We had informed to the Insured of the TP claim and NCD issues and Insurance agreeable to let the Insurance handle 
the claim. 
 
In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is down against Insured. We also noted that TP made an injury 
claim as well. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer  HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER 

Cost of Repair                           $     5,571.44                   $ 1,500.00 
Loss of Rental ($120 x 4 days)                          $         480.00                   $    400.00 ($100 x 4 days) 
LTA Search Fee                          $             7.49                   $         7.49 

TOTAL                          $     6,058.93                   $ 1,907.49 
 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 

*3 days recommendation for repair +1 Sunday = 4 days 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
For your approval and/or further instructions please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


