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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 10:00 AM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW. ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY*** ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 J & SLG 5363 R ON

18.05.2019 ALONG TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2
AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VP05/021825

Dear Nivitha,
Kindly proceed as requested.

At the same time, please highlight to the case handler to
assess liability before proceeding with Direct Settlement
as our insured is also claiming against the third party.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

)

The all ©%%3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authonsed external parties only.

From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com]

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 9:28 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY*** ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 J & SLG 5363 R ON 18.05.2019 ALONG
TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2 AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS [External Confidential]
Importance: High

Our Ref: XE 2361 )
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your email of even date informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of
Surveyors

Our client confirmed appointment of KALVIN ANG as the Single Joint Expert for this matter.



Piease be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTE LTD

1 TUAS AVENUE 20

SINGAPORE 638832

Contact: Ms. Jolene @ 6302 1999 (Please call before going)

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday,
Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Tah

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

cc: XE 2361 J — By Email only

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 4:02 PM

To: Elaine Toh

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG

Subject: RE: ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY™*" ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 J & SLG 5363 R ON 18.05.2019 ALONG
TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2 AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : 18/19/19/VP05/021825
Dear Elaine,

Please see the list of surveyors below and let us hear from you.

Kalvin Ang

Jackson Quek

Paul Thanapal

Aw Po Huat (Andrew)
Ng Chun Wei (Adam)
Mohd Taufik

Mohd Rasul

Marcus Chua
Kenneth Kong

Adrian Ling
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Best Regards

‘Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

=

The all %" |onpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only

From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com)

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 3:25 PM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Subject: ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY*** ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 J & SLG 5363 R ON 18.05,2019 ALONG
TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2 AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS

Our Ref: XE 2361 J (YL)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed by CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTE LTD to notify you of a road traffic accident on 18.05.2019 ALONG
TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2 AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS involving our client’s mator
vehicle registration number XE 2361 J and motor vehicle registration number 5LG 5363 R driven by you/your insured
at the maternial time

As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your
insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the motar vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within
the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the motor vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Toh

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

cc XE 2361 J —BY EMAIL

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721 148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490




"DISCLAIMER:
The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email
by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any
person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email
transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above, If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




Denise T’"l (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 952 AM

To: Jolene Cheng; Rasul (LKKAutD)

Cc: olivia sia@choonheng.com.sg; sales@ephraimtrucks.com; rosli@ephraimtrucks.com
Subject: RE: GIA report and estimate for XE2361)

Dear Jolene,

As spoken, the finalized amount will be 58989, as part has at 10% discount.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-2315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | Sl408933)

From: Jolene Cheng <jolene.cheng@choonheng.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 11:16 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.coms; olivia.sia@choonheng.com.sg; sales@ephraimtrucks.com;
rosli@ephraimtrucks.com

Subject: RE: GIA report and estimate for XE2361J

Hi Rasul,

To finalise the amount 5o it will be:
- Parts: Step - 5110
- Labour- 5800
- Lossof use?

Thank you.

Best regards,

Jolene Cheng CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTELTD
Admin Assistant {1 Tuas Avenua 20

Singapore 538832

Main (65) 8302 1899

DID (B5) 6302 1982

Fax (85) 6863 3101

Email jolane chena@chognhana com $g

Websilea www choofhang com &g

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 9:50 AM
To: Jolene Cheng <jolene.cheng@choanheng.com.sg>



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Jolene Cheng <jolene.cheng@choonheng.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 11:16 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAutD)

Ce: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); olivia sia@choonheng.comsg; sales@ephraimtrucks.com;
rosli@ephraimtrucks.com

Subject: RE: GIA report and estimate for XE2361)

Hi Rasul,

To finalise the amount so it will be:
Parts: Step - 5110
Labour - $800
- Loss of use?

Thank you.

Best regards,

Jolene Cheng CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTELTD
Admin Assistant 1 Tuas Avenue 20

Singapors 638832

Main (85)8302 1999

DID (65) 6302 1982

Fax (65) 6863 3101

Emall jglgns chang@Eichopnhang com 54

Website www choonhang com.sg

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 9:50 AM

To: Jolene Cheng <jolene.cheng@choonheng.com.sg>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; olivia.sia@choonheng.com.sg; sales@ephraimtrucks.com;
rosli@ephraimtrucks.com

Subject: RE: GIA report and estimate for XE2361)

Hi lolene,

Refer to the previous email dated 02 July , we have agreed on the labour part 5800.
So, the total finalisation amount is $910 / 4 days of repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rosul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@kkautg.com | fax: 68414315
Bik 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

1



Denise Taz SLH.KAutn}

From: Jolena Cheng <jolene.cheng@choonheng.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 10:33 AM

To: SUR

Ce Rasul (LKKAuto); ‘Olivia Sia'; rosli@ephraimtrucks.com
Subject: Accident between XE2361) & SLG5363R

Dear Survey Team,

We have a case between the owner of the vehicle: SLG5363R and our vehicle: XE2361J. The estimate was reviewed
by Mr Rasul and he could not agree to the labour charges at $1,080, However, the labour charges include panel
beating ($300) , spray painting ($300) as well as the dismantling and fixing back all the accident parts {$200) which
can easily approximately about $800. However, Mr Rasul feels that the labour charges should be only 5500. Thus,
we cannot come up with an agreement. Please advise what to do.

Thank you.

Best regards,
Jolene Cheng CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTELTD
Admin Assistani 1 Tuas Avenus 20

Singapore 638832

Main (65) 6302 1999

DID (65) 6302 1982

Fax (65) 6863 3101

Email jglgng chengiEchoonhend.com s
Website www.choonheng com 64




Denise Ta! !LI{I{Autu!

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 10:46 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); '‘GERALD POH WEE BIN'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; SUR

Subject: RE: ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY*** ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 ) & S5LG 5363 R ON

18.05.2019 ALONG TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2
AT ABOUT 1850 HOURS [External Confidential]
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED XE 2361) pdf

Dear Sirf/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle XE 2361)

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email: denisetav®ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408233)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 10:38 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ***PRE-REPAIR SURVEY***® ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 2361 J & 5LG 5363 R ON 18.05.2019 ALONG
TRAFFIC JUNCTION OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2 AT ABOUT 1950 HOURS [External Confidential]

Resend
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed that repairer agreed our surveyor Mr. Rasul to survey this vehicle.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 68411072 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6a56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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£1 LI AVE 1, #01-25 PAVA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATORE 400933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX ; (068) 82360373

Your Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021825
Date:25/6/2019

Our Ref: CS/LPC19010988/R11d3

The Motor Claims Department
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SLNS64TK .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle

on 21/06/2019 _at the premises of M/s ___ Choong Heng Logistic _and have the
following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : l 00
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 610.00
“Check™ ltems Amount : S§ 0.00
Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8% -
Nett Value 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Repair days: 4

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent,

Yours faithfully
Rasul
Automotive Assessor
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Plasss repor I'.‘I:l'r‘_ﬂl:‘ﬂ‘! the datails of the scoden o speed wp 1Ne claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andlior the Authorised Denver

3. nformation provided must be 88 truthful end accursie as possible. Any wilul misrepresentation of withokiing of matansl facts may alow NSUrANCE coMmpanes 1o
fepudiate polcy Lability

d, The maue and scoeptance of this Form by insurance companias s nol an adrmeasion of policy lability on e part of the iNsurance companies

5. Any false reparting may be referred to the Police for imvestigation.

6. This report will be forsamied by e insurens of the GiA Aecords Management Cenirn eslablinhed by the Genernl innurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and Bhal coples of Bis report will, for 3 few, be made avadable upon applicEbon by ineresied paries

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers. you hereby consent to the archiving of this report st the centre and to copies of the report being made svailable
Aloresas

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 21/05/2019 15:57
Date Of Accident 18/05/2019 19:50
Exact Location Of Accident TRAFFIC JUNCT OF TUAS SOUTH AVE 3-TUAS SOUTH AVE 2
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vahicle Registration Number XE2361J
InsuredPolicyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner CHOON HENG LOGISTICS PTE. LTD
Co Reg No 201112364C
Email Address KENT.GOH@CHOONHENG.COM.5G
Maobile Phone No
Altarnative Phona Mo OFFICE-63021999
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer DAF
Modal FTCFAS.410 WB3600

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident WORK PURPOSE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicls? e

If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vahicle Calagary COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
Type Of Covarage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number 5091708513-01

Caover Note Number

Driver

Name of Orvar SONG JIANGUO

NRIC No GEA21929P

Date Of Birth 2000211973

Oecupation OUTDOOR

Cate OFf Dnving Pass 23042012

Oriving Experence
Gender

Maobile Mumber
Fax Number
Contact Numb.er
EMail Address

T YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
MALE
(LOCAL) +65-91708928

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 18



Addrass

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured’s Company
If No. Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Dnver's Own Vahicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicla)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accidem?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other matenal or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown parsonis)
soliciting/affering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?
If Yes Please state which Police Station
Police Station Name

Police Station Addrass

Police Station Contact

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

if Yes.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER POLICE REPORT

Attachment{s)

Are accident photos available for altachment?
Was there any wieo captured by Car Camera?
Was there any asudio recorded?

1 TUAS AVENUE 20
638832
YES

COLLISION - CHANGE/CROSS LANE
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO
NO
YES

MO

YES

NANYANG N.P.C

ROAD 2 JURDONG WEST AVE 5, POSTCODE: 649482 . COUNTRY:
SINGAPORE

TEL NO- 1800-7829959 - FAX NO
NO

YES

YES

NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vihicle Category

Hame of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Addrass

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

SLGS5363R
HOMDA  VEZEL

PRIVATE CAR

LEE JIN HENG JUSTIN
587038268

Page 2 of 18



No. Of Passenger [Including Driver)

Fage 3ol 18
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Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1
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DESCAIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENTTUAL  Sdvth Pive 3

Refr poli et

Driver's Signature
Date & Time: [I¥ driver is not the policyhalder]
Date & Time:

G SwrrhPant orm_vl

Raporting Centre P
Name:

NRIC/FIN No.-

Tﬂoeh Signature

|
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Police Station Of Origin:
Nanyang N.P.C

2 Jurong West Avenue 5 SINGAPORE
649482

Tel No: 1B00-7928900

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Commaon Statement Pg. 1

TRO1905122102

1af3
Raport No. T/201808182103

Date/Time Report Made:
1%5'251921 01

_J,_" 3 AL "!f.._: L

nme of Informant

Station Diary No.:

SONG JIANGUD APT BLK 518 JURONG WEST STREET 52 #07-141 |
SINGAPORE 840518

ID Type /1D No.: Contact No.: I

FIN NO / GB821529p Home/Office: 91708928 Mobile:

Nationality Email: |

CHINESE [

Sex: Age Date of Birth: Type of Informant:

Male 45 20/02/1973 Diriver

Race: Language Institution / School Name:

Chinese

Dmupnhm Driving Licence Information:

TUAS AVENUE 2
| Traffic unction of TUAS Avenue 2
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit
Clear Diry 70 Km/h
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume
Dual iage Way Traffic Light - Working Heavy
Type of Collision; Anyone conveyed by
Between Moving Vehicles - Side Swipe - Same Direction :
No

Any tnan Invulvad No

No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL

| Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA

Page §of 18



Common Statement Pg. 1

SINGAPORE
L RN T

Police Station Of Origin: 2003
Nanyang N.P.C Report No. T/20190518/2102
2 Jurong West Avenue 5 SINGAPORE

649482 CONTINUATION OF REPORT
Tel No: 1800-Te298388

Name | SONG JIANGUO i ' No. G6821 ;
Related Vehicie | NIL Contact No | 91708928
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Classof | Class: 3.4 '
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence &
Expiry Date
 Date Treatment | NIL Date Discharge | NIL
No. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Degree of Injury | NIL
Brief Details.

On the above date and time, | was driving along Tuas Ave 2 in XE2361J by myself crossing lowards Tuas

Ave 1 via the traffic junction. | noticed the traffic junction was congestad and maoving slowly. While

engaging in a turn lowards Tuas Ave 1, a grey colour Honda Vezel marked SLGS363R that was moving

by my left side bumped into the side bumper of my vehicle, This damaged tha bumper. Thareafter, the

driver of the vehicle got out at the side of the road and | got out as weil, before we exchanged parficulars, |
This report is for insurance claiming purposes. No injuries wera sustained on both sides. The other

driver's particulars are SBTD38268, Lee Jing Heng, Justin |
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Common Statement Pg. 1

POLICE FORCE L

TR201005162 102

Palice Station Of Origin: Jof3
Nanyang N.P.C Repon No. TR20180518/2102 '
2 Jurong West Avenue 5 SINGAPORE — |
549482 CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Tel No: 1800-7928989

Sketch Plan
Informant is not abie to provide skétch plan

IMPORTANT: Plsase attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Ceriificate to this report. If you don't have
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating ihe report number as reference.
——— e e

Signature Of Officar Recarding The Report Signature Of Informant |
Ji

Insp LOO SHI TENG w

Signature Of Intarpreter  DatelTime.
Not applicable 19/05/2018 21:01

Officer In Charge Of Case: | Classification Of Case: =
TP HRT/

S| KALESWAR| PALANI
Contact No : 65476907

! 1 s

e ———
ir__ i
Authentication Stamp' & E
NP1GE %EW’E W
‘ Siunfure ¥

-___‘_‘—-—-—___
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Commaon Statement Pg. 1

Traffic Police Department
Charge Office
10 Ubi Avenue 3
Singapore 408865
Traffic Police
AMENDMENT
Name: Traffic Accident Report no:
Song Jlanguo T/20180518/2102
Address: Accident Date / Time:
Bik 518 Jurong West Strest 52 #07-141 18/05/2019 @ 1850hrs
NRIC no: Vehicle{s) involved:
GB821829P 1) XE2361J
2) SLG5363R
Contact no:
Q1708928
Date of Amendment:
22/05/2018
Dear Sir / Madam
| wish to amend as follows:
Reference o the Traffic Accident Report which | lodged on 19 May 2019 (Ref: T/20190519/2102),

In-charge case is TPHRT/ 5| Kaleswari

Palani

| wish to amend that the comect streat name is Tuas

instead of Tuas Avenue 2

South Avenue 3 (towards Tuas South Avenue 2)

That's all.

]
Yours &ﬂ:ﬁ;ﬂr

SN 127,
b NANYANG NPC
g W | 2 JURONG WEST AVE 5
; NGAPORE 649482
. o . : 1800-7529999
Sii_ HE Pﬂ"‘__ -
S5C2 Hagen
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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GINIRAL INVUNANCE ASR0CIATION OF SINGAPONE MECONDS MANASEMINT CLNTRI
B e ey T10-F eagagess AL

Pe Nl AT e WA o

Chma ey fer) e tr brmey SO0 | LU0

T m—— L SRV R ey AT PTEL

IMPORTANT NOTE: Please submit the completed Aodendum form to the same Suthorsed Repornng Centre
with whom you subsmitted the Deaginal Regort

ADDENDUM

(A} PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THE AMENDMENTS:
Ceiginal Report Mo M-U 31 ff‘ f 95){ Vehicie Regntration Mo ‘;(f 24 J‘Lr

R— LTV 7 NRIC/TIN/Passsort No G E #1929
("Vehicle Driver / Viehicie Owner}{*) Please delete a5 appropriate

Address [ Thag A 2 - I/j‘!;‘;l
Cantact (Tel) £302 14999 siobdeng . TITEF TIF

tmail Address jrﬂj-.éf e <y E-M..i};

Dme ofaccident ;L8 4 /T it toidin- A

Place af Acodent :?ﬂ[ﬁt ,Lw' fof Jusl [iadd A 2 - jie) Joeih Ae)

imurance Company AT

(8] ADDITIONALINFORMATION { AMENDMENTS:

| have made & report on the above mentioned accdent and woukd ke to mclude additonal imformanon or
make the lollowing amendments

l F‘.rir-ii J'.; I'T*J"l/ it ﬂmfr.r&i"/ ﬁ{id" Igiﬂvf

g
Reporting Ccﬂu Perwonnei's Signature
[y I _"A .Ir._.- II i
NRILTIN Na
Date.
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Hp Gootov ¥
§ dop o
:u,u:.[ﬁ @610k
EPHRAIM DA\ o
- ng
Pre Lra fowis Sht o——
Business Reg No: 201500892N Tﬂud Quotation
To : Choon Heng Logistics Pte Ltd Our Ref : WIEHME!
Attentlen  : Mr. Dickson Poh Quoted By : Htoo
Tel : +65 94898856 Date : 14-Jun-19
Fax :+65 6863 3101 Page :1of1
Subject : XE2361) Accldent Repair jobs RO :
We are pleased to quote the followings of the above mentioned repair,
A. PARTS
No Description Qty Unit Price Amount
1 STEP  Crs,~ 1911154 1 L 11000 & 110.00 .~
2 Front Bumper assy will knock and use back e 1 5 . 5 Lo .
[o .f-\
goo
B. JOBScopP Ir 5 IW
Removal and replacement of new step cover g0
Pennel beating and spray painting 6
Dismantle and fix back for all accident parts
,--"‘f 1
Wal v ovall E
Labour and parts total 5 1,150.00
GST@ 7% $ 80.50
Balance Due 3 1,230.50
NOTE: Waiting for Approval Terms: 30 Days

it has been a great pleasure to be of service to you. | hope the quotation Is favourable and

reply by return fax duly signed. Please contact me should you have any query,

Customer Stamp / Signature / Date

Remark

Ephraim Engineering Pte Ltd

This quotation is only an enstimated quotation and should additional work be found necessary

during the course of repair, extra meterial and labour costs would be charged accordingly for
whirh vnu shall he intnrmed orlor to action taken
A surcharge of 30% labour price will be charged should you decide not to proceed with the repair

I

the Répaire:
» To resist

» To ey

. YT
T
[ 3"
L-F an

Bluso H ' o din

doanwiedged by Repains:
Seranry
O

.’_‘.ﬁﬂﬂ“ﬂ'm“ni and final.quatation.
LKK Aute Consultants hencs nolify

n Company

I Tuas Avenue 20 Singapare 838832
Ia' (551 AIN7 1060 Fav: (RS RART TINS

ro——
LXX Ayto Congultants hence
the Reparer the foliowing:
= T memrvey Iy ey

= To discley damaged par(s) durng resareey
« Parts prces are sutwec! (o conlrmmson

* Thrg party survey i or o “Without Pegssdion” heeis
* o gl mocieatoni|  Miowed
* Supplemaniary fem(s) st be eaurveyed aad

8 et 12 finsd aporoeal from imarance Company

ADowMed by Facer i
Sgrasry:
D




! 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H; ; —§— 51 Ubl Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL B258 1551 FAX® 6256 4315

Reg. No: 190607188R GS5T Reg. No. 18-9607 168-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Intamationale Des Experts En Automablie

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref CS/LPC18010868/R 11d3a2
e Npm——_L R |||
Code - LPC2
1 : Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLG 5383R Veh. Inspected XE 2351J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, 18/19/19/VPO5/021825 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD POH Assign Date 21/068/2018
2. | Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model DAF FTCFB5410 c.c 12802
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. XLRTEBSMCOG113574 Colour RED
Odometer 108848 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/ Front Tyre |31580R2Z25 GT RADIAL 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre [315/80 R22.5 GT RADIAL 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |31580R225 (D) GT RADIAL 8/8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |315/80 R22.5 (D) GT RADIAL B/8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/05/2018 |Inspection Date 21/06/2019
Survey heid at CHOONG HENG- 1 TUAS AVE 20
Repairer -
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h, | Estimate Days of Repair

|E5TIM&TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




’ V L" LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

::_;ji‘-_; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: B258 3561 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg No: 199607108R GST Reg. N 19-9607198-R Page No. 1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XE 2361J

ay|  Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By |

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|STEP CRACKED 110.00 110.00

1IFRONT BUMPER ASSY WILL KNOCK AND USE BACK TO REPAIR SEE - -
(NPA) LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOLUNT . -11.00

110.00 99,00

LABOUR
REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT OF NEW STEP COVER. 1.040.00 BO0.00

PENNEL BEATING AND SPRAY PAINTING.

DISMANTLE AND FiX BACK FOR ALL ACCIDENT PARTS
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER ASSY
WILL KNOCK AND USE BACK

1,040.00 B00.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,150.00 B899.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I | 899.00]
Report Ref No. CS/LPC19010968/R 11d3e2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMBOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser

CHSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Rapen is mads sslsly for (ke uss ani Denalil ol he Clhani named an ihe tonl pegs of his Repan




