Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 5 September, 2019 12:15 PM
To: Nicole Chong; Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Allan Goh; Cher Yip; Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: LOD - SDP 5192P DOA 15.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G19010941/Aha3
Attachments: 5192ra-0001.pdf; 5192ra.pdf; 5192lod.pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nicole Chong <nicolechong.cas@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 September, 2019 11:07 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Allan Goh <allangoh.cas@gmail.com>; Cher Yip <casgaragesg@gmail.com>
Subject: LOD - SDP 5192P DOA 15.06.2019

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please find the attached LOD.

COR $8,000.00

LTA $7.45
GIA  $29.00
LOR  $960.00

Total: $8,996.45

Kindly arrange for settlement.



Regards,

Nicole Chong

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22
Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Hp: 9791 6119

Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M



