Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 12:53 PM
To: see see

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YN 1349Y-DOA: 3/6/2019
Dear Sir,

Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to INDIA INTERNATIONAL
INSURANCE PL

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: see see <bscauto@yahoo.com>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 10:54 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: YN 1319Y-DOA: 3/6/2019

ok comfirm .lump sum repair cost at @2300 .+ 3 days loss of uses at $150 per day. . so total bill is @2750 ..

On Friday, June 28, 2019, 10:44:50 AM GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mathew,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $2300 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



