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51 UBIAVE 1, 801-25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19003985MFSH Date: 24/06/2019

Our Ref: cs/FCI1e010882R11d3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO,_SJP 47]11C
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
20/06/2019 at the premises of M/s Asia Motorsports have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 9.387.08
Revised Estimate Amount ;5% Hh.604.54
“Check™ Items Amount : S% 235.50
Market Value - 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 58
Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage: rear

The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear O/S portion.

Froet

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Rasul
Automotive Assessor



Mll.: . Fi rstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co®eq bo L9500010EC O3 Reg Mo M2 00018054

& Raffles Quay #2100 Singapore 048580
Tet (656222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

Chaims & Metor Underwriting Deps: 36 Bobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 05BB77
Tel (65) 6507 3548 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
whane msfirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
18-06-2019 Our Ref No. D19003985MFSH
17-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCaT10D Third Party Vehicle. SJP4711C
37A EVERITT ROAD
MA
67453811/ 0 Fax No. 67465110

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO COMNSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

ASIA MOTORSPORTS
SOLUTION PTELTD

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Attention. MIL

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com=>
Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 4:33 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) SIP 4711 C Estimate

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Hi Mr Rasul,

We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your proposed lump sum repair of $4,700.00 at 8
working days for SIP 4711 C .

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update vour records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soon.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsportsi@hotmail.com

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2015 9:45 AM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: (Gentle Reminder) SIP 4711 C Estimate

Hi,

Kindly refer to attachment

Parts prices on your estimate is a little bit high need to be reduce
Finalised amount is 5 4,700 / 8 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 3:19 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: SJP 4711 C Estimate

Attachments: SJP4711C_marked_estimate_page1.jpg; 5JP4711C_marked _estimate_page2.jpg.

$JPAT11C_picl jpg; SIPAT11C_pic2,jpg; SIP4711C_pic3 jpg; SIP4711C_picdjpg;
SJP4711C_pic5.jpg; SIP4T11C_pick.jpg; SIP4TT 1C_pic7.jpg

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Hi Mr Rasul,
Attached is an image of your marked estimate for SJP 4711 C.
We look forward to your proposed lump sum repair cost and your recommended days of repair

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now
operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soon.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 10:07 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motar Claims'; assignments; SUR
Cc: '‘May Chua Hui Chin'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003985MF5H/N
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SIP 4711C.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIP 4711C

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 5:21 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12003985MFSH/1

Dear 5ir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-84734 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 5:17 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003985MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARENCOIFE Rakhata Frmiir

Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D:

Singapore NRIC
6215)

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Wehicle Make:

WVehicle Model;

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis Nou:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value;
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

SJP4711C

Mo

21Jun 2019
TOYOTA

VIOS G AUTO
Silver

2009
1INZXB84059
MROS3HY9305106114
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$13472.00

26 Mar 2009

26 Mar 2009

3

$10,731.00

PARF Eligibility
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaunt:

Forfeited

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category;

COE Period(Years):
PQOP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

25 Mar 2024

A -Car (1600cc & below)
5

$12,763.00

$12,152.00

$12,152.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE
expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Jun 2019
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PageNo.1 -

TOTAL PARTS

6027.08

VEHICLENO SJP4711C TOYOTA VIOS
aTy DESCRIPTION CONDITION REPAIRER S SURVEYOR S
ESTIMATE(SS) | ADIUSTMENT
PARTS (LIST ITEMS)
1, |Rear bumper cﬁg,,f @ 1 9/311":!{] o
P(7{ Rear bumper side retainers le“‘/(LH’ K 130:50 47
1 |Rear bumper reflector RHS CHA #~ 128:00| » 7
1 |Rear bootlid 'Er‘fz" 97950| £ 7T
2 |Rear bootlid hinges @49.20 X5~ 98.40
1 |Rear boot edge weatherstrip ¢4 ~~ 26400| £
1 |Rear bootlid inner lock ¢f 23800| | vD
1 |Rear bootlid lock catch bf ~ 87:00|5
1 |Rear bootlid Toyota badge A* 72:00| 't
1 |Rear bootlid Vios emblem A 67.50| 50
1 |Rear bootlid G emblem A+ 24.00
1 |Rear bootlid insulator < §Y*~ ; 242.00|
2 |Rear bootlid rubber stopper @32.404* -~ |@ 1% 64.80] 56
1 [Rear bootlid c%ntre{anulding)ﬁM 278.00| .
1 |RHS Taillamp . 67240 2 (0
1 |RHS Rear fender Fapas? b*f 789.00|"
1 |Rear exhaust silencer assembly b~ 650.00|-
2 |Rear exhaust silencer assembly mountings /4 < 98.00)" )
1 |Rear end panel bf - C’f:—o}‘i? @ 97800 eq0
1 |Rear end panel outer bracket LHS - YAan S & 72,00
1 |Rear end panel top garnish'{ | o - 242:00|/ ‘53
e 7156.10
L4078 less| 25% 1789.02| 25%
5367.08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 |Reverse sensor At~ " 00|V
1 |Rear end panel sealant P £ ;oaﬁu Co | ,{') O
1set |Rear bootlid insulator clips Aer ™ 6p00| o 3
1 |Rear windscreen sealant 9% %< i 108700 o
1set |Rear bumper clips As 7 ﬁeﬁ] Yo
1set |Rear end panel top garnish clips A" - *:’}Otﬂ‘t}"fb /




Page No. 2

VEHICLE NO SJP 4711C TOYOTA VIOS
N DESCRIPTION REPAIRER'S SURVEYOR'S
™ ESTIMATE (S$) | ADJUSTMENT
LABOUR
1 |To remove the affected parts & fittings to commence 14040.00 ‘301) .
repairs; panel beat & reshape the affected areas;
replace the damaged parts and components.
2 |To supply paint materials, expandable items & putty, 1}0‘(‘3& 8‘UD _'
respray paint on parts replaced and repaired areas
3 |To remove and re-fix wiring and check all electrical 158700 ?()
components at damaged areas for proper functions
4 |To remove rear fittings, garnish, trimmings etc so as to 1}9‘&]6’9 2 50
facilitate repairs at rear kA
-
5 |To remove and replace rear exhaust silencer assembly goﬁ 8o
and check for proper system function
6 |To remove and refix rear windscreen 14p60 (2.9
7 |To remove and replace reverse sensors and check 12g-00 6—0
for proper function
8 |To provide anti-rust treatment on affected areas 2934&0
Labour Total ;| 3360.00
TOTAL (PARTS & LABOURY): 9387.08

NOTE: The parts listed in this preliminary estimate will be checked for damage after the vehicle
is disassembled (dismantle). Additional damaged parts (if any) will be submitted as supplemantary parts

;
34057

LXK Auto Congultants hence notify |

the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey belore/afor spraty paining

« To diapiay damaged peris) during resurvey

» Parts prices are subject to confirmation |
» Third party Survey is on 8 "Without Prejudice: b
» No iegal modifcation]s) is slkowad

N

iemis) must b resurey:

Supplomantary )
is subject 1o final approvel from insurance
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS/FCI9010882/R11d3n2

sonommoonson wmoreosssrr e asaoe | [N
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 37100 Veh. Inspected SJP 4711C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18003985MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 19/06/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWVIOS GAUTO c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. MRO53HY9305106114 Colour GREY
Odometer 108977 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 185/60 R15 GOODYEAR 5mm
L/H Front T',rrg 185/60 R15 GOODYEAR 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 GOODYEAR 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/60 R15 GOODYEAR 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE YEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/06/2018 Inspection Date 20/08/2019
Survey held at 15 KAKI BUKIT RD 4 #01-53
Repairer ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTELTD
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 8 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 af 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJP 4711C
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 981.00 480.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS OfS NECESSARY / 130.50 47.00

N/S SERVICEABLE
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RHS CRACKED 128.00 85.00
1|REAR BOOTLID BENT 979.50 655.00
2|REAR BOOTLID HINGES @549.20 SERVICEABLE 98.40 z
1|REAR BOOT EDGE WEATHERSTRIP cut 264.00 184.00
1|REAR BOOTLID INNER LOCK cuT 238.00 100.00
1|REAR BOOTLID LOCK CATCH BENT 87.00 50.00
1|REAR BOOTLID TOYOTA BADGE MECESSARY 72.00 48.00
1|REAR BOOTLID VIOS EMBLEM NECESSARY 67.50 50.00
1|REAR BOOTLID G EMBLEM NECESSARY 24.00 24.00
1|REAR BOOTLID INSULATOR SERVICEABLE 242,00 t
2|REAR BOOTLID RUBBER STOPPER @$32.40 NECESSARY 64.80 36.00
1|REAR BOOTLID CENTRE CHROME MOULDING SERVICEABLE 278.00 =
1|RHS TAILLAMP CRACKED 672.40 370.00
1|RHS REAR FENDER BENT 789.00 789.00
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER ASSEMBLY BENT 650.00 650.00
2|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER ASSEMBLY MOUNTINGS NECESSARY 98.00 98.00
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 978.00 690.00
1|REAR END PANEL OUTER BRACKET LHS NOT NECESSARY 72.00 .
1|REAR END PAMEL TOP GARMNISH DEFORMED 242.00 185.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,789.03 -1,135.25
5,367.07 3,405.75
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 280.00 220.00
1|REAR END PAMEL SEALANT (SN} MECESSARY 100.00 60.00
1|SET REAR BOOTLID INSULATOR CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 60.00 40.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 60.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19010882/R 1td3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0807198-R

Page Mo.-2 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition ‘f’““‘:;; ?;ll Que ‘E‘;i}“““‘
1|SET REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40,00
B60.00 460,00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE THE AFFECTED PARTS & FITTINGS TO 1.400.00 A00.00
COMMENCE REPAIRS;PANEL BEAT & RESHAPE THE
AFFECTED AREAS;REFLACE THE DAMAGED PARTS AND
COMPOMENTS.
TO SUPPLY PAINT MATERIALS EXPANDABLE ITEMS & 1,000.00 800,00
PUTTY RESFRAY PAINT ON PARTS REPLACED AND
REPAIRED AREAS.
TO REMOVE AND RE-FIX WIRING AND CHECK ALL 150.00 30.00
ELECTRICAL COMPOMENTS AT DAMAGED AREAS FOR
PROPER FUNCTIONS,
TO REMOVE REAR FITTINGS, GARNISH TRIMMINGS ETC 150.00 G0.00
S0 AS TO FACILITATE REPAIRS AT REAR.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR EXHAUST SILENCER 250.00 80.00
ASSEMBLY AND CHECK FOR PROPER SYSTEM
FUNCTION.
TO REMOVE AMD REFIX REAR WINDSCREEM. 140.00 120.00
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE REVERSE SEMSORS AND 120.00 60.00
CHECK FOR PROPER FUNCTION.
TO PROVIDE ANTI-RUST TREATMENT ON AFFECTED 150,00 80.00
AREAS.
3,360.00 2,030.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,387.07 5,8085.75
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,700.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19010882/R1td3n2

MARKET VALUE: $30,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $12,152.00=NETT VALUE: $17,848.00

i

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Raport s made sclaly for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




