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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

= #
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 9 July 2019 11:31 AM
To: SUR; 'Lim Zi Liang’
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: Security Clearance-QX 1138C
Attachments: QX 1138C PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Zi Liang,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of QX 1138C

We will submit our report accordingly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 3:49 PM

To: 'SeungHun LEE' <seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Lim Zi Liang' <Ziliang_Lim @sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: RE: Security Clearance

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : C5/MSG19010862/T1vd3

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: SeungHun LEE [mailto:seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 3:44 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Lim Zi Liang <ZiLian Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: RE: Security Clearance

Dear Nivitha,
We refer to your email below.
We would appreciate it if you could send us the surveyor’s report for our further action.

Regards
SeungHun

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 6:01 PM

To: tan_siong beng@customs.gov.sg

Cc: SeungHun LEE <seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Security Clearance

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless you are certain
the sender and content are safe,

Dear Mr.Tan,
Attached is the security clearance form for tomorrow survey of QX 1138C AND QX 626S.

Our surveyor Mr. Taufikh will be coming for the survey.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: LKK Bukit Merah [mailto:rsbm@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 5:07 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Subject: Security Clearance

Hi Nivitha,
Attached form.

Regards



Taufikh

. AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
A WwWw.avg.com
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y Y -l; : Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

31 UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: 0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: 594267PLY
Our ref: CS/MSGI19010862/T1vd3 Date:9/7/2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.QX 1138C

We thank you for your instruction on 18/6/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

21/6/2019 at the premises of M/s 1 BULIM DRIVE
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §§1,460.50
Revised Estimate Amount : §51,460.50
"Check" Items Amount :S$
Market Value : S%
LTA Reimbursement Value : S§
Nett Value : S$

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s body and rooftop

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



" Nivitha (LKK Auto)

—————
From: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang_Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 3:37 PM
To:. assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: lina.s@etiga.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Siti SAMSUDIN; SeungHun
LEE
Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by

falling tree on 22 May 2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: 594267 PLY,
TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref : TBA

Dear Sirs,
Please refer to the above matter.

We like to appoint a motor surveyor from LLK to assess the two third party’s vehicles (QX1138C & QX626s) at the
workshop, Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd.

Please request the surveyor to liaise with Mr Seung Hun (cc in this email) as he is our appointed loss adjuster for
this case.

Have a great Tuesday.
Lim Zi Liang

Senior Executive, Claim Services
Direct line +65 6594 2527 | Direct fax +65 6221 1829 | ziliang_lim@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o o

From: SeungHun LEE [mailto:seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 10:24 AM

To: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang_Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: lina.s@etiga.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Siti SAMSUDIN <siti.samsudin@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by falling tree on 22 May
2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: 594267 PLY, TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref : TBA

I EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Dear Zi Liang,
The Third Party’s appointed workshop is as below: -

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd
+65 6452 0893(0Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Fax)
+65 8661 1572 (Mobile)

Regards
SeungHun



From: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>

" . Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 11:19 AM

To: SeungHun LEE <seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg>

Cc: lina.s@etiga.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Siti SAMSUDIN <siti.samsudin@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by falling tree on 22 May
2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: 594267 PLY, TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref: TBA

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless
vou are certain the sender and content are safe.

Dear Seung Hun,
Thank you for your update.

Please advise us of the details for the Third Party's appointed workshop so we can engage a motor surveyor on our
end.

Have a great week ahead.
Lim Zi Liang

Senior Executive, Claim Services
Direct line +65 6594 2527 | Direct fax +65 6221 1829 | ziliang_lim@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o ©), @ O

From: SeungHun LEE [mailto:seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 June, 2019 11:37 AM

To: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: lina.s@etiga.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Siti SAMSUDIN <siti.samsudin@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by falling tree on 22 May
2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: 594267 PLY, TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref: TBA

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Dear Zi Liang,
We refer to our phone conversation just now.

As discussed, the Third Party is the government. They notified that their vehicles are self-insured. We understand
that Insurers have their panel motor surveyors.

Hence, we would appreciate it if you could engage a motor surveyor to access the Third Party’s vehicles.
We are pleased to liaise with a motor surveyor once it has been arranged.

Regards
SeungHun

From: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 9:17 AM
To: SeungHun LEE <seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg>




Cc:‘i'ina.s@etiqa.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Siti SAMSUDIN <siti.samsudin@crawford.com.sg>
* Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by falling tree on 22 May
2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: 594267 PLY, TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref : TBA

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless you
are certain the sender and content are safe.

Dear Seung Hun,
Thank you for Report No.1.

For our records, please let us have a copy of the contract agreement between our Insured and their landscape
maintenance contractor.

Have a great Friday ahead.
Lim Zi Liang

Senior Executive, Claim Services
Direct line +65 6594 2527 | Direct fax +65 6221 1829 | ziliang_lim@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o © @ o

From: SeungHun LEE [mailto:seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 1:07 PM

To: Lim Zi Liang <ZiLiang Lim@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: lina.s@etiga.com.sg; ChanKimChai@tokiomarine.com.sg; Wee Say Bian <SayBian Wee @sg.msig-asia.com>; Siti
SAMSUDIN <siti.samsudin@crawford.com.sg>

Subject: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles, fence damaged by falling tree on 22 May 2019 |
Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: TBA, TMI Ref : TBA, Etiga Ref : TBA

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Dear Zi Liang,
Please find attached our Report No.1 for your attention.
Regards

Lee SeungHun * Engineering Adjuster = Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = 8 Shenton Way, #0201 AXA Tower, 068811 Singapore
Direct: +65 6632 8609 * Mobile: +65 9634 5428 « Office: +65 6632 8600 » Fax: +65 6632 8040
» Emall seunghun.lee@crawford.com.sg * Web site: www.crawfordandcompany.com

Craford'

ONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
uding any attachments) may contain information that s onwileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any



¥
perfan other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended

.. recipiént, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents,



Yahoo Mail - RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: ... hitps://mail.yahoo.com/d/folders/1 /messages/AAVIqTAP3IZ40X...
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RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles damaged by falling tree on 22 May 2019 | Crawford Ref:
1091206/G/LSH, MSIG Ref: TBA

From: Siong Bang TAN (CUSTOMS) (TAN_Siong_Beng@customs.gov.sg)
To:  leong_skw@yahoo.com.sg
Date: Friday, 24 May 2019, 8:01 pm SGT

Message Classification: Restricted

Dear Steven,

Attached is the quotation 1o repair the damaged vehicles from our tesm contraclor. anclohmfmmymhuwmnou!dehjmth:rtpimomﬁ'umymﬁunu
the visit by your appointed loss adjuster on 27 May 2019.  Cusloms would Iﬁscwpmceedwiihl!wmpuirfwbuﬂhvdﬁcleammtpouiblehminiminnrﬁuhﬂ
impact to our operations.

Also, do update me on the status for the repair to the damaged chain linked fence.
‘Thanks.

Regards,

Tan Siong Beng | Operations Management Branch | Singapore Customs

DID: 6325 1059 | Fax: 6227 8485| Website: www.customs.gov.sg

SINGAPORE CUSTOMS: We Make Trade Easy, Folr And Secure

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: Privileged Confidential inf; ion may be ined in this ge. If you are nat the intended addressee, you must not copy. distnbute of take any action
reliance thereon, C ieation of any infs jon wn this email o eny unauthorized person is an offénce undes the Oficial Secren Act (Cap 213}, Please noufy the seader mmmediately if you receive
this in error

P Pleme consider the envizoament before priating this e-mail

Tnxonginy
V5061 acdd wc- Mot ekl 551 5-<TIE M7 GubIRAL]

From: Siong Beng TAN (CUSTOMS)

| Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 8:56 PM
To: 'Steven Leong' <leong_skw@yahoo.com.sg>

| Subject: RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicies damaged by falling tree on 22 May 2019 | Crawford Ref. 1091208/G/LSH,
MSIG Ref. TBA

M Classification: ted

Hi Steven,

Noled. Clearance will be granted.
Regards,

Tan Siong Beng | Operalions Management Branch | Singapora Cusloms
DID: 6325 1059 | Fax 6227 8485 | Website: www.customs.qov.sq
| SINGAPORE CUSTOMS: We Make Trade Easy, Falr And Secure !

|
CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: Prvilsgad/Confidantial information may be containgd in Iie message. If you are nct the Intendad addressea, you must nat copy, distnbute o lake |
any action in reliance tnereon. Communication of any information in this email lo any unguthorized person is an cfance under Ing Official Secrets At (Cap 213) Please nality Ihe

sander immadiataly f you receive this in emor |

29/5/2019, 10:21 am |



Yahoo Mail - RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: ... https://mail.yahoo.com/d/folders/ [ /messages/AAVIq7TAP3Z40X...

P Pleass consider the emdronment before printing this e-mail

Taxonomy
[35-iche 5911 14004 205 880 84020230 84! Bc128045]

From: Steven Leong <leong_skw@yahoo.com,sg>
Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 5:03 FM

To: Siong Beng TAN (CUSTOMS) <TAN_Siong_Beng@cusloms.gov.sg>
Subject: Fw: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: Two vehicles damaged by falling tree on 22 May 2019 | Crawford Ref: 1091206/G/LSH,
MSIG Ref TBA

Hi Siong Beng,

The MCST 1218, loss adjuster would like to visit Custom premise on 27/05/2018 (Mon) at 10am fo access the damaged vehicles. Atlached herewith the particular of
the adjuster.

Rdgs

Steven Leong
The MCST 1218

- Forwarded message —

From: SaungHun LEE <seunghun.lee. >

To: leong_skwi@yahoo.com.sq <leong_skw(@yahoo com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019, 2:07:25 pm SGT

Subject: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpaint | Incident: Two vehicles damaged by falling tree on 22 May 2019 | Crewford Ref: 1081208/G/ILSH, MSIG Ref: TBA
Dear Mr Steven Leong,

We refer lo our phone conversation.

We are the Loss Adjusters appointed by the Insurers of MCST 1216 (Southpelnf) to leok into the matier,

We wiil be there eround 10 am on Monday, 27 May 2019. If nol available, please let us know what lime will be.

The below are the visitor's particulars,

Name : Lee Seung Hun
IC(FIN) No. : G5332454T

Regards

Lee SeungHun + Engineering Adjusler - Singapore
Crawford & Company International Ple Ltd « 8 Shenlon Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 088811, Singapore
Direct; +65 6632 8609 « Moblle: +65 9634 5428 « Office: +65 6632 8600 « Fax: 55 6532 8040

+ Emall: seunghun Jee@crawford.com,5q * Web Site: www crawfordandcompany,com

Crawford

Dear Jimmy,

The Quotation as below seek for your approval:

OXII38C
JAE [  FONGTAT | HE XING

20f4 29/5/2019, 10:21 am



Yahoo Mail - RE: Insured: MCST 1216 - Southpoint | Incident: ...

3 of 4

LH Tail Lamp — NON SOR S 160.00 + 10% $ 165.00 + 10% $ 165.00+ 10%
LH Roof Moulding - NON SOR S 50.00+10% $ 50.00+10% S 48.00+10%
Front Windscreen Moulding - NON S 40,00+ 10% $ 70.00+10% S 5000+ 10%
SOR
Frant Windscreen Sealant - NON SOR S 40.00+10% $ 40.00+ 10% § 4500+ 10%
Labour — ANNEX C2 S 38.00x6hrs
To Putty & Spray Paint Roof Panel, Rear § 304.50 x 2 panel
LH Fender — ANNEX C6 NO.B LINE
pe)
To Putty & Spray Paint Rear Bumper — § 304.50 x 1 bumper
ANNEX C6 NO.B LINE 09
Sub Total: :S'_I__-!_‘;_O.Sﬂ $1499.00 $1480.30
GST 7%: S 10224 § 104.93 $ 103.62
Total Amount: §1562.74 $1603.93 $1583.92

_OX6265

JAE FONG TAT HE XING
Front Windscreen Glass — NON SOR $ 350.00+10% | § 380.00+10% 418 | § 450.00+ 10%

495.00
Front Windscreen Moulding — NON S 30,00+ 10% § 3500+10% |$ 55.00+10% 6050
SOR 38.50
Front Windscreen Sealant — NON SOR S 40.00+10% $ 4500+ 10% $ 4500+ 10%
49.50
Front Windscreen In Bracket — NON § 2500+ 10% $ 2500+10% |$ 28.00+10% 30.80
SOR 27.50
Mirror-Side — ANNEX C6 NO.A LINE § 356.15
43
Front Bonnet — NON SOR $ 385.00 + 10% $ 400.00 + 10% § 420,00 + 10%
440.00 462.00

To Spray Whole Car -NON SOR $2200.00
Labour — ANNEX C2 5 38.00 x 6 hrs 228.00
Sub Total: $3697.15 $3757.65 $3881.95
GST 7%: § 258.80 $ 263.04 $ 271.74
Total Amount: $3955.95 $4020.686 $4153.69

Please review and let us have your instruction soonest,

Any enquiry please do not hesitate to contact us.

Thank you and regards,
Joyce
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

+65 8661 1572 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.fcebook.com/LTMsg

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore

https:/mail.yahoo.com/d/folders/ | /messages/AAVIq7TAP3IZ40X...

29/5/2019, 10:21 am
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QXx1138C

LH Tail Lamp — NON SOR

$ 160.00 + 10%

LH Roof Moulding — NON SOR S 50.00 + 10%
Front Windscreen Moulding— NON SOR S 40.00 + 10%
Front Windscreen Sealant — NON SOR S 40.00+ 10%

Labour — ANNEX C2

S 38.00x6 hrs

To Putty & Spray Paint Roof Panel, Rear LH
Fender — ANNEX C6 NO.B LINE 22

$ 304.50 x 2 panel

To Putty & Spray Paint Rear Bumper — ANNEX
C6 NO.B LINE 09

S 304.50 x 1 bumper

Sub Total: $1,460.50
GST 7%: $ 102.24
Total Amount: $1,562.74

QX626S

Front Windscreen Glass — NON SOR

$ 350.00 + 10%

Front Windscreen Moulding — NON SOR

$ 30.00 +10%

Front Windscreen Sealant — NON SOR S 40.00 + 10%
Front Windscreen In Bracket — NON SOR S 25.00+ 10%
Mirror-Side — ANNEX C6 NO.A LINE 43 S 356.15

Front Bonnet — NON SOR

$ 385.00 + 10%

Labour — ANNEX C2

S 38.00x 6 hrs 228.00

To Spray Whole Car —-NON SOR $2,200.00
Sub Total: $3,697.15
GST 7%: $ 258.80
Total Amount: $3,955.95

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the. Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey before/after spray (';!nt;ru;;
» To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
» Parts prices are subject lo confirmation
» Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
* No lllegal modification(s) is allowed
* Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed pnd
is subject Io final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:
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= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref : CS/MSG19010862/T1vd3e2
;24%1FE|]6EI\?GQL%%YNG BLDG SINGAPORE 048581 Do’ 12:07-2019 l”l||||"”|||"|||"|"l||
Code: MSG
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected QX 1138C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 594267 PLY Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LIM ZI LIANG Assign Date 18/06/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA WISH c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. JTDGG20W20J003566 Colour GOLD
Odometer 41050 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY AND ROOFTOP PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/05/2019 Inspection Date 21/06/2019
Survey held at -
5a. ' Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. QX 1138C
_ _ - Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Des Parts Condition = = i g
o] i dton | Workshop($)| (5
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LH TAIL LAMP - NON SOR (WCP) cuT 160.00 160.00
1|LH ROOF MOULDING - NON SOR (WCP) cuT 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING - NON SOR (WCP) CuT 40.00 40.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT - NON SOR (WCP) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
COST PLUS 10% 29.00 29.00
319.00 319.00
LABOUR
LABOUR - ANNEX C2. 228.00 228.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ROOF PANEL, REAR LH 609.00 609.00
FENDER - ANNEX C6 NO.B LINE 22.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER - ANNEX C6 304.50 304.50
NO.B LINE 09.
1,141.50 1,141.50
GRAND TOTAL 1,460.50 1,460.50
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS l | [ 1.460.50]
Report Ref No. CS/MSG19010862/T1vd3e2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solsly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




