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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars S ————
g::’ :g Type: Singapore NRIC
Vehicle Details e
Vibicla g~ = === == i ) SLR565IX
Vehicle to be Exported: Nao
Intended Deregistration Date: . 19 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A4 14TFSIS TRONIC
Primary C:orw; p——— i Brown
Manufacturing Year: B 2017
Engine No.: CVND40756
Chassis No. WAUZZZF4ABHAL177989
Maximum Power Output: 110.0 kW (147 bhp)
Open Market Value: $32,098.00
Original Registration Date 18 Aug 2017
First Registration Date: 18 Aug 2017
Transfer Count: 0 ;
Actual ARF Paid $26,938.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details —
PARF Eligibility: IR Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: = ] _ 17Aug2027
PARF Rebate Amount: e $20,203.00
Intended COE Rebate Details = Ll0
COE Expiry Date: 17 Aug2027
COECategory: _ B-Carabove 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): S 9 10
QP Paid: AL 3 _ $53711.00
COE Rebate Amount: 1 N _ $43,835.00
Total Rebate Amount: T $64,038.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Jun 2019
OK
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-‘ Shm'_!mm (LKK Auto)

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

From:
:::nt: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 5:55 PM
‘Claims’
Cc SUR: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuUto)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SLR 5653 X - DOA : 09/06/2019
Attachments: ESTIMATE.pdf
Dear Troy,

Our surveyor's has authorise repair on the same day of inspection (18/6/2019) (Excess 300/-)
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 10
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before

completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims [mailto: claims@prerniurnauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 2:24 PM
To: 'SUR' <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com;

Cc: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SLR 5653 X - DOA : 09/06/2019

'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Dear All,

ne early by Adrian on this morning.
ise the own damage claims approval.

Survey was just do
te with marking for your reference. Kindly advis

Hereby attached with the estima

Thanks

Best Regards,

TRoy Goh

Claims Advisor !
N

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (g o 197902271W)
55 Ubi Road | Road Singapore 408699
+65 634{ 1183

Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

+65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f.
e.
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra
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:  Own damage Claim
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