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“Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles.”



28 (M 3R) B5A K 2 7
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #0400, #02-02 & #1703 Singopore STS722 Tel 6433 B0 Fax: 6459 6267

GST No; M2012860K-3
LEM: Jgn7Tear

ESTIMATE

Juantity LU e )
, ol SO K | 0 A s
| [RE] ” H?’l‘m 0 i A

F N " ] c:f; A A
= . iy Lhey s
' Gt timy €20 —

. rd

ey 4 7
- ~, —
ary e
% ' &

: e, 7
N, ) s

2mible e, (.

k@ RAsy CAROLINER MARK IV i, s itiy & W
B, Ed ki SAICO Deluxe ™ s & &

XX Auto Consuliants hence nolify
the Repairer of the laliowing:

o To remurpm) bk aber Pty r.-- T

« To deyplay dumnaged pass) derr r—
= Party srices ons suibloct (p cosdlemzdios '

= Third sty ey 3 on 8 "Wiihoo! Pasiudtics’

* b Mgl modhcaion[t) o o d

* Slipplameniany SaTii) rmust 2 Lyt e

I3 3ustiec b final approwl bom sy ¢

Aomoasadged by Rengrer
R R T b N e
Dae

hEie

SITTRRTy

Ny Mk R AR

"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO

Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles."
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"Our services include the latest and relinble CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the sup
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs, We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater Tor re-spraying all motor vehicles."



g jarigha PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

"+ > Back to OneMotoring

'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Foreign Identification Number
Owner 1D: 4241N

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: 52988CD

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 14 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: E200 SEDAN (R17)
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2013

Engine No.: 27492030067980
Chassis No.: WDD2120342A815051
Maximum Power Output: 135.0kW (181 bhp)
Open Market Value: $42,967.00

Original Registration Date: 03 Sep 2013

First Registration Date: 03 Sep 2013
Transfer Count: 2

Actual ARF Paid: $0.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Sep 2023

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Rebate Amount: $0.00

Total Rebate Amount: $0.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Jun 2019

OK
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~ Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Jeannie Cheng <jeannie.cheng@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Manday, 17 June 2019 521 PM
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc sur@lkkauto.com; Jeannie Cheng
Subject: FW: PRS IRO S2988CD | Ol : SLM1202S | DOA: 14/06/2019| ERGO REF:
SLM12025/5L/)c
Attachments: 17062019152748 pdf; 17062019152800.pdf; SLM 12025 OI.PDF { I
-ogan® (16119
podond Jenr)
Hi LKK, cmf In

@ Kennefn

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to t'he Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the "Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and try to finalize with the repairer on the repairs.
Their client's vehicle can be surveyed at the location as stated in the email below.

Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

[Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey Reports.)

Thank you
ERG It mance Mg Lia

-0 Five
lan il e M 99

ERGO

1 gy sevmimny @nd Europe Werideeds FRGD & mpresanied in moare than 31D countres and conosrirgtes
pof Mumch Ra (Group), oné of The worid § eamng rsl carnas

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Tne miomation contamed in ths email commumcation & configential You should only read, discioss, re-ransmil, copy, disiribute, acl in meliance on or
commesTiaires the information if you are authorized o do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
Tepiying o ine emal and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

ANy views expressed in this emal communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Ple. Lid. does nol represent, warrand or gusranies
Thit the witegnty of this communicaiion has been maintmined or that the communication is fres of errors, virus or interferance.

ERGO Insurance Ple Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attschmuent. No part may be reproduced by any process or lor gny
purpoza withaul prios writlen permuission,

in}l £




From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 5:19 PM
To: 'Jenny Lim'
Ce: Jeannie Cheng; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)
Subject: RE: PRS IRO S2988CD | OI : SLM1202S | DOA: 14/06/2019| ERGO REF: SLM1202S/SL/jc

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear lenny,

We will assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd accordingly.

Thank you,
Fi Bie Lid
- Suntac Towar Fra
BRI oftengieno com sy
I irdurEnce groups it Getmany and Europe Werldwide, ERGD & repimssantad iy mare than 10 countres =nd Cononn b alas
£ & part of Mumch Re (Gioup), one of the world's leading risk carrars
T T AT SONOeTIL SSaEE Oy o the runned addieiSed  aod mary D ervleged 1D you S8 no e inlended mecipeent you
i Trn Commurscatan. If you ore nof the iidesdind repent plosde nabdy the ook By reluen etad and dislele s message
1w = AEDN. yTil POTRE O CCER e faE MAT T T ay coMmn e virus or TN COOR BN yOL B e el ERGD Insurmnoe P s wil
rage et duuesl

From: Jenny Lim i

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 3:36 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: Request for Survey - Your Ref: SLM 1202S / Our Ref: S 2988CD (Date of Accident: 14.06.2019)

Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter

Please can you arrange LKK Auto Consultant to survey our client's vehicle no. S 2988CD on tomorrow 18.06.20197
Supporting documents are enclosed for your reference.
Thank you

Kind regards

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, 804-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 4538110
Fax. 64598267
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" -; ; Pte Lrd Ceompany Registration No. 129607 198R

51 UBIAVE |, #02.25 PAY A UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 6256356) FAX : (065) 62564515

Yourrel: TBA Date: 19/06/2019
Owur ref: CC4/EG119010782/Kda3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. S 2988CD
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 18/06/2019

at the premises of M/s Lai Huat ( Meng Kee) Motor Pie Lid and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 88 10,918.00

Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 10,156.40

"Check” Items Amount : 5% 321.60

Total (Including Check Items) : §§ 10,478.00

Market Value - 5% - lest)

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% - (esL)

Nett Value : 8$ - (esL)

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



‘Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Jeannie Cheng <jeannie.cheng@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 3.59 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd)

Subject: RE: PRS IRO S2988CD | Ol - SLM1202S | DOA: 14/06/2019| ERGO REF:
CDMPG19001106/5L/)c

Dear Mei Kwan,

Dur claim ref [s COMPG19001106.

Warmest Regards,
Jeannie Cheng
ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid.

5 Temasek Boutevard, #04-01 Suntec Towar Five
Singapare 03B3BE
DID.: -B65 GEZG 91890 x 184

izannie.cheng@ergo com.sg

ERGO

ERGO is ons of the major insurance groups n Germany and Europe. Wordwide, ERGO m represeming in more than 30 countnas and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Graup), one @f the world s laading rizk camiers

Clacliuimar: Thia mesange and ds sttachrmemts are confidential. inlended only lad the named acdmeses. and may be prvileged. If yoo ane nal the inlendoed recpiant, yod
ahwule not dciowe, @iEtibute, copy of aue the communicaton, | you are rof the ended recysient, plenss aobly the sence by metun emil shd delety e message
By operng any atachimenl i i messag. you sgred 10 Rccopi e nuk thet 1 may contain & vius or damaging code, and you agres Tal ERGO Wmurance Fha Lid. will
il b llaksle lor any lnes or darmage (Meemby oo

WA ETO0. COM. 60

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2019 11:55 AM
To: Jeannie Cheng
Cc: Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto); CS A Team
Subject: RE: PRS IRO S2988CD | OI : SLM1202S | DOA: 14/06/2019] ERGO REF:
SLM1202S/SL/jc
WITHOUT PREIUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

EGI REF: TBA
LKK REF: CC4/EGI19010782/Kda3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: § 2988CD

We have not authorized repairs.



Repair Survey, both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pre Lid have agreed on your company 0 be the “Single
- Joint Expert”™.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and try to finalize with the repairer on the
repairs. Their client's vehicle can be surveyed at the location as stated in the email below.

Anached are the necessary documents for your further actions.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

(Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey
Reports.)

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Jeannie Cheng
ERGO Insurance Pre. Lid.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985
DID.; +65 68299199 x 194

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in
more than 30 countries and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of
the world's leading risk carriers.

PO, BTCHD G ONTL RS

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Tha inlormation contained in this emal communécation is confidential. You shoulkd only read, discloss, re-iransmit, copy, distribute, act in relinnce on of
commuercialize the information if you are aulhorized 1o do so. If you afe not the intended reciplent of this email communication, please nollfy he sender by

replying 1o the emall and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.
Any views oxpressed in 1his email communication are those of ihe indyidual ssnder. ERGD Insurance Pia. Lid. does nol represent, warman! or guarantee

that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or thal the communication is free ol arrors, virus or inlerdorence.
ERGO Insurance Pla. Lid. asserts copyright in respact fo this amall including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by Bny process of for any
|purpose withaul priar wiltlon permission.

inll £

Disclaimer: This message and its attachments are confidential, intended only for the named addressee, and
may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disclose, distribute, copy or use this
communication. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and delete this
message. By opening any attachment to this message, you agree to accept the risk that it may contain a virus
or damaging code, and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd. will not be liable for any loss or damage

thereby caused.

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. (Claims Department)

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 5:19 PM

To: Jenny Lim’

Cec: Jeannie Cheng; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Subject: RE: PRS IRO S2988CD | O1 : SLM1202S | DOA: 14/06/20191 ERGO REF: SLM12025/SL/jc
3



160 Sin Ming Drive
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVg.com
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny lim@Ilaihuat com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 4:54 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto]

Subject: RE: Your ref: S2988CD [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLM12025 AND 52988CD

ON 14/06/2019]

Dear Jia Le

We refer to the above matter

We are agreeable to your offer to settle our client’s claim as provided therein.
Please lei us have the payment.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110
Fax 64596267

From: lia Le [LKK Auto) <liale@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 11:22 am

To: lenny Lim <jenny. lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Subject: Your ref: 52988CD |ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5LM12025 AND 52988CD ON 14/06/2019]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 12025 & § 2988CD ON 14/06/2019
We refer to the above malter.

We propose setflement al a global sum of $12,200.00{all-in),
Please confirm occeptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6749 5702 | emall; Jinle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



KEPOLISIAN NEGARA REPUBLIK INDONESIA
DAERAH KEPULAUAN RIAU
RESOR KOTA BARELANG
INDONESIA NATIONAL POLICE
RIAU ISLAND REGIONAL POLICE
RESOR POLICE OF BARELANG
__Jalan Jenderal Sudirman 04 Batam

LETTER OF STATEMENT
Nomor : SKET/ 43 I VI 7 2019 ISatlantas

Yang bertanda tangan dibawah ini

The Undersigned,
Nama | PUTU BAYU PATI SIK. M H
Name | PUTU BAYU PATI SIK . MH
Jabatan KASAT LANTAS
Pasition Head of Barslang Traffic Pouce
Pangkat KOMISARIS POLISV84061726
Rank Commissioner Police
Kasatuan POLRESTA BARELANG
Unit Barelang Resor Police

Menerangkan bahwa Pemilik Surat lzin Mengemudi golongan A" dibawah ini
Explain that the owner ‘s License class " A "below

Nama ANDRI GLINAWAN

Name ANDR! GLINAWAN

Tempat dan tanggal Lahir Pontianak, 03 Agustus 1975
Place and date of Birth Pontianak, August 03 1975

Nomar Paspor D 039962
Passport Number D 039962
Alamat JI. Depok Raya D'lavender Town
RT 2/8 Antapam Tengah Kota Bandung
Addres JI Depok Raya D lavendet Town

RT 2/8 Antapani Tengah Kola Bandung

Adalah benar pemilik Surat lzin Mengemudi A dengan nomor register
1305161003450 yang dikeluarkan oleh Kepolisian Negara Republik Ingonesia
Resor Kota Besar Bandung, Jawa Baral yang diterbitkan pada langgal 21 Oklober
2015 berlaku sampal dengan 03 Agustus 2021

Is aclually the owner 's License’A” wilh a registration number 1305161003450

iIssued by the Indonesian Natnonal Police Resor City Bandung, West Java Police
issued on Oclober 21 2016 will expire on August 03 2021

Scanned by CamScanner
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Company Reglsiration No. 199607 198R

£1 UM AVE 1, #02-28 PAVA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 62563501 FAX : (063) 62364315

To : M/s ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Date: 15/11/2018

THIRD P ETTLEME

SLM 12025 (Insd Veh) [Your Ref No. : COMPG19001106
Vehicle No. it o —

S 298BCD (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC4/EGI18010782/Kda3q2
Date of Accident 14/8/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost - $ 11,265.39
Loss of Use :$ days B
I_%ental (If any) % 1,000.00 10 days B
Others: -

- =
12,265.39

Final Settlement Sum s 12,200.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks . - B

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

12,200.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 19880718BR GST Reg No. 18-0607198-R

Afflliated to Federatlon Internationale Des Experts En Automablla

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Rel CC4/EGI180107T82/Kdadg2
ot SO ToweR |MARRRI
#04-05 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 15-11-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
16 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLM 12025 Veh. Inspected 52888CD
Policy No. DMPG19001248 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. CDOMPG19001106 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/08/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E200 (A) c.C 1891
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WDD2120342A815051 Colour METALLIC BLACK
Odometer 85530 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
53 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 MICHELIN B mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 MICHELIN 7 mm
4. I Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. ‘ General Information
Accident Date  14/068/2018 Inspection Date 18/06/2018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. | Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR B Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. S 2988CD

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6258 4115
Reg. No: 150607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

aty Description of Parts Condition |,
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING LH NECESSARY 137.00 137.00
1|REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING RH NECESSARY 137.00 137.00
1|REAR BUMPER BENT / CRACKED 1,698.00 1,698.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH BENT 245.00 245.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER PART (CENTRE) CRACKED 260.00 260.00
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR INNER LH SHORTED 188.00 188.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH cuT T18.00 718.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH CuT/ SPLIT 718.00 718.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET LH MISSING 52.00 28.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET RH CRACKED 52.00 28.00
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 1.825.00 1,925.00
1|REAR END PANEL TRIM GARNISH DISTORTED 135.00 135.00
1|REAR BOOT LID BENT 2.850.00 2,850.00
1|REAR BOOT LID CHROME MOULDING NECESSARY 120.00 120.00
1|REAR BOOT LID E200 EMBLEM NECESSARY B5.00 85.00
1|REAR BOOT LID MERCEDES LOGO EMBLEM NECESSARY 50.00 S0.00
1|REAR BOOT LID 7G TRONIC EMBLEM NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER PART LH (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 52.00 52.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER PART RH (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 52.00 52.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -852 .40 -047 80
8,571.60 8,528.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) DENTED 40.00 40.00
40.00 40.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK / ERASE FAULT CODE. 120.00 120.00
TO APPLY UNDERBODY UNDERCOATING. 100.00 60.00
TO TRANSFER REVERSING CAMERA + CABLE ETC. BO.00 80.00
TO STRAIGHTEN REAR BODY INCLUDING CUTTING AND 1,000.00 800.00

WELDING, TO KNOCK DENTS ON TAIL LAMP PANEL LH &
RH AND RENEW OF PARTS

Report Ref No. CC4/EGI19010782/Kda3g2




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e v 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 1695607168R GST Reg No 19-9607188-R Page No..2 of 2
Description of Parts Condition | EStimate By nurngmu
aty i mail Workshop (S)]  (8)
TO SPRAY PAINT. 1,100.00 800.00
2.400.00 1,860.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,011.60 10,528.40
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 10,528.40

Report Ref No. CC4/EGI19010782/Kda3q2

Y 44

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Haport is made solely far the 158 snd benefi of the Clinnt nemod on the front page of this Repor.




