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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 11:48 AM

To: Meekey Yap

Ce: Pegasus Engineering; assignments

Subject: RE: ARRANGE SURVEY - OUR REF: SNM19D202098 -accident involving- Grab:

SLU2902G Your Insured; GBG4121Y DOA: B/05/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE ASTO COSTS

Dhear Sir,

We regret to inform that we are not agrecable 1o vour list of proposed survevors and will be assigning our
panel survevor, M/s LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the Pre-repair survey.

Please contact our surveyor to conduet the post repair inspection before returning the repaired vehicle 1o the
claimant

Aside to LKK,
Please refer to the email below and liaise with third party workshop accordingly.
Ihank vou.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID. (65) G3BEG1TY | M. {65) XXXX XXXX | F: (65)6222 1033

W: www sq entaiping com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A E ¥ Taiping SG 3 Ansan

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (85) 63896171 | M (65) XXAXX XXXX | F (65)6222 1033

From: Meekey Yap [mailto:meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June, 2015 11:34 AM

To: Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg»

Subject: Re: ARRANGE SURVEY - OUR REF: SNM19D202098 -accident involving- Grab: SLU2902G Your Insured:
GBG4121Y DOA: 8/05/2019

Dear Boon Sen.

Pls advise survey arrangement on tomorrow 19/6
Infinity Edward Choo...my selection.

Thank You

Best Regards,
Mee Key



Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Tncl: Road sszs&uu

Office: 6513 7748
Fax 8251 3161

On Fri, 14 Jun 2019 at 18:55, Meckey Yap <meekey.pegasusengre@aomail com> wrole:

Your Vehicle : GBG 4121Y
Our Vehicle : SLU 20020
DOA: 08.05.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear All

We refer to the above matter.

We enclose the following documents for vour attention:-

. Copy of our client’s SAS report wnd damuged photos;

Mursuant o paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for our selection
und please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client’s vehicle. 1T we do
not hear from you within the stipulmed timeline, our client shall proceed 10 repair the vehicle without further reference 10 you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocal, you must compensate our
client for the loss of use of his’her vehicle for the day that the mspection 5 conducted.

Im addition, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% linhility for this case.

Y ehicle will be ground on 19/ 06/ 2019
Please arrange 1o survey our client’s vehicle at 74 Kian Teck Road S628800,

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mee Kay

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pie Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Emaill m J il
Office: 6513 7748

Fax 6251 3161

On Thu. 13 Jun 2019 at 13:58, Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chongl@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We are prepared to direct settle subject to estimate.



Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive

Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F (65)6222 1033

W: www sgcntaipingcom | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsg! | WeChat: X% Taiping SG 3 Ansan
Road #16-00 Sprningleal Tower Singapore 079909

DID {B5) 63896171 | M: (65) XXAXX XXXX | F (B65)6222 1033

From: Meekey Yap [mallto:meekey.pegasusengre@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May, 2019 12:45 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>
Subject: Re: CHECK LIABILITY - OUR REF: SNM19D202098 -accident involving- Grab: SLU2902G Your Insured:

GBG4121Y DOA: 10/05/2019

Dear Boon Seng,

Pls advise updated status for the incident. Check and advise liability,

Your Reference: GBG 4121Y

Our Reference: SLU 2902G

DOA: 10/ 05/2019.



my client advise TP already lodged Insurance report.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mee Key

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid
74 Kian Teck Road 5628800

Email

Office. 6513 7748

Fax 6251 3161

On Wed, 22 May 2019 at 17:01, Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong(@sg cntaiping.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Insured yet to report

Unable to advise at this juncture

We will follow up as usual.

You may wish to ask your client to claim QD.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive

Dapartment



China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078808

DID (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F (65)6222 1033

W: www sgcntaiping com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsy/ | WeChat: A8 Taiping SG 3
Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 072900

DID (65) 53898171 | M (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(B65)6222 1033

From: Meekey Yap [mailto:meekey pegasusengre @gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 4:37 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@®sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg. cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of
CTl <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping com>; Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims SUSENErg.com.sg>

Subject: CHECK LIABILITY - OUR REF: SNM19D202098 -accident involving- Grab: 5LU2902G Your Insured:
GBG4121Y DOA: 10/05/2019

Dear Boon Sen,

Kindly check and advise liability.

GRAB: SLU 2902G

TP:GBG 4121Y

DOA: 08/05/2019

Thank You

Best Regards.

Mee Key



Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Email meekey pegasusengrg@gmail com
Office: 6513 7748

Fax: 6251 3181

On Mon, 13 May 2019 at 18:03, Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@'sg entaiping.com=> wrole:

Dear Boon 5&n,

Please conduct PRS —5LU2902G soonest possible

File with DIC-Chong Boon Sen -6389 6171

Regards

Angie Foo

From: Meekey Yap [mallto:meekey.pegasusengre@gmail.com|
Sent: Monday, May 13, 2015 4:34 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1; Chong Boon Sen
Cc: Pegasus Englineering
Subject: ARRANGE SURVEY Grab: SLU2902G Your Insured: GBG4121Y DOA: 10/05/2019

Your Vehicle : GBG 4121Y

Our Vehicle SLU 2902G

DOA: 10.05.2018

Without Prejudice

Dear All,



We refer 1o the above matter

We enclose the following documents for your attention -
a. Copy of our tlient's SAS report and damaged photos:

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocal for NIMA Cases, please |et us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for
our selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of
our client's vehicle. |f we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the
vehicie without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocol, you must
compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspeclion is conducted

In addition, pleasa confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% liabllity for this case

Viehicle will e grounded at our workshop on 15/052019

Plense arrange to survey our elient’s vehicle at 74 Kian Teck Road S628800,

Thank You

Best Regards.

Mee Key

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S828800

Email

Office 6513 7748

Fax: 6251 3181

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit htip://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud.com
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

e ———————————————————————————————— e ——

From: Rasul (LEKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 6:05 PM

To: Vivian Tan

Cc Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise For SLU2902G (DOA 08/05/2019)
Hi Vivian,

Finalised amount confirmed

Best Regards,

Rusul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: f256-3561 | email: Rasul@@lkkauto.com | fux: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{408933)

F K 2
SesSRER  ~w Sqve the Earth Print only when necessary

From: Vivian Tan [mallto:vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 12 September, 2019 10:45 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team; ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg
Subject: RE: Finalise For SLU2902G (DOA 08/05/2019)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr. Rasul,

Finalise amount @ Part By Part §2,054.00 (@ 02 working days.

Parts - §1,344.00

SN - $200.00

Labour - §510.00

Total - $2,054.00
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SUBMITTED BY. Candes Shuyne Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 10/05/2019 15:27
SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
|. Pisases report, carrectly the datails of the acoident to spead up the claims process

2. This Fairn mincsl b A e by e Pol |'._-l-hn||:r:r andlor tha Authonsad Drver

i infarmanon provided muss e @s truthful and socurate a6 poasinie. Ary witful meneprasentaton or withalding of matenal facts may alow nsurancs companias f
repudisia polkcy Nability -

4 Thae msus and acceptanoe of this Form by insurance companss s nof @n sdresson of poicy Eadilily on the pert of ©e nsumnco compamag

5 Any false reporting may ba refarrad to the Police for investigation.

@_This raport will ba focwarded by the ireurem af the GlA Records Manap

archivisg and tht copees of this repon will, for § fes, he mads svallat

gamant Cenire asiablishad by the Ganaral Inswsnce Associafion of Singapohe (GIA] for

n sppliclion by Interesied paries

7. By ha lodgemani of (his roport fo Ihe insurers, you harby cansant 10 the archiving af this repart af the centre and o coples of 1he report being made avalable

aloreamd

Date Of Repor 10/05/2018 15:07

Dale Of Accidan! 08/05/2018 17:00

Exact Locabon Of Accident BALESTIER ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vahicle Ragistration Number SLUZR02G
Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registersd Owner GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
Co Reg No 201617200G

Emnil Address NOEMAIL

Maohila Phonae Mo (LOCAL) =65-82431133
Allernative Phane No OFFICE-BR550005
Vehicle Particulars

Manufaciurer MAZDA

Modal 3

Exact Purpose for which venicle was baing used at

(=]
time of accidant RIVATE HIRE

Are you claiming under your own inaurance policy

for repair to your vehicla? NO

Iif Mo, Please state action 1o be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehiole Category PRIVATE HIRE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company MSIG INSLUIRANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD
Typa Of Covarage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy YES

Policy Numbear AZE114TEEMKF

Covar Note Number

Driver

Nama of Orivar YEO CIN DEE

NRIC Na STETIT0AG

Date Of Birth 23n2have

Oecupation OUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 14/07/2003

Driving Experience 15 YEARS AND § MONTHS
Gandar FEMALE

Mobile Mumber (LOCAL) +65-824.31133
Fax NMumbaar

Contact Numbar

EMall Address NOEMAIL

Paga 1 of 21



4

Address 176 BOON LAY DRIVE #07-364
Postcode 6401786

Was drver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Ralationship of the Drivar with the Insured  OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Onver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Drver's Own Vehicle -

Type Of Accidant COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR

Weathar Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Was any foreign vehicle invalved In this accidant? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vahicls) 2
Invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any Injured conveyed lo hospllal by NO
ambulanca?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
saliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 4
G NAME: - UNKNOWN
GENDER  : FEMALE

Passenger 2 NAME: - UNKNOWN
GEMNDER - FEMALE

Passenger 3 NAME: : UNKNOWN
GEMDER: : FEMALE

Was the acodent reponad to the police? NO
if Yas Please state which Police Stafion
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes, against wham?

r

ON 08 MAY 2018, AT ABOUT 1700HRS, | WAS DRIVING MY VEHICLE, SLU2802G ALONG BALESTIER ROAD TOWARDS
CTE. AS TRAFFIC WAS HEAVY, MY VEHICLE WAS STATIONARY WHEN SUDDENLY THERE WAS A LOUD THUD FROM
THE REAR PORTION OF MY VEHICLE. NOBODY WAS INJURED

Are accident photos avallable for attachment? YES

Was thare any vides caplurad by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recordad 7 NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vahicle Registration Number GBG4121Y
Vehicle Maka/Modal/Colour
Detalls Of Properties
Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver LAI WAl KIONG

Page 2 of 21



MRIC/Passport Numbear

Contact Number

Address

Posicode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

MNo. Of Passenger (Including Dnver)

+B587864185

Pags 3 of 21
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ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Cficer in
Tel

Emall

74 KIAN TECK ROAD
SINGAPORE 628800

Charge - YAP MEE KEY

Quotation
From : Customer ;
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD GRAB RENTALS PTELTD

18 SIN MING LANE
#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573880

Aftn:
Tel:
Fax No. :

Quotation No. : Q019/05-1152

Quotation Date : 15/05/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No. : SLU2902G

Chassis No. : JMBBN22ABHO157598

Third Party Insurer : CHINA TAIPING

Model : MAZDA 3 Date of Accident : 08/05/2019
Remarks :
| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | Qty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 REAR BUMPER dlz - 1 1.075.0000 1,075.00
2  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER X ¢ 2 55.0000 110.00
3 REAR BUMPER CLIPS Ags 10 4.0000 40.00
4 REAR BUMPER RIVET As ¢~ 4 5.0000 20.00
§  REAR BUMPER TOW COVER Y& 8¥C 2 35.0000 70.00
B REAR BUMFPER REFLECTOR )'f. sVl 2 115.0000 230.00
7 REAR BUMPER INNER CENTER BRACKET )QL 1 35.0000 35.00
7 7
8  REAR REINFORCEMENT 1 545.0000 545.00
8  REARENDPANEL X gvt- 1 £15.0000 615.00
10 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH X 9~ 1 125.0000 125,00
11 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS X S¥“C 6 40000 24.00
12 REAR WEATHERSTRIPS Y $a 1 155,0000 155.00
{3 REARBOOTLID cover X #AN 1 965,0000 965,00
14 REAR BOOTLID 'MAZDA EMBLEM X 1 75.0000 75.00
15  REAR BOOTLID 'skyAcTiv BADGE X L An\ 1 65.0000 65.00
16  REAR BOOTLID MAZDA 3 BADGE X 1 55,0000 55.00
17 LESS 20% 1 -840.8000 -840.80
-~
{8 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @ 1SET 7 A% 1 2800000 2610 280700
19 REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING )( : v 1 B0.0000 50.00
CIF 0,00

Page 1 of 2
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+ ~ PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation
From ; Customer ;
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
T4 KIAN TECK ROAD 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 828800 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573860
Officer in Charge - YAP MEE KEY
Tel Attn,
Email Tel:
Fax Mo. ;
Quotation No. : @019/05-1152 Quotation Date : 15/052019 Terms : 30 DAYS
Vehicle No. : SLU2802G Chassis No. : JMEBN22ABHD157598 Third Party Insurer : CHINA TAIPING
Model : MAZDA 3 Date of Accident : 08/05/2018
Remarks :
| meEm | DESCRIPTION | Qty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
B/F 0.00

20  TOREMOVE & REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSOR

1 1200000 6o };erﬁa

21 TOREMOVE & REARRANGE REAR TAILLAMP & REFLECTOR 1 1000000 a4 X 100.00
WIRING SYSTEM
22 TOAPPLY RUST PROOFING & TUFFCOATING TREATMENT 1 1200000 1 " X 12000
23 TO PANEL BEATING 1 10000000 250 J,Bdﬁ'ﬁu
24 TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS 1 1,000.0000 2e-g 106000
AMul

[ o

Please conduct the survey al
Pegasus Enginearing @ 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Ho Foviaob \Q\\“o\
2. deap
il
;a;/ﬂ(ﬁq @ 115C
(Ew,) befe

Sub Tatal 6,043.20
GST(7.00%) 423.02
Total (SGD) 6,466.22
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EGASUS

i?fé .C&fnﬂ fﬂ?r:-f
Suprry € Grouse
TPi00

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

& Quotation
Frn'm 3 . Customer :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
74 KIAN TECK ROAD 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE G2B800 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573860
Officar in Charge : YAP MEE KEY
Tel: Aftry: :
Emall ; Tal:
Fax No. :

Quotation No. ;: Q018/05-1152

Quotation Date : 15/05672018

Terms ; 30 DAYS

Vehicla No. : 5LU2802G

Chassis No. : JMEENZ2ABHO157598

Third Party Insurer : CHINA TAIPING

Date of Accldent : OB/IOS/2018

~*~del : MAZDA 3

i marks ; ~
| mEm | DESCRIPTION [ @y | UNITPRICE [AMOUNT (scD)]
1 REARBUMPER gz 1 1,075.0000 1,075.00
2  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER X&'V 2 55,0000 110.00
3  REARBUMPER CLIPS Agd ~ ; 10 4.0000 4000
4  REARBUMPER RIVET A/~ 4 5.0000 20.00
§ REARBUMPER TOW COVER Y& ¥ 2 35.0000 70.00
6  REARBUMPER REFLECTOR %L ¥t 2 115.0000 230.00
7  REAR BUMPER INNER CENTER BRACKET D& ¥ 1 35,0000 35.00
8  REAR REINFORCEMENT 7/ k- 1 §45.0000 545.00
REAR END PANEL YL ¢4 1 815.0000 615.00
10 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH < #*%- 1 125.0000 125.00
41 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS )X o4 o 8 4.0000 24.00
12 REARWEATHERSTRIPS §¢ 7 \ka 2{‘:; Rf, N 1 166.0000 165,00

. " %

{3  REAR BOOTLID COVER Yo A7 ) & 1 885,0000 965,00
14  REAR BOOTLID 'MAZOA' EMBLEM X ‘Y 1 75,0000 76.00
15  REAR BOOTLID 'SKYACTIV' BADGE )(s An 1 65,0000 55.00
18 REAR BOOTLID 'MAZDA 3 BADGE X 1 £6,0000 55.00
17 LESS 20% 1 -840.8000 -340.80
18 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @1 SET 11"/ €D 1 2800000 20O 250700
19 REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING Kg - 1 aucmu 60.00
CIF 0.00
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“XS_7 PEGASUS

/" ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation
From: : Customer &

FPEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
74 KIAN TECK ROAD 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 628800 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 573860
Officer In Charge : YAP MEE KEY
Tel: At
Emall : Tel:

Fax No.

Quotation No. : QD18/05-1152 Cluotation Data ; 16/06/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vghicle No. : SLLI2902C

Chassis No. : JMBBNZZABHO1576580

Third Party Insurar : CHINA TAIPING

Date of Accident : 08/05/2019

Sdel : MAZDA 3
Remarks :
| mEM | DESCRIPTION [ @y | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|

20 TO REMOVE & REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSCR

21  TO REMOVE & REARRANGE REAR TAILLAMP & REFLECTOR

WIRING SYSTEM

TO PANEL BEATING

®RER

/D — & ff‘fﬂo-rff
~g 200 -
{, g oo

< % opap- Y _f' F

e ——

| LKK Aulo Consuitants hence nolify

ihe Repairer of he following:

» To resurvey belane/alisr spray painting

« To dhaplay damagad pari{s) during rasuney

* Pt prices are subjoct 1o conlimation

* Third parky survey Is o 8 “Wilhoul Prejudics” bais
« Na llegal modifcation(s) is aliowed

+ Suppiementary llem{s) must be mesurveysd gnd
Is subjeci o final approval Irom insurance Company

Ackngwisdged by Repalrer

Signate:
Bat:

Please conduct the survey al
Pagasus Engineering @ 74 Klan Teck Road Singapore 628800

TO APPLY RUST PROOFING & TUFFCOATING TREATMENT

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS.

BIF

1
!
: g‘tﬁ

0.00

1200000 bo yu:ﬁ'u

100.0000 A" x 100.00

1 1200000 " X 120,00
1 10000000 250 380000
1 1,000.0000 Jerg 10800

Al
H—P "']ﬂma'&q
2o
i
;q{ﬂtfm @ (K

(,2% b (A

Sub Total
GST(7.00%)
Total (SGD)

B,043.20
423.02
B,466.22



Adjuster Repont
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg e 1sssor1eer)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkaulo.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTIM8010778/R1QD3N2

Date: 011102019
c T
Handling hina Taiping Insurance .
st (Singapore) Ple. Lid Policy No: DMCVSN17522618011
Claimant Insured
Vehicle No : SLU2802G Vehicle No @ GBG4H121Y
, Nature of Claim
Date of Loss:  0B8/05/2019 Clalm: TP No: SNM18D202088C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLU2902G
Make & Model: MAZDA 3, 1.5 SEDAN EUG (A) Engine No: P520450338
Reg. Date: 28/11/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: JMBEBN22ABH0157588
Colour: Black Odometer: 127117 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 oo
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME DOF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/80 R16
Front Left Side: Triangle & mm Rear Left Side: Triangie 6 mm
Front Right Side: Triangle & mm Rear Right Side: Triangle 6 mm
Tha above valuas represent e remmining hre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference DIff %
Parts 3,703.20 1.544.00 2.159.20 58.31
Miscellaneous liems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.340.00 510,00 1.830.00 78.21
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 6,043.20 2,054.00 3.989.20 66.01
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 423.02 143,78 279.24 66.01
Nett Amount (5§) 6.466.22 2,197.78 4,268.44 66.01
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27/09/2019
Date Inspected: 19/06/2018 Inspected At: Pagasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid

Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

(Kian Teck)
74 Kian Teck Road
Singapore 628800

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL

Manager: SHIAL CHAN

NOTE: This report represents our findings al fve fme and place of inspection stated herein. Such nspoction has been camisd ouf fo the bast of our
knowiadge and abilly but any othar lability under gy cther circumstances is hereby axpressly sexcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 1/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS
Reference
|Part Source: MRM-33 Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 01 Oct 2018)
|Parts: 143 MAZDA 3 1.5 SEDAN EUG (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
| Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLU2902G)

'Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code {above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last eslimale page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 ‘REAR BUMPER Deformed 1,075.00FL *1,075.00 FL
2 2 ‘REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Serviceable 110.00FL *-FL
3 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 40.00FL *40.00 FL
4 - *‘REAR BUMPER RIVET Necessary 20.00FL *20.00 FL
5 2 *REAR BUMPER TOW COVER Serviceable T0.00FL *FL
6 2 ‘REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Serviceable 230.00FL *-FL
7 1 *REAR BUMPER INNER CENTER BRACKET Serviceable 35.00FL *-FL
B 1 *REAR REINFORCEMENT Bent 54500FL “545.00FL
8 1 ‘REAR END PANEL Serviceable 615.00FL *-FL
110 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Serviceable 125.00FL *-FL
11 6 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS Serviceable 24.00FL “FL
12 1 *REAR WEATHERSTRIPS Servicaabla 155.00FL ~-FL
13 1 *‘REAR BOOTLID COVER Nol Necessary BE5.00 FL *-FL
14 1 *REAR BOOTLID MAZDA EMBLEM Nol Necessary 75.00FL "-FL
15 1 *REAR BOOTLID SKYACTIV BADGE Mol Necessary B5.00FL *-FL
16 1 *REAR BOOTLID MAZDA 3 BADGE Nol Necessary 55.00FL *-FL
17 1 *SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Nol Working 280.00FS *200.00FS
18 1 ‘REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING Serviceable 60.00FS *-FS

F=Franchiss par. S=Spchetl. L=l iatlemDisc

Sub Total (S§)  4,544.00 1,680.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (5%) B840.80 336.00

Taotal Parts (S5) 3,703.20 1,544.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 1/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3
Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSOR MNaw 120.00 60.00
2 TO REMOVE & REARRANGE REAR TAILLAMP & New 100.00 0.00
REFLECTOR WIRING SYSTEM
3 TO APPLY RUST PROOFING & TUFFCOATING New 120.00 0.00
TREATMENT
4 TO PANEL BEATING New 1,00:0.00 250.00
5 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED New 1,000.00 200.00
AREAS
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2,340.00 510.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 1/10/2019



