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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 3:30 PM

To: Frankie THAY (SPF)

Cc: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF); Cui Fen ENG (SPF); SUR; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Subject: [SPF]: THE VEHICLE NO: SMD 3044D / QX 1459 B ALONG BOON LAY WAY & 

JURONG WEST CENTRAL 2 ON 31/05/2019

LKK Ref: CS/SPF19010771/Avd3e2 

 

Dear Frankie, 

 

TP workshop CS Motorwerkz says they have been unable to contact your good office for last year’s case. They have 

yet to settle this claim. 

 

For your kind action please. 

 

Thank you. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Olivia Lau | Admin Manager 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: LIM ALICE <citymotorspecialist@live.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 3:23 PM 

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: THE VEHICLE NO: SMD 3044D / QX 1459 B ALONG BOON LAY WAY & JURONG WEST CENTRAL 2 ON 

31/05/2019 

 

Dear Frankle, 

 

Refer to the above claim. 

 

Base on our conversation on 14/08/2019, I had mail out the final bill & other documents for your 

reference.  

Last year, the traffic police was out already and I had tried to contact you since last year until today but 

could  

not reach you. 

 

Hope to receive your reply soon so that we could closed this claim. 
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Thank you. 

 

Best regards, 

Ms Alice Lim 

CS MOTORWERKZ PTE LTD 

H/P: 9631 6187 


