Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 May 2020 10:48 AM

To: survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SDK6776A OD-MSIG FINALISATION

Dear Meng Huat,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $19,050.00 before excess $1,500.00 & GST and 8 repair days.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: survey@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:survey@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 6 April 2020 5:38 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SDK6776A OD-MSIG FINALISATION

Hi All,

Enclosed your attention.
P/P=$19,050.00

Please confirm.

Thank you.

Regard
Meng Huat
K.Kim Hin Auto



