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«««CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
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Reforonce

It -
Main Ciairmnt; THINK ONE LEASING PTELTD, Co. Reg. oo 20111S609M
Weehicis Rag, No.: _ GBESSS8T | Date of Loss: lwumnuunu 59
Chakm Type! I'rF [ SNMI9D202771C02 PalicyfCaver Note No.:  DMPCSNAO4S 1918011
Vehicle Reg, No. {Ingured): SIWS383X Palicy No, (Claiisant): (SI0TIREI3

Exgess: -852,00000
Rgaisar: Think One Autocare Pte Ltd (NQ) No. 18 Defu Avenue 2, 539522 Ut - Tel: 68443300

v China Taiping Insurance: (ﬂﬂllm,'p Pre. Lid. (HQ) - Tel! 6369 6111 . [Handiad by Tan Kah
Handling Ingurer __ loong - Gigneia]

Claimant’s Insurer: _NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel.
Add s, LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei 62563561 . [Final Rpt due 27/06/2015]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED v Al | Gompose Cae Mai
There are no mail far This case. o

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view A | SesrchYesie | CrestenewTassk | Comilets |
Chun Date  Prlority  Typa  Task Group Subjict  Handlor Assigned By Complated Dn Croated On  Udne?
MNO FEgaTe

htlps:;‘f:sing;pure.marimen;mmfclaimmﬁndex.eﬁn?ﬁm&bwhﬂﬁaﬁjm&fumcﬁuﬁd". 18/6/2019



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong Tan@sg.cntaiping com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 11:22 AM

To: karentan@thinkone.com sg; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202771 - GBEESEST & SJW9383X ACCIDENT DATED ON
12.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Cear Kareh,

Ve refer to your email of 17.06.2019,

v/e will be assigning M/s LKK Aute Consultants to survey your client’s vehicle on a without prejudice basss:
Asideta LK,

Please refer to the email below & proceed to survey the third garty vehicle.

Thank yol.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078809
OiD: (65) 63898193 | F:(658) 8222 1033

W www sgentaiping.com | FB: www facebook cornichinatalpingsg/

Chaciaimir Thie eamatil and any a3 rangmitid with it e hfended anfy for the narted reciplenis and may cantain confitentisl infarmalion Any
i authanzad deciotone, use or dissenmination of e rmesssge, sdher i Wil or partind 15 profifeted, i o are mot e imteided moisesl, piease
Patity the sender immedisioly. Floase delels the eamall angd any copies of i tharoalter

From: Tan Kah Leong

Sant: Tuesday, 18 June, 2019 9:37 AM

T karentan@thinkone.com.sg

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM19D202771 - GBEBSBAT & SIW9383X ACCIDENT DATED ON 12.06.2019
Without Prejudice

Dizar Karen,

We refer to our email dated 17.06:2019,

Please let ys have your cholce of surveyors to conduct the SIE,

Thank you

Regards



Tan Kah Leong
Assistan Execulive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 075900
D! (65) 63886193 | F. (65) 6222 1033

W www sq cntaiping.com || FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsg/

Uactaumes Thi e-mail and any files ranamitied with it is intended only for U nanied recipionts and may contain confidential information Any
w rautharized disclosure. use or dissemingtion of this message, either in whole or partial, is profibiteel. i you are not the inlendod recipient, pinass
ntily ihe senoer immidintely. Phrase delate the sonal ahd ny copes of I hemsafor

From: Tan Kah Leong
Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 11:42 AM
To: karentan@thinkone.com.sg

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D202771 - GBEBS88T & SIW9383X ACCIDENT DATED ON 12.06.2019
Without Prejudice
Dear Karen,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle Jointly with your client/your motor workshop.
We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors te conduct the Joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

ADRIAN LING

LOW SAR HUE]

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHE FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
SING QUD QIANG

KENNETH KONG

HONG FOOK CHOY

IZHUA WELIE

MARCUS CHUA

HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a
single jaint expert.

Yeiu may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single
joirit expert.

Thank you
Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Ausistant Executive
Claims Department

Cnina Talping Insurance (Singapore} Pte. Ltd,
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 073909
DIDy (65) B389 6193 | F (65) 6222 1033

W:www sg cn@iping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsal




iscaimar This sl and Wiy Mg frandvitied Wit il is itended dniy fde the noemieg reciigits arid msy contain confidanha information Any
uraiihanzes discisuns ise-or disssmination of ths message, sl i wholi or partial, is-profbited I you ate not the nisnded fecian, plesse
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From: Lim Shu Min -
Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 11:31 AM
To: karantan@thinkone.cam sg; Tan Kah Leong <KshLeong Tan@sg cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow

<sochuw chee@sg cntalping.com>
Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D202771 - GBESSBET & SIW9383X ACCIDENT DATED ON 12.06.2019
Irnportance: High

Dear Kah Leong,
P ease conduct PRS -~ GBESSAET soohest possible.

Flle with ﬂfﬁczr-ln-charge ~Tan Kah Leong = 63896193,

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Exscutive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. _
3 Ansan Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 072808
DID. (8583896156 | F. (B5)B2247175

W www sgcntaiping com | FB: www tacebook com/chinalalpingsg/ | WeChat: L 1"¥# Taiping 8G

Drsciaiir This e-mail and any fes ranamitied with it is intndsd only for the named focipinls gnd may contain confideniis! infaprnabon Ame
Wsapthanzed disciosute. ke or dissemination of ths message, et in whole or pamal s profhitied I you ane ool the intinded reoiplent, please
roflly the ssodar imimpdialely. Ploase daibie the e-mail and any copies of it Ihreafar

From: Karen Tan |mgil;g:Emngn@thinkgne.ggm.gg[

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg cataiping.com>

Subject: RE: GBEBSEST & SIW9383X ACCIDENT DATED ON 12.06.2019
Importance: High

Ciear Sir/Mdm,

I wauld like to arrange for a surveyor for GBES588T, As my client is claiming against your insured
5/W9383X for the above mention accident.

Thank you.

Fiiren Tan

Claim Advisor

Think One Autacare Pte Ltd

Mo, 18 Defu Avenue 2

Singapore 539522

HP:9128 8488

0ID < GR4A4 3300 FAX : BB42 4988
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10082018 Marimen e-Claims

Print Sent Message

This mail is-associatad with :
“GBESS88T (SNM19D202771C02)
s
THINK ONE LEASING PTELTD
Jun 122018 6,00PM

Think One Autdcare Pte Lid

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 08/10/2019 18:47 PM.
To CHINA_TAIPING; KahLeong. Tan@lsg.cntaiping.com

cc assignments@ikkauto.com

Subject TP Vehicle No, GBE 8588T (Your Ref: SNM19D202771C02)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

According to the repairer M/s Think One Autocare Pte Ltd, the third party owner had withdrawn claim fram their
workshop.

“here Is no inspection done, therefore we will close this case at our end without Billing.

Best Regards;

t:eline Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email; celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

hitps-isingapars mermin comiciaimsfindex ofm7fussbox=SVCmail&iussaction=dsp_Print&CFID=604179704CFTOKEN=02dasde80bb5Tel-A. 111



