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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: survey@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 9:06 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: sandrakhong@gmail.com; survey2@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Simon'; 

service@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLD 7744C-DOA: 3/6/2019 (AXA OD)

Attachments: AUDATEX_190296_SLD7744C_ADDMENDED.pdf

Hi All, 

 

Enclosed your attention. 

 

Addmended Spare Parts Prices 

1982   R/R DOOR MOULDING 6M21U25532BNXWAA       230.00 
1000   R/R DR OUT HANDLE CHROME                          420.00 

1003   R/R SPORT RIM RIM                                        800.00 

 

Kindy seek approval from AXA. 

Thank you. 

 

Regard 

Meng Huat 

K.Kim Hin Auto 

 

From: Simon <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 7:15 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; service@kkimhin.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 

survey@kkimhin.com.sg 

Cc: sandrakhong@gmail.com; survey2@kkimhin.com.sg 

Subject: Re: SLD 7744C-DOA: 3/6/2019 (AXA OD) 

 

Dear Veron, 

  

Kindly note that this above mentioned vehicle will be doing part by part basis. 

Unable to find 2nd hand parts. Kenneth is aware of this case. 

Do I need to wait for AXA approval again? 

  

  

Regards 

Simon  

64527018 

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 

 
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2019 3:16 PM 
To: service@kkimhin.com.sg ; SUR ; survey@kkimhin.com.sg  

Cc: Simon ; sandrakhong@gmail.com ; survey2@kkimhin.com.sg  

Subject: RE: SLD 7744C-DOA: 3/6/2019 (AXA OD) 

 

Dear Sandra, 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLD 7744C (Excess $800/-). 
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If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 

NOTE: As requested by AXA kindly get a copy of the exemption letter from the navy for record 
purpose. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: service <service@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 12:36 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Simon <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>; sandrakhong@gmail.com; survey2@kkimhin.com.sg; service@kkimhin.com.sg 

Subject: re: SLD 7744C-DOA: 3/6/2019 (AXA OD) 

 
Dear Veron 
  
Good day to you. 
  
Owner works for US Army (Air Force) under MINDEF. 
  
Wife used to work for US Army, now on dependent pass. 
  
Regards 
Sandra 
6452 7018 
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 
  

From: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)" <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2019 12:32 PM 
To: "service@kkimhin.com.sg" <service@kkimhin.com.sg>, "SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>, "survey@kkimhin.com.sg" 

<survey@kkimhin.com.sg> 

Cc: "Simon" <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>, "sandrakhong@gmail.com" <sandrakhong@gmail.com>, 
"survey2@kkimhin.com.sg" <survey2@kkimhin.com.sg> 

Subject: SLD 7744C-DOA: 3/6/2019 (AXA OD)  
  

Dear Sandra, 

  

Kindly assist to check with insured driver the employment status. 

  
  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


