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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 3:06 PM

To: Claims; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuUto)

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR VEHICLESJQ 878 B -DOA: 7/6/2019
Dear Sheila,

Vehicle excess $400/-

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg=

sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 12:57 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) everonchen@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR VEHICLE SJQ B78 B -DOA: 7/6/2019

Hi Veron,
Thank you for the updates, kindly advise excess once available.

Best Regards,
sheila M Ismail
Claims Advisor

premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg v 10227100
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408629
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 GE28 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.COMLSE W. WWW. audi.Com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 .ﬁ.*e::andra Road SII'lgd,..DIE 15%33 p. +65 E335 2223

The all-new Audi Q2

#untagga ble



mp:f!mmw.audi.com,sqfsea!brandfﬁﬂfaudi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-

2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged

If you have received it In errar, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message froam your system,
Pleass do rot copy 1T or use it for any purpose, or disclase its contents of any attachment to any other person, Thank you

Erom: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailm;ugmn;heg@mkggm.@m}
Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 8:52 AM

To: Claims: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR VEHICLE SJQ 878 B -DOA: 7/6/2019

Dear Sheila,
Our surveyor’s has authorise repair on the same day of inspection (17/6/2019) (Excess TBA)

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 5:46 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR VEHICLE 5JQ 878B

Dear all,

Kindly register OD claims for this vehicle. Attached is GlA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once is available.

Kindly assist with approvals thank you.

Best Regards,
Sheila M Ismail
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pe Ltd g we ssseri

55 Ubl Road 1 Road Singapore 408659

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1182

. claims@premiumautp.com.sg w._ www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. 465 6836 2223

2
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Please da nat copy it ar use it for any purposa, o disclose its contents or any attachmeant 1o any other person, Thank you
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crwener 102

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
panufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jun 2017

F‘Il'l.'pGZH'ﬁI'I'I,F[E.gD'J.5Q.'T[a.l"k"l'll'ﬂl'.-'[lI:Il'l.'Er'IqL.I!FBHED&IEU-‘_,'I—'LIDIIGHETOI'&UEFE

PARFICMF Rehata Frniiry

Singapore NRIC
5170E

SIOBTEB

Mo

17 Jun 2019

AUDI

03 1.4 TFSI 5 TROMIC
Grey

2016

CZD2562582
WALIZZZEUKHRO45814
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
$27,901.00

10 Feb 2017

10 Feb 2017

0

$31.062.00

Yes
0% Feb 2027
$23,296.00

0% Feb 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 57kW (130bhp)

10

£48,209.00
$34,869.00
$60,165.00

OK

gINpULFLUINL IR _IL=FUsUauus ||l
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183
Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323

6841 1183
PA/ODIDTS2/2019TG
14-Jun-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No

Model Code
Model | Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr. Lee Hwee Wang
16 West Coast View
Singapore 127186
HP +65 84508338
Own Damage Claims
210050054-02

SJQ 878 B
Audi Q3 1.4 TFSI S TRO
10/2/2017

CZD 262582
WAUZZZBUXHRO45816

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
7-Jun-19
Malacca Street



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408690 ‘ .
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: G841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SJQ 878 B

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

To remove and transfer front wire harmess for
1 headlights, homs, outside temperature sensor and SN $ 360,00 o
headlight washer assy.

To dismantie and renew front bumper, Ihs front fender =
2 and Ihs headlight. Re-organise crash management B 240000 / OOV
components. Reinstall all parts removed, .

e

3 To respray front bumpe'? :and Ihs front fender. 5 2,200.80 o o°
4  To renew Ihs front rim and carry out wheel alignment SN 8§ 280.00
4 To carry out diagnostic check. SN % 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 5,432.00



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJQ 878 B

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONTBUMPER Te . ¢ $ 1,788.00 .
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS /1€ é1- 5 99.00 *
3 FRONT AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH A7 ez $ 139.00 * |
4 FRONTBUMPERSPOILER /AT $ 34900~
5 FORNTFENDER-LH “Re-Ald 5 82400~
6  FRONTFENDERATTACHMENTPARTs << N $ e300 ~ X
7 FORNT FENDER BRACKET-LH  TWC A $ 7500 - %
8 POPRIVET M 3 1800 =~
9 FRONT BRACKET SUPPORT-LH Nt N« s 06.00 & 7K
10 FRONT HEADLIGHT MOUNTING - LH > “~ $ 107.00
11 FRONT HEADLIGHT RETAINING PLATE -LH /“ $ 79.00
12 FRONT HEADLIGHT - LH VT e~ $ 7,087.00 _t
13 FTCYLINDER-LH et én $ 192,00 4
4 \WHEEL HOUSING LINER - LH T $ 223.00
15  WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS * A<~ $ 139.00 +
16  WHEEL SPOILER-LH ot ‘ 66.00 X
7 WHEEL COVER - LH ‘i{} Lt $ 236.00 =
18 \WHEEL COVER - RH i S 236.00
19 ALUMINIUMRIM M A $ 694.00 X °
20 RUBBERVALVE M rin 3 13.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,523.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES % 5,432.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 17,955.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax
Name - :’..IIA'“'L:.-‘\ pa P A
Surveyed Date - . ?I"f{} Gl 4 <]

Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability

Remarks : Mt vsed ﬁt?md 3=

Please Note +  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the

progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 |Uki Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tal - 6366 2323 Fax @ 6841 1183

Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg { claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323

5841 1183
PAIOD/OTE22019TG
14-Jun-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

COwner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr. Lee Hwee Wang
18 West Coast View
Singapore 127186
HP +55 94508338
Own Damage Claims
210050054-02

sSJQ 878 B

Audi Q3 1.4 TFSIS TRO
10/2/2017

CZD 262582
WAUZZZBUXHR045816

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
7=Jun-19
Malacca Street




Premium Automobiles

55 ki Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel - G366 2323 Fax:@ 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SJQ 878 B

Estimated Surveyar's
Sin Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and transfer front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, cutside temperature sensor and SN 5 360.00 5 360.00
headlight washer assy.
To dismantle and renew front bumper, Ihs front fender
2 and Ihs headlight. Re-organise crash management b 2,400.00
components, Reinstall all parts removed. $ 1,000.00
3 To respray front bumper and lhs front fender, 5 2,200.00 § 1,100.00
4 To renew Ihs front im and carry out wheel alignment SN % 280.00
4 To carry out diagnostic check. SN % 192.00 s 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5 5.432.00 5 2,652.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJQ 878 B

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER $ 1,788.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 99.00
3 FRONT AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH $ 139.00
4  FRONT BUMPER SPOILER $ 349,00 279.20
5  FORNT FENDER - LH $ 824.00 T
6§ FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS $ 63.00
7 FORNT FENDER BRACKET - LH $ 75.00
8  POPRIVET $ 18.00 o
9 FRONT BRACKET SUPPORT - LH $ 96.00
10 FRONT HEADLIGHT MOUNTING - LH § 107.00
11 ERONT HEADLIGHT RETAINING PLATE - LH $ 79.00
12 FRONT HEADLIGHT - LH $ 7,087.00
13 LIFT CYLINDER - LH $ 192.00
4 \WHEEL HOUSING LINER - LH 223.00
15  WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS $ 130.00
16  WHEEL SPOILER - LH § _—
17 \WHEEL COVER - LH $ 236.00 18080
18 WHEEL COVER - RH 5 236.00 188.80
19 ALUMINIUM RIM $ 694.00
20 RUBBER VALVE $ 13.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,523.00 1,330.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5 5,432.00 2,652.00
GRAND TOTAL §  17,955.00 3,982.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 8:30 AM

To: 'jiayee,yap@premiumaum.cnm.sg': CS A Team; Admin A; SUR
(ol ‘Boo seng yak'; ‘Carrine Leong’; 'Chang Chee Sing'

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - 5JQ878B- OD AIG - SURVEYED 17 JUN 19

Dear Jia Yee,
Confirm repair cost of $3982.00 before excess $400 @ 4 days of repair.

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiuma uto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 28 September 2019 9:50 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@|kkauto.com=; Cs A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <yeronchen@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Carrine Leong' <carrine.leong@ premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Chang Chee
Sing' <claims@premiumauto .COM.SE>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - 5JQ878B- OD AIG - SURVEYED 17 JUN 19

Hi Adrian and all,
Revised estimate is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $3982.00 @ 4 days of repair.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regard
JiaYee Yap
Claims Administrator

premium Automobiles Pte Lid (regne 1emeaziiw|

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singap: 108695
p. +65 638 7373 d, +65 6768 9325 £ +G5 6841 1183
e, Jiayee yap@pramiumauio tom.ag w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 alewandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +h5 6836 2223



Premium Automobiles

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Morah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building 6841 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SJQ 878 B PA/OD/0403/2019/NH

9 October 2019
Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SJQ 878 B, Audi Q3 1.4 TFSI S TRONIC.

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SJ() 878 B, claimant,
Ms. Lee Hwee Wang, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85014327 - S§3,832.74,
2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
G768 9911,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Morah Khai
Claims Dept

Encl
AIG-SJIQ 878 B

from

Telephone +65-
Telefax  +65-
EMail

Crur department
Qur Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automeblles Ple Lid
Showroom

9 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 139080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Cenlres
55 Uk Rd 1

Singapore 408693
Telephane (B5) 6336 2323
Telafax (B5) 824 11183



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Audi Centre Singapore Alexandra Service Centre Ubi Service Centre Customer Service
F81 Alexandra Rosd 261 Alexandra Road 55 Ul Road 1 Secvica Appaintment 5366 2322
Singapore 159536 Singapone 168838 Sngeapore 4085059 24-nour Braskdown Sarvice S828 1233
Main Tetaphore 6336 2223 Main Telapnona G368 2223 Main Telephone 8386 2323 Email customer carapremiumauto com.ag
Main Talefax G471 3723 Mamn Tedafaz 6475 1023 Main Telefax  BB41 1183
C INS TAX INVOICE
Page 1 14:10 Company Reg. No. 199902271W

GST Reg. No. 199902271W

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD  Invoice No: 85014327 Account: nOODE (T 0)
MOTOR CLAIM DEPT

IG ILDIE
?éhﬁﬁg‘:ﬂ:‘gé“ﬁnf Date 071072019 AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

MOTOR CLAIM DEPT

#07-16
AIG BUILDING
2 =3 78 0 o e
INGAFORE 078120 079120 Order @ SJO0DBTEE 8 BHENTON WAN
$07-16
Term - 30 SINGAPORE 079120
Regn No: sJppe7se (v 32585) Regn Date: 10/02/2017 Mileage: 17227 WIP MNo.: 55891
Model: 93 1.4 TFSI 5 tronic BUGARX Chassis: WAUZZZSUXHRO45B16 Engine: czp zg2582 Dept: u
You have been assisted by :- vB-Siti Marsilla ¢ 137}
Details Oty Unit Price Amount
o ExC M: BHEE -400.00 1.00 -400.00
Insurance Excess/Liability
5 BODYWORE M: 360.00 1.0 360.00
TC REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS FOR
HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, OUTSIDE TEMPERRTURE SENSOR
AND HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY
3 BODYWORE M: 1000.00 1.00 1,000.00
To DISMANTLE AND RENEW LHS FRONT FEMDER.
T6 BEPAIR FRONT BUMPER.REORGRANISE CRASH
MANAGEMENT COMPOMENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS
REMOVED
5 BODYWORE M: 1100.00 1.00 1,100.00
T BESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND LHS FRONT FENDER
5 BODYWORE M3 152.00 1.00 152,00
T3 CARRY OUT DIRGROSTIC CHECH
% ASUCHZ1105 FENDER Less 020% 1.00 823.50 E58. 6O
% ABUDBOTOG61N 4ud FR.SPOILER (LAST) Less 020% 1.400 349,00 279,20
i AN D161857 FOP-RIVET Less 020% 6.0 3.00 14.40
b d RBUQES3ITLT  4UH COVER(LAST) Less 020% 1.00 236.00 1B8.80
® ABUOE53ITIE  4UH (A) (SK)COVER 20/6/19 Less D20% 1.00 236.00 188.80
Parts 1,330.00 E— Sub-Total 3, 582,00
Labour 0.00 « MO g™
Sublet 2,652.00
' T
Menus 0.00 : 7% GST 230
Lubricant 0.00 & |
Grand Total 3,832.74

Received by For & on behalf of
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd




Premium Automobiles

Telefax

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Litd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120
Motor Claims Dept
Yr Ref: STQ 878 B

Norah Khai
6768 9628
6841 1183

Eody Repair

PA/ODM493/2019MNS5
12 July 2019

1

RE: CLAIM - OWNER'S SATISFACTION/DISCHARGE YOUCHER

Make & Model
Vehiele Chassis No.
Vehicle Regn No.
Vehicle Mileage
Vehicle Owner

Certificate No

Own Damage Excess

Accident Date
FPlace

Repair Cost
WIF No.

Repairer's Name

Audi Q3 1.4 TFSL S TRONIC
WAUZZZEUNHRO45816
SIQRTEB

17121 KM

Ms Lee Hwee Wang
2100500542-02

8% 428 .00 (Inclusive 7% GST)
7 June 2019

Malacca street

53991

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

I'We certify that the vehicle has been fully repaired to my entire satisfaction and that
payment of the repairer*s charges that are claimable under the policy will be deemed in
full and final settlement of my claim.

Owner / Insured Signatore

Time

Date

e

\ak

E'ir Jul Jo 1

MSCHARGE VOUCHER- ALG - SIQ 878 B

from
Telaphone +65-
Telefax +65-
Mokbile +55-
Owur departiment
Your Claim FRef
Our Ref

Date

total pages

Pramiwm Automobiles Ple Lid

5 homroom

9 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 158000
Telgphane (85) 6565 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Pars Centres
55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408583
Telephona (65) 8366 2323
Telefax  (65) 86841 1183



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Cose T Nolifed | ot Submitted | AdjAssigned | AdjRot | Adj submitted | ins Auiied [Statis =
13 Jun 2019 17 Jun 2019 $%3,982.00 = 5%3,982.00 Pending for Survey
Main | 16:40 Edit Estimates || View Rpt | Repart
Ediét Adj Rpt l | | cCancal Case |
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Reference
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|Repairer; : " premium Automabiles Pte Ltd (UBI) 55 Uni Road 1, 408699 Ubi - Tel: 67689828/9827/9911
. | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. {SG) - Tel: 65- £419-3000 . [Handbd by Gan, Hunchung]
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coReg no-199607188R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkautu.mm:assbgnmants@Ikkaulo.ccm

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. Our File No:  CC3/AIG19010693/AVD3N2
AIG Building, 78 Shenton \Way #08-16
Singapore 079120 Date: 14/10/2019
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: LEE HWEE WANG Policy No:
Date of Loss: 07/06/2019 MNature of Claim: 0D Claim No: GB7433682056G
Cl N ENT ATIO F E
Reg No: 5JQBTEE
Make & Model: AUD!I 3, 1.4 TFSI (A} Engine No: CZD262582
Reg. Date: 10/02/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No:  WAUZZZBUXHRO45816
Colour: Grey Odometer: 16608 km
Engine Capacity: 1385 cc
Market Value/New Car $$105,000.00
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
1 T
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/55R17 Rear Tyre Size: 235/55R17
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone & mm
The above vaiues represent the remaining fyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 12,523.00 1,330.00 11,193.00 £9.38
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 5432.00 2,652.00 2,780.00 51.18
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 17,955.00 3,982.00 13,973.00 77.82
- Excess (S$) 400.00 400.00 0.00 0.00
(5%) 17,555.00 3,582.00 13.973.00 79.60
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 1.228.85 250.74 o78.11 79.60
Mett Amount (S$) 18,783.85 3,832.74 14,951.11 79.60
IN Tl
Date of Assignment: 17/06/2019
Date Inspected: 17/06/2019 Inspected At: Premium Automobiles Ple Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This repor repressents our findings af tfre tme and place of inspection stated hereln. Such inspaction has bean carmed out (o the best of our
kniowledge and ability but any ather labilty under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 1,788.00F3 *-F3
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS Not Mecessary 99.00FS *FS
3 1 *FRONT AIR GUIDE GRILLE-LH Mot Necessary 139.00FS “-F5
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER SPOILER Cut 345.00FS *279.20FS
5 1 *FRONT FENDER-LH Dented 824.00FS *658.80FS
B 1 *FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS Mot Necessary 63.00FS *-FS
Fi 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET-LH Mot Necessary 75.00FS *-FS
8 & *POP RIVET Mecessary 18.00FS *14.40F5
9 1 *FRONT BRACKET SUPPORT-LH Mot Necessary 96.00FS *-FS
10 1 *FRONT HEADLIGHT MOUNTING-LH Mot Necessary 107.00FS “-FS
1 1 *FRONT HEADLIGHT RETAINING PLATE-LH Not Necessary 79.00Fs *-F5
12 1 *FRONT HEADLIGHT-LH Mot Mecessary 7,087.00F3 *-F5
13 1 *LIFT CYLINDER-LH Mot Mecessary 192.00FS *-F3
14 1 *WHEEL HOUSING LINER-LH Mot Mecessary 223.00FS *-F8
15 1 *WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS  Not Necessary 139.00F5 *-FS
16 1 *WHEEL SPOILER-LH Mot Necessary 66.00FS *-FS
17 A *WHEEL COVER-LH Cut 238.00FS *188.80FS
18 1 “WHEEL COVER-RH Necessary 236.00FS *188.80F5
19 1 *ALUMINIUM RIM Not Necessary 694.00FS *-FS
20 4 *RUBBER VALVE Mot Mecessary 13.00FS *-F8
F=Franchise part. 3=SpchMati. =

1,330.00

Total Parts (S8) 12,523.00

-

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFE FRONT WIRE HARNESS New 360.00 360.00
FOR HEADLIGHTS,HORNS,OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY

2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER,LHS New 2,400.00 1,000.00
FRONT FENDER AND LHS HEADLIGHT.RE-ORGANISE
CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL
PARTS REMOVED

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND LHS FRONT New 2,200.00 1,100.00
FENDER

4 TO REMEW LHS FRONT RIM AND CARRY OUT WHEEL New 280.00 0.00
ALIGNMENT

5 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK MNew 192.00 192.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 5,432.00

2,652.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

i

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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