Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 10:39 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'efficient loyang'

Cc: assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGS1753X ( AlG ) AND GBH6660P

ON 14/05/2019

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Admin-D (LKKAuto) Delivered: 10/7/2019 10:39 AM
‘efficient loyang'

assignments

Admin A

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 10:39 AM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 10:39 AM

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 10:39 AM
Your Ref: GBH6660P Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19010559/K1ka3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGS1753X ( AIG ) AND GBH6660P ON 14/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct seftlement for the above

mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 12:59 PM

To: 'efficient loyang' <efficientloyang@gmail.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGS1753X ( AIG ) AND GBH6660P ON 14/05/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Khanchna,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/A1G19010559/ka3

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: efficient loyang [mailto:efficientloyang@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 12:52 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGS1753X ( AIG ) AND GBH6660P ON 14/05/2019

Dear Claim officer ,
Our Reference:
Your Reference: GBH6660P

Check on liability ?

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Joe Yap

Hp :94208113

Efficient Motor & Engineering Works Pte Ltd
56 Loyang Way

#06-07 Loyang Enterprise Building, S(508775)
Tel: 6284 0827

Fax: 6341 6758
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