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Fram
Estmated Cost;

DOTPAWS ! TP RES | CD RES/ EVA T INV MV

To Inspect Vehicle Mo:

at Waorkshop mis N..-— S’ l
of

Insured

Palicy Ma,

Claims No

Sum Insured; Excess:
[Client's Record)

Make of Veh

{Palicy Conditior)

ASSIGNMENT

Veh Mo

Truck | Trailer or
hake

Colour

Eng/Na

CiNo M
Gen. Cand ré’a,u I Fair

Maodi;  Nil | 8/Rim | ST
" Tyre Size: F:
| i H:

Remark: The veh had commenced its NIS O.!S{

repair at the time of inspection. "'-"J TOYO | YOKO o
Bal. orMarket Value, Front
IDAC Accident Rport:, Consistent? ; Yes or No RiBal
Gla | PR Saern Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal B
Est. Repairs days Res: Yes or No D.0OA .
Lum Bum: Qzﬁ) 9% 3Val: Yes or No Survey held at

CA | REY | REP. | 24HRS

Date: Parson Contacted:

’r oo ﬂ-H“t‘S
[
Sp Reading ngmsl

G 68697 . (7 0ct 216

Mype: I\@.‘ i.Cycle/ Bus | Van [ Loy | Taxi! Prime Mover [

- 159§

AT Insured | Std { NI | NA

TRadio: Insurad | Std | NIT MA

o5 3REH |0 $5& oo

| Poor{ Burnt

Steering: Inaﬂ;r.' Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
Brake Inwerf Jammed ['Leaked [ Burnt or

Rim or

205 /55 R4
(f

|
BS/DUN/EXNOVA | GY / FS/ LIZA | MIC / OHTSU | PIR [ SUMI/

H&Lb f{{a&(

Rear
_mm Rigal G mim
T LiBal

6

W[s Do, , L{p_ﬁaé :g?

Vehicle: IN/OUT

The WIC | Chassis

Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | @ NIS | UIC | Rooftop or

-

frame | Body Structure affected due to collizion

Date | Time Antion | Instruction

W6 Gt ke G vt

. [ @“ﬁﬁ Wit

LS)

2%00

with khers.

N\l \C\ 1—%\0\

RECEIVED -8 SEP-2318
UslefTime, Fiie Pass 107 :‘ Preli. Report ~ Days Of Repair: LS
1) :l: Final Report Resurvey Mo. of Trip: = Suryey Fes [5{]
DatelTwma. Fie Return to? Transportabon n
2) rsh_ BPH Add Fee: - Gite Insp (3 ) __5+RS__®
D. Interview (3 | Photos 0

Report Format cwsS

Lump Sum [1B1: (5 38eols

EI Tech Invs ($
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fer—oi = Coansultanis
Al A B L Company Registration Ne. 193507 198R
51 UHLAVE 1, £02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE J08%33 TEL - (065 623635681 FAX 1 (n5 h25643 15

Your ref: D19003855MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI19010550/Gvd3 Date: 18/9/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLG 8769]

We thank you for your instruction on 13/6/201%

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
14/6/20019  al the premises of M/s N-5 I PTIVE PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5$7,192.43

Revised Estimate Amount :5%3,800.00 (LUMP SUM)

"Check” Items Amount :5%

Market Value SE

LTA Reimbursement Value 5%

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear front
ofs body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

XING GUOD QIANG (HF 8288 0282)
MMATAL AMSAE-A
Automaotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited roreg o 1550000060 GST Reg he, M2 00016769
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tek {B5) 62¢2 2311 Fax (B5)6e22 3547
Clalms & Hotor Undesweiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #1E-01 City House Singapore 058077

Tel |65] 6507 3848 Fax |65} 6507 3840
www . msfirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

13-06-2019 Our Ref No. D12003855MFSH
12-06-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCT116T Third Party Vehicle. SLG8769J

2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
ZI TING

68420051/ 0 Fax No. 67410510

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA
MNA

Fax No. 684163158

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE

LTD Attention. MNIL
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAQ

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required

R




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2015 9:30 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1, SLG 8769)
Attachments: SLG 8769) PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 8769]
Date of survey: 14/6/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 11:52 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai lie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1, SLG 8769)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLG 8769 on 14/6/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkavto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 10:29 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai lie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: CWS5 Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 5:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai lie

<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

P5: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
X WWW.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 11:52 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Henry Kao Caj lie; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1, SLG 8769/
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLG 8769] on 14/6/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 10:29 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims
Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 5:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CW5S Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003855MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. A"G. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WA AVE.COm



PHQRAT

> Back to OneMotoring

PARFITOF Rahata Fambing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type;
Owner |D:

Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Company
7200G

SLG8769)

No

17 Jun 2019

TOYQTA

COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
Grey

2016

1ZRY332131
MRO53REH104558000
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$16,800.00

17 Oct 2016

17 Oct 2016

2

$16,800.00

Yes
16 Oct 2026
$12,600.00

16 Oct 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$50,000.00

$36,645.00

$49,245.00

The information contained herein is correct asat 17 Jun 2019

hitps:tvr. lta.go vasgilanriiacianvenguiresenatesy-ubics elorellereqinputyF LUNL | IUN_IL=FUS080ug | |



@:51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kkl Bukit AutoHuh
2 keaki Bukit Ave 2

#1117 51-18 “Heavy Vehicle =01-08 / Spray Painting =02-27

Singapore 317921 Tel Mo ¢

E-Mal : sales@nil.com.sz

W] B AS(
TG ] O0ERC

Company Reg. No
GST Registration No

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD

~H5 HE42.005]1 Fax Mo

LS AT 0510

18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 573960

Contact : 66530005 91382702

Ih]J(I"I Aula __anﬁ;;l[agtg hence notify
e Repairer of the following:

«To Fesurvey befora/afiey spray cai;&q

* 1o desplay damaged Panis) curmg res

* Parts prices ara Subject In ronrkmaﬁanm

* Third party survey isona

d “Without Projudics” hasi
: No egal madification(s) is aiowsd Save
iu'pmmﬂ' temys) must be rEsurveyed
Subject 10 final 3p0roval rom Ingurance o
Acknowiedged by Repaier
Signature;
Data:
ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM13300
Date in: 12/06/2019
Vehicle Mum. : SLGET769]
Model ; TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVI

Chassis/Eng# : MROSIREHI04558000/1ZRY 332131

Deseription of part

i

FRONT RH DOOR

Parts and Labour Assesment

FRONT RH DOOR BLACK TAPE / ,r‘/(

FRONT RH DOOR FRAME GARNISH

FRONT RH DOOR HANDLE INNER BRACKET x ”N |

@ -~ s

FRONT RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE

w -~ i

FRONT RH DOOR GLASS OUTER CHROME MOULDING ./ G-/r 1

FRONT RH DCOR SIDE MIRROR. ASSY / a\j 3

FRONT BH DOOR 51DE MIRROR COVER

FRONT RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP K

b

FRONT RH DOOR WINDOW GLass B 7 g"fz‘

FRONT RH FENDER SIDE GARNISH X NN

L IS8

REAR RH DOOR-BLACK TAPE

REAR RH DOOR

7

REAR RH DOOR FRAME GARNISH m £ ! .

REAR RH DOOR GLASS OUTER CHROME MOULDING K

REAR RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE x

REAR RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP

REAR RHFENDER N/ ﬂlﬁ?h‘('

Oty Unit Price Amount
I LTS G 1075 Al /
I 7.0 TE00
;“ﬁ LA L (g /
F31.80 131.80 /
125,000 125.04)
1 13500 ‘6{_} 1/4 /
l 1157.60 [.I587.60
SA_}A/ ! 62,50 62,50
1 182,10 18210
I 4G5, 10 Cf-’fLﬂ? .NP'A-'J /
| 25,00 25 .04
| 121170 [(@ ‘QA.:M/
| TA.00 5000 /
| Qg (k) S0 /
I 13150 |31 80
an I 4140 14140
| 191,70 191 70
| 977.70 o770

page 1



+ ¢¥-37 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

ks Bkt AutaHub

2 kaki Bukit Ave 2

==17 7 #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #)1-08 / Sprav Painting 20227
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : =63 6842 0051 Fax No. . ~65 6741 0511
E-Muail : salesand Loom sz

Company Beg. No, - 20061 6380

GST Registeation Mo, 0 2006160380

[ K

GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
18 SIN MING LANE =01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 373960

Contact ; 66530005 91382702

(Lotel (62}
Wkt You 58
¢ 252
%? % 4762254
2605 0 Hoe

f}({}a

CDaS

ESTIMATE

Repair Code ; CLM13300
Datein: [2/06/2019
Vehicle Num. ; SLGE769]

Chassis/Eng# ;

Model ; TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT

MROSIREHIO4558000/1ZRY 332131

REAR TAILLAMP RH / gd’(_

Percentage discount :23%
REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS RH - SET >( N M
Percentage discount (%%

LABOUR

To remove, reinstall electrical wiring harness, check lighting, snd rewire for parking sensor,

To remove, change window glass,

To transfer door glass, regulator gear, motor, railing, channel. rim board. mechanism lock and handle.
To re-spray painting on the change bodyparts, repair portion, and where consistent to the accident

To provide labour, workmanship to change the above damaged bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re-

align hody structure, body alignments and damaged consistent to the aceident

To-apply anti-rust.chemical on reparred and replaced panel.

1 107 G0 391 90
Suhtotal before discount 6,.589.90)
172248

Sub-toral 1 516743

1 2500 25000

Subtoral before discount 2500
TN

Sub-toral 2 B 2300

Parts-total 5,192.43

%0 o

[l-ﬂ ( U]

140600

/250 | AN N
Lﬁﬂo £ TH)
Y4

X L2004
Labour Total {qf Sﬂu 2,000.00
Parts & Labour Total T.A92.43

*** This is a computer-generated document which Tequires T signature =¥

page 2

7
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19980T188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref 1 CS/FCH9010550/Gvd3n2

Date : 18-09-201%

[REIRAILIN

Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 71187 Veh. Inspected SLG 87649
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19003855MF SH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAO Assign Date 13/06/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 15986
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MROS3REH 104558000 Colour BLUE
Odometer 137739 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 HABILEAD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R16 HABILEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QVS BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/06/2019 Inspection Date 14/06/2019
Survey held at  N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PL
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-17 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTIOMN WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CHN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 8769J
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ysiTite {;']} t:ll
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT RH DOOR BUCKLED 1,079.60 1,079.60
1|FRONT RH DOOR BLACK TAPE NECESSARY 75.00 75.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR FRAME GARNISH SCRATCHED 99.00 99,00
1|FRONT RH DOOR GLASS OUTER CHROME MOULDING  |CUT 131.80 131.80
1|FRONT RH DOOR HANDLE INNER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 128.00 :
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE SCRATCHED 138.00 60.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY DISTORTED 1,187.60 1,187.60
1|FRONT RH DOOR SIDE MIRROR COVER NOT NECESSARY 62.50 .
1|FRONT RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP NOT NECESSARY 182.10 2
1|FRONT RH DOOR WINDOW GLASS SCRATCHED 498.10 414.90
1|FRONT RH FENDER SIDE GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 88.00 -
1|REAR RH DOOR BUCKLED 1,211.70 1,068.20
1|REAR RH DOOR BLACK TAPE NECESSARY 75.00 75.00
1|REAR RH DOOR FRAME GARNISH SCRATCHED 99.00 99.00
1|REAR RH DOOR GLASS DUTER CHROME MOULDING ~ |[NOT NECESSARY 131.80 .
1|REAR RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 141.40 :
1|REAR RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP NOT NECESSARY 191.70 -
1|REAR RH FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 977.70 :
LABOUR
1|REAR TAILLAMP RH SCRATCHED 391.90 391.90
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 1,722.48 -1,170.75
5,167.42 3,512.25
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 25.00 ;
25.00 E
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REINSTALL ELECTRICAL WIRING 80.00 30.00
HARNESS, CHECK LIGHTING AND REWIRE FOR PARKING
SENSOR.
TO TRANSFER DOOR GLASS,REGULATOR 140.00 120.00
GEAR,MOTOR,RAILING,CHANNEL, TRIM
BOARD,MECHANISM LOCK AND HANDLE. )

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19010550/Gvd3n2




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
A BRE = 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:2 of 2

<o Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()

TO REMOVE CHANGE WNDOW GLASS. ) 60.00 -

TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE CHANGE 1,000.00 70000
BODYPARTS,REPAIR PORTION, AND WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT

TO PROVIDE LABOUR WORKMANSHIP TO CHANGE THE 600.00 400.00
ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS REPAIR,RE-CONSTRUCT
AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE,BODY ALIGNMENTS
AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR RH

FENDER.
TO APPLY ANTI-RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 120.00 s
REPLACED PANEL.
2.000.00 1,250.00
GRAND TOTAL T,192.42 4762.25
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19010550/Gvd3n2

XING GUD QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A.M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and benefit of the Cliont namad an tha front page of this Repoet,

AL HEH LW P L O e [1 Caniact i SCCopiod (o any tharg Dot O may renly enihe Report whctly of i odarl. An hird party acting o pplving oI




