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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 27-05-2018 Our Ref No. D18003448MFSH
Accident Date 17-05-2010 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHD4709Y Third Party Vehicle. SMKG484K
Survey Location 160 SIN MING DRIVE #06-02 SIN MING AUTOCITY
Comtact Person. CASSANDRA CHUA
Contact No. 62628080/ 86865188 Fax No. 62508015
Suriav T WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. COR (SJE, OFFER LIAB, AT 50% &

¥ ivee QUANTUM TO BE AGREED). ARRANGE PRI ON TUE

Sppointag LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

MBM WHEELPOWER
Cc : Workshop PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor nA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SERENE
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submil the survay repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is s-computer generated letter, no signature required




Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 10:56 AM

To: CWS Maotor Claims; assignments

Cc Sérene Ler

Subject RE: PRI: SLIRVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003446MFESH/N
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer TP owner already withdraw claim.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Hes) Regards;

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | emalil: celinefongét[klkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubk Avenue 1, woz-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmetorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 6:33 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Serargler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15003446MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Wa refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

WIS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel: 6507 3848

Fex : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



