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EV/ERD CEAN AIITN CERVINE
e W eI Y i W AN, | W Dl A W
BLK 30224 UBI ROAD 1 #01-49

SINGAPORE 408716

Tel No. - 67437111 Fax No. : 67489611

E-Mai| -

eversenautotfisimgnet.
Buss Reg No. ' B24044500/K

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LIMITED
5 TEMASEK BOLNLEVARD #0401
SUNTEC TOWER 5

com.sg

T -
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Nivitha !LKI{ Auto)

From: Mei Kwan [LkKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.caom>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 6:37 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: accident involving with your insured policy holder.
Attachments: AMENDED GIA REPORT _ 5KS 7754 G.PDF

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 5:04 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: accident involving with your insured policy holder.

Dear LKK,

Please survey vehicle, thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Phoebe Jay Xie

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985
PID.: +65 68299191

phoebe.xie({@ergo.com.sg

From: EversenAuto [mailto:eversenauto@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 12:01 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: accident involving with your insured policy holder.

Dear Sir Mdm
Please be informed accident involving with your insured policy vehicle.

Your insured vehicle regno : XD 3942 G driven by mr ONG AH LENG

Qur clients vehicle : SKS7754 G
Date and time : 30/05/2019 08.40 hrs
Location + along serangoon road

Attached SAS reports and our estimated repair bill for your kind attention.

Kind arrange your representative to inspect our damaged vehicle at below mentioned address.

Thank you & best regards
TanTS
EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE

BLK 3022A, UBI ROAD 1, #01-48
5INGAPORE 408716

026w 131619

vN1
Peor® Mr Ten



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Monday, 19 August 2019 12:18 PM
'EVERSENAUTO@SINGNET.COM. 5G

RE: accident involving with your insured palicy holder. *** LKK REF:
CC4/EGI19010530/Aea3

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guldeline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your

client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate

settiement.

Thank You.

Best Regords

Asher Sng | Cose Hondlse
LEK Auto Comultanh Ple Lid

phone: 6841-8031 | emoil gibanng@kkoUto com | fox 6741-4108

Blk 21, Poya U Ingdutirial Park, Utd Avenyue | 802-25 | S{408%33)

From: EversenAuto ilto:

2 in LCOMm.

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 12:01 PM
To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: accident involving with your insured policy holder,

Dear Sir Mdm

Please be informed accident involving with your insured policy vehicle.

Your insured vehicle regno

Our clients vehicle

XD 3942 G driven by mr ONG AH LENG

SK5 7754 G



Date and time : 30/05/2019 08.40 hrs
Location : along serangoon road
Attached SAS reports and our estimated repair bill for your kind attention.
Kind arrange your representative to inspect our damaged vehicle at below mentioned address.
Thank you & best regards
TanT$s
EVER SEX AUTO SERVICE
BLK 3022A, UBI ROAD 1, #D1-49

SINGAPORE 408716
TEL: 6743 7111 FAX: 6748 9611

EMAIL: eversenauto@singnet.com.sg



EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE

BLK 3022A, UBI ROAD 1 #01-49 SINGAPORE 408716
TEL: 6743 7111 FAX : 6748 9611 Emall: stellaeversen@gmail.com
Reg No : 24044500K

ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

ERGOD Insurance Pte Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard #04-01 Suntex Tower 5
Singapore 038585

Dear: Sir/madam
Accident invoving vehicle no SKS7754G & XD3942G @ 08:40 hrs 30/05/2019 along serangoon road

we understand that you are the Insurrer of vehicle XD3942 G
we wish to inform you that our vehicle 5KS 77546 have completed repair to my satisfaction

se claims f our as follows:
1 Cost of repairs $4,600.00
2 loss of use 7days xS60.00 $420.00
3 Search fee 52.00
total 55,032.00

kindly let us have payment asap.

Yours sinceraly,

Thank you.



Asher Er.'.ﬂ {LKKAHE}

— — —— ————
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent Maonday, 19 August 2019 1217 PM
To: NCEMFG@GMAILCOM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 3942G AND SKS 7754G ON 30/05/2019

Our Rel: CC4/EGI19010530/Aca3
19 AUG 2019

NCK MANUFACTURING

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 3942G AND SKS 7754G ON 30/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed 1o
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third
Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and
your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @lkkauto.com

o.c. ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD
{Mator Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

llllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllll

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

DEAR SIRS,

--------------------------------------

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

This letter is to authorise EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE to handle all
matter pertaining to the above accident and all correspondence
to be mailed direct to them. They are also authorised to sign all

required documents on my behalf

This letter further authorised you to direct all payment made

payable to my repairer : EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE

Yours fai

P S, 1. N
Signature

U BoON (i
NTI%I ST e

llllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllll

Name / NRIC



EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE

BLK 3022A UBI ROAD 1 #01-49
SINGAPORE 408716

Tel No. : 67437111 Fax No. ; 67489611
E-Mail : eversenauto@singnel.com.sg
Buss. Reg. No. : B24044500/K

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LIMITED ' ir Bill *
T EAASER BOCL LR } Final Repair Bill : T119/013
SUNTEC TOWER 5 Dale - 30/08/2015
SINGAPORE 038985 Vehicle Num. : SKS 7754 G
: _ Make/Modal : TOYOTA ALTIS
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# - MROS3 REH 104532285
Contact ' 8208199 Fax No. : BB250247/68280248 Acciden! Date ! 30052018
Claim No. -
Reference
Policy No. :
Amourt 5§
LUMPSUMP REPAIR /PAIINTING ALL IN 4,600.00
EingDollars | Four Thousand Six Hundrad Cnly
Total S§ : 4,600.00
f-a-% 4 @ = v v = v 4

-~

EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE



Invoice

GENERAL

INSURANCE
ASSOCLATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©° redistration No: M400017735

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am lo Spm

TAX INVOICE
Our Raf Nox: GR-19-088467
Date of Request: 040652019 Your Ref No; Onling Purchase
Ever Sen Auto Service
Blk 30224, Ubi Road 1
#01-48
Singapore 408716
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 0410672019
Enquiry By Tan Thiam Sang
TP Vehicla No. AD3842G
Accident Dale 30/052018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Officlal use:
Data:
[X] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Cheque



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& RaMes Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Frone 265 6224 0010 Fax. a2 254 0030
ASSOCIATION Operafing Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm
istrati 4
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°' Registration No: M400017735

GENERAL

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-088457
Date of Request: 04/06/2019 Your Rel No: Onling Purchase
Ever Sen Aulo Service
Blk 3022A, Ubl Road 1
#01-49
Singapore 408718
Dear SifMadam,
Enquiry Dats O4/08/2018
Enquiry By Tan Thiam Sang
TP Vehicle No. XD3s42G
Accident Data 3052019
Enguiry Result
TP Vehicle No. Insurer Perlod of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
XD3ID42G ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid, 12012019-0307/2019 6320 9180
Thank You.

The images provided fo you are taken from the onginal reports fofwarded to the centre by the membars of the General Ingurance
Aseociation of Singapare and we take na responsibility for thelr accuracy or canients and shall be undsr ng liability whatscaver for any
loss or damage arising out of or In connection with the reports or their Images

This is a computer genaraled document and requires no signature.




FITLZ s

Company Registration Na. 19980T188R

21 UBIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAORE 408933 TEL : () 62563501 FAX @ (105} 62564315

To : M/is ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Date: 14/10/2019

IRD PAR RE M
. XD 3842G (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No.:
Vehicle No. — —— -
SKS 7754G (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: ::c&:l_sﬂ_lm_nlqsaw.neaaqa
Date of Accident 30/5/2019
Liability 100% B
Final Repair i‘._:_ust ; 5 _ 4?[_}0_(1(}
Loss of Use '3 420.00 7 days
Rental (i any) s days -
Others: - 2.00 - o
- B o
5,022.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 5,022.00

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE

R

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i 8V 51 Ubil Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9507188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabilla

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CC4/EGI18010530/Aealg2
o0y SNTEC TOWER: T
#04-05 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 14-10-2018
SINGAFORE 038985
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XD 3542G Veh. Inspected SKS 77546
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From PHOEBE Assign Date 120082019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS s'c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. MROSIREH 104531010 Colour SILVER
Odometer 38372 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/55 R18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R18 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R1& DUNLOP B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 DUNLOP & mm
4 Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/05/2018 Inspection Date 14/06/2019
Survey held at EVER SEN AUTO SERVICE
BLK 30224 UBI ROAD 1
#01-40
SINGAPORE 408716
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E5TI|MATEE} NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL 6256 3561 FAX: B258 4315

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg No: 108607168R GST Reg No. 19-6607188-R Page No 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKS 7754G
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
oy Pt Workshop ($))] _(5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET DENTED 1.221.00 1,221.00
2]|BONNET HINGE @$105.00 NOT NECESSARY 210.00
1|FENDER -FRONT -RH BUCKLED T57.00 485,00
1IHEAD LAMP ASSY - RH CRACKED 2.985.00 2.795.00
1|BUMPER DEFORMED T78.00 T778.00
1|BUMPER RETAINER NECESSARY T8.00 78.00
11SPLASH SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 135.00 -
10JCLIPS @5%12.23 MNOT NECESSARY 122 .30 -
1|SHOCK ABSORBER -FRONT NOT NECESSARY 1.023.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1.827.33 -1.339.25
5481 .67 4017.75
1|WHEEL RIM [SN) cuT B80.00 450.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -170.00 -
510.00 450.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 250.00
250.00
LABOUR
ACCIDENT REPAIR PANEL BEATING. 1.200.00 600,00
RESPRAY PAINT WORK ONM REPAIR AREA. SB0.00 600.00
CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 80.00
UC.UNDER CARRIAGE REPAIR & REPLACE. NOT NECESSARY 220,00
2 550.00 1,280.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,791.97 5. T47.75

Report Ref No. CC4/EGI18010530/Aeadq2




I 74 74

. .;g

'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/EGI18010530/Aealqg2

Page No.2 of 2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTEAMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Repar ls mads solaly for the wes and benafit of the Clan named an i front page of this Report
Mo lebiity of respanaibilily WOALEOEYEL 0




