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- n P L Company Registration Mo VERIOT 1R

ST AYVE 1228 PAVA LBEISTHUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 48833 TEL : (065) 62361561 FAN (S 625641]3

Your ref’ To Be Advised
Owur ref: CCA/EQY010506/Megb3 Dane: 30,07.2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sir/Mudam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. FBE231L
We refer 1o the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 12.06.2019

at the premises of M/s _Sg 98 Motor Pte Ltd _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 4,905 .50

Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 2.600.00

"Check” Items Amount - 5% -

Market Value : 5% .

LTA Reimbursement Value - 5% -

Neit Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: r———

The vehicle sustained damages at the e (f ] o

N/S Front Portion & N/S Body & N/S Rear portion e ———
s

Comments/Present Status:

Darnages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: -+ days

Yours faithlully,

ANG BRYAN TANI

Licensed Appraiser



SG 98 VIOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 569822

Date. 14 June 2019

To LKK

Attn ©  Bryan Ang

Tel: 97237799

VEHICLE NO FBF 231U

ACCIDENT DATE: 8 June 2019

Description

Visor Cwk | by Kan

Front Cowling by Kaa
Head Lamp Assy Jededohs o
Mirror By e

Handle Bar LH 4

Front LH Signal brokew.
Biltom Grip LH ds4wssh

Fork Tube slistedrh

Clutch Lever Cuad

Front LH Fairing Cud

Top Cover LH beles-a

Head Lamp Switch Cuw4
Seal - Rider MM

Rear LH Pillion Footrest ¢ w4
Rear LH Tail Cover o
Pillion Grip l'q;n-h |8

Inner Cowling LH ™l

Rim Repair/Repress plgy el )

Lamp Stay (4
Rear Side Fairing LH pg ka

224002
241,00

Yamaha YZF-R15

Sub—l’l'uml
Less{10%

SubT’ulaI

Tel: 6452 4808 Fax: 6452 4858
Email: sg_motor_enterprisefyahoo.com.sg

By Fax: 6256-4315

Quotation $

230.00 —
32500
450.00 «—
240.00 —
125.00
95.00
85.00 —
480.00 —
95.00
180.00 —
125.00 L~
180.00 o —
135.00 X
125.00 «—
195,00 »
85.00 X
230.00 X

_9080 3o|-
230.00 L~
245.00 «—

3.845.00
394.50
3,550.50



. . Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Wei Yin <welyintan@eqginsurance.comsg>
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2012 1:39 PM
To: Admin A; assignments@lkkauto.com
Ce: Sg Motor
Subject: FW: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U
Attachments: FBF 231U-PRI.PDF
Dear Sirs,
Please attend.
P Rost
Thank you.
‘l" 1 L,q'b-m}‘ ™
Regards,
Ve iw
- -
an Wei Yin | 2 /
L 1]
| Lt G Trinned
EQ Insurance Company Limited
i | tel 55 6 i vl & Fax &5 ¢
~.‘ A Mermibees of Chtyaiate
fprmalingn medy OF fonfzmed (8 R masage. o ore not Bhe ntended rECpNenT, Negse nofify Phe aeogar mmedlely @nd aeiete all copied ot

From: 5g motor enterprise Giam [mailto:sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2019 1:36 PM

To: 5g Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>; Tan Wei Yin <welyin.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U

Hi all,

pls arrange Lkk to survey the bike no: FBF 231U,
thank you

rose

SG 98 motor Pte Itd
On Wednesday, 12 June 2019, 8:05:46 am GMT+8, Tan We! Yin <weiyin.tan@eainsurance com sg> wrote

Without Prejudice



Save As To Costs

' Dear Sir/Madam,

\We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle

Below Is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have
any objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are

deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please
specify one or more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Lid 2) Automobile Inspection Services
Pte Ltd

Tel: 6255 0808
Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155
Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pre | 4) Priority Services
Ltd

L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Tel: 6281 6690/ 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748

Tel: 62934822

Contedt Bueson: Aunil Grae Contact Person: Sharon

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 67480361

Fax: 6741-4108

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene
7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services Services
Tel: 81825263 Tel: 96623655
Fax: 67461148 Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Kelvin Contact Person: Mr Chee




9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
.| Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822

Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service

Tel : 96684818/90099001

Fax: 64587432

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor
surveyors whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2
working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor
before you return your client's vehicle to him/her

Thank you.
Regards,

Tun Wei Yin
Exccutive | Claims

eqnsurance

EQ Insuranee Company Limited
3 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 0691 10
did 65 GI969882 | tel 65 6223 9433 exi 882 | fax 65 6223 4190

D A Mt o Ctpatan

Privifeged Confidennal mjormarion mey be contcined in this message [f vou are not the imtended reciplent, pigose notify the sender immedictely and delete all copies of

From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000@vahoo.
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2019 5:40 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eaqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U



| Aun Motor Claims Dept

Dear SirlMadam

Piease arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U as per attached.
Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax 84528898



1)

2)

3)

4

SG 98 MOTORPTELTD

Blk 4001 Ang Mo Klo Industrial Park 1
H01-21 Singapore 569622
Office Tel: 6452 4B98 / Fax: 6452 4868
Emall: sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg

Date : 11th June 2019

EQ Insurance Co Ltd

5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 065110

Attn : Matar Claim Dept
Fax : 6224 3903

Dear Sir/Mdm,
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION

Accident between FBF 231U and SMK 4777D accident on 9/06/2019 - 1350 Hrs
Location: Choa Chu Kang Ave 5

We hereby give you NOTICE that we are clalming agalnst your insured motor
Vehicle No : SMK 47770 damages to our client's Motor Vehicle No: FBF 231U

Kindly provide a list of surveyors and thelr respective company name.

Kindly let us know If you wish to conduct a pre-repair inspection only after 11.30am
at Blk 4001 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 Singapore 569622,
(Tel : 6452 4898, HP : 9171 1655

If we do not hear from you within the next two (2) working days, we shall advise our
clients to proceed with their own Iinspectlon and repalrs.

Hope you are able to asslst us on the above matter soonost.

Yours faithfully

)

Rose

5G 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Tel : 6452 4898

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Tel : 6452 4808




Shu Pei (LKKAuto

From: Tan Wel Yin <weiyintan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 2:46 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: EQ REF: DM19HOO01688/WY, Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U
Attachments: SA52625124 PDF

Dear Shu Pei,

Please find OI's SAS and video attached.

https://www dropbox. com/s/zfSc8terSz68av3/Video%20-%20Accident%20%283%29. AVITdl=0

ttps:/fwww

Thks.

Regards,

Tan Wel Yin

Ererutive | Claims

=

EQ Insurance Company Limited

y Manwell Baad B17-00 Toswsr Block MND Comgiles Sengapore 069110

did 5 B4G60RRT | tel &% 6223 a3 gut BAD | fax 65 6223 4190 B

W I INRLEr BCE LT ]

I

PriviegedyConfidentind mformoation moy be contamed in s metsoge. If pou are nat the intended recipient, please nonify the sender immediately ond detefe aff copies af it

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, July 12, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Tan Wei Yin <welyin.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Please arrange PR| on bike FBF 231U

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,



Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto com | fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pej (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 9:31 AM
To: Tan Wei Yin' <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | ermail: shupsi@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Payva Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 2:03 PM

To: 'Tan Wei Yin' <welyin.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com=; assignments

<assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilk com>
Subject: RE: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | emall: assignmentsd®lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
2



Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Tan Wei Yin [mailto:weiyin. tan@eginsurance.com.sgl
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 1:39 PM

To: Admin A -a@lkkauto.com>; assignments@lkk
Cc: 5g Motor < r_enlerprise LCOM.SE>
Subject: FW: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U

Dear Sirs,
Please attend.
Thank you.
Regards,

Tan Wel Yin

Expcutive | Claima

g

EQ Insurance Company Limited

s Mavwipll Roed n17-00 Tower Block MND Comples Singupose 069110
did &5 64969882 | tel 65 6223 9433 avt B82 | fax 65 6223 4190 E
W BO NG NCE DO SR

1 T—

Privileged/Confidentiol information may be contaimed in this message. (f you are nat the infended recipfent. please notify the wender immediately and delete oll copies of it

From: Sg motor enterprise Giam |mailto:sg motor enterpri ahoo.com.
Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2019 1:36 PM
To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@vyahoo.com.sg>; Tan Wel Yin <weiyin.tan m.sg>

Subject: Re: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U

Hi all,

pls arrange Lkk to survey the bike no: FBF 231U,
thank you

rose

SG 98 motor Pte Itd
On Wednesday, 12 June 2019, 8:05:46 am GMT+B, Tan Wel Yin <welyin.lan@eginsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Save As To Cosls
Dear Sir/fMadam,

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please rever within 2 working days if you agree or
have any objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you,
you are deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us.
Alternatively, please specify one or more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services
Pte Lid

Tel: 6255 0808
Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155
Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte | 4 Priority Services

Litd

Tel: 62934822
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283

Fax: 6281 8748
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

Contact Person: Sharon

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361

Fax: 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services Services
Tel: 81825263 Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67461148 Fax: 67635662




Contact Person: Kelvin Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fox: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel ;: 96684818/90009001

Fax: 64587432

If you object 1o all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor
surveyors whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you
within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor
before you return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Thank you.
Regards,

Tan Wei Yin
Executive | Claims

T Ea— =

EQ Insurance Company Limited
S Mazwell Rosd #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 =
did 65 64069882 | el 65 6223 9433 ex1 BEZ | fux 65 6223 4190 jﬂ

WIAaTARCE Doy

5 E—

Frivile ped Confidennind imformanon may be congimed in iy message, [ vou are pot the intended recipient, pleaie nonify the sentle v immadicoely and delete all coples af it




From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg|

Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2019 5:40 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Cc: Sg Motor
Subject: Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231 u

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear SirMadam

Please arrange PRI on bike FBF 231U as per attached.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524858 Fax: 64526838



- Cecilia Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 1:47 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc Sg Motor

Subject: Your Insured: SMK 47770  Our Ref: FBF 231U Accident on 9/6/2019
Dear Cecilia

Confirm acceptance $2680. Please provide DV,

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park |
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Wednesday, 14 August 2019, 03:06:22 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Attached plse find the Final Repair bill and LOA for bike FBF 231U

Thank You

Repards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 201-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park |
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



SG 98 MOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio lndusirial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 585622
Tol: 6462 4968 Fux: G457 4808
Emafl: sg_motor_onterprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 6th Augusl 2018 Invoice No: SG98-PD-19-074

EQ Insurance Co Lid LETTER OF DEMAND
5 Maxwell Road #17-00

Tower Block MND Complex

Singapore 0689110

Your Insured: SMEK 4777D
Date of Accident  9/6/2019

Location: Choa Chu Kang Ave 5

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO.  FBF 231U (Yamaha YZF-R15)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No,; FBF 231U (Lump Sum) $2,600.00
Loss of Use 4Days X $30 $120.00
Total: $2,720.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: TWO THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND TWENTY ONLY
et

1 All cheque paymant should be "Crossed” and made payabio lo 53 98 MOTOR PTE LTD
Z Mmmmw'mﬂn"MMermmuhm
3, Far furthar snquiries on hts involce, ploasa feal free Io contect us

56 98 Motor Pta Ltd
LG



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2019 3:39 PM

To: MUHD HANIFE@GMAILCOM

Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> CC4/EQI19010506/gb3 *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SMK 4777D & FBF 231U ON 09/06/2019 ***

Our Ref: CC4/EQI19010506/gb3

17 JULY 2019

MUHAMMAD HANIF BIN ADBUL MALIK

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 47770 & FBF 231U ON 09/06/2019

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance
policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from FBF 231U,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD pratector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

"Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of lability on our
part ar on the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter|s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made In respect of this present matter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any sattlement arising from this offer in any other related matters,

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further ail original documents shall be retained by us after we have made paymaent
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740-4274 | emall: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

1
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Save the EFarth- Frint only when necessary



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT * «

Pa,mg Prao ﬁl{amg @aretln  (wghe third party claimant”)

I,
C 6o ¥)
of Ble16T1 thoa Uau [Camnp North X &, pvl-115 (address),
S , E .
owner of &~ 231y (vehicle no,) hereby authoriZé

Sk 8 mutve Pl (et

(“the workshop”) to act for ma with respect to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of usa ("claim") for my
C@FI3L U that was damaged pursuant to the
accident which occurred on 4[6(1A (date) along Chroe C‘*—M

Conmg 82 § — (Location)
Eﬂ¢k.H+ﬂiP

vehicle no.

involving vehicle no/s

(“the aci:idunt“] .

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
glaim in a manner that they deem, f£it and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim

with payment chegue/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/idsurers of the

other vehicle/s ls concerned.

Dated this (\ day of J'-LM {month) 20 Iﬂ {yeax)

y | Y7

Signed by “the workshop”

Signed by “the third party claimant®



SG 98 VIOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 568622
Tel: 6452 4898 Fax: 6452 4568
Emall: sg_motor_enterprisef@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 6 August 2019 Invoice No: SG98-PD-19-074

EQ Insurance Co Lid PD - Direct Settlement
5 Maxwell Road #17-00

Tower Block MND Complax

Singapore 069110

Your Insured: SMK 4777D
Date of Accldent:  9/&/2019

Location: Choa Chu Kang Ave 5

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO.  FBF 231U (Yamaha YZF - R15)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FBF 231U (Lump Sum) $2,600.00
Total: $2,600.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: TWO THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED ONLY
Moo

1. All ehegue payment should be “Crossed” and made payable to SG 99 MOTOR PTELTD
2. All chaque should have our "involoe No" wrilten on the reverse side of the chague
3. Far funthar enguirios an |his involce, pleasa foel frea to cantact us

r

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
LG




Company Registration No. 189807 158R

SHUMEAVE 1, #0225 PAYA LB INDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408930 TEL : (0651 62503561 FAX @ (0451 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 28/08/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicle N SMK 4777D (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM1SHOD1688/WY
Sereiion FBF 231U (TP Veh) |OurRef. No.: CCA/EQI19010506/Dgb3a2

Date of Accident 8/6/2019
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost 13 2,600.00 -
Loss of Use - 80.00 4 days
Rental (If any) - _S days B
Others: %

' $

2,680.00

Final Settlement Sum |[: § 2.680.00
Remarks
Payment In i 's Breakdown

1) |SG 88 MOTOR PTE LTD

9 2,680.00

JOAMNMNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

¥y LI7L

‘-H; ;; : &1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL B256 1561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R
ANlliated to Fedoration Internationale Dos Exparts En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CC4/EQI18010506/Dgb3qg2
Yo By T
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Dale: 28-08-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMK 47770 Veh. Inspected FBF 231U
Policy No. DMPPHO19-002676 Coverage ($) 0.00
Cilaim No. DM18HDD188BMWY Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  WEIYIN Assign Date 12/06/2019
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YAMAHA YZF-R15 c.c 150
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. ME138B01XA2019370 Colour BLACK
Odometer 61199 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |100/80 R17 BRIDGESTONE 2 mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |100/80 R17 BRIDGESTONE 2 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT & N/S REAR PORTION AND N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/06/2010 Inspection Date 12/068/201%
Survey held at SG 98 MOTOR PTELTD
BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1
#01-21 SINGAPORE 569622
Sa, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 160607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No-10f 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, FBF 231U
- -y 'Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition wmhp%, "ﬁj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1IVISOR CUT / BROKEN 230.00 230.00
1|FRONT COWLING BROKEN 325.00 325.00
1|LH HEAD LAMP ASSY SCRATCHED 450,00 450.00
2|LH MIRROR BROKEN 240,00 240.00
1|HANDLE BAR LH BENT 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT LH SIGMNAL BROKEN 95.00 85.00
1|HANMDLE BAR GRIP LH DEFORMED B5.00 B5.00
1|FORK TUBE DISTORTED 480.00 480,00
1|CLUTCH LEVER cuT 95.00 85.00
1|FRONT LH FAIRING GuT 180.00 180.00
1|TOP COVER LH BROKEN 125.00 125.00
1|HEAD LAMP SWITCH cuT 180.00 180.00
1|SEAT -RIDER NOT NECESSARY 135.00 -
1|REAR LH PILLION FOOTREST cuT 125.00 125.00
1|REAR LH TAIL COVER NOT NECESSARY 185.00
1|PILLION GRIP REPEATED B85.00
1|INNER COWLING LH NOT MECESSARY 230.00 -
1|RIM REPAIR /REPRESS NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|LAMP STAY BENT 230.00 230,00
1|REAR SIDE FAIRING LH BROKEN 245,00 245.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -364 .50 -324.00
3,550.50 2.816.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|METER ASSY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 650.00 :
B65.00 15.00
LABOUR
TOWING FEE. 40.00 30.00
LABOUR TO REMCVE & REPLACE NECESSARY 280.00 150.00

PARTS ALIGN & ETC.

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18010506/Dgb3q2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

57 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL 6258 3661 FAX: B256 4315

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Reg No: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No.:2 of 2
Al 5. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty ‘Description of Parts Condition Workshop (8)) ()

REMOVE & REPLACE FORK TUBE & TOP UP FORK OIL 120.00 80.00
PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINT WHERE NECESSARY 250.00 120.00
690.00 380.00

GRAND TOTAL 4,805.50 3,311.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,600.00

ANG BRYAN TANI

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI19010506/Dgb3q2

Automotive Assessor [ Investigator

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- Theas Report is made sainiy fer the use s benefll of the Clieni named on the frent pege of e Repond
o litility of raspormibillty whatseuver, [n contact of tart, |s sccapted 16 any (nird pacty sha may testy.an the Repart whaily ot o sar. Any Ihird party scting ar repleing s this
Aepart. in whole arin e doss xo.ad his oc her gwn sk



Joanne Lee (LKK Auto!

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 10:22 AM

To: ‘egiprs@eqginsurance.com.sg’

Ce: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlerment - Accident Involving SMK 4777D (OI) and FBF 231U (TP) on
09/06/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT.pdf

Denr Sir'Madam,
I"lease be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.

Linclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: report@lkkauto com
BIk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



