Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 1:.07 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLX7962) against SMG9594C on 03/06/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG19010447/Aha3

Attachments: 3rd party pic.jpg

Hi Vic,

Noted. Attached is the picture of the vehicle at the accident scene.
Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

On Thu, Aug 1, 2019 at 12:12 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Suhaimi,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we received the LOD.

However, we are still pending for our Insured to lodge the GIA report.

We will continue to follow up and will get back to you for an update.



Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

W Save the Earth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 9:10 AM

To: Ace Auto Solution; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLX7962J against SMG9594C on 03/06/2019 *** LLKK REF:
CC6/AIG19010447/Aha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -



LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/AIG19010447/Aha3 Vic - 6841 2096

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution @ gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 8:46 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLX7962]J against SMG9594C on 03/06/2019

Hi,

My mistake. I have not passed the documents to Adrian yet. Nevertheless, can i have the OIC for this
accident case.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.
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On Wed, Jul 31, 2019 at 8:43 AM Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi,

Can 1 know who the OIC is for this accident case? I would like to check if all documents such as my LOD
and invoices that i've passed to Adrian on 26/07/2019 has reached the OIC.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.



