Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 1:02 PM

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)’; assignments
Cc: Admin A; phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBL9895M & SLR2694Y on 30/05/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) [mailto:claims@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 4:33 PM

To: Admin A (admin-a@Ikkauto.com) <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR (sur@Ilkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Accident Involving FBL9895M & SLR2694Y on 30/05/2019

Hi,

Please survey vehicle for direct settlement.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Phoebe Jay Xie
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.: +65 68299191

phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June, 2019 3:23 PM

To: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: FW: Accident Involving FBL9895M & SLR2694Y on 30/05/2019

Dear Sir,

We acknowledged receipt of your email for the PRS request as below.



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016”, do select an assessor from the list
below.

1 AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 PS Priority Services

8 VAC  Vicom Ltd

9 AJAX  AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

10 QRM  Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Kindly let us have your reply on the selection of the surveyor.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Phoebe Jay Xie
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.: +65 68299191

phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg

From: Raymond [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June, 2019 12:44 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: Accident Involving FBL9895M & SLR2694Y on 30/05/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,
We attached the third party claim file for your perusal.
Appreciate for you to arrange for the pre-repair survey.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
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