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Celi:;e Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:19 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Caymen

Subject: Survey assignment - Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS
Attachments: XE766M 22.05.2019.pdf

Dear Bryan,

Please assist to survey the Insured vehicle, XE766M to ascertain the cause of damage. Attached the repair
estimate for your reference.

You may contact Caymen of Tan Lim Motor (copied-in) @ 68585151 for the necessary arrangement.

Hi Caymen,

We have appointed Bryan from LKK for the survey. Pls assist.

Best Regards,

Karew Tan

Motor Claims Dept.
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax No. :

6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Hemoer of m INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"};
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for detalls of
PDPA Persanal Data Collection Statement.

Caonfidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail



Celine Fonc-; (LKKAuto)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 10:34 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Urgent advice! Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS
Attachments: CIMG3605.JPG; CIMG3606.JPG; CIMG3607.JPG; CIMG3609.JPG; CIMG3611.JPG

Dear Bryan,

Can you assist to verify what could be the possible cause of the windscreen damage based on the
photographs attached.

The damage occurred when the vehicle was parked.

Hope to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,

Karéw Taw

Motor Claims Dept.
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax No. :

6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Hemer of m INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of
PDPA Parsonal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mall is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. if you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediatealy by return e-mail



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

— =
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:29 AM
To: caymen@timotor.com.sg
Subject: RE: VEHICLE XE 766M
Dear Caymen,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle XE 766M (Excess $100/-) as windscreen
claim.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 11:29 AM
To: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: VEHICLE XE 766M

Dear Caymen,

Any updates of above vehicle as we need update it to insurance company.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 3:58 PM
To: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Subject: VEHICLE XE 766M

Dear Caymen,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Refer to the tele-conversation between you and our colleague, Bryan.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

= =
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:29 AM
To: Karen Tan
Cc assignments; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS
Dear Karen

We have just provided Tan Lim Motor with authorization to repair under windscreen claim.
Once repair is completed and verified by my surveyor, we will submit our report to your good office.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S$(408933)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 5:05 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS

Dear Bryan,
Thank you for the info.

I have checked and note that the Policy is extended to cover the cost of reinstating any glass in the
windscreen or in the windows provided there is no further damage to the motor vehicle up to the
limit of $1,500.00.

In view thereof, the excess of $100.00 is applicable for this accident.
Please proceed to inform the workshop to authorise repair.

You may submit your report and bill.

Best Regards,

Karew Taw

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax
No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for detalls
of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.



Shiau Chan_'(l.KKAuto)

— e —— e i
From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 5:05 PM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Cc: assignments; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS
Dear Bryan,
Thank you for the info.

I have checked and note that the Policy is extended to cover the cost of reinstating any glass in the
windscreen or in the windows provided there is no further damage to the motor vehicle up to the
limit of $1,500.00.

In view thereof, the excess of $100.00 is applicable for this accident.
Please proceed to inform the workshop to authorise repair.

You may submit your report and bill.

Best Regards,

Karew Taw

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax
No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Hember of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details
of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy,
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mall.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June, 2019 6:10 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS

Dear Karen
No other damage to the insured vehicle. We have inform Tan Lim that base on the report, this case should be park
and found damage and under OD claim. Tan Lim have inform insured pending their decision. Once we have further

information, my side will inform you.

Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

On 18 Jun 2019, at 17:48, Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:




Dear Bryan,
We refer to the captioned matter.

Please confirm was there any other damage to the Insured vehicle other than the
windscreen? Hope to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,

Karéw Taw

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507
3582 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

<image001.jpg>

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential, It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended,
you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all
copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 June, 2019 3:01 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Survey assignment - Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF:
D19003646MCVS

Dear Assignment Team
Please assign surveyor. Vehicle at Tan Lim Motor.
Please check on the consistency of the front windscreen damage.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:19 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Caymen <caymen @tlmotor.com.sg>
Subject: Survey assignment - Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF:
D19003646MCVS

Dear Bryan,

Please assist to survey the Insured vehicle, XE766M to ascertain the cause of damage.
Attached the repair estimate for your reference.

You may contact Caymen of Tan Lim Motor (copied-in) @ 68585151 for the necessary
arrangement.



Hi Caymen,

We have appointed Bryan from LKK for the survey. Pls assist.

Best Regards,

Karewn Tawn

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507
3582 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

<image001.jpg>

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"}:
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Persanal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it s intended,
you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message In error, please delete the message and all
copies from your system and notify the sender immaediately by return e-mail.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:44 AM

To: Karen Tan; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS
Attachments: CSFCI19010360Uqd3.pdf

Dear Karen,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of XE 766M. (windscreen claim)

Kindly advise whether will create claim in CWS.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:30 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D18003646MCVS

Thanks Bryan!

Best Regards,

Karewn Tawn

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax
No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Hemser of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("POPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details
of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement,

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or 1o whom it is intended, you may not copy,
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 9:29 AM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Windscreen Claim for XE766M on 22.05.2019 - MSFCI REF: D19003646MCVS

Dear Karen
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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19003646MCVS Date: 20 June 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19010360/Uqd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance L.td

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __XE 766M .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/06/2019 at the premises of M/s TAN LIM MOTOR. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$  1.141.00

Revised Estimate Amount : S$ 1.025.00

“Check” Items Amount : S$ 80.00

Market Value : S$ -

LTA Reimbursement Value :S§% -

Nett Value : S$ -

Description of Damage: —

The vehicle sustained damages —

at the front windscreen cracked. = | from
offside

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser
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PARFICNF Rehata Frniiry

Enqu'ire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
1659K

XE766M

No

11 Jun 2019
SCANIA
P400CB8X4MHZ
Multi-Colour
2015

6872613
YS2P8X40005383971
$134,280.00

03 Jul 2015

03 Jul 2015

0

$6,714.00

No

$0.00

02 Jul 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$13,286.00

$8,048.00

$8,048.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 11 Jun 2019

nups:/ivri.ita.gov.sg/lta/vri/actuon/enquireepate sy upiicseroreUeregIinput FEUNG | IUN_IUSFUSUGUUY T |

11
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MOTOR VEHICLE ACCIDENT REPORT FORM
(For Damage To Windscreen Or Vehicle Whilst Parked)

The issue and acceptance of this form is not ar edmission of lability on the pant of the company

THE INSURED
Name LGN Eve\\ Pﬂfﬁihm-.wj J.—h\c-dﬂ H(,,‘,';E‘,i“
vidrese 29 Marrson Rooed #1Q-00  Lion ss,ﬂ-,j Eu_kiug 9'3984§
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Pl'sl-mq T 10 s 9 Detu Sty Shay |

Wan wh..m o hed my gaade 3 faee ny
wiedoeen Clotkeed

A Lo Wik ] S TR | 1

Ve Wit 24 Howsen Tead #oS . S 3EAEU R
TSN 2b o\ 3ci3 SIEY 53>

Ton \7gn W e 144

Iherchy declare that, te the best of my hiwowledge and behisd, the above stmements are fuily und oy made

i

TeradLicrin D1 AA Date 9%/ 0L 0% Hf‘bhq
Signature of Insured (if Company. please stamp and indicate the name of the person signing the form)

I you receive any communications in anyway connected with the sccident. pleuse tarward them to the Company irmediate |y

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY

Sum Ihsured: Add. Cover-a) W § S
Excess: (Section 1) HP _ Agency o o
Premium - NCD RI

-




Policy No
Date of Accident : 22 May 2019

. D-18091327MCVS

Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
36 Robinson Rd #16-01

City House
Singapore 068877

Estimate To Repair XE766M - SCANIA P400CB8X4MHZ

Chassis No : YS2P8X40005383971

‘J'j }

TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539365
Tel : 68585151 ( 24 Hours )  Fax : 68580877

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Date : 11 June 2019

A
Zg/

Total ﬂ/’)/ M‘O ((/ $ 1,141.00
2l /)2 L o

S/No | Quantity Description Amount
LIST ITEMS
01 [1pc front windscreen glass OEM $ Crey 950.00 |—
$ 950.00
Less 10 % $ 95.00
$ 855.00
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES X
02 (1pc front windscreen sealant $ ffﬂ 80.00 |/~
01 To resupply |.U. bracket. $ vi€ 2600|220
02 To remove and refit front windscreen glass $ 180.00 |/ (>
$ 286.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Cs/F Cl1 901 0360!qu392

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

——

Accident Date

Ref :
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date:  08-07-2019 ""I"H"Immm IM
Code : FCI2
Insured Veh Veh. Inspected XE 766M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19003646MCVS Excess ($) 100.00
Assngn From KAREN TAN Assign Date 07/06/2019
~ Vehicle Particulars & Conditior S
Make & Model SCANIA P400 c.c 12742
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. YS2P8X40005383971 Colour WHITE
Odometer 46611 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[315/80 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR 6/6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[315/80 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR 6/6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[315/80 R22.5 (D/D) GOODYEAR 6/6/6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [315/80 R22 5 (DID) GOODYEAR 6/6/6/6 mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT WINDSCREEN CRACKED

DAMAGES SEE DETA]LS

__General |

22!05!2019

||m~ np‘ﬂ

Inspection Date 11!06!2019

Survey held at
Repalrer

1 DEFU LANE 6
TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

A}DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIS :

0.500 Worklng Days

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XE 766M

e D= A — = —r— —— (T

1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS OEM CRACKED 950.00 950.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -95.00 -95.00
855.00 855.00

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
80.00 -

LABOUR

TO RESUPPLY |.U. BRACKET. 26.00 20.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS. 180.00 150.00
206.00 170.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,141.00 1,025.00

(

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

I i i - 1 cepted to any third party who may reply on the Report wholly or in part. Any third par)




