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Shifley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 10 August 2019 3:31 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: SDW 73X / DOA: 07-06-2019

Dear Shirley,

We confirmed our acceptance to your proposed COR at $4850 / 4 working days.
Kindly advise OIC and reference number for our submission of LOD.

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Reporting Centre: 385 Sin Ming Drive #01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre Singapore 575718

On Wed, Jul 24, 2019 at 3:51 PM Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Adelle,

Please confirm L/S § 4,850.00/4 days .

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

= — _— e e e
From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 4:39 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; Albert Hong
Subject: Claim ref:C10003261/AH || Ol- SLA3113R (Brown) TP- SDQ73X || Est:0.00 || Team
Autopro
Attachments: 2D.73.3113.pdf

Hi Team,
We would like to arrange TP Survey for SDQ73X. Please see below email for reference.

Kindly confirm.
Regards,

Ivy
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg

Budget rusted
Direct Avword’
INSUrance . .o

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.s

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.



This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is

_for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

!

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 3:39 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: 2 Days Notice: SDW 73 X (Our Ref) and SLA 3113 R (Your Ref) Dated 7th June 2019

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SDW 73 X (Our Ref) and SLA 3113 R (Your Ref)
Dated 7" June 2019, Time around 06:15

@ Blk 108 Canberra Walk Deck 2A Multi storey carpark

We represent our client; Low Ai Shi, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client’s vehicle
registration number: SDW 73 X and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SLA 3113 R.

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your
reference.

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of Mr Lim - LKK as the SJE for subject claim. Please
let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at least ten

(10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-

Contact Person Alan Koh 9092 7279
Frederick Lim 9674 6635

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
|Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.®

Cheers,

Michelle Lim

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

385 Sin Ming Drive
#01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 575718

Virus-free. www.avag.com




‘This'email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &

- General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
~ reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.
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> Back to OneMotoring

' - Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

PARF/ICOF Rahata Fnnuirv

Singapore NRIC
4106)

SDW73X
No

12 Jun 2019
B.MW.

5231 2.5 AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR GAS/D NAV

White

2011
10407696N52B25AF
WBAFP32050C864591
150.0 kW (201 bhp)
$45,547.00

25 Mar 2011

25 Mar 2011

1

$45,547.00

Yes
24 Mar 2021
$25,050.00

24 Mar 2021

COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $57,002.00
COE Rebate Amount: $10,159.00
Total Rebate Amount: $35,209.00
The information contained herein Is correct as at 12 Jun 2019
OK
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6/12/2019 Used BMW Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
= BMW 5 Series 523i $46,800 $14,990 fyr 07-Mar-2011 2,497 cc 93,000 km Luxury Available
1 Owner,Low Mileage Done Only 93,000Km,100% Loan And Balloon Scheme Avallable,Ex-Bankruptcy And Bad Credit Welcome, High Trade In,

Faster Auto Trading
Posted: 08-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523i, 2011 brmw S23i, BMW 523i, bew 5231, BMW, 523, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i $49,800 $14,530 Jyr 26-Apr-2011 2,497 cc 123,000 km Luxury Available

Come With A Free Comprehensive 120 Points Check Amnd 6 Months Warranty From MBM, Accident Free. Most Wear And Tear Parts Replaced, Low
Bank Interest Rate From 1.99% Only, In House Loan Up To 90% Of Th...

Posted: 08-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523i, 2011 bew 5231, BMW 5231, brmw 5231, BMW, 5231, Usad BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i $54,000 £15,100 fyr 02-Sep-2011 2,497 cc 115,000 km Luxury Available
Full M5 Body Kit, Original Breyton Rims 20" With Warranty Card, Full PZero Tyres, Eisenman Exhaust, Front Brakes 6 Pot, 4 Aprakovic Exhaust Tips,
Blistein Shock Absorbers, New Paint Metallic Grey High... [ raanin 16 |

Monster Motors Pte Ltd
Posted: 07-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523, 2001 bew SZ3i, BMW 523/, brmw 5231, BMW, 523i, Used BMW

ADVERTISING

% StarHub

BMW 5 Series 523i $45,800 $14,800 /yr 21-Jan-2011 2,497 cc 122,000 km Luxury Available

Good Condition. Well Maintained. Flexible & Fast Arrangement For Loan & Insurance. Trade In Are Welcomed! Hurry Call Our Friendly Sales For More
Info Or Visit Us At Our Showroom For Test Drive!

Posted: 07-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 5230, 2011 brwe 5231, BMW 523, brmw 5230, BMW, 5231, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i $53,800 $13,950 fyr 14-Jul-2011 2,497 cc 160,000 km Luxury Avallable
One Of The Best In Its Class, Remarkable Design And Ride Comfort, Smooth And Responsive Engine For Excellent Fuel Efficiency. Pristine Condition,
100% Accident Free With No Repalrs Needed. STA Evaluat... i o §

Euro Performance Asia Pte Lid
Posted: 05-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523i, 2011 bmw 5231, BMW 523, bmw 523i, BMW, 523, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i - N.A 29-Apr-2011 2,497 cc - Luxury SoLp
Car Done Up, No Problems, Buy With Peace Of Mind! Lowest Deprediation Of This Class! Extremely Well Maintained. Servicing Done. Tires Just =
Changed, Comes With Warranty For Engine And Gearbox, Super Co...

Posted: 03-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523i, 2011 bmw 5231, BMW 523i, bmw 523i, BMW, 523, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i Highline I N.A 27-Apr-2011 2,497 cc - Lucury SOLD

Highline PML Model With Low Mileage Yet Lowest Depreciation, Beautiful White With Gray Interior! High Spec With GPS, Auto Tailgate And Parking
Assist, Excellent Condition, Well Maintained, Great Condl...

Posted: 02-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 5230, 2011 brw 523, BMW 5231, bavw 5231, BMW, 5231, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i $46,888 $13,830 /yr 10-May-2011 2,497 cc 123,558 km Luxury Available
Sporty White With 19" Sports Rims. Stock Condition. Well Maintained. Many Parts Had Been Replace With Receipt Proven. Need To Touch Up Paint
Work, High Loan And Trade In Available For Arrangement, Cal,.. fonect omer}

Posted: 01-Jun-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 5230, 2011 brmw 5231, BMW 523i, bmw 5231, BMW, 523/, Used BMW

BMW 5 Series 523i $48,800 $15,700 fyr 31-Mar-2011 2,497 cc . Luxury Available

Posted: 31-May-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 523, 2011 bmw 5231, BMW 523i, brmw 5231, BMW, 523, Used BMW

) ] BMW 5 Series 523i $54,800 $14,580 fyr 30-5ep-2011 2,497 cc 110,000 km Luxury Avallable
Executive Popular Luxury Sedan That Blends Perfectly For Business And Leisure. Immaculate Condition.

Posted: 31-May-2019  Tags: 2011 BMW 5231, 2011 brnw 5231, BMW 5231, bmw 523, BMW, 5231, Used BMW

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MMO=523|&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=2011&MOD=BMW
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(03)Shied (09)Buckied (10)Broken (1 1)iiecesary (12)Missing  (13)Tam MOTOR CAR (Frt) (4)Hot Conisiant (NC)
U Unconfinmed  (15)Nor Waorking . ’ . .
" " Front Portion VehicteNo:  SD [V 73 X
NAC| INC |Item CON|AC|Qty| NAC| INC |Item CON|[AC|Qty
1001 | 991886 |Frt Number Plate 1071 | 992205 |Fuse Box
1002 | 991887 |Frt Number Plate Base . 1072 | 994011 |Relay Box
1003 | 991889 |Fit Number Plate Garnish 1073 | 995053 |Wiper Washer Tank
1004 | 991300 |Frt Bumper T L 1074 | 995052 |Wiper Washer Tank Motor
1005 | 992341 [Fit Bumper Clips NE 1075 | 990159 [Alternator Assy
1006 | 991325 |Frt Bumper Brackel 7 |, 1076 | 990160 |Alternator Belt
1007 | 991462 |Frt Bumper Side Retainer NEE 1077 | 992688 |Power Steering Pump
1008 | 991433 |Frt Bamper Reinforcement 4 1078 | 992669 [Power Steering Belt
1009 | 991318 [Frt Bumper Beam 1079 | 994431 |Power Steering Cooler. Pipe
1010 | 991468 [Frt Bumper Sponge 1080 | 992692 |Power Steering Hose
1011 | 991427 |Frt Bumper Protector 1081 | 990010 [ABS Pump Control Unit
1012 | 991420 [Frt Bumper Pad 1082 | 990427 |Brake Master Pump Assy
1013 991363 |Frt Bumper Grille 11083 | 990403 |Brake Booster Pump Assy
1014 | 991301 |Frt Bumper Moulding 1084 | 991005 Engine Top Cover
1015 | 991407 |Frt Bumper Lower Spoiler 1085 | 991011 |Engine Under Cover
1016 | 991438 [Frt Bumper Sensor eyt |1 1086 |.990946 |Engine Mounting
1017 ) 995100 |Frt LH Bumper Fog Lamp Cover ' 1087 | 990949 |Engine-Mounting Frt
1018 | 991355 |Frt RH Bumper Fog Lamp Cover 5 1088 |. 990950 |Engine Mounting LH
1019 | 995079 |Frt LH Bumper Fog Lamp 1089 | 990952 |Engine Mounting RH . '
1020 | 995080 | Frt RH Bumper Fog Lamp 1090-| 990951 |Engine Mounting Rear
1021 | 991793 |Frt Grille 1091°| 992234 |Gear Box Mounting -
1022 | 991328 [Frt Grille Emblem 1092 | 991520 |Ft LH Chassis Member
1023 | 991799 |Frt Grille Chrome Moulding 1093.] 991520 |Frt RH Chassis-Member
1024 | 991222 |Frt Apron Panel -1094 | 990728 |Frt Vertical Cross Member
1025 | 992013 [Frt Support Panel 1095 | 991863 |Frt Lower.Cross Member
1026 | 992025 |Frt Support Panel Top Gamish Cover 1096 | 995Q70°|Frt LH Fender
1027 | 992416 [Horn 1097 | 995072 |Frt LH Fender Inner Panel
1028 | 991277 |Frt Brace Panel 1098 | 995147.|Frt LH Fender Lamp
1029 | 995153 |Frt LH Headlamp Assy 1099 | 995148 |Frt LH Fender Protector
1030 | 991821 |Frt REl Headlamp Assy 4 1100 | 991740 |Frt LH Fender Inner Shield
1031 | 995088 |Frz LH Side Lamp 1101 | 995179 [Frt LH Mudflap
1032 | 995089 |Fit RH Side Lamp T, 1102 | 995170 |Frt LH Wheel Rim
1033 | 990248 |Bounet 1103 | 994025 |Frt LH Rim Cover
1034 | 991328 |Bonnet Emblem s 1104 | 995065 |Frt LH Tyre
1035 | 990287 [Bonnet Lock 1105 | 995071 |Frt RH Fender )
1036 | 990285 |Bonnet Insulator 1106 | 991739 [Frt RH Fender Inner Panel
1037 | 990273 |Bounet Hinge 1107 | 991744 |Frt RH Fender Lamp
1038 | 990261 |Bonnet Damper 1108 | 991752 [Frt RH Fender Protector 4
1039 | 990305 [Bonnet Rubber 1109 | 991740 |Frt R#{ Fender Inner:Shield ™
1040 | 990252 [Bonnet Cable 1110 | 991884 |Frt RH Mudflap
1041 | 990311 [Bonnet Stand 1111 | 992087 |Frt RH Wheel Rim -
1042 | 9901 19| Air Con Condenser 112 | 994025 [Frt RH Rim Cover
1043 | 990122 [Air Con Fan Assy 1113 | 995065 [Frt RH Tyre
1044 | 990134 | Air Con Suction Pipe (Low Pressure) * 1114 | 992093 [Frt Windscreen Glass
1045 | 9901 18 | Air Con Suction [Hose 11157] 992117 |Frt Windscreen Rubber
1046 | 990133 |Air Con Discharge Pipe (High Pressure) 1116 | 992108 |Frt Windscreen Moulding
1047 | Y901 14 |Air Con Discharge FHose 1117 | 992098 |Frt Windscreen Sealant
1048 | 990149 |Air Con Liquid Pipe 1118 | 991019 |ERP Bracket
1049 | 995066 |Alir Con Receiver Drier 1119 [ 991020 |ERP Unit
1050 [ 990111 [Air Con Compressor Assy 1120 | 992140 |Frt Wiper Arm
1051 ] 995294 | Air Con Belt 1121 | 992142 |Frt Wiper Blade
1052 | 995074 |Radintor 1122 | 995045 |Wiper Panel Garnish
1053 | 992738 |Radiator Cowling 1123 | 991126 |Firewall Panel
1034 | 992742 |Radiator Fan Assy 1124 | 990753 |Dashboard Assy
1055 | 992745 |Radiator Fan Clutch 1125 | 992282 [Glove Box Cover
1056 1992758 Radiator Hose Top 1126 | 992281 |Glove Box Compartment
1057 | 992757 |Rudiator Hose Bottom 1127 | 994483 |Steering Wheel Airbay
(058 | 992741 |Radiator Expansion Tank 1128 | 994485 [Steering Wheal Airbag Sensor
1059 | 990151 |Air Duet 1129 | 990749 |Dashboard Airbag
1060 | 990070 |Air Cleaner Assy _ 1130 | 990750 | Dashboard Airbag Sensor
| 1061 | 990056 [Air Cleaner Hose 1131 | 990029 | Airbag Control Unit
1062 | 995089 | Air Cleaner Resonator 1132 | 990864 |F=: Driver Seat
1063 1 991712 |Fri Exhaust Mani fold 1133 [ 991922 |Frt RH Seat Belt Assy
1064 | 991713 [Frt Exhaust Mani fold Cover § 1134 ] 991899 [Frt Passenger Senl
1065 | 991054 |Fri Exhaust Manifold Sensor (Dxyeen) 1135 | 995182 |Frt LH Seat Belt Assy: .
L0660 [ 9917 14 [Front Lxhausr Pipe )i 1136 | 990247 |Sticker -
J_1067 1990219 Bultery ' Bripallee- 281 b{sa NECL s ),
1068 | 990224 [Ballery Coyer . RH | Heed ] 1gu £ uidAhis & BRIV
106Y 1990223 |Butery Brcker y
110 ] 990229 Buitery Tm_\i. s _ s
Mis of irrnw:__fi___ . Agsessor: | /_ L L {( ( , 12¢



. Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 355 sin Ming Drive #01-02 Vicam Inspaction Centre Singapore 575718 r

Tel: 8268-9993 Email: teamautop/@gmail.com / teamautoffice@gmail.com '
SIE: LYIC e Vi T- & Vehicle Nos:  SDW 73X
Date of Survey : ) Model : BMW 523]
Date of ReSurvey: After-Paint: Year :
Contacts : Chassis No :
* AGREED Cost Of Repair and Repair Day/s with SJE *
Amount: Warking Day:
Nos. |PARTS Qty Unit S$ TOTAL 55
1 |Front bumper 1|3 1,205.00 | $ v/1,205.00 | DDy
2 |Front bumper retainer 2 |& 65.00 | & ~13000 | NEC
3 Front bumper reinforcement 1 $ 814.00 | S BH400 | RX
4 |Front bumper inner sponge 1 | 86.00 | § —86-06-{N N_X
5 |Front bumper nozzle cover 1 S 63.00 | § v 63.00 | PRV
6 |Front bumper logo 1 S 69.00 | § v 69.00 | NEcy/
7 |Front bumper sensor Mig 1 Cq?j% 2 |s 383.00 | S 290 76600 Cuf
8 |Front bumper fog lamp 1 |3 21900 | § v 21800 | A
9  |Front bumper fog lamp garnish 1 |3 116.20 | $ v 11620 | B R
10  |Headlamp Rh T 1|3 2,552.00 | § 29¢nj5f2552:00 | BE
11 |Headlamp ballast Rh i ft TN 1,155.00 [ $ 15500
12  |Front fender Rh 1. |'s 1,677.90 | § 167790 | X
Parts Sub Total : | $ 596 (.158,853.10
5% Discount | $ 255.1}; 442.66
PARTSTOTAL: | $4203,318.410.45
Nos. |SPECIAL NETT Qty Unit §$ TOTAL S$
1 |Sundries 1 |.$ 60.00 | 6868 iy
2 |Front bumper clips 1 |5 5000 (8 3q.qp 5000 NEL
3 |Headlamp seal 1 |s 80.00 | $ 88:80 [NINA
4  |Front fender sealant 1 |3 100.00 | § Le go 100660 ’-;.-, D
SPECIAL NETTTOTAL: | $ 4 0. 100.00 |V~
Nos. |LABOUR s$
1 | R&R distance sensor $ £0.0o 100700 |~
2 R&R wire harness to facilitate repair, reconnect and check function hi $ Bogae JQO*OU ~ )
3 R&R front fender signal lamp 7’" $54.0 8060 s
4 Headlamp adjustment and alignment - s 8880 |7 NN
5 | Panel beat ' $ rfnr—01,200.00 | 7 5a0L
6 Rust proofing S fps  108:00 D a
7 | Spray painting 5 $ foe-p1,200.00 ny 2>
LABOUR TOTAL: | $ 124 2 2,860.00
RCSLL’(VGL:] Ou— ‘5/&/!3
I Ur 0 - \7\'—\\« PARTS TOTAL: § 8,410.45
o SPECIAL NETT TOTAL: § 100.00
Luwwp swe Re paia farts 480} 33 LABOUR TOTAL: § 2,860.00
n 4 ) SN b9+ 00
Keé '}xu r {{,;H 5 ¢ LK Laboci 125567 GRANDTOTAL: §  11,370.45
6/0% 33
/}TILULL ut @29% 1221+ 4} 150Ny
- —_—
488534

Prepared by Eric (8269-9999) Page 1 of 1
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¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BaE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (S) PL Ref : CS/AGI19010340/Bsd3e2
S ENBNCEAL VNG 3o [N
SINGAFORE SHOPPING CENTNEGINGAPORE  D¥te: 26082010
239924
Code: AGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLA 3113R Veh. Inspected SDW 73X
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C10003261/AH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From IVY RATILLA Assign Date 10/06/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model B.M.W. 523| c.c 2497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. WBAFP32050C864591 Colour WHITE
Odometer 69723 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[225/56 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [225/56 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/55 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/06/2019 Inspection Date 12/06/2019
Survey held at 160 SIN MING DRIVE # 01-14
Repairer TEAM AUTOPRO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDW 73X

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty _ Description of Parts Condition Workshop (g) (:j)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 1,205.00 1,205.00
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER @$65.00 NECESSARY 130.00 130.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 814.00
LABOUR
1|[FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 86.00
1|FRONT BUMPER NOZZLE COVER BROKEN 63.00 63.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGO NECESSARY 69.00 69.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SENSOR @$383.00 MISSING / CUT / 766.00 398.00
SHORTED
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP BROKEN 219.00 219.00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH BROKEN 116.20 116.20
1|HEADLAMP RH } BROKEN 2,552.00 2,860.15
1|HEADLAMP BALLAST RH } 1,155.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,677.90 -
LABOUR
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -442 66 -253.02
8,410.44 4,807.33
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|HEADLAMP SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
290.00 60.00
LABOUR
R&R DISTANCE SENSOR. 100.00 60.00
R&R WIRE HARNESS TO FACILITATE REPAIR, 100.00 50.00
RECONECT AND CHECK FUNCTION.
R&R FRONT FENDER SIGNAL LAMP. NOT NECESSARY 80.00
HEADLAMP ADJUSTMENT AND ALIGNMENT, NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
PANEL BEAT. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,200.00 600.00
BUMPER REINFORCEMENT AND FRONT FENDER RH.
RUST PROOFING. 100.00 30.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 500.00
2,860.00 1,240.00
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GRAND TOTAL

11,560.44

6,107.33

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

LIM TEOW GUAN

Automotive Assessor

Report Ref No. CS/AGI19010340/Bsd3e2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




