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DADENE Dakale Fome

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

FURIEN . om oo et 6 g Vi W

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owinser 1D Type: Singapore NRIC

Crerer 10 2406)

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle Mo SLSISTSE

vehicle to be Exported: Mo

mended Deregistration Date 13 Jun 2019

Wehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN

Wehicle Model GOLF 1.4 TSIAT SG13HZ
Primary Colour Red

Manufacturing Year 2016

Engine Nou CZC152761

Chiassis Mo WYWZZZAUZHW112090
Maxmum Power Qutpul: Y20 kW 1123 bhp)

Open Market Value: §20,330.00

Original Registration Date: 20 Sep 2017

First Registration Date 20%ep 2017

Transfer Count: o

Arctubl ARF Paid: $10,442.00

intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Ellgibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 19 Sep 2027

PARF Rebate Amount: §7.846.00

intended COE Rebate Detalls

COE Expiry Date: 19 Sep 2027

COE Category. A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Periad(Years) 10

QP Paid £34,001.00

COE Rebate Armaunt: £29,760.00

Total Rebate Amount: $37,606.00

The information contalned herein i correct as at 13 Jun 2019

OK
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Khanchna SLKK Autuz

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 9 September 2019 5:55 PM

To: Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore)

Cc: Waong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore); Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Goh Edmund
(VGS - 5G/Singapore), Admin A

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SL53696E & SJU2188A

ON 7.6.19 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG190710332/ka3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
we refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as lollows:

I. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $4871.1%9
2. Loss of Use |3 days x § 50) $ 150.00
4, LTA Search Fee 5 200
Total $5.023.1%

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna(alkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 3 August 2019 12:24 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|lkkauto.com>

Ce: Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore) <meiy.wong(@vw.com.sg>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Goh Edmund (VGS - SG/Singapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SLS3696E & SJU2|188A
ON 7.6.19 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19010332/ka3

Ha,



'PAYMENT ADVICE

Your ref: AIG Insurance Vehlicle MNo.

4
Claimant's Vshicle No. _ ‘I.'U-'_? Eq_ E_

=L=y
Accldent on -:] = 1_ inwvalving vehicle/a Ho,

along/at _"l:l"l'ﬂ_ ‘t!fﬂ_ e

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S

; entre Sinjinpore
1. Repair Cost S§ _Hl:l I_l‘i_ _ Payable to l.ruihksu-\rasiﬂﬂ‘ﬂd
gonys % €
Z. Loss-of-Use/ N }
2 agen Centre Sing.
cir-peatal 55_ _H._ - - . Payable to _vﬂlhsim% it L_
3. a1 snd Volkswagen Centre Singe: « (2
Search Fees 5§ _1"' - = - . FPayaple to _ _
Remarcks :

Garvice Adviser

Contact MNo.H/P.



!’ U Auto

. Consuifants
Bl . BB & Pre Lid

S L HEAVE [, #0123 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 10651 62363561 FAN : (0651 A2364315

Our Ref: CC3/AIG19010332/ka3

13 JUNE 2019

TAN CHOON SZE
J1C NIM ROAD
SINGAPORE 805076

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU2188A & SLS3696E ALONG MARTABAN ROAD OPEN
SPACE CAR PARK ON 07/06/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SLS3696E against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
L
KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841-2360

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com




Provide always that this discharge of my claim
for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle
shall not prejudice or affect or preclude me
from making a further claim for general and special
damages for my personal injuries sustained

in the same accident
AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third aim
L HW Lt Yho LpukA (the third party claimant™) of

7 SIME| STEH‘T 4 L} lj'-ﬂ} ﬂl’aas* (address), owner of _ SLS36AGE
{vehicle no.) hereby authorize ""-'f"-’l"W H‘Eﬂ [,Gf"]ﬂi ﬁ”‘\ﬂTIFE (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/for loss of use (“claim”) for

my vehicle no iM;E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
07/ob [2n9 (date) along _ TTSM_Stpee can L [ mARTAGM RoAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s _SMZPA _ (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other

vehiclefs is concerned.

Dated this_ 28 (day)of __SWE  (month) 20 19 (year)

Signed w‘lht third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



slways that this discharge «f my claim
E: ;i::::gcs r};nlmg 10 the damage i my vehicle
shall not prejudice or affect or preclude me
from making a further claim for general and special
damages for my personal injuries

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, VOLK SWAGEN CENTRE SINUAPoRE(“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/|
have resched an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pe Lid
LKK AUTQ CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect 1o the amount claimed
for 88 8,84 19 (Repair Cost), 8§ 150.00  (Loss of Usc/Ramiad), 8§ 2-00 _ (Disbursement)
for vehicle no. __SLS 369 GE that was damaged pursuant to the sccident which occurred
on 0%/ g4 201 (date) along ___ MARTAGAN RoAD 0TEN TPACE CARTALE (location)
involving vehicle no/s S3Y 2\X§AThis is pursuant 1o the inspection conducted on 1% ] 0#l2014 (date)
al "the workshop".

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner HU\ L\ VAo LAuGA (“the
third party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLS36 98E  make the claim as sct out in the above paragraph
snd we/l have full authority to settle the matter on hissher behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit.

We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant®.

Well further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” afler the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs andfor rental and/or loss of use pursuant o the

domageto SLS3CQECE (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Wefl confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of "“the
third party claimant” pursuant to the saccident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this B  (day)or__o9 (month) 2019 (year)

’

Signed by “the
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Singapore 6381786
Rir Feg Mo. 188101 484F Volirwagen SHODA el
GST Na: M200SBS052
Tax invoice
Page 12
Company Customear Details Documani no 12233900544
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PAL Mg Documant date 27-08-2019
78 Shanton Way HU Customar no. 5211043785
#07-16 AIG Building LI YAD, LAURA Customar GST-ID 207 0094040
Singapore 079120 7 SIME| STREET 4 Dealer 29950
#1103 Job orger numbear 2018001021/ 1
Singapore 523864 Job orer dale 18-06-2018
Service Advisor CHARMAINE KONG
License plate | Model code Firsi rogistration ViM Moded Milgage
SLS3696E SG13HZ 20-09-2017 WVWIZZAUZHW 12000 | Goll 1.4 GLEM 92 TSI D7F 9,800
| |
Position no. Description Quantity Unit Uit prica Taxcooe  Total amount  Tolal amouni
excl GET excl. BST Inel. GET
Dnagnoatic and Programming i poi 480,00 #1 480.00 51360
Check Short Clecull / Hamess Repair 1 pos 280000 LL B80.00 2949 60
SGOBOTZ1TBNGAU Cover For Bumper Primed i pes. 1.083.84 L 1,083.64 1.159.49
CD-210818
5GOBOTTZID Support Par 1 Pt 50,48 Ll 5049 o402
[BUMPER GUIDE LH)*AO-210819
SGOBOTOAGA Guide Piece 1 pes. 1918 #1 19.18 20452
[BUMPER BRACKET LH)"AD-210813
SGOBS3IETT 869 Coofing Ar Grill Satin B 1 pos. 118.98 21 11698 128,38
[CENTER LOWER GRAILL|"XR- 200619
5G091HG3 Senacr Sracher i pce: 3.2 #1 1am 1413
XR-200819
5309184930 Sensor Bracke! 2 pes: 13.21 L) 2642 a8.27
XA-200619
560015404 Sensor Brachet 1 peos. 133 n 1321 14,73
XR-200618
O 180KU2A1 2k-Plasiic Adhesive 1 pcs T4.29 " 7429 79.48
MNR-200618%
500916133 5B%  Seal Ring Safin Biack 1 peca 1.18 L3 1.18 1.28
XR-200618
5(.2941005E Twin Halogen Headlamps 1 pes. 854,01 # &a4.01 74259
XR-200618
LABOUR 1 pos. B40.00 " B40.00 8658 80
Spray Painiing 1 =8 B 0O L B00.00 856.00
Bonding Agent lor plasiic 1 pcs 58 90 a 56.90 a0.88
AlG DIRECT SETTLEMENT DOWA: 7.5.18
SURVEYOR: LKK STEVE TP VEH
SJUZTB8A
Tax Labour Material a5T % GBT Total amoun Tolal amount
Code ewci, GET Inct. GST
2 T80.00 37825 ¥ d1a.68 4,552 51 4 87,15

Pigase mmpect your vehicie Drior 10 aving our Premisss; we Seek your LRSHILENGSTg Tl we Bre Aol A8 1 HONoUT QTS o ICrEiches. oents pic. after your car has
el o prermyses



Sngrpore 638176
Biz, Fleg No.. 1991014842
G5T No.: M200SB5052

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE @ @ @
9 Tuas Avenue
Valkiwagen SMODA  vohle

fax invoice
Pago 22
Campany Customer Daiails: Documen! na 1233100544
AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PIL My Documan] dais 27-08-2018
78 Shenlon Way HLUI Customer na, 5211043785
#07-16 ANG Building LI YAD, LALIRA Customer GET-ID 2010094040
Singapore 079120 7 BIMEI STREET 4 Dealer 39998
#11-03 Job order number 2019001021/ 1
Singapore 529864 Job order dale 16-06-2019
Service Advisor CHARMAINE MONG
License plale | Model code First registration WiN Model Miloage
SLS3656E EG13HZ 20-09-207 WYWZZZALZHW112090 | Goll 1.4 CLBM 82 TS| DTF 9,800

—~VISIT OUF WEBSITE. aftersgies va com sg [ior online servoe apooirimants) and solkssage cim g and www.ahods com.sg (lor sddtional services. produc
and promotgng), —-

AR fung truneier paymenE ENoud be Made payatio 10 Yolkewagen Group Sngapore Pie Lid: Barm Name: Deulsche Bank AG (Singapors Bramch), Bank Account
25IRI14002, Swill Codo: DEUTSGE0. Pease indicate Cusiomer Number (eg. 527 XX00000K), Cusiomer Marme and irvoce Nomiber in he paymarnts

il payrant of & poocE (part, Accesuones eic.) han been made in fl 1o and eosves by Volkewagen Group Singapore (VGS), the goods reman in egal
possession af VGS, respeciive If They have aiready been nstalied ino your vehicls. Howsver, Ihe warmanty of 1he goods [whers applicable) mans with ine ssuance of
I imvoios of the collection ol your car, whicheve: B sarlier

For warnsnly terms and condibons poase visil our webaille sww volRSWBgRT COM 0

This @ an auihonsed document. No sgratune & reguired,
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
l"m Phona: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSDCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M4D0017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-19-091804
Date of Reguest: 10/06/2019 Your Ref Na: Online Purchasa
Volkswagen Cenire Singapom
24T Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Dale 10/06/2019
Enguiry By Edmund Goh Hui Huang
TP Vehicle No. SJU2188A
Accident Data O7/062019
|DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
|GST Amaunl 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps:/fsingapore marimen comiclaims/index cimHusabor=MTRsas&lusasction=dsp_geninviphrefid=21723428CFI0=541T80428CF TOKEN=aID... 272



Mernimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Enpress

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cass Maotifies Ext Submitte Ad) Assighed Ad) Apt Ad| Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
v | 123002019 DIna0is  lgeassasi | ss4ss2s PR ferIre
tou nag | | | e acymax | Eatit Etimates | | view Rot | cancel Caee | :

—-———-——_——_l"""'—""—'_l
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]

Insured: TAM CHOOM S2ZE, 10: 56817012 ]

Main X
Claimant: HUT LI YAD LAURA, [0: SETI3406) |
Wahicke _ |07j06/2018 08:00 - :59
Nos.: SLS3696E Onte of Los5: |18 \cthe and 18 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
ciim Type: | TP / 05510244685G Phiny gl
M P rg';'m:‘;“ - 18091 72MVPC
(Insured)! i
Excess

Repairer: va Centre Singapors (HQ) 247 Alexandra ln-:i. 159934 Almxandra - Tel: 63057268
Hanalng | a1G Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Hanilied by Lee, Ming-Yaa] Mingiao. Lee@alg.com

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311
| Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tell 6256-3561 . [Handled by CHEN TSUE YEE] .. [Final Rpt due 20/06/2019]

There ars no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS® View All | Searcn Tasks | Creats New Task |  Compete |

Due Oate  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On ~ Done?
Mo resuits.
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Claim Documents

*5SLS3I696E (05510244685G)
[SJu21B8A]
TP
HUI LI YAD LAURA
Jun 7 2018 8:00AM
[TAN CHOON SZE]

Page | of 2

Volkswagen Centre Singapore
mmmml Upios PRotos | tnnm-mwrl umuw-aJ wmnl mm

Letters/ Correspondences ltperpage [v] M
Me | Finallzed O LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) | Thumbinail | Print
1 |(Dram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown 0|
Photos/Images [1perpage o] B4
Ne | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auts Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |13/06/19 15:49 | Ganeral View 0 s | A
2 |13/06/19 15:49 | Geners| View O | leadirs | H
3 130619 15:49 | General View B wdws || &
4 |13/06/1515:49 | Odometer Resding O wdrs | &
£ |1WD6/19 15:49 | Chassls Number 0 wasaws | B
f |13/06/1015:49 | General View 0 | loeds | B
7 [13/06/1915:43 | Genarsl View O | loadws | B
(B [13/06/19 1549 | General View O | leadies | B
|8 |13/06/1915:43 | General View ﬂ_ Lood PG | B
10 |13/06/19 15:49 | General View )| woodws | B |
11 |13/06/10 15:48 | General View ) | eadirc | A
12 |13/06/19 15:48 General View 0| ladies | A
13 |13/06/19 15:49 | General View O edrs | B
14 |13/06/1915:49 | General View © | wears | A |
15 |13/06/19 15:48 | General View 0| toaws |
18 | 1WO0E/19 15:48 | General View 0| Leadies | &
17 |13/06/1915:49 | General View 0O | waws | A
18 [13/06/19 15:49 | General View 0| eawc | M
15 |13/06/19 15:48 | Genaral View O | aaws | A
20 |13/06/19 1549 | Genersl View ﬁ Load PG | BA
2t |13006/19 15:49 General View 0| tedivc | A
27 [13/06/19 1549 | General View 0! wawc | A
23 |13/06/19 1548 | General View 0| tondirc | M
24 |13/06/19 15:49 | General View 0| dire | &
Documentation i per page -.. _5_3;_
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lbd (HQ) Thumbrail | Print
1 |11/06/18 20011 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP ESTIMATE Load POF

2 |1u06/19 20:11 TP GIA REPORT _8_ Load POF

1 [13/06/19 10:01 | LETTER TO O1 Load POE

4 [21/06/19 10:15 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

5 14/10/19 15:53 | WORKSHOP INVOICE ) | Load poF

& |14/10/1% 1551 | AUTHORISATION TOD ACT FORM Losd POF

7 |14/10/1915:53 | Release Voucher o 3 Load PDF |

8 |14/10/19 15:53  |[LDD 8 Load POF

5 |14/30/19 15:53 | GIA SEARCH Load POF
[No_|Finailzed On AID Asta Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. (G) Thumbnail | Print
1 |12/06/18 D8:17 Ol G1A REPORT n Load POF

Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST ]
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Aeset | Save | Mntll

lr‘rhu‘ are e document m configured,
| ]

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG)

Show Remarks Tor [ Handling Insurer
P Demosey aew privele phiesd ik Ghow B ID efhes parties
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SJU2188A (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF 1.4

SLS3696E (TP veh)

TSI (A)

| Date of Accident: | 07/06/2018

Global Sum Settlement [ - | [ ] Yes | 1X] No
Repair Estimate s 11,361.39
Final Repair Cost 5 487119
Loss of Use 5 150.00 3.00 days at $50.00 per day
Rantal (if any) 3 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fes L] 2.00
Others: - 0.00
$
Final Settlemant Sum S 502312

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?
below)

[ 1] YES [ X] NO

(Kindly indicate

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No:

Assessed Liability (*):

* Assessed Liability lo be filled only for chain colisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

(%)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Volkswagen Centre Singapore - 5.023.19
2) $
k)] -
14 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting decuments to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 14/10/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg Mo 1sssorsser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@kkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our Flle No: CC3/AIG18010332/EKA3GZ
Date: 14102018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No
Claimant 5
Vehicle No : SLS368GE Insured Vehicle No : SJU21B8A
Date of Loss: 07/06/2018 Nature of Claim: P Claim No: 055102448856
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLS3I696E
Make & Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF, 1.4 TSI (A) Engine No: CZC152761
Reg. Date: 20/09/2017 (Man. Year. 2016) Chassis No. WVWZZZALUZHW112080
Colour; Red Odometer 18454 km
Engine Capacity 1385 cc
Market Value/MNew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$). Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modificalion: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R17
Front Left Side Cinturato 6 mm Rear Left Side: Cinturato 6 mm
Front Right Side: Cinturato 8 mm Rear Right Side: Cinturato & mm
Tha above values represen! (he rernaming e inesds dephh
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %)
Parts 3,298.12 215251 1,145 61 3474
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 7.320.00 2,400.00 4,920,00 67.21
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 D.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 10,618.12 4,552.51 6,065.61 5713
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 743.27 J18.68 424 59 5712
Nett Amount (S$) 11,361.39 4 871.19 6,490.20 5713
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5550.00/day) (S§) 150.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 200
Nett Liability (S§) 5,023,19
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 1206/2019
Date Inspected: 1406/2019 Inspected AL Volkswagen Centre Singapore (HQ)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158634
Estimated Perod of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE

Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj
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NOTE: mmwmwmm:nmm.mmmmmmm.mrmmnnmmumummdw
knowieage and ability but any other lability under any other crcumstances s hersby expressly sxciided
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty .. Particulars Condition  Repairers Amount

1 1 *COVER FOR BUMPER PRIMED Broken 1,.063.64 F5*1,083. 84 F5

2 1 *FOAM INSERT Mot 38.75FS *-F5
Necassary

3 1 *IMPACT BEAM Not S587.B4F5 *-FS
MNecessary

4 1 *SUPPORT PART (BUMPER GUIDE LH) Broken 50 49F5 *50.48FS

5 1 *SUPPORT PART (BUMPER GUIDE RH) Not 5049FS *.F§
Necassary

[ 1 *GUIDE PIECE (BUMPER BRACKET LH } Broken 19.18F5S *19.18FS

7 1 *GUIDE PIECE (BUMPER BRACKET RH } Not 18.16FS *~.F5
Necessary

B 1 *RETAINER FOR SPOILER SATI Not 17453 FS -FS
Necassary

g 1 ‘GODI.EIHG AIR GRILL SATIN B [CENTER LOWER Broken 119.98F5 *118.98F5

GRILL
0 1 *COVER PART FOR BUMPER SAT (LH FOGLAMP Not 2558FS *-F5
GRILL) Necessary

11 1 *COOLING AIR GRILL SATIN B (LH LOWER GRILLE) Not B4 62F5 *F8
Necessary

12 1 *SENSOR BRACKET Necessary 1321F8 *13.21FS

13 2 *SENSOR BRACKET Necassary 26 42FS *2642FS

4 1 *SENSOR BRACKET MNecassary 1321FS *"13.21FS

15 1 *BONDING AGENT FOR PLASTIC Necessary 56.90F5 *56.90FS

1B 1 *2K-PLASTIC ADHESIVE Necessary 7420FS °T4.29F5

17 1 *SEAL RING SATIN BLACK Necessary 1.18FS *1.18F5

1B 1 *SENSOR PRIMED Mot 164 62FS *“FS
MNecessary

18 1 *TWIN HALOGEN HEADLAMPS Cut 60401 FS *634.01FS

F=Franchisa parl. S=SpciNait

Total Parts (5§) 3,298.12 2,152.51

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thers are no now miscellansous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR New 3.360.00 840.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING New 3,200.00 800.00
3 DIAGNOSTIC AND PROGRANMMING New 480.00 450,00
4 CHECK SHORT CIRCUIT/HARNESS REPAIR New 280.00 280.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 7,320.00 2,400.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out I
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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